
ACT 142 

ACT 142 

An Act Relating to the Modification of Certain Fees and Penalties of Certain 
Boards and Making an Appropriation Therefor. 

Be it Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Hawaii: 

SECTION 1. Chapter 58 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended, 
relating to the practice of barbering, is hereby further amended in the fol-
lowing respects : 

(a) By amending section 58-11 (a) to read as follows :
" (a) The fee to be paid by an applicant for an examination to determine

his fitness to receive a certificate of registration to practice barbering shall 
be $15. The fee to be paid by an applicant for an examination to determine 
his fitness to receive a certificate of registration to practice as an apprentice 
shall be $10." 

(b) By deleting the sum "$2" appearing in section 58-11 (b) and inserting
in lieu thereof the sum "$4". 

( c) By deleting the sum "$1.50" appearing in section 58-11 ( c) and insert
ing in lieu thereof the sum "$3.00". 

186 



ACT 142

(d) By amending section 58-11(d) to read as follows:
“The fee to be paid by an applicant to conduct a barber shop shall be $25.

The fee to be paid for the annual renewal of a certificate shall be $7 and for
the restoration of an expired certificate $7.”

SECTION 2. Chapter 59 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended,
relating to the regulation of beauty culture, is hereby further amended in the
following respects:

(a) By deleting the sum “$2” appearing in section 59-11 and inserting in
lieu thereof the sum “$3”.

(b) By deleting the sum “$15” appearing in the first sentence of the first
paragraph of section 59-13 (a) and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$20”.

(c) By deleting the sums “$15” and “$7.50” appearing in the last sentence
of the first paragraph of section 59-13(a) and inserting in lieu thereof the
sum “$20” and “$10”, respectively.

(d) By deleting the sum “$2” appearing in section 59-16(c) and inserting
in lieu thereof the sum “$3”.

(e) By amending section 59-16(d) to read as follows:
“(d) Renewal after lapse. The certificate of an apprentice operator or

instructor shall be reinstated upon payment of all delinquent fees and a
penalty of $10 if application is made within three years after lapse.”

(f) By deleting the sum “$10” appearing in section 59-18(a) and insert
ing in lieu thereof the sum “$15”.

(g) By deleting the sum “$2” appearing in section 59-18(b) and inserting
in lieu thereof the sum “$3”.

(h) By amending the last sentence of section 59-19 (b) to read as follows:
“A lapsed certificate may be reissued upon payment of the renewal fee

and a penalty of the same amount as the required annual registration fee.”
SECTION 3. Chapter 61 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended,

relating to dentistry, is hereby further amended in the following respects:
(a) By deleting the sum “$5” appearing in the third sentence of section

61-7 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$7”.
(b) By deleting the sum “$25” appearing in the second paragraph of sec

tion 61-9 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$40”.
SECTION 4. Chapter 62 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended,

relating to dental hygienists, is hereby further amended in the following
respects:

(a) By deleting the sum “$15” appearing in the second paragraph of sec
tion 62-1 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$20”.

(b) By deleting the sum “$1” appearing in the second and third sen
tences of the fourth paragraph of section 62-1 and inserting in lieu thereof
the sum “$3”.

(c) By deleting the sum “$15” appearing in the last sentence of the fourth
paragraph of section 62-1 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$20”.

SECTION 5. The first sentence of the last paragraph of section 68-7 of
the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended, relating to optometry, is
hereby further amended by deleting the sum “$3” and inserting in lieu
thereof the sum “$5”.

SECTION 6. Section 69-8 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, relating
to dispensing opticians, is hereby amended by adding thereto the following
sentence:

187



ACT 142

“The holder of an expired certificate may have the same restored within
one year of the date of expiration upon due application therefor and pay
ment of the delinquent fees and a penalty of “$10.”

SECTION 7. Chapter 70 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended,
relating to osteopathy, is hereby further amended in the following respects:

(a) By deleting the sum “$25” appearing in section 70-5(a) and inserting
in lieu thereof the sum “$35”.

(b) By amending the first sentence of section 70-5 (b) to read as follows:
“The provisions of section 70-2 and any other provision of this chapter

to the contrary notwithstanding, there shall be paid to the board of osteo
pathic examiners by every person licensed to practice as an osteopathic
physician or osteopathic physician and surgeon, every year between June 1
and June 30, a renewal fee in the amount of $5.”

(c) By deleting the sum “$35” appearing in the last paragraph of section
70-9 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$100,,.

SECTION 8. Chapter 71 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended,
relating to pharmacists and pharmacy, is hereby further amended in the
following resp&ts:

(a) By deleting the sum “$5” appearing in section 71-7 and inserting in
lieu thereof the sum “$8”.

(b) By deleting the sum “$5” appearing in section 71-8(b) and inserting
in lieu thereof the sum “$8”.

(c) By deleting the sum “$10’, appearing in the first and second par
agraphs of section 71-16 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum “$12”.

(d) By adding the following sentence at the end of the second paragraph
of section 71-16:

“The holder of an expired permit may have the same restored within
three years of the date of expiration upon due application therefor and pay-
meat of the delinquent fees and a penalty of $12.”

SECTION 9. Chapter 73 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as amended,
relating to veterinarians, is hereby amended in the following respects:

(a) By deleting the sum “$25” appearing in section 73-8 and inserting in
lieu thereof the sum “$35”.

(b) By deleting the sum “$10’, appearing in section 73-9(c) and inserting
in lieu thereof the sum “$15,,.

SECTION 10. Chapter 164 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as
amended, relating to public accountancy, is hereby further amended in the
following respects:

(a) By adding the following sentences to section 164-13:
“A certificate which has not been renewed on or before January 1 shall

expire on January 2. The holder of an expired certificate or registration may
have the same restored within three years of the date of expiration, upon due
application therefor and payment of the delinquent fees and a penalty of
$10.,,

(b) By changing the period at the end of the first paragraph of section
164-15 to a semicolon and by adding thereto the following words:
“providing further, that such persons shall first be required to register with
the board, specifying the extent of such practice and pay a fee of $25 for
each period of three months or less of such temporary practice. The board
shall issue temporary permits for such practice.”

188



ACT 142 

SECTION 11. Section 165A-6 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, re
lating to private detectives and watchmen, is hereby amended by adding 
thereto the following sentence: 

"The holder of an expired license may have the same restored within one 
year of the date of expiration upon due application therefor and payment of 
the delinquent fees and a penalty of $25." 

SECTION 12. Chapter 166 of the Revised Laws of Hawaii 1955, as 
amended, relating to professional engineers, architects and surveyors, is 
hereby further amended in the following respects : 

(a) By deleting the sum "$25" appearing in section 166-3(c) and insert
ing in lieu thereof the sum "$50". 

(b) By deleting the sum "$5" appearing in the first paragraph of section
166-9 and inserting in lieu thereof the sum "$30".

( c) By deleting the sums "$5" and "$10" appearing in the last paragraph
of section 166-9 and inserting in lieu thereof the sums "$15" and "$30", 
respectively. 

SECTION 13. The following sums or so much thereof as may be neces
sary in order to provide for continuing the services of the programs affected 
by this Act, are hereby appropriated from the general revenues of the State, 
not otherwise appropriated, for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 1961 and 
ending June 30, 1962: 

DEPARTMENT OF TREASURY AND REGULATION ________________ $55,102 

Board of Barbers ----------------------------------------------------------------$ 9,565 

Board of Beauty Culture ---------------------------------------------------- 13,253 
Board of Dental Examiners ------------------------------------------------ 7,624 
Board of Registration for Professional Engineers, 

Architects and Land Surveyors ------------------------------------$24,660 

The appropriations made in this Act shall be from the general revenues 
of the State; provided, that the special funds of the boards affected are 
abolished and if not then the sums as indicated above shall be construed as 
authorization for the expenditure of that amount of money from their re
spective special funds. The appropriations made above shall be in lieu of any 
other appropriation to these programs for the fiscal year 1961-1962 enacted 
during the general session of 1961. 

SECTION 14. This Act shall take effect upon its approval provided 
however the increased fees shall not apply to existing licenses until the ap
propriate renewal dates. 

(Approved July 5, 1961.) S.B. 942. 

189 




