
 S E N A T E   J O U R N A L  -  4 8 t h   D A Y  -  A P R I L  1 2,   2 0 2 2 
 523

 
FORTY-EIGHTH  DAY 

 
Tuesday, April 12, 2022 

 

 The Senate of the Thirty-First Legislature of the State of 
Hawai‘i, Regular Session of 2022, convened at 10:05 a.m. with 
the President in the Chair. 
 

 The Roll was called showing all Senators present. 
 

 The President announced that he had read and approved the 
Journal of the Forty-Seventh Day. 
 

 At this time, Senator San Buenaventura thanked her staff for 
their work, especially since Linda Menda, her longtime staffer, 
had retired at the end of March. Senator San Buenaventura then 
introduced members of her staff: Jackie Rosas; intern Billie-
Ann Bruce; and Amelia Castro, who had offered a moment of 
contemplation prior to the Senate’s floor session. 
 

MESSAGES FROM THE GOVERNOR 
 

 The following messages from the Governor (Gov. Msg. 
Nos. 18, 19, and 868 to 870) were read by the Clerk and were 
placed on file: 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 18, letter dated April 8, 2022, informing the 
Legislature that a transfer of general funds between programs 
for the Department of Land and Natural Resources was 
approved, pursuant to Act 88, Section 72, SLH 2021. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 19, letter dated April 8, 2022, transmitting 
proposed changes to the FY 23 Executive Supplemental Budget 
for the Departments of Accounting and General Services, 
Budget and Finance, Defense, and Health. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 868, informing the Senate that on April 8, 
2022, the Governor withdrew the nomination of JUSTIN MEW 
to the Hawaii Teacher Standards Board, under Gov. Msg. 
No. 815, from consideration by the Senate. 
 

 In accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 868, the nomination listed 
under Gov. Msg. No. 815 was returned. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 869, informing the Senate that on April 11, 
2022, the Governor withdrew the nomination of ELISE 
ANDERSON to the Board of Registration of the Island of 
Oahu, under Gov. Msg. No. 770, from consideration by the 
Senate. 
 

 In accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 869, the nomination listed 
under Gov. Msg. No. 770 was returned. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 870, informing the Senate that on April 11, 
2022, the Governor withdrew the nomination of SUSAN 
CROW to the Greenhouse Gas Sequestration Task Force, under 
Gov. Msg. No. 794, from consideration by the Senate. 
 

 In accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 870, the nomination listed 
under Gov. Msg. No. 794 was returned. 
 

HOUSE COMMUNICATIONS 
 

 The following communications from the House (Hse. Com. 
Nos. 514 to 573) were read by the Clerk and were disposed of 
as follows: 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 514, informing the Senate that on April 8, 
2022, the House disagreed to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to the following House bills: 
 

 H.B. No. 1681, H.D. 2 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 1743, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 1789, H.D. 2 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 1801, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 2006, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); 

 H.B. No. 2255, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 2495, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); and 
 H.B. No. 2514, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1), 
 

 was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 515, informing the Senate that on April 8, 
2022, the House reconsidered its action taken on March 30, 
2022, in disagreeing to the amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 2392, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1), was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 516, returning S.B. No. 1048, S.D. 1, which 
passed Third Reading in the House of Representatives on 
April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 517, returning S.B. No. 2082, which passed 
Third Reading in the House of Representatives on April 8, 
2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 518, returning S.B. No. 2114, which passed 
Third Reading in the House of Representatives on April 8, 
2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 519, returning S.B. No. 2305, which passed 
Third Reading in the House of Representatives on April 8, 
2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 520, returning S.B. No. 2376, S.D. 1, which 
passed Third Reading in the House of Representatives on 
April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 521, returning S.B. No. 2741, which passed 
Third Reading in the House of Representatives on April 8, 
2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 522, returning S.B. No. 2780, which passed 
Third Reading in the House of Representatives on April 8, 
2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 523, returning S.B. No. 2998, S.D. 1, which 
passed Third Reading in the House of Representatives on 
April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 524, returning S.B. No. 3038, which passed 
Third Reading in the House of Representatives on April 8, 
2022, was placed on file. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 525, returning S.B. No. 1107, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1107, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 526, returning S.B. No. 1211, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1211, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 527, returning S.B. No. 1294, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1294, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
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 Hse. Com. No. 528, returning S.B. No. 2125, as amended in 
H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House of 
Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2125, and requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 529, returning S.B. No. 2136, as amended in 
H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House of 
Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2136, and requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 530, returning S.B. No. 2137, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2137, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 531, returning S.B. No. 2182, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2182, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 532, returning S.B. No. 2196, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 2, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2196, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 533, returning S.B. No. 2202, as amended in 
H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House of 
Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2202, and requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 534, returning S.B. No. 2251, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 2, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2251, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 535, returning S.B. No. 2276, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 2, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2276, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 536, returning S.B. No. 2298, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2298, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 537, returning S.B. No. 2359, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2359, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 538, returning S.B. No. 2371, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2371, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 539, returning S.B. No. 2375, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 2, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2375, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 540, returning S.B. No. 2378, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 2, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2378, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 541, returning S.B. No. 2382, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2382, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 542, returning S.B. No. 2390, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2390, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 543, returning S.B. No. 2474, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2474, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 544, returning S.B. No. 2483, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2483, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
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 Hse. Com. No. 545, returning S.B. No. 2504, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2504, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 546, returning S.B. No. 2570, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2570, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 547, returning S.B. No. 2581, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2581, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 548, returning S.B. No. 2667, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2667, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 549, returning S.B. No. 2678, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2678, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 550, returning S.B. No. 2740, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2740, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 551, returning S.B. No. 2808, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2808, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 552, returning S.B. No. 2812, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2812, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 553, returning S.B. No. 2818, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2818, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 554, returning S.B. No. 2822, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2822, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 555, returning S.B. No. 2824, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2824, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 556, returning S.B. No. 2862, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2862, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 557, returning S.B. No. 2877, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2877, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 558, returning S.B. No. 2923, as amended in 
H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House of 
Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 2923, and requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 559, returning S.B. No. 3040, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3040, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 560, returning S.B. No. 3044, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3044, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 561, returning S.B. No. 3077, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 2, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3077, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
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 Hse. Com. No. 562, returning S.B. No. 3078, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3078, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 563, returning S.B. No. 3094, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3094, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 564, returning S.B. No. 3095, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3095, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 565, returning S.B. No. 3140, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3140, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 566, returning S.B. No. 3142, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3142, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 567, returning S.B. No. 3190, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3190, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 568, returning S.B. No. 3219, as amended in 
H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House of 
Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3219, and requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 569, returning S.B. No. 3235, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3235, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 570, returning S.B. No. 3325, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3325, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 571, returning S.B. No. 3335, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3335, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 572, returning S.B. No. 3337, S.D. 2, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3337, S.D. 2, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 573, returning S.B. No. 3374, S.D. 1, as 
amended in H.D. 1, which passed Third Reading in the House 
of Representatives on April 8, 2022, was placed on file. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 3374, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 The Chair then announced: 
 

 “Conferees will be named at a later date.” 
 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3969) recommending that the 
Senate consent to the appointment of SHELLIE K. PARK-
HOAPILI to the District Court of the First Circuit, in 
accordance with Jud. Com. No. 23. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3969 and Jud. Com. No. 23 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3970) recommending that the 
Senate consent to the appointment of NATASHA R. SHAW to 
the District Family Court of the First Circuit, in accordance 
with Jud. Com. No. 24. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3970 and Jud. Com. No. 24 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3971) recommending 
that the Senate advise and consent to the nominations to the Aha 
Moku Advisory Committee of the following: 
 

 KEITH ROBINSON, in accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 717; 
 

 WALTER RAWLINS, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 718; 

 

 ROBERT LUUWAI, in accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 719; 
 

 MANUEL KULOLOIO, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 720. 

 

 FRANCES KALUHIWA, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 721; 

 

 CHARLES YOUNG, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 722; 
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 LLEWELLYN KAOHELAULII, in accordance with Gov. 
Msg. No. 723; and 

 

 WINIFRED BASQUES, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 724. 

 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3971 and Gov. Msg. Nos. 717, 718, 719, 720, 721, 
722, 723, and 724 was deferred until Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3972) recommending 
that the Senate advise and consent to the nomination of 
KANOE WILSON to the Legacy Land Conservation 
Commission, in accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 776. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3972 and Gov. Msg. No. 776 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3973) recommending 
that the Senate advise and consent to the nomination of ELENA 
BRYANT to the Kane‘ohe Bay Regional Council, in accordance 
with Gov. Msg. No. 775. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3973 and Gov. Msg. No. 775 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3974) recommending 
that the Senate advise and consent to the nomination of 
WAYNE KATAYAMA to the Commission on Water Resource 
Management, in accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 798. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3974 and Gov. Msg. No. 798 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3975) recommending 
that the Senate advise and consent to the nominations to the 
Hawaii Historic Places Review Board of the following: 
 

 NICHOLAS BELLUZZO, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 690; and 

 

 WILLIAM CHAPMAN, in accordance with Gov. Msg. 
No. 701. 

 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3975 and Gov. Msg. Nos. 690 and 701 was deferred 
until Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

ORDER OF THE DAY 
 

ADVISE AND CONSENT 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3889 (Gov. Msg. Nos. 737, 738, 739, 
740, 741, 742, and 743): 
 

 Senator Kim moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3889 be 
received and placed on file, seconded by Senator Kidani and 
carried. 
 

 Senator Kim then moved that the Senate advise and consent 
to the nominations to the Hawaii Commission for National and 
Community Service of the following: 
 

 KAREN MUKAI, term to expire June 30, 2024 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 737); 

 

 ANNE NAKAKURA, term to expire June 30, 2022 (Gov. 
Msg. No. 738); 

 

 ANNE NAKAKURA, term to expire June 30, 2025 (Gov. 
Msg. No. 739); 

 

 DIANE PETERS-NGUYEN, term to expire June 30, 2022 
(Gov. Msg. No. 740); 

 

 DIANE PETERS-NGUYEN, term to expire June 30, 2025 
(Gov. Msg. No. 741); 

 

 FRANK HAAS, term to expire June 30, 2022 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 742); and 

 

 FRANK HAAS, term to expire June 30, 2025 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 743), 

 

 seconded by Senator Kidani. 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes: 
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.   
 

 At this time, Senator Kim introduced newly confirmed 
commission members Anne Nakakura, Diane Peters-Nguyen, 
and Frank Haas, who were present in the gallery. 
 

 The Chair thanked the commission members for their 
service. 
 

THIRD READING 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3886 (H.B. No. 1539, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that H.B. No. 1539, H.D. 2, 
S.D. 1, having been read throughout, pass Third Reading, 
seconded by Senator Keith-Agaran. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz then offered the following floor 
amendment (Floor Amendment No. 8) to H.B. No. 1539, 
H.D. 2, S.D. 1: 
 

 SECTION 1.  House Bill 1539, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, section 5, is 
amended to read as follows: 
 

 “SECTION 5.  This Act shall take effect on July 1, 2050.” 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Floor Amendment No. 8 be 
adopted, seconded by Senator Keith-Agaran. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz rose to speak in support of the amendment 
as follows: 
 

 “Your Committee on Ways and Means is requesting this floor 
amendment to defect the effective date.” 
 

 The motion to adopt Floor Amendment No. 8 was put by the 
Chair and carried. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz then moved that Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 3886 be received and placed on file, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried. 
 

 By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 1539, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, 
entitled: “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE 
SAFETY OF JUDICIARY PERSONNEL,” was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading on Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

H.B. No. 1600, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that H.B. No. 1600, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, having been read throughout, pass Third Reading, 
seconded by Senator Keith-Agaran. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz then offered the following floor 
amendment (Floor Amendment No. 5) to H.B. No. 1600, 
H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 SECTION 1.  House Bill No. 1600, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, is 
amended by deleting SECTION 3 found at page 1, line 8, to 
page 65, line 7, and inserting in its place a new SECTION 3 to 
read as follows: 
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 “SECTION 3.  APPROPRIATIONS.  The following sums, or 
so much thereof as may be sufficient to accomplish the 
purposes and programs designated herein, are hereby 
appropriated or authorized, as the case may be, from the means 
of financing specified to the expending agencies designated for 
the fiscal biennium beginning July 1, 2021 and ending June 30, 
2023.  The total expenditures and the number of positions in 
each fiscal year of the biennium shall not exceed the sums and 
the position ceilings indicated for each fiscal year, except as 
provided elsewhere in this Act, or as provided by general law.* 
 

 SECTION 2.  House Bill No. 1600, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, is 
amended by deleting SECTION 4 found at page 66, line 1 to 
page 109, line 6, and inserting in its place a new SECTION 4 to 
read as follows: 
 

 SECTION 4.  Part III of Act 88, Session Laws of Hawaii 
2021, is amended as follows: 
 1.  By adding nine new sections under the heading 
“ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT” to read as follows: 
 “SECTION 6.01.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for strategic marketing and support (BED100), 
the sum of $200,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary 
for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for international 
sister state relations with Hawaii's sister states in Japan; 
provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 6.02.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii technology development corporation 
(BED143), the sum of $3,500,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2021-2022 shall be expended for 
various grant programs and $1,000,000 or so much thereof as 
may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended 
for the state match to establish the Hawaii office of naval 
research grant program; provided further that the moneys 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided further that 
any moneys that remain unencumbered on June 30, 2023, shall 
lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 6.03.  Provided that out of the American Rescue 
Plan Act appropriations for the Hawaii community development 
authority (BED150), the sum of $13,874,350 or so much thereof 
as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended for infrastructure upgrades at Kalaeloa, Oahu, for 
needy families. 
 SECTION 6.04.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii housing finance and development 
corporation (BED160), the sum of $300,000,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended for the purposes for which the rental housing 
revolving fund was established; provided further that the 
moneys appropriated shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year 
for which the appropriation is made; provided further that any 
moneys that remain unencumbered on June 30, 2024, shall 
lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 6.05.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii housing finance and development 
corporation (BED160), the sum of $10,000,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended for the purposes of establishing an equity program to 
address the high, unmet demand of for-sale units by Hawaii 
residents, specifically those residents earning more than eighty 
per cent and up to one hundred twenty per cent of the area 
median income; provided further that the moneys appropriated 
shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the 
appropriation is made; provided further that any moneys that 
remain unencumbered on June 30, 2024, shall lapse on that 
date. 

 
* The table is identified as “ATTACHMENT A” to the 

Journal of this day. 

 SECTION 6.06.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii housing finance and development 
corporation (BED160), the sum of $5,000,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended for the purpose of providing, in whole or in part, 
loans to nonprofit community development financial institutions 
and nonprofit housing development organizations for the 
development of affordable homeownership housing projects; 
provided further that the moneys provided in this section shall 
not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the 
appropriation is made; provided further that any moneys that 
remain unencumbered on June 30, 2024, shall lapse on that 
date. 
 SECTION 6.07.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for agricultural resource management (AGR141), 
the sum of $26,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary 
for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended to repair and 
expand the spillway associated with the Wahiawa irrigation 
system and to bring the spillway into compliance with all 
relevant dam safety requirements and to acquire a fee simple 
interest in the spillway associated with the Wahiawa irrigation 
system; provided that the terms of sale shall be conditioned on 
an appraisal of the property pursuant to section 171-30, Hawaii 
Revised Statutes; provided further that the moneys provided for 
in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for 
which the appropriation is made; provided further that all 
moneys from the appropriation that are unencumbered as of 
June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 6.08.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for general administration for agriculture 
(AGR192), the sum of $100,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
agriculture workforce development program for agriculture 
licensure, credentials, and certificates; provided further that the 
department of agriculture shall partner with the department of 
education and the university of Hawaii community colleges in 
creating a pipeline for non-credit courses at the community 
colleges; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 6.09.    Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for fisheries management (LNR153), the sum of 
$1,327,059 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the payroll and 
operational costs of the division of fisheries 
management;  provided further that the department of land and 
natural resources shall continue to work with the department of 
agriculture on a pilot program at Wahiawa reservoir to 
implement Act 223, Session Laws of Hawaii 2021; provided 
further that any funds not expended or encumbered for this 
purpose shall lapse to the general fund June 30, 2023.” 
 2.  By adding after the new SECTION 6.09 added by item 1 
of this section, a new subject heading entitled 
“EMPLOYMENT” and a new section to read as follows: 
“EMPLOYMENT 
 SECTION 6.10.  Provided that out of the American Rescue 
Plan funds appropriation for office of community services 
(LBR903), the sum of $2,000,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for 
emergency food assistance programs in each county as follows; 
 

  (1)  City and county of Honolulu - $1,220,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; 
 

  (2)  County of Hawaii - $400,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; 
 

  (3)  County of Maui - $260,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; and 
 

  (4)  County of Kauai - $120,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; 
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provided further that funds shall only be awarded to The 
Emergency Food Assistance Program (TEFAP) of the Food and 
Nutrition Service of the United States Department of 
Agriculture-approved programs; provided further that any funds 
not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023.” 
 3.  By adding after the new SECTION 6.10 added by item 2 
of this section, a new subject heading entitled 
“TRANSPORTATION FACILITIES” and a new section to read 
as follows: 
“TRANSPORTATION FACILITIES 
 SECTION 6.11.  Provided that out of the special fund 
appropriation for highways administration (TRN595), the sum 
of $2,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the coordinated removal 
of albizia and other invasive trees that potentially threaten the 
public roadways and utility infrastructure on public and private 
land; provided further that the funds are matched on a two-to-
one basis from a public utilities source; provided further that 
any funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall 
lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023.” 
 4.  By adding after the new SECTION 6.11 added by item 3 
of this section, a new subject heading entitled 
“ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION” and a new section to 
read as follows: 
“ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
 SECTION 6.12.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for LNR – natural and physical environment 
(LNR906), the sum of $144,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023, including two permanent 
full-time equivalent (2.0 FTE) cultural resource specialist III 
positions, shall be expended for the Kahoolawe island reserve 
commission; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023.” 
 5.  By adding three new sections under the heading 
“HEALTH” to read as follows: 
  “SECTION 8.01.  Provided that of the special fund 
appropriation for Hawaii health systems corporation – regions 
(HTH212), the sum of $35,000,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for 
operating costs, including costs associated with four hundred 
forty full-time equivalent (440.0 FTE) pre-existing positions, 
for the Oahu region. 
 SECTION 8.02.  Provided that of the American Rescue Plan 
Act appropriation for Hawaii health systems corporation – 
regions (HTH212), the sum of $20,218,840 or so much thereof 
as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended for the Oahu region. 
 SECTION 8.03.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for state laboratory services (HTH710), the sum 
of $14,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for planning, design, 
repairs, renovation, and modernization of existing laboratories; 
provided further that the funds provided in this section shall not 
lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the appropriation is 
made; provided further that all moneys from the appropriation 
that are unexpended or unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall 
lapse as of that date.” 
 6.  By adding four new sections under the heading “SOCIAL 
SERVICES” to read as follows: 
  “SECTION 9.01.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for homeless services (HMS224), the sum of 
$2,567,200 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended for one permanent full-time 
equivalent (1.0 FTE) program specialist V position (SR24) and 
for the establishment, implementation, and administration of 
two homeless triage center pilot programs that serves as a crisis 
assessment and management center; provided further that any 
funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse 
to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 

 SECTION 9.02.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii public housing authority 
administration (HMS229), the sum of $1,500,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended by the Hawaii public housing authority to support the 
state rent supplement program; provided further that any funds 
not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 9.03.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii public housing authority 
administration (HMS229), the sum of $25,000,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended to rehabilitate, remodel, renovate, and repair at least 
two hundred fifty housing units; provided further that funds 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided further that 
all moneys from the appropriation that are unexpended or 
unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 9.04.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for general administration – DHS (HMS904), the 
sum of $15,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the ohana zones 
pilot program established pursuant to Act 209, Session Laws of 
Hawaii 2018, as amended by Act 128, Session Laws of Hawaii 
2019, including expenses relating to staffing, facility 
construction, provision of services, and administrative costs; 
provided further that the funds provided in this section shall not 
lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the appropriation is 
made; provided further that all moneys from the appropriation 
that are unexpended or unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall 
lapse as of that date.” 
 7.  By adding forty-five new sections under the heading 
“FORMAL EDUCATION” to read as follows: 
  “SECTION 17.01.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for school-based budgeting (EDN100), the sum of 
$461,289 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 
2022-2023 shall be expended for workforce development 
opportunities in career and technical education programs, 
including five permanent full-time equivalent (5.0 FTE) 
positions to be housed within the office of the superintendent; 
provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.02.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for school-based budgeting (EDN100), the sum of 
$1,850,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended to provide increased 
custodial services during the summer months; provided further 
that any funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose 
shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.03.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for special education and student support services 
(EDN150), the sum of $7,148,647 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for 
special education and student support services, including 
eighteen permanent full-time equivalent (18.0 FTE) registered 
professional nurse V positions; provided further that the 
department of education shall establish licensed practical nurse 
and registered nurse positions in the school list of approved 
positions that may be purchased by principals for school level 
services; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.04.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for special education and student support services 
(EDN150), the sum of $103,163 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
development, maintenance, and enhancement of alternative 
learning programs, including one permanent full-time 
equivalent (1.0 FTE) educational specialist III position to 
support the state alternative learning programs through 
collaboration with complex area superintendents and school 
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principals to develop and implement plans for alternative 
learning programs, facilitation of the guidance committee, 
coordination of professional development and workforce 
development opportunities, and the collection of data for 
reporting purposes; provided further that any funds not 
expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.05.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for special education and student support services 
(EDN150), the sum of $1,278,590 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
high core alternative learning program to support the 
implementation of alternative learning programs for students 
who demonstrate academic, behavioral, and social-emotional 
challenges, which requires additional support services within a 
smaller learning setting that individualize academic 
interventions, behavior supports, and workforce development 
opportunities, including eleven and one-half permanent full-
time equivalent (11.5 FTE) positions; provided further that the 
funds be directly allocated to the Leilehua-Mililani-Waialua 
complex area within the department of education's 18863 
budget program account; provided further that any funds not 
expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.06.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for instructional support (EDN200), the sum of 
$560,154 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 
2022-2023 shall be expended for the department of education to 
develop a statewide kindergarten readiness assessment pursuant 
to Act 210, Session Laws of Hawaii 2021, and section 302A-
1165, Hawaii Revised Statutes, to the legislature no later than 
thirty days prior to the convening of the regular session of 2023; 
provided further that the department of education shall submit 
the statewide kindergarten readiness assessment and data 
findings on the implementation results to the legislature no later 
than thirty days prior to the convening of the regular session of 
2023; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.07.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for instructional support (EDN200), the sum of 
$103,163 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 
2022-2023 shall be expended for the coordination and support 
of the Perkins V federal career and technical education program 
with workforce development programs; provided further that 
any funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall 
lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.08.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for instructional support (EDN200), the sum of 
$1,200,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the grow our own 
teachers initiative; provided further that of the general fund 
appropriation, $300,000 shall be prioritized for candidates who 
teach Hawaiian immersion or comply with the requirements set 
forth in the memorandum of understanding between the 
department of education and the university of Hawaii for the 
grow our own program; provided further that any funds 
unexpended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.09.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for state administration (EDN300), the sum of 
$16,134,014 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for 
which the appropriation is made; provided further that any 
moneys that remain unexpended or unencumbered on June 30, 
2024, shall lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 17.10.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$6,364,830 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended within four complex areas; 
Kauai; Maui (Molokai); Hawaii island (Honokaa-Kealakehe, 

Kohala, Konawaena); and Leilehua-Mililani-Waialua for the 
purpose of a pilot greenhouse(s) for sustainability and 
agriculture training, including robotics and other agricultural 
technology training; provided that, to the extent practicable, the 
greenhouse(s) shall be adjacent to agricultural production 
centers and shall develop capacity for future farming and 
farmers; provided further that the moneys provided in this 
section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the 
appropriation is made; provided further that any moneys that 
remain unexpended or unencumbered on June 30, 2024, shall 
lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 17.11.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$1,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended to provide menstrual 
products free of charge to all students on all public school 
campuses; provided further that any funds unexpended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.12.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$6,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for an agriculture innovation 
center on Kauai; provided that moneys provided in this section 
shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the 
appropriation is made; provided that all moneys from the 
appropriation that are unexpended or unencumbered as of 
June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.13.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$15,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for the purpose of securing a 
maintenance base yard; provided further that the moneys 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided that all 
moneys from the appropriation that are unexpended or 
unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.14.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$45,500,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for centralized kitchens on 
Oahu for the farm-to-school program; provided that the moneys 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided that all 
moneys from the appropriation that are unexpended or 
unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.15.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$2,500,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for the purpose of securing 
and renovating a permanent facility for the Papahana o Kainoa 
alternative learning center; provided further that the moneys 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided that all 
moneys from the appropriation that are unexpended or 
unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.16.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$8,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for the Center for Workforce 
Excellence; provided that the moneys provided in this section 
shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the 
appropriation is made; provided that all moneys from the 
appropriation that are unexpended or unencumbered as of 
June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.17.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$13,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for securing, renovating, or 
improving a permanent facility for the high core alternative 
learning center; provided further that the moneys provided in 
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this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which 
the appropriation is made; provided further that all moneys 
from the appropriation that are unexpended or unencumbered as 
of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.18.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$453,940,455 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall not lapse at the end of the year for which 
the appropriation is made; provided further that any moneys 
that remain unexpended or unencumbered on June 30, 2024, 
shall lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 17.19.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for public libraries (EDN407), the sum of 
$1,933,365 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for various repairs and 
maintenance including but not limited to roofing, paving, 
window tinting, and other improvements and maintenance; 
provided further that the moneys provided in this section shall 
not lapse at the end of the fiscal year for which the 
appropriation is made; provided that all moneys from the 
appropriation that are unexpended or unencumbered as of 
June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.20.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school facilities agency (EDN450), the sum of 
$2,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022 shall be expended for the plans, designs, 
construction, and renovation of preschool facilities; provided 
further that the moneys provided in this section shall not lapse 
at the end of the fiscal year for which the appropriation is made; 
provided that all moneys from the appropriation that are 
unexpended or unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse 
as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.21.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school community services (EDN500), the 
sum of $200,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2021-2022 shall be expended for adult workforce 
readiness programs, including for two permanent full-time 
equivalent (2.0 FTE) workforce development coordinators 
positions for McKinley community school for adults and 
Waipahu community school for adults; provided further that any 
funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse 
to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.22.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for charter schools commission and 
administration (EDN612), the sum of $97,202 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended to hire one full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) position to 
ensure compliance by public charter schools with this Act and 
Title IX of the federal Education Amendments of 1972, as 
amended; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.23.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $983,847 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended by the 
Hawaii P-20 partnerships for education office; provided further 
that the Hawaii P-20 partnerships for education office 
coordinates statewide workforce development initiatives, aligns 
education pathways with state departmental employment needs, 
and regional economic development and career opportunities, 
including programs in the department of education, the 
university of Hawaii, the department of labor and industrial 
relations, the department of human resources development, and 
the department of business, economic development, and 
tourism; provided further that Hawaii P-20 partnerships for 
education office shall submit a report to the legislature of the 
coordination, alignment, shared metrics, and resulting impacts 
of statewide career technical education, college and career 
readiness, college and career pathways, workforce 
development, and training opportunities no later than thirty days 

prior to the convening of the regular session of 2023; provided 
further that the funds provided in this section not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.24.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, Manoa (UOH100), the 
sum of $381,767 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended to increase the State's 
capacity to train new nurses and project future nursing 
workforce needs; provided further that no funds provided in this 
section shall be expended unless the nursing program at the 
university of Hawaii, west Oahu is first reinstated; provided 
further that any funds not expended or encumbered for this 
purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.25.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, Hilo (UOH210), the sum 
of $532,150 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended to increase the State's 
capacity to train new nurses and project future nursing 
workforce needs; provided further that no funds provided in this 
section shall be expended unless the nursing program at the 
university of Hawaii, west Oahu is first reinstated; provided 
further that any funds not expended or encumbered for this 
purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.26.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $2,542,572 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended to 
increase the State's capacity to train new nurses and project 
future nursing workforce needs; provided further that no funds 
provided in this section shall be expended unless the nursing 
program at the university of Hawaii, west Oahu is first 
reinstated; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.27.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $303,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
operating expenses of the culinary institute of the Pacific; 
provided that the university of Hawaii shall raise new moneys 
for the remainder of the other current expenses in the amount of 
$376,677; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.28.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $2,650,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
early college program; provided that the early college program 
shall target at-promise youth with a focus on career and 
technical education and workforce development; provided 
further that any funds not expended or encumbered for this 
purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.29.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $4,800,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
Hawaii promise program; provided that Hawaii promise 
program scholarships shall cover not more than ninety per cent 
of unmet needs; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.30.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $1,540,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for 
workforce development programs; provided further that the 
workforce development programs funded by this section shall 
focus on non-credit workforce training; provided further that 
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any funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall 
lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.31.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $1,538,980 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
Wahiawa value-added product development center; provided 
that the Wahiawa value-added product development center shall 
prioritize services for products made in or sourced from Hawaii; 
provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.32.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $645,134 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
learn and earn program; provided further that the learn and earn 
program shall be implemented with the hub and spoke model 
and shall focus on healthcare and agriculture pathways; 
provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.33.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $800,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
Waikiki adaptation and resilience plan by the university of 
Hawaii community design center; provided further that any 
funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse 
to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.34.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, Manoa (UOH100), the 
sum of $300,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the homeless data 
clearinghouse by the center on the family; provided further that 
any funds not expended or encumbered for this purpose shall 
lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.35.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $800,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
university of Hawaii community design center to conduct a 
study to create an inclusive and fair criminal legal system 
devoted to restoration and healing, particularly addressing the 
disparate challenges facing Native Hawaiians, Pacific Islander 
communities, and people of color in the criminal legal system; 
provided that in developing the Hookaulike plan, the 
community design center shall work with the department of 
public safety, other state law enforcement, the department of 
human services, the department of the attorney general, the 
judiciary, the county police departments, county prosecuting 
attorney offices, the Hawaii paroling authority, and community 
stakeholders; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.36.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $800,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
university of Hawaii community design center to conduct a 
statewide cultural heritage study; provided that in developing 
the cultural heritage study, the community design center shall 
work with the state foundation on culture and arts and Hawaiian 
museums; provided further that the study shall begin with the 
State of Hawaii Museum of Monarchy History (Iolani Palace); 
provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.37.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $800,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
university of Hawaii community design center to conduct a 
study on the spectrum of supportive housing for Hawaii; 

provided that in developing this housing study, the community 
design center shall work with the Hawaii public housing 
authority, the Hawaii housing finance development corporation, 
the department of Hawaiian home lands, the department of 
health, the Hawaii state hospital, and the department of human 
services; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.38.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $800,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
university of Hawaii community design center to conduct a 
study on statewide centralized kitchen for the farm-to-school 
program; provided that in developing this farm-to-school study, 
the community design center shall work with the department of 
education, the department of agriculture, and the agribusiness 
development corporation; provided further that any funds not 
expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.39.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $1,000,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
university of Hawaii community design center to develop a 
master plan that identifies the priorities for physical 
improvements for the department of education school 
campuses; provided that in developing the these school campus 
plans, the community design center shall work with the 
department of education; provided further that any funds not 
expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.40.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, Manoa (UOH100), the 
sum of $1,598,905 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended by the university of 
Hawaii college of engineering to study the impact of sandbag 
walls or “sand burritos” on sand movement patterns and coastal 
erosion and on public trust resources, including beach access, 
coastal water quality, and recreation, at Ehukai beach park, 
including from the shoreline area near Ke Iki road to Sunset 
beach; provided further that the university of Hawaii college of 
engineering shall submit a report of its findings and 
recommendations, including any proposed legislation, to the 
legislature no later than twenty days prior to the convening of 
the regular session of 2025; provided further that the moneys 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided further that 
any moneys that remain unexpended or unencumbered on 
June 30, 2024, shall lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 17.41.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, Manoa (UOH100), the 
sum of $2,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended by the university of 
Hawaii college of engineering to conduct traffic studies in Puna 
on the island of Hawaii; provided further that the county of 
Hawaii shall provide not less than a $500,000 match for this 
purpose; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 17.42.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, community colleges 
(UOH800), the sum of $51,450,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for 
projects including but not limited to various repairs, 
maintenance, and improvements of facilities, equipment, 
infrastructure, utilities, and existing buildings; provided further 
that funds provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of 
the fiscal year for which the appropriation is made; provided 
further that all moneys from the appropriation that are 
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unexpended or unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse 
as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.43.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for university of Hawaii, systemwide support 
(UOH900), the sum of $88,083,334 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended on 
systemwide projects including various repairs, maintenance, 
and improvements to facilities, equipment, infrastructure, 
utilities, and existing buildings; provided further that funds 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided further that 
all moneys from the appropriation that are unexpended or 
unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.44.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school-based budgeting (EDN100), the sum of 
$104,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be expended by the office of the 
superintendent for workforce readiness programs; provided that 
the moneys provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of 
the fiscal year for which the appropriation is made; provided 
further that all moneys from the appropriation that are 
unexpended or unencumbered as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse 
as of that date. 
 SECTION 17.45.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for school support (EDN400), the sum of 
$21,300,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2022-2023 shall be deposited into the Hawaii 3R's school 
improvement fund pursuant to section 302A-1502.4, Hawaii 
Revised Statutes.” 
 8.  By adding after the new SECTION 17.45 added by item 7 
of this section, a new subject heading entitled “CULTURE 
AND RECREATION” and two new sections to read as follows: 
“CULTURE AND RECREATION 
 SECTION 17.46.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for spectator events and shows – Aloha Stadium 
(AGS889), the sum of $50,000,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be deposited into 
the stadium development special fund, to be expended for 
stadium costs for operations, maintenance, and contract costs to 
developers.     SECTION 17.47.  Provided that out of the 
general fund appropriation for spectator events and shows – 
Aloha Stadium (AGS889), the sum of $350,000,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall not 
lapse at the end of the year for which the appropriation is made; 
provided further that any moneys that remain unencumbered on 
June 30, 2024, shall lapse on that date.” 
 9.  By adding two new sections under the heading “PUBLIC 
SAFETY” to read as follows: 
  “SECTION 18.01.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii emergency management agency 
(DEF118), the sum of $17,800,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
purpose of acquiring Mililani Tech Park Lot 17721, Lot 17722, 
Lot 937, Lot 938, and Lot 939-B; provided further that the 
moneys provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the 
fiscal year for which the appropriation is made; provided further 
that any moneys that remain unencumbered on June 30, 2024, 
shall lapse on that date. 
 SECTION 18.02.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for Hawaii emergency management agency 
(DEF118), the sum of $35,000,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for the 
purpose of improving infrastructure, construction, designs, 
equipment, and site plans; provided further that the moneys 
provided in this section shall not lapse at the end of the fiscal 
year for which the appropriation is made; provided further that 
any moneys that remain unencumbered on June 30, 2024, shall 
lapse on that date.” 
 10.  By adding five new sections under the heading 
“GOVERNMENT-WIDE SUPPORT” to read as follows: 

  “SECTION 21.01.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for public works – planning, design, and 
construction (AGS221), the sum of $28,000,000 or so much 
thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be 
expended for plans, designs, equipment, and construction for 
infrastructure and warehouses; provided further that the moneys 
provided for in this section shall not lapse at the end of the 
fiscal year for which the appropriation is made; provided further 
that all moneys from the appropriation that are unencumbered 
as of June 30, 2024, shall lapse as of that date. 
 SECTION 21.02.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for legal services (ATG100), the sum of $834,000 
or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-
2023 shall be expended for special investigations and 
prosecutions and to fund the following positions: 
 

  (1)  Two permanent, full-time equivalent (2.0 FTE) deputy 
attorney general positions; 
 

  (2)  Three permanent, full-time equivalent (3.0 FTE) 
forensic analysist positions; 
 

  (3)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) legal 
assistant position; 
 

  (4)  Two permanent, full-time equivalent (2.0 FTE) 
investigator positions; 
 

  (5)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) legal 
clerk position; and 
 

  (6)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) deputy 
attorney general position; 
 

provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 21.03.  Provided that out of the general fund 
appropriation for legal services (ATG100), the sum of $754,000 
or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-
2023 shall be expended for the operations of human and sex 
trafficking services and to fund the following positions: 
 

  (1)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) 
supervising deputy attorney general position; 
 

  (2)  Two permanent, full-time equivalent (2.0 FTE) deputy 
attorney general positions; 
 

  (3)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) human 
trafficking abatement coordinator position; 
 

  (4)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) human 
services professional position; 
 

  (5)  Two permanent, full-time equivalent (2.0 FTE) 
investigator positions; 
 

  (6)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) legal 
assistant position; and 
 

  (7)  One permanent, full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) legal 
clerk position, 
 

provided further that any funds not expended or encumbered for 
this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on June 30, 2023. 
 SECTION 21.04.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for legal services (ATG100), the sum of $483,000 
or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-
2023 shall be expended for the law enforcement standards 
board, including one permanent full-time equivalent (1.0 FTE) 
executive director position exempt from chapter 76, Hawaii 
Revised Statutes, and one permanent full-time equivalent (1.0 
FTE) secretary position subject to chapter 76, Hawaii Revised 
Statutes; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund on 
June 30, 2023. 
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 SECTION 21.05.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for enterprise technology services - operations 
and infrastructure maintenance (AGS131), the sum of $144,000 
or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-
2023 shall be expended for one permanent full-time equivalent 
(1.0 FTE) chief data officer exempt from chapter 76, Hawaii 
Revised Statutes.” 
 11.  By amending section 11 to read as follows: 
  “SECTION 11.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for school-based budgeting (EDN100), the sum of 
$611,450 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 
2021-2022, and out of the general fund appropriation for special 
education and student support services (EDN150), the [same] 
sum of $728,469, or so much thereof as may be necessary for 
fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended for Papahana `O 
Kainoa to support the implementation of alternative learning 
programs[,] for students who demonstrate academic, behavioral, 
and social-emotional challenges that require additional support 
services within a smaller learning setting that individualize 
academic interventions, behavior supports, and workforce 
development opportunities, including [for 
seven] eight permanent full-time equivalent [(7.0 FTE)] (8.0 
FTE) positions; provided further that the funds shall be directly 
allocated to the Nanakuli-Waianae complex area in the 
department of education's 18865 budget program 
account; provided further that any funds not expended or 
encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the general fund.” 
 12.  By amending section 14 to read as follows: 
  “SECTION 14.  Provided that of the general fund 
appropriation for instructional support (EDN200), the sum of 
$3,000,000 or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal 
year 2021-2022, and out of the general fund appropriation for 
special education and student support services (EDN150), the 
[same] sum of $6,000,000 or so much thereof as may be 
necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023 shall be expended by the 
areas to [establish alternative learning centers to provide 
identified secondary students with opportunities for student-
centered engaged and supported learning environments] create 
alternative learning programs for students who demonstrate 
academic, behavioral, and social-emotional challenges that 
require additional support services within a smaller learning 
setting that individualize academic interventions, behavior 
supports, and workforce development opportunities, including 
but not limited to facilities, equipment, properties, operating 
expenses, and personnel, as follows: 
 

  (1)  Kauai [District]- $1,000,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2021-2022 and the same sum or so 
much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-
2023; provided further that the funds shall be directly allocated 
to the Kauai district for deposit into a new account and 
expended to create alternative learning programs for students 
who demonstrate academic, behavioral, and social-emotional 
challenges that require additional support services within a 
smaller learning setting that individualize academic 
interventions, behavior supports, and workforce development 
opportunities; 
 

  (2)  East Hawaii [District]- $1,000,000 or so much thereof 
as may be necessary for fiscal year 2021-2022 and the same 
sum or so much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 
2022-2023; provided further that the funds shall be directly 
allocated to the East Hawaii district for deposit into a new 
account and expended to create alternative learning programs 
for students who demonstrate academic, behavioral, and social-
emotional challenges that require additional support services 
within a smaller learning setting that individualize academic 
interventions, behavior supports, and workforce development 
opportunities; 
 

  (3)  Maui [District]- $1,000,000 or so much thereof as may 
be necessary for fiscal year 2021-2022 and the same sum or so 

much thereof as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-
2023; provided further that the funds shall be directly allocated 
to the Maui district for deposit into a new account and expended 
to create alternative learning programs for students who 
demonstrate academic, behavioral, and social-emotional 
challenges that require additional support services within a 
smaller learning setting that individualize academic 
interventions, behavior supports, and workforce development 
opportunities; 
 

  (4)  Campbell[,] - Kapolei[,] and Pearl City[, and] - Waipahu 
[Complexes] complex areas - $1,000,000 or so much thereof as 
may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; provided further 
that the funds shall be directly allocated to the Campbell[,] -
 Kapolei[,] and Pearl City[, and] - Waipahu complex areas for 
deposit into a new account and expended to create alternative 
learning programs for students who demonstrate academic, 
behavioral, and social-emotional challenges that require 
additional support services within a smaller learning setting that 
individualize academic interventions, behavior supports, and 
workforce development opportunities; 
 

  (5)  West Hawaii [District]- $1,000,000 or so much thereof 
as may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; provided further 
that the funds shall be directly allocated to the West Hawaii 
district for deposit into a new account and expended to create 
alternative learning programs for students who demonstrate 
academic, behavioral, and social-emotional challenges that 
require additional support services within a smaller learning 
setting that individualize academic interventions, behavior 
supports, and workforce development opportunities; and 
 

  (6)  Honolulu [District]- $1,000,000 or so much thereof as 
may be necessary for fiscal year 2022-2023; provided further 
that the funds shall be directly allocated to the Honolulu district 
for deposit into a new account and expended to create 
alternative learning programs for students who demonstrate 
academic, behavioral, and social-emotional challenges which 
requires additional support services within a smaller learning 
setting that individualize academic interventions, behavior 
supports, and workforce development opportunities, 
 

provided further that each district/complex area that receives 
funding pursuant to this section shall allocate special education 
personnel, including behavioral health specialists and/or 
educational assistants; provided further that any funds not 
expended or encumbered for this purpose shall lapse to the 
general fund[.] on June 30, 2023.” 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Floor Amendment No. 5 be 
adopted, seconded by Senator Keith-Agaran. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz rose to speak in support of the amendment 
as follows: 
 

 “Your Committee on Ways and Means is requesting this floor 
amendment to amend various sections of the budget bill. 
Specifically, the floor amendment proposes to make corrections 
in the S.D. 1.” 
 

 The motion to adopt Floor Amendment No. 5 was put by the 
Chair and carried. 
 

 By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 1600, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, 
entitled: “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE STATE 
BUDGET,” was placed on the calendar for Third Reading on 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3897 (H.B. No. 1570, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 Senator Baker moved that H.B. No. 1570, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, 
having been read throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by 
Senator Dela Cruz. 
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 Senator Baker then offered the following floor amendment 
(Floor Amendment No. 6) to H.B. No. 1570, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 SECTION 1.  House Bill No. 1570, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, is 
amended by amending the effective date from July 1, 2050, to 
July 1, 2022, in section 6 and to read as follows: 
 

 “SECTION 6.  This Act shall take effect on July 1, 2022.” 
 

 Senator Baker rose to speak in support of the amendment as 
follows: 
 

 “This measure provides a clean effective date, and we 
believe that it is in the public’s best interest to move this 
measure along as expeditiously as possible. Mahalo.” 
 

 Senator Baker moved that Floor Amendment No. 6 be 
adopted, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz. 
 

 The motion to adopt Floor Amendment No. 6 was put by the 
Chair and carried. 
 

 Senator Baker then moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3897 
be received and placed on file, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz 
and carried. 
 

 By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 1570, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, 
entitled: “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE YOUTH 
VAPING EPIDEMIC,” was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading on Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3961 (H.B. No. 1775, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that H.B. No. 1775, H.D. 2, 
S.D. 2, having been read throughout, pass Third Reading, 
seconded by Senator Rhoads. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz then offered the following floor 
amendment (Floor Amendment No. 7) to H.B. No. 1775, 
H.D. 2, S.D. 2: 
 

 SECTION 1.  House Bill No. 1775, S.D. 2, section 2, is 
amended as follows:  
 

 1.  By inserting a definition of “state educational program or 
activity” at page 6, line 10, to read: 
 

 ““State educational program or activity” means an 
educational program or activity of the University of Hawaii, the 
department of education, or public charter schools.” 
 

 2.  By amending page 6, lines 13-17, to read: 
 

      “§368D-     Annual report to legislature.  No later than 
September 1 of each year, each state educational program or 
activity shall submit to the legislature a report that includes 
information pertaining to the immediately preceding school 
year, as follows:” 
 

 3.   By deleting the requirement that all public charter 
schools submit their annual report on violations of 
Chapter 368D, Hawaii Revised Statutes, or Title IX to the State 
Public Charter School Commission, found at page 11, lines 11-
15. 
 

 SECTION 2.  House Bill No. 1775, S.D. 2, section 3, is 
amended by deleting the proposed subsection (d) at page 14, 
lines 4 through 6. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Floor Amendment No. 7 be 
adopted, seconded by Senator Rhoads. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz rose to speak in support of the amendment 
as follows: 
 

 “In an abundance of caution, your Committee on Ways and 
Means is requesting this floor amendment to better align the 
measure being reported out of the Committee with the 
amendments as they were announced at the time of passage.” 

 The motion to adopt Floor Amendment No. 7 was put by the 
Chair and carried. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz then moved that Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 3961 be received and placed on file, seconded by Senator 
Rhoads and carried. 
 

 By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 1775, H.D. 2, S.D. 3, 
entitled: “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CIVIL 
RIGHTS,” was placed on the calendar for Third Reading on 
Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3841 (H.B. No. 1953, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3841 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1953, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CONCESSIONS,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3842 (H.B. No. 2119, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3842 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2119, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENT ASSISTANCE COMPACT,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3843 (H.B. No. 2240, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3843 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2240, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO OTHER POST-
EMPLOYMENT BENEFITS,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3844 (H.B. No. 1903, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3844 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1903, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO DATA ABOUT SNORKELS 
AND MASKS,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

H.B. No. 2337, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, H.B. No. 2337, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HIGHWAY 
SAFETY,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading 
on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3848 (H.B. No. 1575, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Baker, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3848 was adopted and H.B. 
No. 1575, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO PHYSICIAN ASSISTANTS,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
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Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3849 (H.B. No. 1980, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Baker, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3849 was adopted and H.B. 
No. 1980, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TELEPHONIC SERVICES,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3850 (H.B. No. 1644, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Baker, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3850 was adopted and H.B. 
No. 1644, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3851 (H.B. No. 1635, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Baker, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3851 was adopted and H.B. 
No. 1635, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO HEALTH CARE,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3852 (H.B. No. 2169, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3852 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2169, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE COMPREHENSIVE 
OFFENDER REENTRY SYSTEM,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3854 (H.B. No. 1991, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3854 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1991, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CONSUMER PROTECTION,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3856 (H.B. No. 1841, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3856 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1841, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE JUDICIARY,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3859 (H.B. No. 1932, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3859 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1932, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CHILD WELFARE 
SERVICES,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3860 (H.B. No. 2020, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3860 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2020, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HOUSING,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3861 (H.B. No. 2061, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3861 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2061, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE ANIMAL INDUSTRY 
SPECIAL FUND,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3862 (H.B. No. 2062, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3862 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2062, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO AGRICULTURAL LOANS,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3863 (H.B. No. 2098, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3863 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2098, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT 
COST ITEMS,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3864 (H.B. No. 2233, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3864 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2233, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TEMPORARY ASSISTANCE 
FOR NEEDY FAMILIES,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3866 (H.B. No. 2421, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3866 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2421, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO WOMEN’S COURT,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3869 (H.B. No. 980, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3869 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 980, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO ADULT PROTECTIVE 
SERVICES,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
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Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3871 (H.B. No. 1497, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3871 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1497, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO INVASIVE SPECIES,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3872 (H.B. No. 1550, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3872 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1550, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII MEDICAL 
EDUCATION SPECIAL FUND,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3873 (H.B. No. 1568, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3873 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1568, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO AGRICULTURE,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3874 (H.B. No. 1579, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3874 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1579, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading 
on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3876 (H.B. No. 1688, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3876 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1688, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO REGISTRATION OF 
VEHICLES,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3877 (H.B. No. 1711, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3877 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1711, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading 
on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3878 (H.B. No. 1741, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3878 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1741, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CHILDREN AND FAMILY OF 
INCARCERATED INDIVIDUALS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3879 (H.B. No. 1759, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3879 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1759, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO LEGAL SERVICES FOR LOW-
INCOME IMMIGRANTS,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3880 (H.B. No. 1762, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3880 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1762, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO LANGUAGE ACCESS,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3882 (H.B. No. 1828, H.D. 3, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3882 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1828, H.D. 3, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE TAXATION BOARD OF 
REVIEW,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading 
on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3884 (H.B. No. 1883, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3884 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1883, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO ELECTIONS,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3887 (H.B. No. 1548, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3887 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1548, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO GRADUATE MEDICAL 
EDUCATION,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

H.B. No. 1888, H.D. 2, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, H.B. No. 1888, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ELECTIONEERING COMMUNICATIONS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

H.B. No. 1147, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, H.B. No. 1147, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE STATE BUDGET,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
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H.B. No. 1540, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, H.B. No. 1540, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO STATE BONDS,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

H.B. No. 2179, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, H.B. No. 2179, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO COLLECTION OF 
DELINQUENT TAXES,” having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3899 (H.B. No. 1239, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3899 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1239, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO LAW ENFORCEMENT,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3900 (H.B. No. 137, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3900 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 137, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO LIQUOR,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3901 (H.B. No. 986, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3901 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 986, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO NEWBORN HEARING SCREENING,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3902 (H.B. No. 987, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3902 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 987, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO HEARING AND VISION PROGRAM,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3903 (H.B. No. 1413, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3903 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1413, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO ABANDONED VEHICLES,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3905 (H.B. No. 1434, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3905 was adopted and 

H.B. No. 1434, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE COUNTIES,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3906 (H.B. No. 1672, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3906 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1672, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO SPECIAL IMPROVEMENT 
DISTRICTS,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3908 (H.B. No. 1758, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3908 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1758, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO NURSES,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3909 (H.B. No. 1787, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3909 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1787, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3910 (H.B. No. 1917, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3910 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1917, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO AFFORDABLE HOUSING,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3912 (H.B. No. 2076, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3912 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2076, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO TOBACCO MANUFACTURER 
QUALIFIED ESCROW FUNDS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3913 (H.B. No. 2141, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3913 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2141, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO REPORTS TO THE LEGISLATURE 
FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3914 (H.B. No. 2312, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3914 was adopted and 
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H.B. No. 2312, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PRISON REFORM,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3915 (H.B. No. 2405, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3915 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2405, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3918 (H.B. No. 1436, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3918 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1436, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO DEVELOPMENT RIGHTS,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3920 (H.B. No. 2225, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3920 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2225, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HAWAII TECHNOLOGY 
DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3921 (H.B. No. 2339, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3921 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2339, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT MAKING AN EMERGENCY 
APPROPRIATION TO THE STATE DRUG AND ALCOHOL 
TOXICOLOGY TESTING LABORATORY SPECIAL FUND,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3923 (H.B. No. 2515, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3923 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2515, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading 
on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3924 (H.B. No. 1552, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3924 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1552, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE STADIUM 
DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3925 (H.B. No. 1561, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3925 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1561, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO EDUCATION,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3927 (H.B. No. 1893, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3927 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1893, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE OAHU REGIONAL 
HEALTH CARE SYSTEM,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3928 (H.B. No. 2120, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3928 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2120, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENT,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3931 (H.B. No. 2338, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3931 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2338, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE STATE DRUG AND 
ALCOHOL TOXICOLOGY TESTING LABORATORY,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3932 (H.B. No. 2399, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3932 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2399, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO WASTE MANAGEMENT,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3934 (H.B. No. 2159, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3934 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2159, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO WORKFORCE DEVELOPMENT 
BOARDS,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading 
on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3935 (H.B. No. 1536, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3935 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1536, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE JUDICIARY,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
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Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3937 (H.B. No. 1982, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3937 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1982, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TAXES,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3939 (H.B. No. 2195, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3939 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2195, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CESSPOOLS,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3940 (H.B. No. 2307, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3940 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2307, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO FOOD SAFETY,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3941 (H.B. No. 2329, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3941 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2329, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HISTORIC PRESERVATION,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3942 (H.B. No. 2475, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3942 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2475, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO STATE HOLIDAYS,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3943 (H.B. No. 2511, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3943 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2511, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HAWAIIAN HOME LANDS,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3945 (H.B. No. 956, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3945 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 956, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO STATEWIDE 
INTEROPERABLE PUBLIC SAFETY 
COMMUNICATIONS,” having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3946 (H.B. No. 1179, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3946 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1179, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO INVASIVE SPECIES,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3947 (H.B. No. 1488, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3947 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1488, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO RESIDENCE FOR TUITION 
PURPOSES,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3948 (H.B. No. 1586, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3948 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1586, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO DISASTER RESPONSE,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3949 (H.B. No. 1587, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3949 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1587, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO AN INTRASTATE MUTUAL 
AID SYSTEM,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3950 (H.B. No. 1588, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3950 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1588, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HAZARD MITIGATION,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3951 (H.B. No. 1829, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3951 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1829, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO BONDS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3953 (H.B. No. 1974, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3953 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1974, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO PROCUREMENT,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
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Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3955 (H.B. No. 1653, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3955 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1653, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO AQUATIC RESOURCES,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3956 (H.B. No. 1712, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3956 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1712, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO AGRICULTURAL LANDS,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3957 (H.B. No. 2423, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3957 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2423, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO CLIMATE CHANGE MITIGATION,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3959 (H.B. No. 2248, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3959 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2248, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO SCHOOLS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3962 (H.B. No. 1992, H.D. 3, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3962 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1992, H.D. 3, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE ENVIRONMENT,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3968 (H.B. No. 2309, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3968 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2309, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO INCARCERATION,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

H.B. No. 2197, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, H.B. No. 2197, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
GAMBLING,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Fevella).  Noes, 
none.  

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3853 (H.B. No. 2422, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3853 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2422, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO SENTENCING,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Fevella, Gabbard, 
Ihara, Moriwaki).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3855 (H.B. No. 1823, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Baker, seconded by Senator Rhoads 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3855 was adopted and H.B. 
No. 1823, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO HEALTH,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 21; Ayes with Reservations (Dela Cruz, Misalucha).  
Noes, 4 (Fevella, Gabbard, Kim, Riviere).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3857 (H.B. No. 1872, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3857 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1872, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO SUSTAINABILITY,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Riviere).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3858 (H.B. No. 1885, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3858 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1885, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO GOVERNMENT DATA,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3865 (H.B. No. 2288, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3865 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2288, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO LAND,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Ihara, Moriwaki).  Noes, 
none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3867 (H.B. No. 2471, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3867 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 2471, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Keith-
Agaran. 
 

 Senator Taniguchi rose to speak in support of the measure as 
follows: 
 

 “Colleagues, this measure relates to the unemployment 
compensation program and amends the experience rating 
provisions of the Hawaii Employment Security Law. Because 
our unemployment insurance system is based solely on 
employer contributions to keep the UI Trust Fund afloat, in 
normal times, employers would have been statutorily required 
to cover over $1 billion in unemployment insurance payouts 
over the time of the pandemic. 
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 “House Bill 2471 is an effort to help employers by amending 
the definition of ‘adequate reserve fund’ to exclude the times of 
record high unemployment rates from the calculation of rates. 
The effect of this will result in an average savings of $365 per 
employee in 2023 and an average savings of $668 per employee 
for 2024. In combination with last year’s $747 million 
unemployment insurance loan repayment by the State to the 
federal government, the primary purpose of this bill this year is 
to keep employers in business and to help them survive the last 
two years of struggle. I urge my colleagues to vote in support of 
House Bill 2471. Thank you.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3867 was adopted and H.B. No. 2471, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE 
ADEQUATE RESERVE FUND,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3868 (H.B. No. 2512, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3868 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2512, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO OHANA ZONES,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3870 (H.B. No. 1658, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Rhoads and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3870 was adopted 
and H.B. No. 1658, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE TRANSFER OF NON-
AGRICULTURAL PARK LANDS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Fevella, Ihara).  
Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3875 (H.B. No. 1682, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3875 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1682, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE ISSUANCE OF SPECIAL 
PURPOSE REVENUE BONDS TO ASSIST NEXT LEVEL 
SOLUTIONS GROUP INC.,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 22; Ayes with Reservations (Ihara, Kim, Moriwaki, 
Riviere).  Noes, 2 (Acasio, Fevella).  Excused, 1 (Keohokalole).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3881 (H.B. No. 1798, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3881 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1798, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO SPECIAL PURPOSE 
REVENUE BONDS FOR ASSISTING NOT-FOR-PROFIT 
CORPORATIONS THAT PROVIDE HEALTH CARE 
FACILITIES TO THE GENERAL PUBLIC,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 24.  Noes, none.  Excused, 1 (Keohokalole).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3883 (H.B. No. 1848, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Acasio 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3883 was adopted and H.B. 

No. 1848, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO STUDENT JOURNALISM,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 24.  Noes, none.  Excused, 1 (Keohokalole).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3885 (H.B. No. 2510, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3885 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 2510, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Keith-
Agaran. 
 

 Senator Taniguchi rose to speak in support of the measure as 
follows: 
 

 “Colleagues, this House measure, as amended by the Senate, 
will raise the minimum wage in increments until it reaches $18 
an hour in 2026 and would eliminate our current tip credit in 
two increments. This bill is part of a package of bills which help 
employers and workers. As I mentioned earlier with House 
Bill 2471, last year we appropriated $747 million to pay back 
our federal unemployment insurance loan. In normal times, this 
would have been paid back by employers through increased 
unemployment insurance taxes. The governor also authorized 
an additional $100 million into the UI Trust Fund to prevent the 
loss of a federal employer tax credit which would have 
significantly raised the FUTA (Federal Unemployment Tax Act) 
taxes for our employers. 
 

 “This year, House Bill 2471 would adjust the experience 
rating to exclude the period of record high unemployment from 
the rate calculation for the next eight years. This would mean 
hundreds of dollars of savings in unemployment insurance taxes 
per employee for our employers. 
 

 “So, colleagues, if anyone tells you that the Legislature did 
nothing for employers and only helped minimum-wage 
workers, then you must tell them that they are not correct. Some 
of the same people may tell you that increases in the Senate 
version of House Bill 2510 are too fast and should be more 
gradual. Most of these same people have been fighting any 
increase in the minimum wage for years. They have 
successfully delayed efforts to raise the wage twice in the last 
three years, with the pandemic stopping efforts in 2020. 
 

 “A DBEDT study in 2019 indicated that $18 per hour was 
what a person would need to survive in Hawai‘i. If this bill 
passes, it will still take seven years since that study to reach $18 
per hour, and things have definitely gotten even worse for our 
lowest-paid workers with the pandemic. We really must act 
now. I urge my colleagues to vote in support of House 
Bill 2510, Senate Draft 1. Thank you.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3885 was adopted and H.B. No. 2510, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO INCOME,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 24; Ayes with Reservations (Wakai).  Noes, 1 
(Riviere).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3888 (H.B. No. 598, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Rhoads and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3888 was adopted 
and H.B. No. 598, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO TOBACCO PRODUCTS,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
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H.B. No. 2075, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, H.B. No. 2075, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
FIREARMS,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 22.  Noes, 3 (Fevella, Gabbard, Misalucha).  
 

H.B. No. 510, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that H.B. No. 510, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, 
having been read throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by 
Senator Keith-Agaran. 
 

 Senator Acasio rose to speak in support of the measure with 
reservations as follows: 
 

 “I just strongly support extending the earned income tax 
credit and making it refundable. I further support making the 
EITC permanent. However, my reservations pertain to the 
constitutional integrity of this bill. Mahalo.” 
 

 The Chair commented: 
 

 “If it would help put you at ease, Senator Acasio, it passed 
First Reading last Friday. Today will be Second Reading. It 
goes back to the House. If it comes back, we will schedule Final 
Reading to meet the three-reading constitutional requirement.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, H.B. No. 510, 
H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO TAXATION,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Ihara).  Noes, 
none.   
 

H.B. No. 1988, H.D. 2, S.D. 3: 
 

 Senator Baker moved that H.B. No. 1988, H.D. 2, S.D. 3, 
having been read throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by 
Senator Gabbard. 
 

 Senator Baker rose to speak in strong support of the measure 
as follows: 
 

 “This measure addresses concerns that the commercial use of 
coral contributes to the decline and degradation of the state’s 
coral reef by prohibiting the sale, import, harvest, or export of 
coral products with some exceptions. Many deep-water coral 
native to Hawai‘i grow very slowly and are facing 
unprecedented stressors, including acidification, warming 
oceans, overfishing, and pollution. The prohibition of the sale, 
import, harvest, and export of coral products will put an end to 
this archaic trade in coral. Without the prohibitions in House 
Bill 1988, Senate Draft 3, Hawai‘i’s black coral is subject to 
commercial harvesting by any person with a $100 commercial 
marine license and relies on self-reporting without any 
verification. This measure will further efforts to protect 
Hawai‘i’s coral reefs, and I urge my colleagues to join me in 
supporting this measure. Mahalo.” 
 

 Senator San Buenaventura rose to speak in support of the 
measure as follows: 
 

 “While I fully support the need to protect our coral reefs, I 
want our body to understand the consequences of what has 
passed previously. When I was growing up, the law was, and it 
still is, that black coral is the Hawai‘i state gem, and it was 
promoted as such to all the tourists in Waikīkī. And so a number 
of us, myself included, inherited black coral jewelry, which we 
have now, because of our promotion, have made endangered. As 
this bill progresses, I request our colleagues to understand that 
maybe it’s about time we recant making the black coral as the 
Hawai‘i state official gem so that we don’t promote it, and we 

preserve it. And secondly, that we look into the fact that a 
number of us have inherited coral because it was promoted as 
such, and there should be some kind of exclusion for those of us 
who went on the bandwagon at a time when we were promoting 
Hawai‘i. Thank you very much.” 
 

 Senator Chang rose to request that remarks in support of the 
measure with reservations be entered into the Journal, and the 
Chair so ordered. 
 

 The Chair having so ordered, Senator Chang’s remarks read 
as follows: 
 

 “I vote to advance this measure with reservations because I 
am concerned about impacts this bill will have on existing 
owners and retailers of corals harvested legally prior to this bill 
taking effect. 
 

 “In particular, I am concerned about locally owned shops 
which harvested or acquired coral in compliance with all legal 
requirements at the time. It would be unfair to change the rules 
on them when they bore the burden of legal compliance at the 
time. Additionally, nonprofit organizations and individuals own 
corals they acquired legally, and they would no longer be able 
to sell them. One possible solution would be to extend the 
effective date to give owners and retailers of corals time to 
lawfully sell their products. Another possible solution would be 
to exempt the sale of corals that were legally harvested before 
Endangered Species Act restrictions took effect.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, H.B. No. 1988, 
H.D. 2, S.D. 3, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO CORAL,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Chang).  Noes, none.   
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3898 (H.B. No. 1517, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Baker, seconded by Senator Dela Cruz 
and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3898 was adopted and H.B. 
No. 1517, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO COFFEE,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3904 (H.B. No. 1432, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3904 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1432, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO CONCESSIONS ON PUBLIC 
PROPERTY,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Fevella).  Noes, 
none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3907 (H.B. No. 1752, H.D. 3, S.D. 1): 
 

 Senator Rhoads moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3907 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 1752, H.D. 3, S.D. 1, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz. 
 

 Senator Acasio rose to speak in support of the measure with 
reservations as follows: 
 

 “I strongly support incentivizing landlords to accept housing 
choice vouchers; however, my objection is to the removal of the 
anti-discrimination focus of the original intent of the bill. 
Mahalo.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3907 was adopted and H.B. No. 1752, H.D. 3, S.D. 1, 
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entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HOUSING,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3911 (H.B. No. 1971, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3911 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1971, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PEER-TO-PEER CAR-SHARING,” 
having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Ihara).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3916 (H.B. No. 1414, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3916 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1414, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO ABANDONED VEHICLES,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3917 (H.B. No. 886, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3917 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 886, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO PROFESSIONALLY LICENSED OR 
CERTIFIED GOVERNMENT EMPLOYEES,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 24.  Noes, 1 (Fevella).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3919 (H.B. No. 2000, H.D. 1, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3919 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2000, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO EDUCATION,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3922 (H.B. No. 2345, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3922 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2345, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO LAND,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Fevella).  Noes, 
none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3926 (H.B. No. 1800, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3926 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 1800, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Keith-
Agaran. 
 

 Senator Acasio rose to speak in support of the measure with 
reservations as follows: 
 

 “Colleagues, when the state declared a climate emergency, it 
gave many people devoted to this issue hope that the state and 
we, as legislators, would be taking meaningful action to 
mitigate the impacts of climate change. As originally written, 
H.B. 1800 represented meaningful action—it was co-introduced 

by 23 of our House colleagues and drew widespread support 
from climate focus groups. The current language, while it 
continues to have meaningful input, removes details on specific 
targets and goals, which I believe are imperative in this climate 
emergency. The time for action is now. Thank you.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3926 was adopted and H.B. No. 1800, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CLIMATE 
MITIGATION,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3929 (H.B. No. 2206, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3929 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2206, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO AN APPROPRIATION FOR 
THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3930 (H.B. No. 2332, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3930 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2332, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO EASEMENTS,” having been 
read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3933 (H.B. No. 1768, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator 
Keohokalole and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3933 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1768, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE DISPOSITION OF 
WATER RIGHTS,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Fevella).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3936 (H.B. No. 1785, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Taniguchi, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3936 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1785, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO TOURISM GOVERNANCE,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3938 (H.B. No. 1983, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3938 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1983, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE DEPARTMENT OF 
BUSINESS, ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, AND 
TOURISM,” having been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3944 (H.B. No. 2513, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3944 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 2513, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE RENTAL HOUSING 
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REVOLVING FUND,” having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3952 (H.B. No. 1837, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3952 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1837, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HOUSING,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3954 (H.B. No. 1640, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3954 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1640, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO RECYCLING,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Misalucha, 
Wakai).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3958 (H.B. No. 2260, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3958 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2260, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO CANNABIS,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Kim, Misalucha, 
Moriwaki, Riviere, San Buenaventura).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3960 (H.B. No. 2336, H.D. 2, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Dela 
Cruz and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3960 was adopted and 
H.B. No. 2336, H.D. 2, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE PHOTO RED LIGHT IMAGING 
DETECTOR SYSTEMS PROGRAM,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 24; Ayes with Reservations (Kim).  Noes, 1 (Fevella).  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3963 (H.B. No. 2024, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3963 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 2024, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Keith-
Agaran. 
 

 Senator Inouye rose to speak in strong support of the 
measure as follows: 
 

 “Astronomy is on my island and in my district. I share these 
comments as chair of the Committee on Water and Land. We all 
know that humankind has been fascinated by the heavens and 
the study of the universe since the earliest of times. We know 
that Hawai‘i is one of the best places in the world for the study 
of astronomy. After years of study and proposals in the early to 
mid-20th century, it came to pass that Mauna Kea was chosen 
as the ideal location for large-scale and world-class astronomy. 
Over the course of more than 60 years, the observatories have 
made Mauna Kea the most scientifically productive site for 
astronomy worldwide. We should relish in the fact that our 
astronomical facilities are a world-class center of study and 
research supported by numerous international partners and 
research facilities all over the world. The research conducted on 
Mauna Kea is purely scientific in nature and dedicated to better 

understand the universe around us. Mauna Kea has the best 
combination of topography, climate, minimal light pollution, 
and a clear elevation in which to conduct astronomical research 
and observation. 
 

 “We cannot let our world-class status in the scientific 
community be compromised by a poorly crafted bill such as 
H.B. 2024, House Draft 1; it may cripple, if not end, our very 
prestigious and productive astronomy industry. While the 
present draft of H.B. 2024, Senate Draft 2, does a better job 
than the H.D. 1 version by including language like declaring 
that astronomy is a policy of the state and allowing the 
University of Hawai‘i to have jurisdiction over 550 acres of 
land surrounding the observatories, managing the summit, 
Summit Access Road, and the Hale Pōhaku facility, this bill still 
needs more work. The State of Hawai‘i needs to do everything 
possible to keep our world-class astronomy industry firmly 
grounded on the top of Mauna Kea. A few suggestions that need 
to be made in order to assure the long-term survival of 
astronomy on Mauna Kea is to change the governance model so 
that each and every observatory has a vote at the table along 
with the other members of the commission as outlined. The 
governance model will also need to be amended to fix the 
timeline of land transfer and extend that out to at least 2026 or 
longer if required. Issues requiring the powers of authority need 
to also be addressed as well as the revenue requirements for the 
self-sustaining clause in the bill. We need to remind ourselves 
that astronomy in Hawai‘i supports the employment of at least 
1,313 residents and had a total impact of $221 million in 2019. 
 

 “Astronomy is far-reaching not only to the stars but also on 
the ground. Just this past weekend, I was thrilled to see 
children, teens, and adults become excited about astronomy on 
a TV news report showcasing the open house of the University 
of Hawai‘i’s Institute for Astronomy in Mānoa. Some of these 
children and teens may grow up to be astronomers, and also, 
some are already in colleges throughout our country and the 
University of Hawai‘i. And, indeed, Ms. Onodera, in my 
district, graduated in astronomy, moved to Mauna Kea, and is 
now employed in the prestigious level on Haleakalā. We cannot 
and should not cheat them out of a possible future in Hawai‘i if 
we cannot continue having a world-class center of astronomy as 
we do now on Mauna Kea. 
 

 “Mr. President, I am convinced that the people of Hawai‘i 
support astronomy in a huge way. The bottom line is that 
astronomy needs to be saved—the successful implementation of 
this governance model will require resolution of several 
outstanding issues. These include Part II, Section 5, Senate 
Draft 2 calls for the transfer of all rights, powers, functions, and 
duties of the University of Hawai‘i with respect to the non-
astronomy lands transferring to July 1, 2023, to the new 
authority. This transfer in July 2023 is not feasible given that 
the new authority will not yet be stood up or independent. Plus, 
UH still has obligations under its CDUPs, the master plan, 
CMP, and rules with respect to the 10,000 acres, which are non-
astronomy lands that need to be worked out with DLNR and the 
authority. This should be changed to ‘July 1, 2026,’ to align 
with the three-year transition period. Section 3(b)(1) of S.D. 2 
provides that the authority will be the principal authority in 
conjunction with the DLNR for the management of the state-
managed lands within the Mauna Kea conservation lands. 
Clarification is needed regarding the powers of the authority as 
principal authority versus the statutory and regulatory powers of 
DLNR and the Board of Land and Natural Resources. For 
example, DLNR is the entity that would approve the sublease 
from UH to the new authority as well as UH’s comprehensive 
management plan (which is the CMP), which is currently in the 
process of being updated, and any subleases issued by the 
authority. How does this legislation impact DLNR’s role and 
jurisdiction? Also, S.D. 2 does not address the applicability of 
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DLNR’s sublease requirements, such as whether the authority 
will be required to have a management plan similar to UH’s. 
 

 “I make my support known for H.B. 2024, S.D. 2, 
Mr. President, with the hope that the bill can be further 
amended in conference to create a better bill for our world-class 
astronomy industry and for the people, our children, in Hawai‘i. 
Therefore, Mr. President, I will support H.B. 2024, S.D. 2. 
Mahalo.” 
 

 Senator Fevella rose to speak in support of the measure as 
follows: 
 

 “I have very mixed emotions, colleagues, because we’re 
talking about astronomy, but we’re also talking about 
desecration and mismanagement. This is a bill that is trying to 
level the playing fields on both sides.  
 

 “I am against TMT and I’m always going to be against TMT. 
Whatever telescopes for astronomy is on the mountain, we will 
review the extension of their leases. But having so many people 
oppose the construction of TMT, approximately 1,600 people, 
and due to nearly 50 to 60 years of desecration on that 
mountain, the protection of Mauna Kea means more to the 
people than looking into the stars, depending on who you talk 
to. But I am for this bill. My colleague worked very hard on it, 
but I don’t agree on everything. But if this goes to conference 
and there is an attempt to push for the construction of TMT, I 
am voting against this in conference. I just wanted to let you 
know I support the bill in its current form, but if it changes in 
any way, I’ll vote it down in conference.” 
 

 Senator Kim rose to request that remarks regarding the 
measure be entered into the Journal, and the Chair so ordered. 
 

 The Chair having so ordered, Senator Kim’s remarks read as 
follows: 
 

 “Rise in Support. 
 

 “The Senate is continuing to refine and develop HB 2024 to 
balance the interests and concerns of our Native Hawaiian 
community to properly steward a cultural treasure with the 
interests of the State through the University of Hawaii 
(‘University’) to continue its world class science-based 
education and academic research unit in astronomy at Mauna 
Kea. In collaboration with the Higher Ed Chair, these proposed 
amendments are reflective of the discussions that we’ve had 
with various community groups, stakeholders, and from the 
testimonies submitted. 
 

 “Thus, Senate Draft 2, is a significant improvement over 
Senate Draft 1. Senate Draft 1 addressed very real concerns 
regarding the potential demise of astronomy at Mauna Kea 
caused by the whole sale replacement of the University with the 
newly created Mauna Kea Stewardship Authority. But as noted, 
it was still a work in progress.” 
 

 “We have listened to reasonable suggestions expressed on 
many sides of the current controversy regarding this potential 
demise. The proper care and management of the mountain 
involves many agreements and contracts with several 
organizations, employees, contractors, and funding from the 
National Science Foundation, as well as, arrangements with 
foreign countries. As a premier world class academic research 
center, we were faced with how the newly created authority 
could quickly jump in to manage these agreements and 
contracts and prevent uncertainty and disruptions from arising 
that could place in jeopardy the relationships developed since 
the 1960’s with the University’s scientific and research partners. 
 

 “Senate Draft 2 is an improvement over Senate Draft 1 in 
that the new draft creates ‘joint oversight’ of Mauna Kea 
between the University and the newly created authority. The 
responsibilities to manage the mountain will be bifurcated or 

split between the two entities. The new authority will manage 
approximately 9,450 acres on the mountain, while the 
University will manage the Astronomy Research Lands 
comprised of the Astronomy Precinct, Halepohaku complex and 
the Mauna Kea access road, or approximately 550 acres. The 
existing 1968 and 1999 State Leases between the State Board of 
Land and Natural Resources and University (expiring in 2033) 
will be kept in place. The University, as Lessee under the State 
Leases, will sublease to the authority within a year of its 
operational formation lands totaling approximately 9,450 acres, 
which we have labeled as the Mauna Kea Conservation Lands. 
The authority will be charged to properly conserve, protect, and 
manage the public uses of the Mauna Kea Conservation Lands. 
At the same time, the University will be solely responsible to 
care for and manage the Astronomy Research Lands. 
 

 “The ‘joint oversight’ structure addresses the perceived threat 
to the future of astronomy in our State, through a collaborative 
sharing of management duties and responsibilities between the 
authority and the University of Hawaii. 
 

 “The current administrative organization under the aegis of 
the University of Hawaii at Hilo will be kept in place, and will 
continue to service the operational and staff needs of both the 
new authority and the University thereby, avoiding any 
additional costs associated with creating a new organizational 
structure or two separate administrative structures. 
 

 “Our goal in Senate Draft 2 was to develop a management 
structure from a practical standpoint that would be workable 
while balancing the diverse interests in the conservation, 
protection, and regulating of current and future uses of Mauna 
Kea. Senate Draft 2, like Senate Draft 1, provides for an audit to 
be done in 2029. 
 

 “The refinement of Senate Draft 2 continues to strive for the 
best balance of interests on Mauna Kea. We realize that each 
side may not be satisfied with the joint oversight model we are 
proposing, but unfortunately there is no perfect solution to this 
controversy. Each side must be willing to compromise. A shared 
responsibility model accomplishes that.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3963 was adopted and H.B. No. 2024, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO MAUNA 
KEA,” having been read throughout, passed Third Reading on 
the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio, Ihara, Rhoads, 
San Buenaventura).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3964 (H.B. No. 2108, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3964 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 2108, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Keith-
Agaran. 
 

 Senator Baker rose to speak in strong support of the measure 
as follows: 
 

 “As my colleagues well know, digital currency is growing in 
popularity and acceptance worldwide; however, there is very 
little regulation of the industry here in the United States. The 
Division of Financial Institutions of the Department of 
Commerce and Consumer Affairs and the Hawaii Technology 
Development Corporation are currently conducting a two-year 
sandbox program to study digital currency transactions that 
allow companies to conduct digital currency transactions 
without obtaining a money transmitters license. House 
Bill 2108, Senate Draft 2, establishes a licensing program that 
will replace the Digital Currency Innovation Lab. This measure 
will establish a program for licensure, regulation, and oversight 
of digital currency companies to ensure that the necessary 
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consumer protections are adhered to. Please join me in 
supporting this measure. Mahalo.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3964 was adopted and H.B. No. 2108, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO SPECIAL 
PURPOSE DIGITAL CURRENCY LICENSURE,” having 
been read throughout, passed Third Reading on the following 
showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3965 (H.B. No. 2171, H.D. 2, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Rhoads and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3965 was adopted 
and H.B. No. 2171, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC SAFETY,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3966 (H.B. No. 2424, H.D. 1, S.D. 2): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3966 be 
adopted and H.B. No. 2424, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, seconded by Senator Rhoads. 
 

 Senator San Buenaventura rose to speak in strong support of 
the measure as follows: 
 

 “Our system is broken regarding how we deal with child 
abuse. Hopefully, this is a step further to empower our child 
welfare service workers to be able to investigate when 
necessary and provide funding for the amount of hours that they 
go and basically investigate abuse. And, hopefully, with this 
passage, we can fix the system and prevent child abuse in the 
future. Thank you.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 3966 was adopted and H.B. No. 2424, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, 
entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CHILD 
WELFARE SERVICES,” having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3967 (H.B. No. 1809, H.D. 3, S.D. 2): 
 

 On motion by Senator Dela Cruz, seconded by Senator 
Keith-Agaran and carried, Stand. Com. Rep. No. 3967 was 
adopted and H.B. No. 1809, H.D. 3, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TAXATION,” having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading on the following showing of 
Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25; Ayes with Reservations (Acasio).  Noes, none.  
 

REFERRAL OF 
HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTIONS 

 

 The President made the following committee assignments of 
House concurrent resolutions received on Friday, April 8, 2022: 
 

H.C.R. No.: Referred to: 
 

H.C.R. No. 3, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Water and Land, then to the
Committee on Ways and Means 

  

H.C.R. No. 4 Committee on Water and Land, then to the
Committee on Ways and Means 

  

H.C.R. No. 5 Committee on Water and Land, then to the 
Committee on Ways and Means 

  

H.C.R. No. 6, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Health and the
Committee on Water and Land and the
Committee on Public Safety,

Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs 
  

H.C.R. No. 7, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Education 

  

H.C.R. No. 8, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs and the 
Committee on Government Operations 

  

H.C.R. No. 14, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Labor, Culture and the Arts 

  

H.C.R. No. 27, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs, then 
to the Committee on Judiciary 

  

H.C.R. No. 28, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection and the Committee on 
Health 

  

H.C.R. No. 29 Committee on Transportation 
  

H.C.R. No. 33 Jointly to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection and the Committee on 
Health 

  

H.C.R. No. 38 Committee on Health, then to the Committee
on Ways and Means 

  

H.C.R. No. 46 Jointly to the Committee on Energy, Economic 
Development, and Tourism and the Committee 
on Public Safety, Intergovernmental, and 
Military Affairs 

  

H.C.R. No. 47, 
H.D. 2 

Jointly to the Committee on Energy, Economic 
Development, and Tourism and the Committee 
on Transportation 

  

H.C.R. No. 50, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Education 

  

H.C.R. No. 51, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Education 

  

H.C.R. No. 53 Committee on Education 
  

H.C.R. No. 56, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Education 

  

H.C.R. No. 66, 
H.D. 2 

Jointly to the Committee on Health and the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer
Protection 

  

H.C.R. No. 69 Committee on Labor, Culture and the Arts 
  

H.C.R. No. 74 Committee on Education 
  

H.C.R. No. 75 Committee on Agriculture and Environment 
  

H.C.R. No. 76, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs and the 
Committee on Judiciary 

  

H.C.R. No. 82 Committee on Water and Land 
  

H.C.R. No. 87 Committee on Public Safety,
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs 

  

H.C.R. No. 99 Jointly to the Committee on Agriculture and 
Environment and the Committee on Health 

  

H.C.R. No. 103 Jointly to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection and the Committee on 
Transportation 

  

H.C.R. No. 104 Committee on Water and Land 
  

H.C.R. No. 106, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs and the 
Committee on Ways and Means 
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H.C.R. No. 111 Committee on Agriculture and Environment 
  

H.C.R. No. 115, 
H.D. 2 

Jointly to the Committee on Commerce and
Consumer Protection and the Committee on
Energy, Economic Development, and Tourism 

  

H.C.R. No. 119 Committee on Labor, Culture and the Arts 
  

H.C.R. No. 122, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Human Services
and the Committee on Judiciary 

  

H.C.R. No. 125 Jointly to the Committee on Transportation and
the Committee on Education 

  

H.C.R. No. 134, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Education 

  

H.C.R. No. 143 Jointly to the Committee on Judiciary and the
Committee on Government Operations 

  

H.C.R. No. 153, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Transportation and 
the Committee on Government Operations 

  

H.C.R. No. 166, 
H.D. 1 

Committee on Labor, Culture and the Arts 

  

H.C.R. No. 170 Jointly to the Committee on Housing and the
Committee on Ways and Means 

  

H.C.R. No. 180, 
H.D. 1 

Jointly to the Committee on Transportation and
the Committee on Public Safety,
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs 

 

 At this time, Senator Shimabukuro reminded members of the 
Committee on Hawaiian Affairs that they would be having a 
1:00 p.m. hearing on a resolution. 
 

 The Chair made the following comments: 
 

 “With slightly over three weeks to go and doing the Second 
Cross, congratulations to the members, and I applaud all of your 
hard work and efforts but, primarily, I wanted to say thank you 
to all of our hardworking support staff in the individual offices, 
the support agencies, and every single job here is important in 
allowing us to get our job done. And while I will thank you 
again when we gavel out, I don’t think we can thank you 
enough for all of your hard work.” 
 

ADJOURNMENT 
 

 At 10:55 a.m., on motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by 
Senator Fevella and carried, the Senate adjourned until 
11:30 a.m., Thursday, April 14, 2022. 
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