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EIGHTEENTH  DAY 

 
Tuesday, February 15, 2022 

 

 The Senate of the Thirty-First Legislature of the State of 
Hawai‘i, Regular Session of 2022, convened at 11:36 a.m. with 
the President in the Chair. 
 

 The Roll was called showing all Senators present, with 
Senators Chang, Dela Cruz, Gabbard, Inouye, Keohokalole, 
Moriwaki, Rhoads, Shimabukuro, Taniguchi, and Wakai present 
and participating via videoconference. 
 

 The President announced that he had read and approved the 
Journal of the Seventeenth Day. 
 

MESSAGES FROM THE GOVERNOR 
 

 The following messages from the Governor (Gov. Msg. 
Nos. 681 and 682) were read by the Clerk and were disposed of 
as follows: 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 681, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Health Planning Council, Kauai Subarea, 
the nomination of JENNIE CHAHANOVICH, term to expire 
June 30, 2024, was referred to the Committee on Health. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 682, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Language Access Advisory Council, the 
nomination of RANDALL LANDRY II, term to expire June 30, 
2025, was referred to the Committee on Health. 
 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

 Senator Keohokalole, for the Committee on Health, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2308) recommending 
that S.B. No. 2034, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2034, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO HEALTH,” passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Keohokalole, for the Committee on Health, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2309) recommending 
that S.B. No. 2467, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2467, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO MENTAL HEALTH SCREENINGS,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Senator Keohokalole, for the Committee on Health, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2310) recommending 
that S.B. No. 2529, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2529, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO BEHAVIORAL HEALTH SERVICES,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Chang, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2311) recommending that S.B. 
No. 3177, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means and the 
Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3177, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO HOUSING,” passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means and the Committee on 
Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 2312) recommending that S.B. No. 2835, as amended in 
S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2835, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO INSURANCE,” passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the majority of the Committee on 
Judiciary, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2313) 
recommending that S.B. No. 2507 pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and S.B. No. 2507, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
PROPOSING AN AMENDMENT TO ARTICLE IX, 
SECTION 5, OF THE HAWAII STATE CONSTITUTION, TO 
REQUIRE THE STATE TO PRODUCE ENOUGH HOUSING 
TO MEET DEMAND,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2314) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2397, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2397, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO CHILD CUSTODY,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2315) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2130, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2130, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE CRIME VICTIM COMPENSATION FEE,” passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2316) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2131, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2131, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE CRIME VICTIM COMPENSATION SPECIAL 
FUND,” passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2317) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2406, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 



 S E N A T E   J O U R N A L  -  1 8 t h   D A Y  -  F E B R U A R Y   1 5,   2 0 2 2 
 178

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2406, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO SPECIAL PURPOSE REVENUE BONDS,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2318) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2417, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2417, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO ELECTIONS,” passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2319) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2391 pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2391, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE ZERO TO THREE COURT,” passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2320) recommending that S.B. 
No. 3207 pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3207, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
WOMEN’S COURT,” passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2321) recommending 
that S.B. No. 2153, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2153, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO STATE PARKS,” passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the majority of the Committee on Water 
and Land, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2322) 
recommending that S.B. No. 3133, as amended in S.D. 1, pass 
Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means and the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and S.B. No. 3133, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO DISPOSITION OF PUBLIC LANDS BY 
NEGOTIATION,” passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means and the Committee on 
Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2323) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3328, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3328, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO KANEOHE BAY,” passed Second Reading and was 

referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kim, for the Committee on Higher Education, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2324) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3186, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3186, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
PROPOSING AN AMENDMENT TO ARTICLE X, 
SECTION 6, OF THE HAWAII CONSTITUTION TO 
REPEAL THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII BOARD OF 
REGENTS CANDIDATE ADVISORY COUNCIL,” passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kim, for the Committee on Higher Education, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2325) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3187, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3187, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII BOARD OF REGENTS 
CANDIDATE ADVISORY COUNCIL,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kim, for the Committee on Higher Education, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2326) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3277, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3277, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE PRESIDENT OF THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII 
SYSTEM,” passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senators Kim and Taniguchi, for the Committee on Higher 
Education and the Committee on Labor, Culture and the Arts, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2327) 
recommending that S.B. No. 3267, as amended in S.D. 1, pass 
Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 3267, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE RESEARCH CORPORATION OF THE 
UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kim, for the Committee on Higher Education, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2328) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3374 pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3374, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII COMMUNITY 
COLLEGES,” passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Wakai, for the Committee on Energy, Economic 
Development, and Tourism, presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2329) recommending that S.B. No. 2697, as amended 
in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 



 S E N A T E   J O U R N A L  -  1 8 t h   D A Y  -  F E B R U A R Y  1 5,   2 0 2 2 
 179

Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2697, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO VIRTUAL CURRENCY,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection and the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Wakai, for the Committee on Energy, Economic 
Development, and Tourism, presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2330) recommending that S.B. No. 2695, as amended 
in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2695, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO CRYPTOCURRENCY,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection and the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Chang, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2331) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2237, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2237, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE CONVEYANCE TAX,” passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Chang, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2332) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2588 pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2588, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HOUSING,” passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2333) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2183, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2183, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION RESIDENCY 
REQUIREMENTS,” passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Judiciary and the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2334) recommending that S.B. 
No. 3292, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3292, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE SCHOOL FACILITIES AUTHORITY,” passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2335) recommending that S.B. 

No. 3093, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3093, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO OFFICIAL SCHOOL BUSINESS,” passed Second Reading 
and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator San Buenaventura, for the Committee on Human 
Services, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2336) 
recommending that S.B. No. 2002, as amended in S.D. 1, pass 
Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2002, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO FAIR HOUSING REASONABLE 
ACCOMMODATIONS,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2337) recommending that S.B. No. 2158 
pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2158, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE USE OF SIRENS BY EMERGENCY VEHICLES,” 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental, and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2338) recommending that S.B. No. 3206 
pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3206, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
DATA ABOUT SNORKELS AND MASKS,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2339) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2892, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2892, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO KE KULA O EHUNUIKAIMALINO,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2340) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2081, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2081, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION COMMERCIAL 
ENTERPRISES REVOLVING FUND,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
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 Senators Kidani and Taniguchi, for the Committee on 
Education and the Committee on Labor, Culture and the Arts, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2341) 
recommending that S.B. No. 3092 pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 3092, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO COMMERCIAL ENTERPRISES IN SCHOOLS,” passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senators Kidani and Inouye, for the Committee on Education 
and the Committee on Water and Land, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2342) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2186, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 2186, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO PUBLIC SCHOOL LAND TRANSFER,” 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2343) recommending that S.B. 
No. 2823, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2823, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO EDUCATION,” passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Wakai and Moriwaki, for the Committee on Energy, 
Economic Development, and Tourism and the Committee on 
Government Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2344) recommending that S.B. No. 3334, as amended 
in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 3334, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS,” passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senators Wakai and Moriwaki, for the Committee on Energy, 
Economic Development, and Tourism and the Committee on 
Government Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2345) recommending that S.B. No. 2170, as amended 
in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 2170, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TOURISM GOVERNANCE,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senators Wakai and Moriwaki, for the Committee on Energy, 
Economic Development, and Tourism and the Committee on 
Government Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2346) recommending that S.B. No. 2077, as amended 
in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 2077, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 

RELATING TO THE HAWAII TOURISM AUTHORITY,” 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Wakai and Moriwaki, for the Committee on Energy, 
Economic Development, and Tourism and the Committee on 
Government Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2347) recommending that S.B. No. 2419 pass Second 
Reading and be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means 
and the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 2419, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO TRANSIENT ACCOMMODATIONS HOSTING 
PLATFORMS,” passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means and the Committee on 
Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Senators Wakai and Moriwaki, for the Committee on Energy, 
Economic Development, and Tourism and the Committee on 
Government Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 2348) recommending that S.B. No. 2483, as amended 
in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 2483, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ENERGY,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2349) recommending 
that S.B. No. 2135, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2135, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO THE OCEAN STEWARDSHIP SPECIAL FUND,” passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2350) recommending 
that S.B. No. 2519, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 2519, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO COASTAL ZONE MANAGEMENT,” passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary and the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2351) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3251, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3251, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO HUNTING GUIDES,” passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2352) recommending 
that S.B. No. 3351, as amended in S.D. 1, pass Second Reading 
and be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means and the 
Committee on Judiciary. 
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 On motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.B. 
No. 3351, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING 
TO PARKING VIOLATIONS,” passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means and the 
Committee on Judiciary. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2353) recommending that S.B. 
No. 1211, S.D. 1, as amended in S.D. 2, pass Third Reading. 
 

 By unanimous consent, action on Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2353 
and S.B. No. 1211, S.D. 2, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO MOTOR CARRIERS,” was deferred until 
Thursday, February 17, 2022. 
 

ORDER OF THE DAY 
 

RE-REFERRAL OF SENATE BILLS 
 

 The Chair re-referred the following Senate bills that were 
introduced: 
 

S.B. No.: Re-referred to: 
 

S.B. No. 2293 Jointly to the Committee on Government 
Operations and the Committee on 
Transportation, then jointly to the Committee 
on Judiciary and the Committee on Ways and 
Means 

 

S.B. No. 2617 Jointly to the Committee on Agriculture and 
Environment and the Committee on Judiciary 

 

 At this time, the Chair announced that there would be a 
leadership meeting immediately following adjournment. 
 

ADJOURNMENT 
 

 At 11:39 a.m., on motion by Senator DeCoite, seconded by 
Senator Fevella and carried, the Senate adjourned until 
11:30 a.m., Wednesday, February 16, 2022. 
 




