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FIFTY-SEVENTH  DAY 

 
Thursday, April 25, 2019 

 

 The Senate of the Thirtieth Legislature of the State of 
Hawai‘i, Regular Session of 2019, convened at 7:12 p.m. with 
the President in the Chair. 
 

 The Roll was called showing all Senators present. 
 

 The President announced that he had read and approved the 
Journal of the Fifty-Sixth Day. 
 

MESSAGES FROM THE GOVERNOR 
 

 The following messages from the Governor (Gov. Msg. 
Nos. 15 to 16 and 1115 to 1124) were read by the Clerk and 
were placed on file: 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 15, letter dated April 24, 2019, transmitting a 
proposed conference draft to SB. No. 1197 to fund the tentative 
agreement concerning Collective Bargaining Unit 7. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 16, letter dated April 25, 2019, transmitting a 
proposed conference draft bill to fund the tentative agreements 
with United Public Workers (UPW), Collective Bargaining 
Units 1 and 10. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1115, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law Senate Bill No. 1288, 
S.D. 1 as Act 14, entitled:  “RELATING TO CONDOMINIUM 
VOTING.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1116, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law Senate Bill No. 638, S.D. 1 
as Act 15, entitled:  “RELATING TO LIQUOR.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1117, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law Senate Bill No. 1211 as 
Act 16, entitled:  “RELATING TO FORMS SUBMITTED TO 
THE INSURANCE COMMISSIONER.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1118, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law House Bill No. 114 as 
Act  17, entitled:  “RELATING TO AMENDING OR 
REPEALING HAWAII INCOME TAX LAWS FOR THE 
PURPOSE OF DELETING OBSOLETE OR UNNECESSARY 
PROVISIONS.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1119, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law House Bill No. 122 as 
Act 18, entitled:  “RELATING TO NON-GENERAL FUNDS.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1120, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law House Bill No. 764 as 
Act  19, entitled:  “RELATING TO MOTOR VEHICLE 
INSURANCE.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1121, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law Senate Bill No. 380, S.D. 1 
as Act 20, entitled:  “RELATING TO THE TRANSIENT 
ACCOMMODATIONS TAX.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1122, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law House Bill No. 121 as 
Act 21, entitled:  “RELATED TO NON-GENERAL FUNDS.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1123, informing the Senate that on April 23, 
2019, the Governor signed into law House Bill No. 31, H.D. 1 
as Act 22, entitled:  “RELATING TO ELECTION 
NOMINATION PAPERS.” 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 1124, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the Governor signed into law House Bill No. 720, H.D. 1 
as Act 23, entitled:  “RELATING TO FIREARMS.” 
 

HOUSE COMMUNICATIONS 
 

 The following communications from the House (Hse. Com. 
Nos. 859 to 868) were read by the Clerk and were placed on 
file: 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 859, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the House agreed to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate and passed the following bills on Final Reading: 
 

 H.B. No. 168, S.D. 1; 
 H.B. No. 169, H.D. 1, S.D. 2; 
 H.B. No. 273, H.D. 1, S.D. 1; 
 H.B. No. 329, H.D. 1, S.D. 2; 
 H.B. No. 497, H.D. 1, S.D. 2; 
 H.B. No. 499, H.D. 1, S.D. 1; 
 H.B. No. 945, H.D. 1, S.D. 1; 
 H.B. No. 1261, H.D. 1, S.D. 1; and 
 H.B. No. 1305, H.D. 2, S.D. 1.  
 

 Hse. Com. No. 860, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the House reconsidered its action taken on April 5, 2019, 
in disagreeing to the amendments proposed by the Senate to 
H.B. No. 807, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1). 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 861, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the House reconsidered its action taken on April 9, 2019, 
in disagreeing to the amendments proposed by the Senate to the 
following House bills: 
 

 H.B. No. 201, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 507, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 664, H.D. 2 (S.D. 1); 
 H.B. No. 711, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1); and 
 H.B. No. 1272, H.D. 1 (S.D. 1). 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 862, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the House reconsidered its action taken on April 11, 2019, 
in disagreeing to the amendments proposed by the Senate to the 
following House bills: 
 

 H.B. No. 336, H.D. 2 (S.D. 2); 
 H.B. No. 748, H.D. 2 (S.D. 2); 
 H.B. No. 944, H.D. 1 (S.D. 2); and 
 H.B. No. 1013, H.D. 2 (S.D. 2). 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 863, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the Speaker appointed conferees on the part of the House 
for the consideration of amendments proposed by the House to 
the following Senate bill: 
 

S.B. No. 1371, S.D. 2 (H.D. 1): 
 

 Representatives Yamane, Lee, co-chairs; Todd, Thielen. 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 864, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the Speaker appointed conferees on the part of the House 
for the consideration of amendments proposed by the Senate to 
the following House bills: 
 

H.B. No. 241, H.D. 2 (S.D. 1): 
 

 Representatives Aquino, Takumi, Hashimoto, co-chairs; 
McDermott. 

 

H.B. No. 546, H.D. 2 (S.D. 1): 
 

 Representatives McKelvey, Takumi, Nishimoto, co-chairs; 
Matsumoto. 

 

 Hse. Com. No. 865, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the Speaker appointed conferees on the part of the House 
for the consideration of amendments proposed by the Senate to 
the following House bill: 
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H.B. No. 398, H.D. 1 (S.D. 2): 
 

 Representatives Woodson, Cullen, co-chairs; Hashimoto, 
D. Kobayashi, Okimoto. 

 

 Hse. Com. No. 866, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the Speaker discharged all conferees to the following 
bills: 
 

 H.B. No. 390, H.D. 1 (S.D. 2); and 

 H.B. No. 1268 (S.D. 1). 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 867, informing the Senate that on April 24, 
2019, the Speaker appointed conferees on the part of the House 
for the consideration of amendments proposed by the House to 
the following Senate bill: 
 

S.B. No. 1047, S.D. 1 (H.D. 2): 
 

 Representatives San Buenaventura, Lee, Kitagawa, 
co-chairs; Eli, Thielen. 

 

 Hse. Com. No. 868, informing the Senate that on April 25, 
2019, the Speaker discharged all conferees to H.B. No. 402, 
H.D. 1 (S.D. 2). 
 

CONFERENCE COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

 Senator Gabbard, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 551, presented a report (Conf. Com. 
Rep. No. 10) recommending that H.B. No. 551, S.D. 1, as 
amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 10 and 
H.B. No. 551, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CESSPOOLS,” was deferred for a period of 48 
hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 566, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 11) recommending that S.B. No. 566, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 11 and 
S.B. No. 566, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE PENAL CODE,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1210, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 12) recommending that S.B. No. 1210, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 12 and 
S.B. No. 1210, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 772, presented a report (Conf. Com. Rep. 
No. 13) recommending that S.B. No. 772, H.D. 2, as amended 
in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 13 and 
S.B. No. 772, H.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO LIQUOR LAWS,” was deferred for a period of 
48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1263, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 14) recommending that S.B. No. 1263, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 14 and 
S.B. No. 1263, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE UNIFORM CONTROLLED 
SUBSTANCES ACT,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 1270, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 15) recommending that H.B. No. 1270, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 15 and 
H.B. No. 1270, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE HOSPITAL 
SUSTAINABILITY PROGRAM,” was deferred for a period of 
48 hours. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 1449, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 16) recommending that H.B. No. 1449, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 16 and 
H.B. No. 1449, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE NURSING FACILITY 
SUSTAINABILITY PROGRAM,” was deferred for a period of 
48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 25, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 17) recommending that S.B. No. 25, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 17 and 
S.B. No. 25, S.D. 2, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE,” was deferred for a period 
of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1240, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 18) recommending that S.B. No. 1240, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 18 and 
S.B. No. 1240, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MEDICAID WAIVER,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 990, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 19) recommending that H.B. No. 990, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 19 and 
H.B. No. 990, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 
FACILITIES,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
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 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 61, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 20) recommending that H.B. No. 61, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 20 and 
H.B. No. 61, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CONDOMINIUMS,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 988, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 21) recommending that H.B. No. 988, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 21 and 
H.B. No. 988, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO TRANSITIONAL AUTHORITY IN 
THE MORTGAGE INDUSTRY,” was deferred for a period of 
48 hours. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 1417, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 22) recommending that H.B. No. 1417, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 22 and 
H.B. No. 1417, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO HUMAN SERVICES,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1173, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 23) recommending that S.B. No. 1173, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 23 and 
S.B. No. 1173, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CHILD SUPPORT,” was deferred for 
a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 980, presented a report (Conf. Com. Rep. 
No. 24) recommending that S.B. No. 980, H.D. 1, as amended 
in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 24 and 
S.B. No. 980, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO EDUCATION,” was deferred for a period of 48 
hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 552, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 25) recommending that S.B. No. 552, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 25 and 
S.B. No. 552, S.D. 1, H.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CONDOMINIUMS,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 

the House to S.B. No. 394, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 26) recommending that S.B. No. 394, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 26 and 
S.B. No. 394, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO TAXATION,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 536, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 27) recommending that S.B. No. 536, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 27 and 
S.B. No. 536, S.D. 2, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PRESCRIPTIONS,” was deferred for 
a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 535, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 28) recommending that S.B. No. 535, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 28 and 
S.B. No. 535, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PHARMACISTS PRESCRIBING 
AND DISPENSING OF OPIOID ANTAGONIST,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 225, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 29) recommending that S.B. No. 225, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 29 and 
S.B. No. 225, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO OCULARISTS,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator English, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1188, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 30) recommending that S.B. No. 1188, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 30 and 
S.B. No. 1188, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT MAKING AN EMERGENCY APPROPRIATION TO 
THE HAWAII COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 
AUTHORITY,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1232, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 31) recommending that S.B. No. 1232, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 31 and 
S.B. No. 1232, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CHILD SAFETY,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 385, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
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Com. Rep. No. 32) recommending that S.B. No. 385, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 32 and 
S.B. No. 385, S.D. 1, H.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PROFESSIONAL AND 
VOCATIONAL LICENSING,” was deferred for a period of 48 
hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 414, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 33) recommending that S.B. No. 414, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 33 and 
S.B. No. 414, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CRIMINAL PROCEDURE,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1176, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 34) recommending that S.B. No. 1176, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 34 and 
S.B. No. 1176, S.D. 2, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO FALSE CLAIMS TO THE STATE,” 
was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 767, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 35) recommending that S.B. No. 767, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 35 and 
S.B. No. 767, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CONTRACTORS,” was deferred for 
a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 852, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 36) recommending that S.B. No. 852, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 36 and 
S.B. No. 852, S.D. 2, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO RESTITUTION FOR VICTIMS OF 
CRIME,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

ORDER OF THE DAY 
 

AGREE/DISAGREE 
 

MATTERS DEFERRED FROM 
WEDNESDAY, APRIL 24, 2019 

 

S.C.R. No. 3, S.D. 1 (H.D. 1): 
 

 Senator Chang moved that the Senate agree to the 
amendments proposed by the House to S.C.R. No. 3, S.D. 1, 
seconded by Senator Kahele. 
 

 Senator Chang noted: 
 

 “The House amendments were technical and nonsubstantive 
in nature.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, the Senate 
agreed to the amendments proposed by the House to S.C.R. 
No. 3, S.D. 1, and S.C.R. No. 3, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, entitled:  
“SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION CONVENING A 
TASK FORCE TO STUDY THE ISSUE OF RESIDENTIAL 
SPRINKLER COSTS IN NEW ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY 
DWELLINGS,” was placed on the calendar for Final Adoption 
on Friday, April 26, 2019. 
 

S.C.R. No. 112, S.D. 1 (H.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Kahele, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the Senate disagreed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.C.R. No. 112, S.D. 1, and requested a 
conference on the subject matter thereof. 
 

 The Chair then announced: 
 

 “Conferees may be named at a later date.” 
 

ADVISE AND CONSENT 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2238 (Gov. Msg. Nos. 686, 687, 707, and 
721): 
 

 Senator Kidani moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2238 be 
received and placed on file, seconded by Senator Kim and 
carried. 
 

 Senator Kidani then moved that the Senate advise and 
consent to the nominations to the Early Learning Board of the 
following: 
 

 KERRIE UROSEVICH, term to expire June 30, 2022 (Gov. 
Msg. No. 686); 

 

 LEILANI AU, term to expire June 30, 2020 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 687); 

 

 BENJAMIN NAKI III, term to expire June 30, 2022 (Gov. 
Msg. No. 707); and 

 

 JUSTINA ACEVEDO-CROSS, term to expire June 30, 2020 
(Gov. Msg. No. 721), 

 

 seconded by Senator Kim. 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes: 
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.   
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2239 (Gov. Msg. Nos. 546, 741, and 
742): 
 

 Senator Kidani moved that Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2239 be 
received and placed on file, seconded by Senator Kim and 
carried. 
 

 Senator Kidani then moved that the Senate advise and 
consent to the nominations to the Hawai‘i Teacher Standards 
Board of the following: 
 

 BRAD SHIMIZU, term to expire June 30, 2021 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 546); 

 

 DAVELYN HAN, term to expire June 30, 2021 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 741); and 

 

 KIM SANDERS, term to expire June 30, 2022 (Gov. Msg. 
No. 742), 

 

 seconded by Senator Kim. 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes: 
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.   
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ADOPTION OF A RESOLUTION 
 

MATTER DEFERRED FROM 
WEDNESDAY, APRIL 24, 2019 

 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 2237 (S.R. No. 154): 
 

 On motion by Senator Kahele, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 154, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE EXTENSION OF KEAUNUI DRIVE TO RENTON 
ROAD IN EWA BEACH,” was adopted. 
 

 At 7:17 p.m., the Senate stood in recess subject to the call of 
the Chair. 
 

 The Senate reconvened at 7:17 p.m. 
 

FINAL READING 
 

Conf. Com. Rep. No. 3 (H.B. No. 170, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Rhoads, seconded by Senator Kim and 
carried, Conf. Com. Rep. No. 3 was adopted and H.B. No. 170, 
H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ETHICS,” passed Final Reading on the 
following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25. Noes, none.   
 

MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS 
 

RECONSIDERATION OF ACTIONS TAKEN 
 

S.B. No. 1292, S.D. 2 (H.D. 3): 
 

 Senator Wakai moved that the Senate reconsider its action 
taken on April 11, 2019, in disagreeing to the amendments 
proposed by the House to S.B. No. 1292, S.D. 2, seconded by 
Senator English and carried. 
 

 Senator Wakai then moved that the Senate agree to the 
amendments proposed by the House to S.B. No. 1292, S.D. 2, 
seconded by Senator English. 
 

 Senator Wakai noted: 
 

 “Mr. President, this measure provides us much-needed 
revenues to deliver much-needed government services.” 
 

 Senator Thielen rose to speak in opposition to the motion as 
follows: 
 

 “Members, I apologize in advance; it’s been an emotional 
week, but I rise in opposition to this motion. I’d like to read an 
email that I received today: 
 

Good afternoon, Senator Thielen [spelled incorrectly]. I 
ask that you please vote ‘no’ on S.B. 1292, H.D. 3, and 
here is why. My name is [I’ll respect his privacy]. I am 
a retired battalion chief with the Honolulu Fire 
Department. I grew up in Kailua and have lived in the 
Waimānalo Beach lot subdivision for the last 19 years. 
Over the past 50 years, I’ve seen the illegal vacation 
rental industry ruin our island home by replacing local 
families in our residential communities with tourists. I 
searched the internet and walked my neighborhood, and 
this is what I was able to find: According to the City 
and County of Honolulu’s property tax maps, there are 
282 residential properties in the Waimānalo Beach lot 
subdivision. Internet searches of Airbnb, VRBO, and 
Google Maps showed the following: 68 illegal vacation 
rentals on 57 properties, 34 transient vacation units (8 
of these have more than one rental on the property), 
23   shared homes/B&B. Twenty percent of our 
neighborhood is no longer available for rent to local 
residents, and this is only the beginning. There are 
several more properties that are for sale and/or under 

construction as we speak. The list price is starting at 
$1,200,000—who will buy these? Local residents? I 
think not. These will also become illegal transient 
vacation units. There are more that I could not verify. 
This is an epidemic. If we don’t put a stop to this 
industry, where are our children going to live? Who will 
rent to locals when they can rent to tourists for three or 
four times as much? Twenty percent of my 
neighborhood is already gone. This industry is driving 
prices up and squeezing the top of the housing market. 
This pushes residents who are trying to buy or rent a 
house down a rung, and the poorest kama‘āina fall off 
the bottom and end up homeless or having to move 
away. Stop this crime so local people can afford to buy 
and rent here. Let’s be a part of the solution, not part of 
the problem. I have a personal stake in this fight: My 
own daughter is moving to California in June because 
she cannot afford to rent an apartment and live her life 
without working three jobs. Please vote ‘no’ on 
S.B. 1292, H.D. 3. Let’s not let this illegal industry 
have any ground to stand on here in Hawai‘i. 

 

 “Twelve ninety-two started out as a Senate bill. We worked 
really hard on the Senate position, as we have done every year 
for the past three years, to have a responsible bill, to make sure 
that these illegal vacation rental operators could be managed, 
that they could not hide behind one of the internet platforms and 
proliferate and crowd out our neighborhoods. This gentleman is 
writing from Waimānalo. The neighborhood I grew up in 
Kailua—that was lost years ago. It’s moving to Kāne‘ohe; it’s 
moving around the corner to Hawai‘i Kai, and the locals who 
are crowded out in the neighborhoods are moving even farther 
into the next neighborhood and the next. If we don’t manage it 
the way the Senate position has been solidly for the last three 
years, it’s going to get worse and worse. There is an ability for 
this legislature this session to pass responsible legislation. 
Sitting here in the Senate is this bill, 1292. We can move to 
accept it, and it would hold the platforms liable for paying TAT 
and GET on every vacation rental unit that they book. 
 

 “At the same time, sitting in the House is House Bill 419, 
which the Senate amended to put in the provisions that we have 
fought to have passed out of this legislature for the last three 
years that would give the counties the ability to manage these 
vacation rentals, to make sure that they’re operating in 
conformance with county laws and would stop the platforms 
from booking the unauthorized vacation rentals. House Bill 419, 
Senate Draft 2, follows almost exactly the language that was 
used in an ordinance in Santa Monica, California. Airbnb and 
HomeAway sued. They said you can’t pass these kinds of 
regulations because we’re protected by the federal 
Communications Decency Act. And that case went on up to the 
Ninth Circuit, which is the same federal circuit that governs 
Hawai‘i, and the Ninth Circuit appellate court said the Santa 
Monica ordinance is legal. It is not preempted by federal law. 
 

 “So just as we are being asked to move to accept 1292, the 
House can move to accept House Bill 419. It doesn’t have to go 
through any committee; it’s not being governed by any 
particular chair or individual member. It is a bill that is sitting 
on the House floor, and the members can move to accept it. I 
don’t know whether we’re going to go forward with the move to 
accept 1292, but I know there are a lot of concerns in the 
Senate. Do we want to be known as a legislature that’s just 
going to make a tax grab and act as a shield for illegal vacation 
rentals to continue to proliferate and take over neighborhood 
after neighborhood? Or do we want to be a legislature that 
changes the narrative, says we want to do both, making sure 
that vacation rentals are paying their fair share of the taxes that 
are due and we want to make sure that the counties have the 
ability to regulate the operations within their counties in a 
manner that works for the different counties around our state to 
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make sure that we can protect our communities and our housing 
for local peoples. I come from a community that would not 
understand me doing anything but a ‘no’ vote on this move to 
accept Senate Bill 1292, but I understand that many people are 
holding out hope that the House will take similar action on 
House Bill 419, and I think it’s important that we send a very 
strong message to the House and to everybody who is watching 
here tonight. Four nineteen, Senate Draft 2, is on the floor of the 
house. Any member can make the motion to accept the Senate 
version of that bill. That will assure that our counties have the 
ability to regulate the vacation rentals in their districts and the 
platforms that are funneling the over 30,000 different units that 
are being operated and offered in our state. They may not be in 
your neighborhood yet, but ‘yet’ is the operative word. And if 
you think that this is a fiscal bonanza for the state, we’ve been 
getting less revenue per capita from tourists for the last 20 
years, but that decline accelerated over the last 10 and even 
more over the last 5. Why? Because people can rent out a room; 
they can rent out a unit; they don’t have to comply with 
permitting; they don’t have to comply with restrictions, and it’s 
cheap. So do we open the door to less and less revenue from 
more and more people with less and less housing for more of 
our residents? Or do we insist that, if we’re going to pass 
something out of this legislature, that it be responsible and 
support both the counties’ and the state’s needs on vacation 
rentals? I ask, if you cannot vote ‘no’ on this motion, to at least 
step forward with reservations to send a strong signal to the 
House that we need them to come to the table so that we can 
protect our communities, our ‘ohana, and our housing. Mahalo.” 
 

 Senator Fevella rose to speak in opposition to the motion as 
follows: 
 

 “I brought this up before, and I’ll bring it up again. We 
wanted the city and county to take lead. Tuesday, went to the 
city council: Councilwoman Pine, Councilman Anderson 
decided to come up with a bill, 89. In the bill, it says to keep the 
resorts resorts, and if these bed and breakfasts and these people 
who want to do vacation rentals need to do it in the resort area. I 
thought was fabulous, awesome. Went down there—sorry to my 
senators and Senate President; that’s the reason why I wasn’t in 
chambers—I went down there on the behalf of my community 
that’s getting slapped, cracks, and everything that you can think 
of by these vacation rentals. I brought up this example before, 
and I’ll bring it up again. ‘Ewa Beach Road, 96706, guys: 
Please visit. Beautiful place to grow up. Plenty local families, 
plenty ‘ohana, are getting ripped apart by these vacation rentals. 
Simple country home built in the ’40s, maybe early ‘50s, was 
made with three bedrooms (very small, now, not like the ones 
you see now; very country). Fifteen vacation rental adults 
decide to rent ’em. Person who rented to them did not know that 
they were going to have 15 people there, 7 cars, bonfire. That’s 
why I talk about making doodoo in my community, and I want 
it to stop. We have the sewer treatment plant; that is fine. But 
when you want to do that on my beaches and in my community, 
I get offended. That’s the reason why I went to the city council, 
and I was so happy to see that they were trying to do something. 
You know, me and Councilwoman Pine and Ron Menor, 
sometimes we don’t see eye to eye, but when they came up with 
something like this, I was like, finally! Finally, they’re going to 
do something for our state, which we talked about, that they 
need to take the lead. And then, here we are: we’re going to 
pass something that’s going to chastise their movement. It’s 
going to handcuff the city in doing what they said they were 
going to do. 
 

 “In ‘Ewa Beach—I’m not sure about all the rest of the 
communities—but my community speaks loud to me. They do 
not want this; they don’t want it in our community. We have a 
house that is being built right now, right now: 15 bedrooms, 7 
bathrooms, but they’re smart. They hide all the utilities, wait till 
the city pau pass ’em. Soon as they’re gone, they know that 

they’re not going to get inspected again. So guess what aunty 
and uncle gotta live next door to; you know goin’ have more 
than 15 people in that house. We want rest for our elderly and 
our seniors and our local families and our community. They 
deserve it! They live there all their lives. To have a 
transformation of a community to be tourism, that is so not 
native to what we do over there in ‘Ewa Beach. There’s a place 
for it, and that’s Waikīkī. And that’s what the council had, and 
when I read that, I was so happy, seriously. And then tonight, 
when I went to the meeting earlier, to one of the committee 
meetings, and they said, oh, that this was just going to go 
straight to the Senate floor, something I learned today. And I 
was very disappointed because I was going to voice myself in 
the committee and say how I felt about this bill and why. But 
we’re here today, again, debating on something that we 
shouldn’t be debating about because no neighborhood should be 
subject—not yours, not mine—to something that is not legal. 
It’s not legal for us to have this. It’s not something that is easy. I 
goin’ tell you right now, five to six of those houses, Filipino 
booking agencies. Six of those houses, they don’t live in the 
States. They never came to Hawai‘i! They purchased that home 
online. These are the people that we’re dealing with. 
 

 “So please, I ask you, my fellow senators, please do not vote 
for this bill, because it’s going to hurt my community and a lot 
of other communities. Give my community, give my ‘Ewa 
Beach residents, my seniors a rest from this kind of everyday 
weekend partying. We know it’s illegal to burn stuff on the 
beach; DLNR says that. But they go take pallets and cardboard 
from the stores, and they burn ’em. ’Kay, fine, but they no clean 
their mess! We get turtles come over there, monk seals. Our 
beaches are beautiful, guys. You guys gotta come and see! You 
can see all of Diamond Head from ‘Ewa Beach Road; beautiful, 
clean ocean. To have this in our community is just a stab in the 
heart for the people who work hard, plantation; they don’t need 
that. We don’t need that, and we’re going to send a message 
tonight; if we vote this down, we’ll send a message to them that 
you gotta get out those neighborhoods. That’s not where you 
belong! Take your action to Waikīkī, the resort areas, like how it 
said in the council bill—resort areas, not residential. So that’s 
my plea to you guys tonight, and I hope you guys make the 
decision and vote this thing down. Thank you.” 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz rose to speak in support of the motion as 
follows: 
 

 “I share the concerns of many of the members. When the bill 
originally passed the Senate, it had a lot of the language that 
was referred to that would help with enforcement. However, 
this bill has $46 million attached to it, and so the hurt that 
communities will also receive if we don’t pass this bill is 
tremendous. This bill may determine if Maui Hospital is 
funded; right now, we’ve approved $22.5 million for Maui 
Hospital. We just passed today a high-tech tax credit with 
$5 million; it could affect that. There’s $4 million for UH 
athletics; there’s millions of dollars in collective bargaining; 
there’s at least $20 million for Aloha Stadium, $15 million for a 
tax credit, and there are still a lot of bills out there for 
education, economic development, public safety, health, and the 
environment. So I understand people have concerns, but it’s 
also our duty to pass a balanced budget, and so unless members 
are willing to forego all the bills with the monies attached, I 
urge my colleagues to at least let the measure move and 
eventually pass so that we can have a balanced budget and fund 
these very needed programs. Thank you.” 
 

 Senator Ruderman rose to speak in support of the motion 
with reservations as follows: 
 

 “I want the tax funding just as much as anybody here, and I 
respect the Ways and Means chair’s desire to be fiscally 
responsible and I support his concerns. I’ll be voting ‘with 
reservations’ because this bill, to me, is toxic if H.B. 419 does 
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not pass, and I just want to state clearly that if 419 does not 
pass, I’ll have to vote ‘no’ on it tomorrow night. I hope I’m not 
alone. Thank you.” 
 

 Senator Riviere rose to speak in opposition to the motion as 
follows: 
 

 “The version that we passed out of this chamber, the Senate, 
to the House was a well-crafted bill, as previously stated, and 
it’s been our position. It’s been our Senate position because it’s 
an honorable bill. It does the right thing: It has enforcement and 
tax collection. Somewhere along the way in the other chamber, 
it got changed and it had taken away all the enforcement and the 
oversight and the mechanisms that made it a balanced bill. I 
think it’s unreasonable that now we are being asked to take a 
bill that is not our position, nor did the other side even come to 
negotiate in good faith on the Senate versus the House position. 
So, to just roll over and to accept the House position, in this 
case, is unacceptable to me. 
 

 “I do believe that the people doing the business should pay 
the tax, but I do not believe that we should covet that money so 
much that we lose sight of the bigger picture. The bigger picture 
is the health and wellness of our communities. As the previous 
speaker from ‘Ewa Beach mentioned, it’s destroying our 
communities, and it’s coming everywhere. It’s really wreaking 
havoc, and it’s just unacceptable that we should be so worried 
about getting what amounts to maybe 2 percent of the budget if 
this passes or doesn’t pass, and if the revenues actually 
materialize in the amounts that are estimated because, according 
to most of these vacation rental people, they’re already paying 
their taxes—so they say, the illegal activities that they’re doing. 
 

 “So I think if you look at the volume of emails that we’ve 
received, the passionate opposition to this bill, 1292, there’s no 
question which is the right side to be on if you’re looking to 
serve the people. If your heart is with the people, I don’t how 
we can do this without requiring enforcement and correction. 
This bill is going to create hardships for the counties. The 
county of Honolulu is on the verge of finally getting control of 
their policies, and this bill, I think, is going to make it that much 
harder for them by providing that shield and that tacit approval 
for what is an illegal activity, so we are now coveting taxes on 
illegal activity. That’s wrong; we shouldn’t be going there. So I 
think if your values are clear, decision-making is easy, and I 
think that going for this now, just because we have no choice, I 
don’t think that’s clear thinking. Thank you.” 
 

 The Chair made the following clarification: 
 

 “Is there any discussion? If not, we have a motion to 
approve, and let me be clear to the members and the audience: 
If the motion passes, this is to put a 24-hour notice for a final 
vote, possibly tomorrow. Any vote being taken right now is a 
procedural vote in positioning the bill and not a final approval 
for the bill.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, the Senate 
agreed to the amendments proposed by the House to S.B. 
No. 1292, S.D. 2, and S.B. No. 1292, S.D. 2, H.D. 3, entitled:  
“A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TRANSIENT 
ACCOMMODATIONS,” was placed on the calendar for Final 
Reading on Friday, April 26, 2019, with Senators Chang, 
Gabbard, Ihara, Inouye, Kanuha, Keohokalole, Kim, Ruderman, 
Shimabukuro, and Taniguchi voting “Aye with Reservations” 
and Senators Fevella, Harimoto, Kahele, Moriwaki, Rhoads, 
Riviere, and Thielen voting “No.” 
 

S.B. No. 1271, S.D. 1 (H.D. 1): 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz moved that the Senate reconsider its 
action taken on April 11, 2019, in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the House to S.B. No. 1271, S.D. 1, 
seconded by Senator Kahele and carried. 

 Senator Dela Cruz then moved that the Senate agree to the 
amendments proposed by the House to S.B. No. 1271, S.D. 1, 
seconded by Senator Kahele. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz noted: 
 

 “S.B. No. 1271, S.D. 1 (H.D. 1) would allow the Department 
of Accounting and General Services or the Department of 
Taxation to offset a debt owed to any state agency against a 
debtor’s tax refund. Both departments are also required to notify 
the debtors and provide certain information to the claimant 
agencies.” 
 

 The motion was put by the Chair and carried, the Senate 
agreed to the amendments proposed by the House to S.B. 
No. 1271, S.D. 1, and S.B. No. 1271, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, entitled:  
“A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TAX REFUND 
OFFSETS,” was placed on the calendar for Final Reading on 
Friday, April 26, 2019. 
 

 The Chair then made the following announcement: 
 

 “The decking deadline for all non-fiscal bills in conference is 
11:30 p.m. tonight.” 
 

DISCHARGE OF CONFEREES 
 

S.B. No. 78, S.D. 2 (H.D. 2): 
 

 The President discharged all conferees on the part of the 
Senate for the conference to be held for consideration of 
amendments proposed by the House to S.B. No. 78, S.D. 2. 
 

CONFERENCE COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

 On motion by Senator Kahele, seconded by Senator Fevella 
and carried unanimously, the Senate authorized the Clerk to 
receive conference committee reports on Senate and House bills 
for Final Reading. In consequence thereof, and subsequent to its 
recessing at 7:43 p.m., the Senate took the following actions: 
 

 Senator Chang, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 699, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 37) recommending that H.B. No. 699, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 37 and 
H.B. No. 699, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII PUBLIC HOUSING 
AUTHORITY,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 471, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 38) recommending that H.B. No. 471, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 38 and 
H.B. No. 471, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO AGING,” was deferred for a period of 
48 hours. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 257, H.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 39) recommending that H.B. No. 257, H.D. 2, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 39 and 
H.B. No. 257, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO HOMELESSNESS,” was deferred for 
a period of 48 hours. 
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 Senator Thielen, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 999, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 40) recommending that H.B. No. 999, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 40 and 
H.B. No. 999, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EXEMPTIONS FROM CIVIL 
SERVICE,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 214, H.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 41) recommending that H.B. No. 214, H.D. 2, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 41 and 
H.B. No. 214, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO DISINTERMENT OF HUMAN 
BODIES,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 252, presented a report (Conf. Com. 
Rep. No. 42) recommending that H.B. No. 252, S.D. 1, as 
amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 42 and 
H.B. No. 252, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO SPEECH PATHOLOGY,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 665, H.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 43) recommending that H.B. No. 665, H.D. 2, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 43 and 
H.B. No. 665, H.D. 2, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE ELECTRONIC 
PRESCRIPTION ACCOUNTABILITY SYSTEM,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Taniguchi, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 913, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 44) recommending that H.B. No. 913, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 44 and 
H.B. No. 913, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII LABOR RELATIONS 
BOARD,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 989, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 45) recommending that H.B. No. 989, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 45 and 
H.B. No. 989, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MORTGAGE SERVICERS,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 

the Senate to H.B. No. 991, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 46) recommending that H.B. No. 991, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 46 and 
H.B. No. 991, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO STATE MILITARY FORCES,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Wakai, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 556, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 47) recommending that H.B. No. 556, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 47 and 
H.B. No. 556, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO ENERGY EFFICIENCY,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 407, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 48) recommending that H.B. No. 407, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 48 and 
H.B. No. 407, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EDUCATION,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Shimabukuro, for the Committee on Conference on 
the disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 420, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 49) recommending that H.B. No. 420, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 49 and 
H.B. No. 420, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO HAWAIIAN CULTURE,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Wakai, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 272, presented a report (Conf. Com. Rep. 
No. 50) recommending that S.B. No. 272, H.D. 2, as amended 
in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 50 and 
S.B. No. 272, H.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO SOLAR ENERGY DEVICES,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 660, presented a report (Conf. Com. Rep. 
No. 51) recommending that S.B. No. 660, H.D. 1, as amended 
in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 51 and 
S.B. No. 660, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO STATE IDENTIFICATION CARDS,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 723, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 52) recommending that S.B. No. 723, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
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 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 52 and 
S.B. No. 723, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE UNIFORM PARENTAGE 
ACT,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1039, presented a report (Conf. Com. 
Rep. No. 53) recommending that S.B. No. 1039, H.D. 1, as 
amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 53 and 
S.B. No. 1039, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PROSTITUTION,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Taniguchi, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 941, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 54) recommending that H.B. No. 941, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 54 and 
H.B. No. 941, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EMPLOYEE’S DESIGNATION OF 
BENEFICIARY FORM,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 290, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 55) recommending that H.B. No. 290, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 55 and 
H.B. No. 290, H.D. 1, S.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE UNIFORM CONTROLLED 
SUBSTANCES ACT,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 323, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 56) recommending that H.B. No. 323, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 56 and 
H.B. No. 323, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MOTOR VEHICLE 
REGISTRATION,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the House to the amendments proposed by 
the Senate to H.B. No. 756, H.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 57) recommending that H.B. No. 756, H.D. 1, 
S.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 57 and 
H.B. No. 756, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO TRANSPORTATION,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1221, presented a report (Conf. Com. 
Rep. No. 58) recommending that S.B. No. 1221, H.D. 1, as 
amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 58 and 
S.B. No. 1221, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 

ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII TEACHER STANDARDS 
BOARD,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 981, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 59) recommending that S.B. No. 981, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 59 and 
S.B. No. 981, S.D. 2, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII TEACHER 
STANDARDS BOARD SPECIAL FUND,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 770, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 60) recommending that S.B. No. 770, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 60 and 
S.B. No. 770, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO REAL ESTATE LICENSES,” was 
deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1486, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 61) recommending that S.B. No. 1486, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 61 and 
S.B. No. 1486, S.D. 1, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO ELECTRONIC PRESCRIPTION 
ACCOUNTABILITY SYSTEM,” was deferred for a period of 
48 hours. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 98, presented a report (Conf. Com. Rep. 
No. 62) recommending that S.B. No. 98, H.D. 1, as amended in 
C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 62 and 
S.B. No. 98, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CROSSWALK SAFETY,” was deferred for a 
period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1236, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 63) recommending that S.B. No. 1236, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 63 and 
S.B. No. 1236, S.D. 2, H.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PARKING FOR DISABLED 
PERSONS,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Inouye, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 693, S.D. 2, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 64) recommending that S.B. No. 693, S.D. 2, 
H.D. 1, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 64 and 
S.B. No. 693, S.D. 2, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
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AN ACT RELATING TO THE STATEWIDE TRAFFIC 
CODE,” was deferred for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 551, S.D. 1, presented a report (Conf. 
Com. Rep. No. 65) recommending that S.B. No. 551, S.D. 1, 
H.D. 2, as amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 65 and 
S.B. No. 551, S.D. 1, H.D. 2, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CONDOMINIUMS,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

 Senator Rhoads, for the Committee on Conference on the 
disagreeing vote of the Senate to the amendments proposed by 
the House to S.B. No. 1342, presented a report (Conf. Com. 
Rep. No. 66) recommending that S.B. No. 1342, H.D. 1, as 
amended in C.D. 1, pass Final Reading. 
 

 In accordance with Article III, Section 15 of the Constitution 
of the State of Hawai‘i, action on Conf. Com. Rep. No. 66 and 
S.B. No. 1342, H.D. 1, C.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE PROBATE CODE,” was deferred 
for a period of 48 hours. 
 

ADJOURNMENT 
 

 At 12:00 a.m. midnight, the Senate adjourned until 6:30 p.m., 
Friday, April 26, 2019. 
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