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THIRTY-NINTH  DAY 

 
Wednesday, April 1, 2015 

 

 The Senate of the Twenty-Eighth Legislature of the State of 
Hawai‘i, Regular Session of 2015, convened at 11:38 a.m. with 
the President in the Chair. 
 

 The Roll was called showing all Senators present. 
 

 The President announced that she had read and approved the 
Journal of the Thirty-Eighth Day. 
 

 Senator Espero, on behalf of Senate President Kim, 
introduced Naia Torres, the reigning USA National Miss 
Hawaii Preteen 2015 and Miss Pre-Teen Hawaii 2014, who was 
accompanied in the gallery by her mother, Tamyra. 
 

 Senator Taniguchi introduced members of the Graduate 
Student Organization at the University of Hawai‘i at Mānoa: 
President Michelle Tigchelaar, Advocacy Co-Chairs Jonathan 
Dial and Nicholas Chagnon, Employment and Compensation 
Chair Bret Polopolus-Meredith, Newsletter Chair Camila 
Ortega, Graduate Student Legislative Fellow Kristine Jan 
Espinoza, Penn Pantumsinchai, Sanna King, Valerie “Pua” 
Hookano Jeter, Pablo Wegesend, Eg Hoogland, and Ryan 
Tolman. 
 

 Senator Kahele congratulated Team Hoku members Brian 
Hall, Theodore Derego, and Casey Pearring for winning the 
2015 Microsoft Imagine Cup Pitch Video Challenge in the 
Games Category. The team members were present in the gallery 
with Jerry Chang, director of university relations at the 
University of Hawai‘i at Hilo; Harry Keith Edwards, the team’s 
instructor; and Misty Carmichael, Brian Hall’s wife. 
 

 Senator Baker welcomed State Representative Jo Jordan, 
former Chair of the Democratic Party of Hawai‘i Dante 
Carpenter, and Jonathan Starr, who were present in the gallery. 
 

 Senator Shimabukuro recognized the outstanding advocacy 
of Art Frank, and presented the following remarks: 
 

 “Thank you so much, Madam President. Art Frank, who is a 
deaf quadriplegic, is someone who has defied all the odds and 
served Hawai‘i’s community in countless ways. He has had a 
long and active role with the disabled community, on the 
Wai‘anae Coast, and with the Hawai‘i Democratic Party. 
 

 “In 1981, Mr. Frank spent five years lobbying for a bill 
which allows deaf individuals to attend government meetings 
and request a sign language interpreter or communication 
access real time translation, also known as ‘CART.’ He also 
worked tirelessly to ensure that Capitol restrooms were ADA-
compliant and that disabled parking was afforded to disabled 
visitors at the Capitol, enduring 27 parking tickets in the 
process. 
 

 “Mr. Frank has also testified in support of measures to 
benefit the Wai‘anae Coast. He has come to the Capitol on short 
notice numerous times to speak out in favor of measures to help 
alleviate traffic and otherwise improve conditions for the west 
side. He also attends neighborhood board and other community 
meetings and events aimed at bettering the lives of those on the 
Wai‘anae Coast. 
 

 “Mr. Frank, along with his dear friend who we are also 
honoring today, Al Lewis, has been a devoted member of the 
Democratic Party for decades. Mr. Frank and Mr. Lewis have 
volunteered countless hours for many campaigns. I met both of 
them on the campaign trail and was deeply inspired by their 
positive energy, enthusiasm, and sense of humor. Mr. Frank, 
who resides on the Wai‘anae Coast, and Mr. Lewis, who hails 
from Waimānalo, have volunteered for campaigns spanning the 

island, going as far as the opposite side of the island to support 
the candidates they believe in. 
 

 “Raised in Waimānalo, Mr. Frank graduated from St. Louis 
High School and is proud of his Hawaiian and ‘chop suey’ 
heritage. He jokes that he met his devoted wife, Carolyn, in the 
shower. In fact, she was his nurse, and the first time they met 
happened to be in the shower of his hospital room. Since being 
married, Carolyn learned sign language and has always been 
Mr. Frank’s rock. Carolyn has supported all of her husband’s 
many community activities and kept the home fires burning 
during the many hours he has spent away from home serving 
his community. 
 

 “The fact that we are honoring Mr. Frank and Mr. Lewis on 
April 1st, April Fools’ Day, couldn’t be more appropriate. Both 
are always cracking jokes and pranks, and together they brought 
double the laughter to all in their company. Mr. Frank told me 
that he once proved a point about the inadequacy of the 
Capitol’s bathrooms for the disabled by hurling a roll of toilet 
paper to the ceiling. That’s the kind of comic relief we need 
more of at the Capitol. 
 

 “I wanted to end by expressing my heartfelt thanks to 
Mr. Frank. He was like an angel sent down from the heavens in 
my time of need. The devotion and time he has spent supporting 
me and the belief that he had in me were instrumental in getting 
me to where I am today, and I will forever be grateful. Now that 
I have met Mr. Frank, whenever I feel my troubles are 
overwhelming, I often think of him. And once he pops into my 
head, I can’t help but smile. I don’t think Mr. Frank, who is a 
deaf quadriplegic, has ever spent a minute feeling sorry for 
himself. Instead, he’s a man who understands how precious life 
is and has chosen to use every ounce of his energy to try and 
make the world a better place. 
 

 “Accompanying Mr. Frank on the floor are his wife and 
sisters. We have his wife, Carolyn Frank; his sister Gwen 
Ahana; and sister Susan Frank-Kama. Thank you so much for 
being here as well. And also here for Mr. Frank in the gallery 
are his friends and relatives, some of whom are from the deaf 
community. We have Representative Jo Jordan; Ruth ‘Wai’ 
Paaoao; Kukana Kama-Toth; Dr. Lawrence Redmond; Debbie 
and Jesse Jackson; Reverend David and Juanita Schiewek; 
Dante Carpenter; Nancyann Micky; Wilfred Soong; Ed Chevy; 
Linda and Jeff Lemrecht; Billy Kekua; Darlene Ewan; Colleen 
Adade; Lisa Tom; and Patty Sakal. And if I missed anyone, 
please do rise. Audience, let’s please thank these guests. Thank 
you.” 
 

 Senator Thielen honored and remembered the life of Albert 
Lewis, and presented the following remarks: 
 

 “Thank you, Madam President. It’s my honor today to pay 
tribute to the late Al Lewis. I want to begin by thanking Art 
Frank; as Senator Shimabukuro said, the two of them were very 
close friends. They grew up together in Waimānalo, and I can 
just see the trouble they caused as young children. And when 
Senator Shimabukuro told Art that she wanted to honor him 
today on the floor, his first request was, ‘Can we also honor Al 
Lewis?’, his good buddy. 
 

 “So I wanted to recognize Al Lewis as one of Waimānalo’s 
most influential community leaders, who selflessly contributed 
to helping those in need. Uncle Al was born in Honolulu on 
May 28, 1944. He’s a graduate of Kailua High School and 
worked for the State of Hawai‘i. 
 

 “Uncle Al became a card-carrying Democrat as soon as he 
could vote at the age of 21 and was a loyal member of the 
Democratic Party of Hawai‘i his entire life. He was a dedicated 
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supporter of local labor groups and committed his time to public 
service and participated in community affairs, including being 
chairman of the Waimānalo Neighborhood Board. 
 

 “During all of his community work, Uncle Al always found 
time for his friends. One night, he was invited to a party that 
was made up of all couples but only one other unmarried 
person, a young woman visiting from the mainland. Uncle Al, 
all six foot four inches of him, swept the young Florence Mae 
Bowes, or Bowsie, just under five feet, off of her feet. And they 
married and became parents to David and Kaleo, and 
grandparents to Kawika, Kristy, Alapaki, and Brieanne. 
 

 “In between all of his family time, though, Uncle Al founded 
the Friends of Waimanalo. He brought communities together 
from all areas of the island to the Waimanalo Community 
Carnival every year, which he was the voice of the community 
carnival. He was the president of the Waimanalo Council of 
Community Organizations, the Waimanalo Jaycees, and worked 
with the Waimanalo Teen Project. He enriched the lives of 
families, keiki, and kūpuna alike and impacted others around 
him with his integrity and make-a-difference outlook. 
 

 “But Uncle Al would not have been able to accomplish his 
community efforts without the full support of his loving wife, 
Bowsie. Bowsie is a former registered nurse and has been 
devotedly at Uncle Al’s side every single day. She was his 
inspiration and encouraged him emotionally and was the 
strength behind his passion to serve. It is her dedication which 
permitted Uncle Al to be generous with his time and a 
significant advocate of Waimānalo who inspired everyone who 
met him. 
 

 “I first met Uncle Al about three years ago, and he was a 
man with about the biggest heart that I knew. It’s funny because 
many of us, we fight over limited resources, but Uncle Al knew 
that there was one resource that was never limited, and that was 
love. And no matter how much love you gave away, there 
was  always more love to give. He dedicated his time to 
helping  cancer victims – he would drive them to get their 
chemotherapy, and on the way home, against the rules of the 
American Cancer Society, he would take them to do whatever 
errands they wanted. But the head of the American Cancer 
Society, a former colleague of ours, said they would make 
exceptions for Uncle Al because they knew that it was just in 
his nature to give and give and give. 
 

 “So I’d like to honor his memory but also to honor his family 
today: his son David and his wife, Bowsie – if you two would 
stand to be recognized, because Uncle Al would not have been 
able to do what he did without your strength and support day in 
and day out. And the many members in the gallery who are 
friends of Uncle Al as well, thank you for attending today.” 
 

 At 11:53 a.m., the Senate stood in recess subject to the call of 
the Chair. 
 

 The Senate reconvened at 12:02 p.m. 
 

MESSAGES FROM THE GOVERNOR 
 

 The following messages from the Governor (Gov. Msg. 
Nos. 554 to 610) were read by the Clerk and were disposed of 
as follows: 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 554, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Commission to Promote Uniform 
Legislation, the nomination of KEN TAKAYAMA, term to 
expire June 30, 2019, was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 555, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Acupuncture, the nomination of 
LAURA CHOCK, term to expire June 30, 2016, was referred to 
the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 

 Gov. Msg. No. 556, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Acupuncture, the nomination of 
JAMES CORCORAN, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 557, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Private Detectives and Guards, the 
nomination of HARRY KUBOJIRI, term to expire June 30, 
2015, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 558, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Private Detectives and Guards, the 
nomination of HARRY KUBOJIRI, term to expire June 30, 
2018, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 559, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Physical Therapy, the nomination 
of DEBRA KUBOTA, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 560, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Physical Therapy, the nomination 
of RACHELLE IOPA, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 561, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Physical Therapy, the nomination 
of MICHAEL TURNER, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 562, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Physical Therapy, the nomination 
of JILL WAKABAYASHI, term to expire June 30, 2018, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 563, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Psychology, the nomination of 
LISA CHUN FAT, term to expire June 30, 2019, was referred 
to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 564, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Psychology, the nomination of 
BRIAN COMBS, term to expire June 30, 2019, was referred to 
the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 565, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Dental Examiners, the nomination 
of RODNEY CHING, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 566, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Dental Examiners, the nomination 
of PAUL GUEVARA, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 567, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Dental Examiners, the nomination 
of MARIANNE TIMMERMAN, term to expire June 30, 2019, 
was referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 568, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Dental Examiners, the nomination 
of COY REBMANN, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
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 Gov. Msg. No. 569, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Dental Examiners, the nomination 
of CANDACE WADA, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 570, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Speech Pathology and Audiology, 
the nomination of SHANNON CHING, term to expire June 30, 
2017, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 571, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Speech Pathology and Audiology, 
the nomination of VALERY OBRIEN, term to expire June 30, 
2017, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 572, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Speech Pathology and Audiology, 
the nomination of JUNE UYEHARA ISONO, term to expire 
June 30, 2018, was referred to the Committee on Commerce 
and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 573, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Veterinary Examiners, the 
nomination of JULIE ADRIAN, term to expire June 30, 2015, 
was referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 574, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Veterinary Examiners, the 
nomination of JULIE ADRIAN, term to expire June 30, 2019, 
was referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 575, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Professional Engineers, Architects, 
Surveyors, and Landscape Architects, the nomination of ALAN 
INABA, term to expire June 30, 2019, was referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 576, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Professional Engineers, Architects, 
Surveyors, and Landscape Architects, the nomination of RON 
IWAMOTO, term to expire June 30, 2018, was referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 577, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Professional Engineers, Architects, 
Surveyors, and Landscape Architects, the nomination of 
CLAYTON PANG, term to expire June 30, 2017, was referred 
to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 578, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Professional Engineers, Architects, 
Surveyors, and Landscape Architects, the nomination of MARC 
VENTURA, term to expire June 30, 2016, was referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 579, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Board of Professional Engineers, Architects, 
Surveyors, and Landscape Architects, the nomination of 
JOYCE NOE, term to expire June 30, 2018, was referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 580, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
PETER HALFORD, MD, term to expire June 30, 2018, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 581, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
DARREN EGAMI, MD, term to expire June 30, 2018, was 

referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 582, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
PALASI-SAM PULETASI, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 583, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
JONE GEIMER-FLANDERS, DO, term to expire June 30, 
2015, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 584, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
JONE GEIMER-FLANDERS, DO, term to expire June 30, 
2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 585, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
GERARD AKAKA, MD, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 586, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Medical Board, the nomination of 
SHARON BINTLIFF, MD, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 587, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Motor Vehicle Industry Licensing Board, 
the nomination of WAYNE DE LUZ, term to expire June 30, 
2015, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 588, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Motor Vehicle Industry Licensing Board, 
the nomination of WAYNE DE LUZ, term to expire June 30, 
2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 589, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Motor Vehicle Industry Licensing Board, 
the nomination of CARL D. JOHNSEN, term to expire June 30, 
2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 590, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Motor Vehicle Industry Licensing Board, 
the nomination of RUSSELL WONG, term to expire June 30, 
2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 591, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Motor Vehicle Industry Licensing Board, 
the nomination of BYRON HANSEN, term to expire June 30, 
2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 592, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Real Estate Commission, the nomination of 
ALETA KLEIN, term to expire June 30, 2017, was referred to 
the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 593, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Barbering and Cosmetology, 
the nomination of ANNE TOKUNAGA, term to expire June 30, 
2017, was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 594, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Barbering and Cosmetology, 
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the nomination of ANGELA HOWARD, term to expire 
June 30, 2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce 
and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 595, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Chiropractic Examiners, the 
nomination of ROBERT KLEIN, term to expire June 30, 2019, 
was referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 596, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Nursing, the nomination of 
JUDY KODAMA, term to expire June 30, 2017, was referred to 
the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 597, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Nursing, the nomination of 
MAY KEALOHA, term to expire June 30, 2017, was referred 
to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 598, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Nursing, the nomination of 
LYLE KAUIHOU, term to expire June 30, 2016, was referred 
to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 599, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Nursing, the nomination of 
OLIVIA KIM, term to expire June 30, 2018, was referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 600, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Pest Control Board, the nomination of 
TERRANCE MANAGO, term to expire June 30, 2019, was 
referred to the Committee on Commerce and Consumer 
Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 601, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Pest Control Board, the nomination of 
DAVID LAU, term to expire June 30, 2019, was referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 602, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Teacher Standards Board, the 
nomination of BRANDEN KAWAZOE, term to expire June 30, 
2018, was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 603, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawai‘i Teacher Standards Board, the 
nomination of ROXANE STEWART, term to expire June 30, 
2016, was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 604, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawaii Teacher Standards Board, the 
nomination of LESLIE MURASHIGE, term to expire June 30, 
2015, was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 605, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawaii Teacher Standards Board, the 
nomination of LESLIE MURASHIGE, term to expire June 30, 
2018, was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 606, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawaii Teacher Standards Board, the 
nomination of KARIANE PARK TOYAMA, term to expire 
June 30, 2017, was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 607, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Endangered Species Recovery Committee, 
the nomination of ERIC VANDERWERF, term to expire 
June 30, 2019, was referred to the Committee on Energy and 
Environment. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 608, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Endangered Species Recovery Committee, 
the nomination of SAMUEL GON, term to expire June 30, 

2019, was referred to the Committee on Energy and 
Environment. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 609, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the State Board of Barbering and Cosmetology, 
the nomination of CHRISTOBAL QUINTANA, term to expire 
June 30, 2019, was referred to the Committee on Commerce 
and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Gov. Msg. No. 610, submitting for consideration and 
confirmation to the Hawaii Teacher Standards Board, the 
nomination of STEVE NAKASATO, term to expire June 30, 
2016, was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

HOUSE COMMUNICATION 
 

 The following communication from the House (Hse. Com. 
No. 346) was read by the Clerk and was disposed of as follows: 
 

 Hse. Com. No. 346, transmitting H.C.R. No. 155, which was 
adopted by the House of Representatives on March 31, 2015, 
was placed on file. 
 

 By unanimous consent, H.C.R. No. 155, entitled:  “HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
JUDICIAL COUNCIL TO APPOINT A COMMITTEE TO 
REVIEW AND RECOMMEND REVISIONS TO THE 
HAWAII PENAL CODE,” was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and Labor. 
 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

 Senator Wakai, for the Committee on Economic 
Development and Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1172) recommending that S.C.R. No. 162 be referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 162, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A FINANCIAL AUDIT OF INFORMATION 
TECHNOLOGY EXPENDITURES IN THE STATE 
EXECUTIVE BRANCH,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Wakai, for the Committee on Economic 
Development and Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1173) recommending that S.C.R. No. 77 be referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 77, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS, 
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, AND TOURISM TO 
PRIORITIZE THE DEVELOPMENT OF KAPOLEI INTO A 
JOB CENTER IN SUPPORT OF THE STATE AND THE 
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU’S POLICIES TO 
DEVELOP KAPOLEI INTO OAHU’S “SECONDARY 
URBAN CENTER”,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senators Ruderman and Shimabukuro, for the Committee on 
Agriculture and the Committee on Hawaiian Affairs, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1174) recommending that 
S.R. No. 119 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 119, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
FEDERAL AND STATE AGENCIES TO CONSULT WITH 
HAWAII SMALL SCALE FARMERS, HAWAII SMALL 
SCALE PRODUCERS, AND AFFECTED PARTIES ON THE 
OFFSETTING OF COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE 
IMPLEMENTATION OF THE FOOD SAFETY 
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MODERNIZATION ACT,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Ruderman and Shimabukuro, for the Committee on 
Agriculture and the Committee on Hawaiian Affairs, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1175) recommending that 
S.C.R. No. 184 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 184, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING FEDERAL AND STATE 
AGENCIES TO CONSULT WITH HAWAII SMALL SCALE 
FARMERS, HAWAII SMALL SCALE PRODUCERS, AND 
AFFECTED PARTIES ON THE OFFSETTING OF COSTS 
ASSOCIATED WITH THE IMPLEMENTATION OF THE 
FOOD SAFETY MODERNIZATION ACT,” was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1176) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 185, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 185, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION TO ORGANIZE AND COORDINATE OUT-
OF-SCHOOL PROGRAMS FOR KINDERGARTEN 
THROUGH TWELFTH GRADE AND IDENTIFY FUNDING 
OPPORTUNITIES FOR CURRENT AND FUTURE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION OUT-OF-SCHOOL 
PROGRAMS,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1177) recommending that S.R. 
No. 120, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No.  120, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
ORGANIZE AND COORDINATE OUT-OF-SCHOOL 
PROGRAMS FOR KINDERGARTEN THROUGH 
TWELFTH GRADE AND IDENTIFY FUNDING 
OPPORTUNITIES FOR CURRENT AND FUTURE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION OUT-OF-SCHOOL 
PROGRAMS,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1178) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 99, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 99, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION TO ALLOW TEACHERS TO USE 
PURCHASING CARDS WHEN PURCHASING SCHOOL 
SUPPLIES AND OTHER RELATED CURRICULUM 
SUPPORT SUPPLIES,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1179) recommending that S.R. 
No. 53, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 53, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
ALLOW TEACHERS TO USE PURCHASING CARDS 
WHEN PURCHASING SCHOOL SUPPLIES AND OTHER 
RELATED CURRICULUM SUPPORT SUPPLIES,” was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1180) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 94 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 94, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE COMMITTEE ON WEIGHTS AND THE 
BOARD OF EDUCATION TO CONSIDER THE UNIQUE 
NEEDS OF REMOTE SCHOOLS WHEN REEVALUATING 
THE WEIGHTED STUDENT FORMULA,” was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1181) recommending that S.R. 
No. 48 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 48, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE COMMITTEE ON WEIGHTS AND THE BOARD OF 
EDUCATION TO CONSIDER THE UNIQUE NEEDS OF 
REMOTE SCHOOLS WHEN REEVALUATING THE 
WEIGHTED STUDENT FORMULA,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1182) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 113 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 113, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION TO 
TELEVISE OR MAKE AVAILABLE ONLINE ITS 
MEETINGS,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1183) recommending that S.R. 
No. 64 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 64, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE BOARD OF EDUCATION TO TELEVISE OR MAKE 
AVAILABLE ONLINE ITS MEETINGS,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1184) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 110 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 110, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION TO 
CONSOLIDATE ITS LEILEHUA-MILILANI-WAIALUA 
COMPLEX AREA ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE AND 
SUPPORT SERVICES FACILITIES AND USE THESE 
EXISTING LOCATIONS TO GENERATE INCOME FOR 
CONSTRUCTION, REPAIR, RETROFITTING, AND 
MAINTENANCE OF SCHOOL FACILITIES,” was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
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 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1185) recommending that S.R. 
No. 61 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 61, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE BOARD OF EDUCATION TO CONSOLIDATE ITS 
LEILEHUA-MILILANI-WAIALUA COMPLEX AREA 
ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE AND SUPPORT SERVICES 
FACILITIES AND USE THESE EXISTING LOCATIONS TO 
GENERATE INCOME FOR CONSTRUCTION, REPAIR, 
RETROFITTING, AND MAINTENANCE OF SCHOOL 
FACILITIES,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1186) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 187 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 187, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
ESTABLISH A PILOT YOUTH DEVELOPMENT FLAG 
RUGBY PROGRAM AIMED AT REDUCING RISKY 
BEHAVIORS AND INCARCERATION RATES AMONG 
NATIVE HAWAIIAN AND PACIFIC ISLANDER YOUTH,” 
was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1187) recommending that S.R. 
No. 122 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 122, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
ESTABLISH A PILOT YOUTH DEVELOPMENT FLAG 
RUGBY PROGRAM AIMED AT REDUCING RISKY 
BEHAVIORS AND INCARCERATION RATES AMONG 
NATIVE HAWAIIAN AND PACIFIC ISLANDER YOUTH,” 
was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1188) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 188 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 188, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE STATE PUBLIC CHARTER SCHOOL 
COMMISSION TO CONTINUE EFFORTS TO ADDRESS 
PUBLIC SCHOOL CAPACITY ISSUES THROUGH 
CHARTER SCHOOL APPLICANTS AND MAKE 
RECOMMENDATIONS ON HOW TO STRENGTHEN 
THESE EFFORTS,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1189) recommending that S.R. 
No. 123 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 123, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE STATE PUBLIC CHARTER SCHOOL COMMISSION 
TO CONTINUE EFFORTS TO ADDRESS PUBLIC SCHOOL 
CAPACITY ISSUES THROUGH CHARTER SCHOOL 
APPLICANTS AND MAKE RECOMMENDATIONS ON 
HOW TO STRENGTHEN THESE EFFORTS,” was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Shimabukuro and Thielen, for the Committee on 
Hawaiian Affairs and the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1190) 
recommending that S.R. No. 24, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
adopted. 
 

 By unanimous consent, action on Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1190 
and S.R. No. 24, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE AHA MOKU ADVISORY 
COMMITTEE TO ENGAGE STAKEHOLDERS IN ORDER 
TO DEVELOP AND ADOPT RULES FOR ITS OPERATION 
AND ADMINISTRATION,” was deferred until Thursday, 
April 2, 2015. 
 

 Senators Shimabukuro and Thielen, for the Committee on 
Hawaiian Affairs and the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1191) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 55, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
adopted. 
 

 By unanimous consent, action on Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1191 
and S.C.R. No. 55, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE AHA 
MOKU ADVISORY COMMITTEE TO ENGAGE 
STAKEHOLDERS IN ORDER TO DEVELOP AND ADOPT 
RULES FOR ITS OPERATION AND ADMINISTRATION,” 
was deferred until Thursday, April 2, 2015. 
 

 Senator Kahele, for the Committee on Tourism and 
International Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1192) recommending that S.C.R. No. 78, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be adopted. 
 

 By unanimous consent, action on Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1192 
and S.C.R. No. 78, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
HAWAII SISTER-STATE COMMITTEE TO EVALUATE 
AND DEVELOP RECOMMENDATIONS FOR THE 
INITIATION OF A SISTER-STATE RELATIONSHIP WITH 
THE STATE OF GOA IN THE COUNTRY OF INDIA AND 
FORWARD ITS RECOMMENDATION TO THE 
LEGISLATURE, PURSUANT TO SECTION 229-3, HAWAII 
REVISED STATUTES, FOR FURTHER ACTION,” was 
deferred until Thursday, April 2, 2015. 
 

 Senator Kahele, for the Committee on Tourism and 
International Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1193) recommending that S.C.R. No. 201, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be adopted. 
 

 By unanimous consent, action on Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1193 
and S.C.R. No. 201, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
HAWAII SISTER-STATE COMMITTEE TO EVALUATE 
AND DEVELOP RECOMMENDATIONS FOR THE 
INITIATION OF A SISTER STATE RELATIONSHIP 
BETWEEN THE STATE OF HAWAII AND THE 
PREFECTURE OF HOKKAIDO, JAPAN, AND FORWARD 
ITS RECOMMENDATION TO THE LEGISLATURE, 
PURSUANT TO SECTION 229-3, HAWAII REVISED 
STATUTES, FOR FURTHER ACTION,” was deferred until 
Thursday, April 2, 2015. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1194) recommending that the Senate 
advise and consent to the nomination of BRIGADIER 
GENERAL ARTHUR LOGAN as Adjutant General of the 
Department of Defense, in accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 517. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1194 and Gov. Msg. No. 517 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 2, 2015. 
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 Senator Espero, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1195) recommending that the Senate 
advise and consent to the nomination of COLONEL 
KENNETH HARA as Deputy Adjutant General of the 
Department of Defense, in accordance with Gov. Msg. No. 518. 
 

 In accordance with Senate Rule 37(6), action on Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1195 and Gov. Msg. No. 518 was deferred until 
Thursday, April 2, 2015. 
 

ORDER OF THE DAY 
 

ADOPTION OF RESOLUTIONS 
 

MATTERS DEFERRED FROM 
TUESDAY, MARCH 31, 2015 

 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1167 (S.R. No. 34, S.D. 1): 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom 
and  carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
S.R.  No.  34, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
COMMEMORATING THE THIRTIETH ANNIVERSARY OF 
HAWAII’S SISTER-STATE RELATIONSHIP WITH THE 
GUANGDONG PROVINCE,” was adopted. 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1168 (S.C.R. No. 158): 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 158, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE LEGISLATIVE 
REFERENCE BUREAU TO EXAMINE IF AND HOW 
OTHER STATES REGULATE TOUR OPERATORS WITHIN 
THEIR JURISDICTION,” was adopted. 
 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1169 (S.C.R. No. 48): 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 48, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DIVISION OF AQUATIC RESOURCES 
AND DIVISION OF CONSERVATION AND RESOURCES 
ENFORCEMENT TO COLLABORATE WITH FEDERAL 
PARTNER AGENCIES TO PROTECT IMPORTANT STATE 
MARINE RESOURCES,” was adopted. 
 

THIRD READING 
 

H.B. No. 126, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Tokuda, seconded by Senator Kouchi 
and carried, H.B. No. 126, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL FOR AN 
ACT MAKING APPROPRIATIONS FOR PUBLIC 
EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS,” having been read throughout, 
passed Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and 
Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

H.B. No. 173, H.D. 1, S.D. 1: 
 

 On motion by Senator Tokuda, seconded by Senator Kouchi 
and carried, H.B. No. 173, H.D. 1, S.D. 1, entitled:  “A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE REPEAL OF FUNDS 
AND ACCOUNTS,” having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading on the following showing of Ayes and Noes:  
 

 Ayes, 25.  Noes, none.  
 

REFERRAL OF A 
HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 

 

 The President made the following committee assignments of 
a House concurrent resolution received on Tuesday, March 31, 
2015: 
 

H.C.R. No: Referred to: 
 

H.C.R. No. 224 Jointly to the Committee on Education 
and the Committee on Government 
Operations 

 

RE-REFERRAL OF A 
SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 

 

 The Chair re-referred the following Senate concurrent 
resolution that was offered: 
 

S.C.R. No: Re-referred to: 
 

S.C.R. No. 154 Committee on Hawaiian Affairs 
 

RE-REFERRAL OF A SENATE RESOLUTION 
 

 The Chair re-referred the following Senate resolution that 
was offered: 
 

S.R. No: Re-referred to: 
 

S.R. No. 96 Committee on Hawaiian Affairs 
 

 At this time, Senator Shimabukuro invited the members to a 
luncheon in honor of Art Frank and Al Lewis that afternoon in 
Conference Room 224. 
 

 Senator Baker rose to speak on a point of personal privilege 
as follows: 
 

 “This has to do with our Easter baskets. We thank you all for 
making your donation and appreciate those who are going to 
continue to bring them by our office. I would invite you all to 
join us in the chamber level tomorrow afternoon, April 2nd, 
between 1:50 and 2:15 for pictures with the baskets and the 
Easter bunny. I cannot tell you who the Easter bunny is going to 
be, but it will be a House person, since it is Rep. Belatti’s office 
who has the costume, so please join us tomorrow afternoon. 
 

 “And also, as we are in the throes of our fundraiser for the 
food bank, we invite you to join our office to raise funds for the 
Maui Food Bank and have a sweet deal: You can get a dozen 
Krispy Kreme doughnuts for $12.00. Presale this week and next 
week, and then you can pick them up April 14th, and we invite 
you to share in something that Maui has that O‘ahu doesn’t 
have yet: Krispy Kremes. Aloha.” 
 

 The Chair then made the following announcement: 
 

 “The deadline to file standing committee reports on Senate 
concurrent resolutions and Senate resolutions that need to move 
laterally to the final Senate committee is 3:00 p.m. today ... 
That’s April Fools; it’s 9:00 p.m.” 
 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried unanimously, the Senate authorized the adoption of 
standing committee reports recommending that Senate 
concurrent resolutions and Senate resolutions be referred to 
committees of last referral. In consequence thereof, and 
subsequent to its recessing at 12:07 p.m., the Senate took the 
following actions on the following resolutions and standing 
committee reports: 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Transportation, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1196) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 143 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 143, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
URGING THE CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU IN 
COORDINATION WITH THE HONOLULU AUTHORITY 
FOR RAPID TRANSPORTATION TO DEVELOP A PLAN 
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TO GENERATE REVENUE FOR OPERATIONS AND 
MAINTENANCE OF RAIL,” was referred to the Committee 
on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Transportation, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1197) recommending 
that S.R. No. 86 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 86, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION URGING THE 
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU IN COORDINATION 
WITH THE HONOLULU AUTHORITY FOR RAPID 
TRANSPORTATION TO DEVELOP A PLAN TO 
GENERATE REVENUE FOR OPERATIONS AND 
MAINTENANCE OF RAIL,” was referred to the Committee 
on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Transportation, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1198) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 138 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 138, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION TO CONDUCT A STUDY 
REGARDING THE FEASIBILITY AND COST OF 
CONSTRUCTING A SMALL COMMERCIAL BOAT 
HARBOR AND SMALL COMMERCIAL AIRPORT IN 
SOUTH PUNA,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Transportation, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1199) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 85, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 85, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE GOVERNOR AND 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION TO INCLUDE IN 
THE 2017-2018 SUPPLEMENTAL CAPITAL 
IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM REQUEST IMPROVEMENTS 
TO CRUISE SHIP PASSENGER TERMINALS AT 
NAWILIWILI HARBOR IN KAUAI, HONOLULU HARBOR 
IN OAHU, KAHULUI HARBOR IN MAUI, AND HILO 
HARBOR IN HAWAII,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Shimabukuro and Ruderman, for the Committee on 
Hawaiian Affairs and the Committee on Agriculture, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1200) recommending that 
S.R. No. 107, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 107, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
ACKNOWLEDGING THE POSITIVE IMPACT OF THE 
TARO SECURITY AND PURITY TASK FORCE AND 
SUPPORTING THE REFORMATION OF THE TASK 
FORCE AS A LEGISLATIVELY ENABLED BODY, 
SHOULD THE TARO FARMING COMMUNITY 
DETERMINE THE NEED TO DO SO,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Shimabukuro and Ruderman, for the Committee on 
Hawaiian Affairs and the Committee on Agriculture, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1201) recommending that 

S.C.R. No. 171, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 171, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION ACKNOWLEDGING THE POSITIVE 
IMPACT OF THE TARO SECURITY AND PURITY TASK 
FORCE AND SUPPORTING THE REFORMATION OF THE 
TASK FORCE AS A LEGISLATIVELY ENABLED BODY, 
SHOULD THE TARO FARMING COMMUNITY 
DETERMINE THE NEED TO DO SO,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Shimabukuro and Chun Oakland, for the 
Committee on Hawaiian Affairs and the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1202) recommending that S.R. No. 105, as amended 
in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 105, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE HAWAII STATE LEGISLATURE’S 
KEIKI CAUCUS TO CONSULT THE LEGACY COALITION 
TO FORM A WORKING GROUP TO DETERMINE HOW 
THE LEGACY COALITION CAN BEST ASSIST THE 
COURTS AND NATIVE HAWAIIAN CHILDREN IN 
MATTERS RELATING TO CHILD CUSTODY AND 
NATIVE HAWAIIAN CHILDREN WHO HAVE BEEN 
REMOVED FROM THEIR HOMES,” was referred to the 
Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Senators Shimabukuro and Chun Oakland, for the 
Committee on Hawaiian Affairs and the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1203) recommending that S.C.R. No. 169, as amended 
in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 169, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE HAWAII STATE 
LEGISLATURE’S KEIKI CAUCUS TO CONSULT THE 
LEGACY COALITION TO FORM A WORKING GROUP TO 
DETERMINE HOW THE LEGACY COALITION CAN BEST 
ASSIST THE COURTS AND NATIVE HAWAIIAN 
CHILDREN IN MATTERS RELATING TO CHILD 
CUSTODY AND NATIVE HAWAIIAN CHILDREN WHO 
HAVE BEEN REMOVED FROM THEIR HOMES,” was 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Senator Chun Oakland, for the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1204) recommending that S.C.R. No. 92 be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 92, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN 
SERVICES TO PROVIDE INFORMATION ON THE 
NUMBER OF INSTANCES WHERE A MINOR PARENT OR 
PARENTS AND THEIR CHILDREN RECEIVE PUBLIC 
ASSISTANCE,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Chun Oakland, for the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1205) recommending that S.R. No. 46 be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
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S.R.  No. 46, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN 
SERVICES TO PROVIDE INFORMATION ON THE 
NUMBER OF INSTANCES WHERE A MINOR PARENT OR 
PARENTS AND THEIR CHILDREN RECEIVE PUBLIC 
ASSISTANCE,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Chun Oakland, for the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1206) recommending that S.C.R. No. 130, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 130, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION CONVENING A WORKING GROUP TO 
DEVELOP MORE COLLABORATIVE INFORMATION 
AND DECISION-MAKING POLICIES AND PROCEDURES 
FOR COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT AS IT RELATES TO 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICTS,” was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Chun Oakland, for the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1207) recommending that S.R. No. 78, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 78, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
CONVENING A WORKING GROUP TO DEVELOP MORE 
COLLABORATIVE INFORMATION AND DECISION-
MAKING POLICIES AND PROCEDURES FOR 
COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT AS IT RELATES TO 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICTS,” was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Thielen, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1208) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 82 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 82, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF A TERM, 
NONEXCLUSIVE EASEMENT COVERING A PORTION 
OF STATE SUBMERGED LANDS FRONTING THE 
PROPERTY IDENTIFIED AS TAX MAP KEY: (1) 3-6-
001:017, WAIKIKI, HONOLULU, OAHU,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Nishihara and Espero, for the Committee on 
Transportation and the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1209) recommending that S.R. No. 29 
be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 29, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION URGING THE 
HONOLULU AUTHORITY FOR RAPID 
TRANSPORTATION TO INCORPORATE A BUS RAPID 
TRANSIT SYSTEM INTO ITS RAIL TRANSIT PLANNING 
TO CONNECT CERTAIN PARTS OF OAHU WITH THE 
RAIL TRANSIT SYSTEM,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Nishihara and Espero, for the Committee on 
Transportation and the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1210) recommending that S.C.R. No. 65 
be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 65, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION URGING THE HONOLULU AUTHORITY 
FOR RAPID TRANSPORTATION TO INCORPORATE A 
BUS RAPID TRANSIT SYSTEM INTO ITS RAIL TRANSIT 
PLANNING TO CONNECT CERTAIN PARTS OF OAHU 
WITH THE RAIL TRANSIT SYSTEM,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Nishihara and Espero, for the Committee on 
Transportation and the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1211) recommending that S.R. No. 27 
be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 27, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION URGING THE 
HONOLULU AUTHORITY FOR RAPID 
TRANSPORTATION TO IDENTIFY AND IMPLEMENT 
COST CUTTING PRACTICES,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Nishihara and Espero, for the Committee on 
Transportation and the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1212) recommending that S.C.R. No. 63 
be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 63, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION URGING THE HONOLULU AUTHORITY 
FOR RAPID TRANSPORTATION TO IDENTIFY AND 
IMPLEMENT COST CUTTING PRACTICES,” was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Baker, for the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1213) recommending that S.C.R. No. 111, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 111, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE LEGISLATIVE 
REFERENCE BUREAU TO STUDY ISSUES RELATING TO 
SELF-GOVERNANCE AND DISPUTE RESOLUTION 
UNDER HAWAII’S CURRENT CONDOMINIUM LAW,” 
was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Nishihara, for the Committee on Transportation, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1214) recommending 
that S.R. No. 83 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 83, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION TO 
CONDUCT A STUDY REGARDING THE FEASIBILITY 
AND COST OF CONSTRUCTING A SMALL 
COMMERCIAL BOAT HARBOR AND SMALL 
COMMERCIAL AIRPORT IN SOUTH PUNA,” was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Espero and Keith-Agaran, for the Committee on 
Public Safety, Intergovernmental and Military Affairs and the 
Committee on Judiciary and Labor, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1215) recommending that S.R. No. 45 
be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
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 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 45, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY TO PROVIDE 
AN ITEMIZED ACCOUNTING OF THE $1,000,000 THAT 
THE JUSTICE REINVESTMENT INITIATIVE SET ASIDE 
IN 2012 FOR COMMUNITY-BASED PROGRAMS AND 
THE $3,400,000 SET ASIDE IN 2013 FOR EXPANDING 
TREATMENT PROGRAMS AND VICTIMS’ SERVICES 
AND INITIATING PLANS TO ESTABLISH A RESEARCH 
AND PLANNING OFFICE,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Gabbard and Dela Cruz, for the Committee on 
Energy and Environment and the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1216) recommending that S.C.R. No. 140 be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 140, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION URGING ALL STATE AGENCIES TO 
RETROFIT STREET LIGHTS AND OTHER OUTDOOR 
LAMP LIGHTING FIXTURES WITH ENERGY EFFICIENT 
LIGHT-EMITTING DIODE BULBS, WHERE 
APPROPRIATE,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senators Gabbard and Dela Cruz, for the Committee on 
Energy and Environment and the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1217) recommending that S.R. No. 84 be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 84, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION URGING ALL 
STATE AGENCIES TO RETROFIT STREET LIGHTS AND 
OTHER OUTDOOR LAMP LIGHTING FIXTURES WITH 
ENERGY EFFICIENT LIGHT-EMITTING DIODE BULBS, 
WHERE APPROPRIATE,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1218) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 128, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 128, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC SAFETY TO FORM A WORKING GROUP TO 
EXAMINE SMARTER SENTENCING TO IMPROVE THE 
QUALITY AND RELIABILITY OF STATE CRIMINAL 
SENTENCING PRACTICES,” was referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1219) recommending that S.R. No. 76, 
as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Judiciary 
and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 76, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 
TO FORM A WORKING GROUP TO EXAMINE SMARTER 
SENTENCING TO IMPROVE THE QUALITY AND 
RELIABILITY OF STATE CRIMINAL SENTENCING 

PRACTICES,” was referred to the Committee on Judiciary and 
Labor. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the majority of the Committee on Public 
Safety, Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1220) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 52, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and S.C.R. No. 52, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION PETITIONING CONGRESS 
FOR A LIMITED AMENDMENTS CONVENTION TO 
RESTORE FREE AND FAIR ELECTIONS BY 
ADDRESSING CONCERNS RAISED BY THE DECISION 
OF THE UNITED STATES SUPREME COURT IN CITIZENS 
UNITED V. FEDERAL ELECTION COMMISSION, 558 U.S. 
310 (2010) AND RELATED CASES AND ADDRESS 
WHETHER MONEY SPENT ON CANDIDATE ELECTIONS 
AND BALLOT MEASURES SHOULD CONSTITUTE 
“SPEECH” UNDER THE FIRST AMENDMENT,” was 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Senators Espero and Keith-Agaran, for the Committee on 
Public Safety, Intergovernmental and Military Affairs and the 
Committee on Judiciary and Labor, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1221) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 122 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 122, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE AUDITOR TO 
CONDUCT AN AUDIT TO DETERMINE THE EXISTENCE 
OF POTENTIAL PATTERNS OF ABUSE IN THE USE OF 
STATE AND FEDERAL LEAVE BENEFITS BY ADULT 
CORRECTIONS OFFICERS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC SAFETY,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1222) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 135 be referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 135, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 
TO CONVENE A WORKING GROUP REGARDING 
PROCESS SERVERS,” was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Senator Keith-Agaran, for the Committee on Judiciary and 
Labor, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1223) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 79, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 79, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF THE 
ATTORNEY GENERAL AND DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN 
SERVICES TO CONDUCT A STUDY ON THE STATUS OF 
THE IMPLEMENTATION OF THE RECOMMENDATIONS 
MADE IN THE FINAL REPORT OF THE COMPACTS OF 
FREE ASSOCIATION TASK FORCE PURSUANT TO S.R. 
NO. 142, S.D. 1, REGULAR SESSION OF 2007,” was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the Committee on Public Safety, 
Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a report 
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(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1224) recommending that S.C.R. No. 90 
be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 90, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC 
SAFETY TO CONTINUE AND EXPAND ITS 
STRUCTURED COMMUNITY PLACEMENT PROGRAMS 
TO ASSIST IN TRANSITIONING FORMERLY 
INCARCERATED FEMALE INMATES BACK INTO 
SOCIETY,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Espero, for the majority of the Committee on Public 
Safety, Intergovernmental and Military Affairs, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1225) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 149, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and S.C.R. No. 149, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
AUDITOR TO CONDUCT A FINANCIAL AUDIT OF 
COMMISSARY OPERATIONS AT OUT-OF-STATE 
CORRECTIONAL FACILITIES CONTRACTED TO HOUSE 
HAWAII INMATES,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Agriculture, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1226) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 80, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 80, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
AGRICULTURE, UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII COLLEGE OF 
TROPICAL AGRICULTURE AND HUMAN RESOURCES, 
AND HAWAII FARMERS UNION UNITED TO 
COLLABORATE TO ESTABLISH A NUTRIENT 
RECYCLING CENTER PILOT PROJECT,” was referred to 
the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Taniguchi, for the Committee on Higher Education 
and the Arts, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1227) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 75, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 75, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THAT THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII AT MANOA DEPARTMENT OF KINESIOLOGY 
AND REHABILITATION SCIENCE CONVENE A 
WORKING GROUP TO DEVELOP AN IMPLEMENTATION 
STRATEGY TO REQUIRE YOUTH SPORTS 
ORGANIZATIONS TO INITIATE AND IMPLEMENT 
CONCUSSION MANAGEMENT PLANS,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Chun Oakland, for the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1228) recommending that S.C.R. No. 183, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 183, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE EXECUTIVE OFFICE 
ON AGING TO ESTABLISH A WORKING GROUP TO 
REVIEW ADULT EDUCATION SERVICES AND THE 

POTENTIAL TO PROVIDE NEW LEARNING 
OPPORTUNITIES TO SENIOR CITIZENS,” was referred to 
the Committee on Education. 
 

 Senator Chun Oakland, for the Committee on Human 
Services and Housing, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1229) recommending that S.R. No. 118, as amended in 
S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 118, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE EXECUTIVE OFFICE ON AGING TO 
ESTABLISH A WORKING GROUP TO REVIEW ADULT 
EDUCATION SERVICES AND THE POTENTIAL TO 
PROVIDE NEW LEARNING OPPORTUNITIES TO SENIOR 
CITIZENS,” was referred to the Committee on Education. 
 

 Senators Chun Oakland and Green, for the Committee on 
Human Services and Housing and the Committee on Health, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1230) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 105 be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 105, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN SERVICES AND DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH TO 
NOT CONSIDER CERTAIN BENEFITS UNDER TITLE II 
OF THE SOCIAL SECURITY ACT AS INCOME WHEN 
DETERMINING MEDICAID ELIGIBILITY AND TO 
ADOPT RULES TO ALLOW A PROVIDER OF MEDICAID 
ADULT DAY HEALTH SERVICES TO BILL IN FIFTEEN 
MINUTE INCREMENTS,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Chun Oakland and Green, for the Committee on 
Human Services and Housing and the Committee on Health, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1231) 
recommending that S.R. No. 59 be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 59, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES AND 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH TO NOT CONSIDER 
CERTAIN BENEFITS UNDER TITLE II OF THE SOCIAL 
SECURITY ACT AS INCOME WHEN DETERMINING 
MEDICAID ELIGIBILITY AND TO ADOPT RULES TO 
ALLOW A PROVIDER OF MEDICAID ADULT DAY 
HEALTH SERVICES TO BILL IN FIFTEEN MINUTE 
INCREMENTS,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senators Chun Oakland and Kidani, for the Committee on 
Human Services and Housing and the Committee on Education, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1232) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 66, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 66, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN SERVICES, DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION, 
AND EXECUTIVE OFFICE ON EARLY LEARNING TO 
COLLABORATE AND EXPLORE THE FEASIBILITY OF 
EXPANDING THE EARLY HEAD START PROGRAM TO 
INCLUDE A BROADER RANGE OF INCOMES,” was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
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 Senators Chun Oakland and Thielen, for the Committee on 
Human Services and Housing and the Committee on Water and 
Land, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1233) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 136, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 136, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING AN UPDATE OF THE STATE 
HOUSING FUNCTIONAL PLAN,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Chun Oakland and Green, for the Committee on 
Human Services and Housing and the Committee on Health, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1234) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 107, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 107, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE CONVENING OF A 
FAMILY CAREGIVERS WORKING GROUP TO EXAMINE 
AND ASSESS LEGISLATION RELATING TO THE ROLE 
OF CAREGIVERS OF PATIENTS DISCHARGED FROM 
HOSPITALS,” was referred to the Committee on Judiciary and 
Labor. 
 

 Senators Kahele and Thielen, for the Committee on Tourism 
and International Affairs and the Committee on Water and 
Land, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1235) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 83 be referred to the Committee 
on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 83, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION URGING THE ALOHA TOWER 
DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION TO DEVELOP A PLAN 
TO RELOCATE, RENOVATE, UPGRADE, REOPEN, OR 
DEMOLISH THE HAWAII MARITIME MUSEUM 
BUILDING AND THE NEARBY AREAS SO THAT PIER 7 
MAY SERVE AS AN ATTRACTION OF THE ALOHA 
TOWER COMPLEX,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senators Kahele and Thielen, for the Committee on Tourism 
and International Affairs and the Committee on Water and 
Land, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1236) 
recommending that S.R. No. 38 be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 38, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION URGING THE 
ALOHA TOWER DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION TO 
DEVELOP A PLAN TO RELOCATE, RENOVATE, 
UPGRADE, REOPEN, OR DEMOLISH THE HAWAII 
MARITIME MUSEUM BUILDING AND THE NEARBY 
AREAS SO THAT PIER 7 MAY SERVE AS AN 
ATTRACTION OF THE ALOHA TOWER COMPLEX,” was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Gabbard and Green, for the Committee on Energy 
and Environment and the Committee on Health, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1237) recommending that 
S.C.R. No. 155, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 155, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 

HEALTH TO PROMPTLY EXAMINE ALL ALLEGED 
VIOLATIONS IN THE SOLID WASTE RECYCLING 
INDUSTRY AND TO EQUITABLY ENFORCE PERTINENT 
LAWS AND RULES,” was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 Senators Gabbard and Green, for the Committee on Energy 
and Environment and the Committee on Health, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1238) recommending that 
S.C.R. No. 69 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 69, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH TO IMPLEMENT A RADIATION MONITORING 
PILOT PROJECT,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Agriculture, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1239) recommending 
that S.R. No. 128, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 128, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING THE AGRIBUSINESS DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION TO DEVELOP A PLAN TO ACQUIRE 
THE DAM AND SPILLWAY OF LAKE WILSON FOR 
HYDROELECTRICITY,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Agriculture, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1240) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 193, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 193, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION ENCOURAGING THE AGRIBUSINESS 
DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION TO DEVELOP A PLAN 
TO ACQUIRE THE DAM AND SPILLWAY OF LAKE 
WILSON FOR HYDROELECTRICITY,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Agriculture, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1241) recommending 
that S.R. No. 82 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 82, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE TO ESTABLISH 
THE HAWAII GOOD AGRICULTURAL PRACTICES 
PROGRAM,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Ruderman, for the Committee on Agriculture, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1242) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 137 be referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 137, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 
TO ESTABLISH THE HAWAII GOOD AGRICULTURAL 
PRACTICES PROGRAM,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
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 Senator Thielen, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1243) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 81, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 81, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF A 
TERM, NON-EXCLUSIVE EASEMENT COVERING A 
PORTION OF STATE SUBMERGED LANDS AT 
LAHAINA, MAUI FOR SEAWALL ENCROACHMENT 
PURPOSES AND AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF A 
TERM, NON-EXCLUSIVE EASEMENT FOR THE RIGHT, 
PRIVILEGE, AND AUTHORITY TO USE, MAINTAIN, 
REPAIR, AND REPLACE AN EXISTING SEAWALL OVER, 
UNDER, AND ACROSS STATE-OWNED LAND IN 
LAHAINA, MAUI,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Thielen, for the Committee on Water and Land, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1244) recommending 
that S.C.R. No. 163, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 163, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF FOUR 
TERM, NON-EXCLUSIVE EASEMENTS COVERING 
PORTIONS OF STATE SUBMERGED LANDS AT STABLE 
ROAD BEACH, STABLE ROAD, SPRECKELSVILLE, 
WAILUKU, MAUI, FOR THE USE, MAINTENANCE, AND 
REPAIR OF FOUR EXISTING ROCK GROINS,” was referred 
to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1245) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 54, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 54, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY REGARDING THE 
NEED TO INCREASE THE DOLLAR THRESHOLD THAT 
DETERMINES WHETHER A SMALL PURCHASE IS 
EXEMPT FROM SMALL PURCHASE PROCUREMENT 
PROCEDURES,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1246) 
recommending that S.R. No. 23, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 23, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY REGARDING THE NEED TO 
INCREASE THE DOLLAR THRESHOLD THAT 
DETERMINES WHETHER A SMALL PURCHASE IS 
EXEMPT FROM SMALL PURCHASE PROCUREMENT 
PROCEDURES,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senators Dela Cruz and Taniguchi, for the Committee on 
Government Operations and the Committee on Higher 
Education and the Arts, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1247) recommending that S.C.R. No. 198, as amended 
in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 

S.C.R. No. 198, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION ENCOURAGING THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII SYSTEM AND THE DEPARTMENT OF 
ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES TO DEVELOP 
A PLAN TO MOVE THE ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICES OF 
THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII SYSTEM FROM THE 
UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII AT MANOA CAMPUS TO 
OTHER STATE-OWNED BUILDINGS,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Dela Cruz and Taniguchi, for the Committee on 
Government Operations and the Committee on Higher 
Education and the Arts, presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1248) recommending that S.R. No. 133, as amended 
in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 133, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII SYSTEM 
AND THE DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND 
GENERAL SERVICES TO DEVELOP A PLAN TO MOVE 
THE ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICES OF THE UNIVERSITY 
OF HAWAII SYSTEM FROM THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII AT MANOA CAMPUS TO OTHER STATE-
OWNED BUILDINGS,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1249) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 190, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 190, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES TO 
INVENTORY ALL OPEN CONTRACTS SINCE 2010 TO 
THE PRESENT FOR ALL STATE AGENCIES AND ASSIST 
THE AGENCIES WITH CLOSING AND RESOLVING ANY 
DISPUTES,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1250) 
recommending that S.R. No. 125, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 125, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING 
AND GENERAL SERVICES TO INVENTORY ALL OPEN 
CONTRACTS SINCE 2010 TO THE PRESENT FOR ALL 
STATE AGENCIES AND ASSIST THE AGENCIES WITH 
CLOSING AND RESOLVING ANY DISPUTES,” was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1251) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 88, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 88, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE INFORMATION 
PRIVACY AND SECURITY COUNCIL, IN COOPERATION 
WITH THE STATE CHIEF INFORMATION OFFICER 
COUNCIL, TO ASSESS EXISTING PROCEDURES OF 
NOTIFICATION FOLLOWING THE BREACH OF 
PERSONAL INFORMATION,” was referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary and Labor. 
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 Senator Dela Cruz, for the Committee on Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1252) 
recommending that S.R. No. 41, as amended in S.D. 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary and Labor. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 41, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE INFORMATION PRIVACY AND 
SECURITY COUNCIL, IN COOPERATION WITH THE 
STATE CHIEF INFORMATION OFFICER COUNCIL, TO 
ASSESS EXISTING PROCEDURES OF NOTIFICATION 
FOLLOWING THE BREACH OF PERSONAL 
INFORMATION,” was referred to the Committee on Judiciary 
and Labor. 
 

 Senators Green and Chun Oakland, for the Committee on 
Health and the Committee on Human Services and Housing, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1253) 
recommending that S.R. No. 58 be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 58, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES TO 
CONSIDER AN ALTERNATE METHODOLOGY FOR 
ESTABLISHING THE BASIC PROSPECTIVE PAYMENT 
SYSTEM RATES FOR INTERMEDIATE CARE FACILITIES 
FOR INDIVIDUALS WITH INTELLECTUAL 
DISABILITIES, TO REBASE THE RATES AT LEAST 
EVERY TWO FISCAL YEARS, AND TO INCREASE BED 
RESERVATION DAYS TO TWENTY-FOUR DAYS PER 
CALENDAR YEAR FOR HOSPITALIZATION AND OTHER 
ABSENCES OF RESIDENTS FROM INTERMEDIATE 
CARE FACILITIES FOR INDIVIDUALS WITH 
INTELLECTUAL DISABILITIES,” was referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Green and Chun Oakland, for the Committee on 
Health and the Committee on Human Services and Housing, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1254) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 104 be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 104, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN SERVICES TO CONSIDER AN ALTERNATE 
METHODOLOGY FOR ESTABLISHING THE BASIC 
PROSPECTIVE PAYMENT SYSTEM RATES FOR 
INTERMEDIATE CARE FACILITIES FOR INDIVIDUALS 
WITH INTELLECTUAL DISABILITIES, TO REBASE THE 
RATES AT LEAST EVERY TWO FISCAL YEARS, AND TO 
INCREASE BED RESERVATION DAYS TO TWENTY-
FOUR DAYS PER CALENDAR YEAR FOR 
HOSPITALIZATION AND OTHER ABSENCES OF 
RESIDENTS FROM INTERMEDIATE CARE FACILITIES 
FOR INDIVIDUALS WITH INTELLECTUAL 
DISABILITIES,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senators Green and Chun Oakland, for the Committee on 
Health and the Committee on Human Services and Housing, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1255) 
recommending that S.R. No. 57 be referred to the Committee on 
Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 57, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION URGING THE 
REESTABLISHMENT OF THE WORKING GROUP TO 

EXAMINE SOCIAL DETERMINANTS OF HEALTH AND 
RISK ADJUSTMENT FOR MEDICAID, GAP-GROUP, AND 
UNINSURED INDIVIDUALS,” was referred to the Committee 
on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Senators Green and Chun Oakland, for the Committee on 
Health and the Committee on Human Services and Housing, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1256) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 103 be referred to the 
Committee on Commerce and Consumer Protection. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 103, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION URGING THE REESTABLISHMENT OF 
THE WORKING GROUP TO EXAMINE SOCIAL 
DETERMINANTS OF HEALTH AND RISK ADJUSTMENT 
FOR MEDICAID, GAP-GROUP, AND UNINSURED 
INDIVIDUALS,” was referred to the Committee on Commerce 
and Consumer Protection. 
 

 Senator Green, for the Committee on Health, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1257) recommending that S.R. 
No. 65 be referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 65, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION ENCOURAGING 
FOOD SERVICE FACILITIES IN THE STATE THAT 
OFFER A CHILDREN’S MENU OF MEAL OPTIONS, OR A 
MEAL THAT IS REPRESENTED AS A CHILDREN’S 
MEAL, TO SERVE CHILDREN’S MEALS WITH HIGHER 
NUTRITIONAL QUALITY AND INCLUDE ONLY 
BOTTLED WATER OR LOW-FAT MILK AS THE 
DEFAULT BEVERAGE IN THE MEAL OR MENU 
OPTION,” was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Senator Green, for the Committee on Health, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1258) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 114 be referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 114, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING FOOD SERVICE FACILITIES IN THE 
STATE THAT OFFER A CHILDREN’S MENU OF MEAL 
OPTIONS, OR A MEAL THAT IS REPRESENTED AS A 
CHILDREN’S MEAL, TO SERVE CHILDREN’S MEALS 
WITH HIGHER NUTRITIONAL QUALITY AND INCLUDE 
ONLY BOTTLED WATER OR LOW-FAT MILK AS THE 
DEFAULT BEVERAGE IN THE MEAL OR MENU 
OPTION,” was referred to the Committee on Commerce and 
Consumer Protection. 
 

 Senator Green, for the Committee on Health, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1259) recommending that S.R. 
No. 95 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 95, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH TO REVIEW AND 
ANALYZE ALL ORAL HEALTH INITIATIVES 
CURRENTLY UNDERWAY IN THE STATE, INCLUDING 
THE CENTERS FOR DISEASE CONTROL PROGRAM, 
AND PREPARE A PROGRESS REPORT ON EACH 
INITIATIVE,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
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 Senator Green, for the Committee on Health, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1260) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 153 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 153, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH TO 
REVIEW AND ANALYZE ALL ORAL HEALTH 
INITIATIVES CURRENTLY UNDERWAY IN THE STATE, 
INCLUDING THE CENTERS FOR DISEASE CONTROL 
PROGRAM, AND PREPARE A PROGRESS REPORT ON 
EACH INITIATIVE,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senators Kidani and Ruderman, for the Committee on 
Education and the Committee on Agriculture, presented a joint 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1261) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 191, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 191, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION ENCOURAGING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION TO ESTABLISH A VOLUNTARY FARM TO 
SCHOOL PROGRAM,” was referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 Senators Kidani and Ruderman, for the Committee on 
Education and the Committee on Agriculture, presented a joint 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1262) recommending that S.R. 
No. 126, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 126, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
ENCOURAGING THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
ESTABLISH A VOLUNTARY FARM TO SCHOOL 
PROGRAM,” was referred to the Committee on Ways and 
Means. 
 

 Senators Kidani and Thielen, for the Committee on 
Education and the Committee on Water and Land, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1263) recommending that 
S.C.R. No. 195, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and 
S.C.R. No. 195, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION, STATE PUBLIC CHARTER SCHOOL 
COMMISSION, AND HAWAII PUBLIC CHARTER 
SCHOOLS NETWORK TO DEVELOP A PLAN TO 
COMMISSION A NEW STUDY SUGGESTING UPDATES 
TO THE SCHOOL IMPACT FEE FORMULA AND 
DIFFERENTIATING THE LAND REQUIREMENTS FOR 
GREENFIELD DEVELOPMENT AND REDEVELOPMENT 
OF URBAN AREAS,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senators Kidani and Thielen, for the Committee on 
Education and the Committee on Water and Land, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1264) recommending that 
S.R. No. 130, as amended in S.D. 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the joint report of the Committees was adopted and S.R. 
No. 130, S.D. 1, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION, 
STATE PUBLIC CHARTER SCHOOL COMMISSION, AND 

HAWAII PUBLIC CHARTER SCHOOLS NETWORK TO 
DEVELOP A PLAN TO COMMISSION A NEW STUDY 
SUGGESTING UPDATES TO THE SCHOOL IMPACT FEE 
FORMULA AND DIFFERENTIATING THE LAND 
REQUIREMENTS FOR GREENFIELD DEVELOPMENT 
AND REDEVELOPMENT OF URBAN AREAS,” was 
referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1265) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 100 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 100, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU, 
IN CONSULTATION WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION AND UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII AT MANOA 
COLLEGE OF EDUCATION, TO PREPARE A STUDY 
THAT EXAMINES AND PROVIDES 
RECOMMENDATIONS ON IMPROVING THE 
RETENTION OF TEACHERS WITHIN THE DEPARTMENT 
OF EDUCATION,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Kidani, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1266) recommending that S.R. 
No. 54 be referred to the Committee on Ways and Means. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. No. 
54, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU, IN 
CONSULTATION WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION AND UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII AT MANOA 
COLLEGE OF EDUCATION, TO PREPARE A STUDY 
THAT EXAMINES AND PROVIDES 
RECOMMENDATIONS ON IMPROVING THE 
RETENTION OF TEACHERS WITHIN THE DEPARTMENT 
OF EDUCATION,” was referred to the Committee on Ways 
and Means. 
 

 Senator Keith-Agaran, for the Committee on Judiciary and 
Labor, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1267) 
recommending that S.R. No. 33 be referred to the Committee on 
Higher Education and the Arts. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.R. 
No. 33, entitled:  “SENATE RESOLUTION DECLARING 
APRIL 24 AS A DAY OF REMEMBRANCE IN 
RECOGNITION AND COMMEMORATION OF THE 
ARMENIAN GENOCIDE OF 1915,” was referred to the 
Committee on Higher Education and the Arts. 
 

 Senator Keith-Agaran, for the Committee on Judiciary and 
Labor, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1268) 
recommending that S.C.R. No. 73 be referred to the Committee 
on Higher Education and the Arts. 
 

 On motion by Senator Green, seconded by Senator Slom and 
carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and S.C.R. 
No. 73, entitled:  “SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
DECLARING APRIL 24 AS A DAY OF REMEMBRANCE 
IN RECOGNITION AND COMMEMORATION OF THE 
ARMENIAN GENOCIDE OF 1915,” was referred to the 
Committee on Higher Education and the Arts. 
 

ADJOURNMENT 
 

 At 9:00 p.m., the Senate adjourned until 11:30 a.m., 
Thursday, April 2, 2015. 
 

 




