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EIGHTEENTH DAY 
 

Tuesday, February 14, 2023 

 The House of Representatives of the Thirty-Second Legislature of the 
State of Hawai‘i, Regular Session of 2023, convened at 12:03 p.m., with 
Vice Speaker Ilagan presiding. 

 The invocation was delivered by Representative Kirstin Kahaloa, after 
which the Roll was called showing all members present with the exception 
of Representative Kitagawa, who was excused. 

 By unanimous consent, reading and approval of the Journal of the House 
of Representatives of the Seventeenth Day was deferred. 

INTRODUCTIONS 

 The following introductions were made to the members of the House: 

 Representative Lowen introduced Keller Laros, founder, Manta Pacific 
Research Foundation. 

 Representative Mizuno introduced Andrew McLean, 2015 CSG Henry 
Toll Fellow. 

 Representative Kapela introduced Michael Golojuch Jr., chair, LGBTQ 
Caucus, Democratic Party of Hawai‘i. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

REPORTS OF STANDING COMMITTEES 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 317) recommending 
that H.B. No. 844, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 844, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 318) recommending 
that H.B. No. 848, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 848, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII INSTITUTE FOR MARINE BIOLOGY," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 319) recommending 
that H.B. No. 694, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 694, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 320) recommending 
that H.B. No. 353, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 353, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 

HEALTH CARE EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 321) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1148, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1148, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
MENTAL HEALTH," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 322) recommending 
that H.B. No. 812, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 812, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 812, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII," passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Pierick voting aye with reservations, and with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 323) recommending 
that H.B. No. 532, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 532, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HAWAII COMMUNITY COLLEGE," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Perruso, for the Committee on Higher Education & 
Technology, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 324) recommending 
that H.B. No. 67, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 67, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT MAKING AN 
APPROPRIATION FOR THE PU‘UHONUA PROGRAM," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Perruso and Woodson, for the Committee on Higher 
Education & Technology and the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 325) recommending that H.B. No. 1204, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1204, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Todd, for the Committee on Transportation, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 326) recommending that H.B. No. 1107, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 
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 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1107, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
COMMERCIAL MOTOR VEHICLE WEIGHT LIMITS," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Todd, for the Committee on Transportation, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 327) recommending that H.B. No. 1104, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1104, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
MOTOR VEHICLES ENFORCEMENT," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Todd, for the Committee on Transportation, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 328) recommending that H.B. No. 1109, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1109, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
COMMERCIAL DRIVER LICENSING," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Todd, for the Committee on Transportation, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 329) recommending that H.B. No. 1108, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 1108, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 1108, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO COMMERCIAL MOTOR VEHICLE FINES," 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Garcia voting aye with reservations, and with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Todd, for the Committee on Transportation, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 330) recommending that H.B. No. 714, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Consumer Protection & Commerce. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 714, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce, seconded by 
Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Ward rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote with 
reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 714, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MOORING LINES," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce, with 
Representative Ward voting aye with reservations, with Representatives 

Alcos, Garcia, and Pierick voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Todd, for the Committee on Transportation, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 331) recommending that H.B. No. 1418, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1418, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
TRANSPORTATION," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 332) recommending that H.B. No. 1045, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1045, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 333) recommending that H.B. No. 540, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 540, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 540, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representatives Garcia and 
Pierick voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 334) recommending that H.B. No. 55, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 55, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 335) recommending that H.B. No. 1345, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1345, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 336) recommending that H.B. No. 332, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 332, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
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THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 337) recommending that H.B. No. 600, HD 1 
be referred to the Committee on Finance 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 600, HD 1 be referred to the Committee on 
Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 600, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOL," was referred to 
the Committee on Finance, with Representative Garcia voting aye with 
reservations, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 338) recommending that H.B. No. 1330, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1330, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
SCHOOL BUS SERVICES," passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 339) recommending that H.B. No. 248, HD 1, 
as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 248, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EDUCATION," was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 340) recommending that H.B. No. 1412, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1412, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
LIBRARIES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 341) recommending that H.B. No. 1327, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1327, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
TAX CREDITS," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Woodson, for the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 342) recommending that H.B. No. 743, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 743, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 743, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Garcia voting 
aye with reservations, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 343) recommending that H.B. No. 781, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 781, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CHILDREN," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 344) recommending that H.B. No. 470, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 470, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, seconded by 
Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Ward rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote with 
reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Matsumoto rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye 
vote with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Tam rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. In support. Mr. Speaker, members, this bill will 
allow us to continue the very radical practice of allowing homeless minors 
to consent to emergency shelters, so they aren't on the streets where they are 
subjected to trafficking, sexual violence, violence, substance abuse, and 
illness. So, I urge everyone to support this measure." 

 Representative Kapela rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. In strong support and I would like the words of 
the representative from Waikīkī entered into the Journal as if they were my 
own," and the Chair "so ordered."  (By reference only.) 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 470, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MINORS," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with 
Representatives Alcos, Matsumoto, and Ward voting aye with reservations, 
with Representatives Garcia and Pierick voting no, and with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 345) recommending that H.B. No. 439, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 439, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
IMMIGRANT SERVICES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 
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 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 346) recommending that H.B. No. 450, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 450, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 450, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CHILD CARE," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Garcia voting 
aye with reservations, with Representative Pierick voting no, and with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 347) recommending that H.B. No. 438, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 438, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
YOUTH PROGRAMS," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 348) recommending that H.B. No. 415, 
HD 1, as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 415, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT MAKING AN 
APPROPRIATION TO IMPLEMENT THE RECOMMENDATIONS OF 
THE TASK FORCE ON MOBILITY MANAGEMENT, ESTABLISHED 
PURSUANT TO ACT 214, SESSION LAWS OF HAWAII 2013," was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 349) recommending that H.B. No. 870, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 870, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE NEIGHBOR ISLANDS BLIND AND VISUALLY IMPAIRED 
SERVICE PILOT PROGRAM," passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 350) recommending that H.B. No. 841, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 841, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
DOMESTIC ABUSE PROTECTIVE ORDERS," passed Second Reading 
and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 351) recommending that H.B. No. 618 pass 
Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 618, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
FAMILY," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 352) recommending that H.B. No. 782, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 782, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HUMAN SERVICES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 353) recommending that H.B. No. 225, 
HD 1, as amended in HD 2, pass Second Reading and be referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 225, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HUMAN SERVICES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 354) recommending that H.B. No. 1188, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 1188, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 1188, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE SUPPLEMENTAL NUTRITION 
ASSISTANCE PROGRAM," passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Finance, with Representatives Garcia and Pierick voting 
no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Mizuno, for the Committee on Human Services, presented 
a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 355) recommending that H.B. No. 1487, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1487, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE SENIOR MEDICARE PATROL PROGRAM," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashem, for the Committee on Corrections, Military & 
Veterans, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 356) recommending that 
H.B. No. 451, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 451, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
INCARCERATED INDIVIDUALS," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Hashem, for the Committee on Corrections, Military & 
Veterans, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 357) recommending that 
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H.B. No. 1132, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1132, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII CORRECTIONAL SYSTEM OVERSIGHT 
COMMISSION," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashem, for the Committee on Corrections, Military & 
Veterans, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 358) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1131, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1131, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
GENDER PARITY IN PROGRAMS FOR INCARCERATED WOMEN," 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashem, for the Committee on Corrections, Military & 
Veterans, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 359) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1130, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1130, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CORRECTIONS," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashem, for the Committee on Corrections, Military & 
Veterans, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 360) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1336, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 1336, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, seconded by 
Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Ward rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "No with a brief comment, please. Mr. Speaker, this is the new no cash 
bail bill, which I think was passed last session, which was then vetoed by 
the governor because as many places on the mainland said, hey, this just 
doesn't work. Getting out of jail free doesn't work. Plus, I would hope that 
people would know that Act 277 was passed in 2019, which if you are 
indigent or you're poor or whatever you have no money to post bail, instead 
of going to jail, which costs us, Mr. Speaker, $258 per day, this Act 277, 
and I hope CJ and other judges are listening, is a bill that this body passed 
which says, hey, if you don't have the money, just give us your signature. 
It's an IOU, it's a promissory note. And if they show up, Mr. Speaker, the 
thing is ripped up, a no brainer. But none of the Judiciary has practiced that.  

 "There is now circulating without a hearing, I think it's bill 1172, which I 
talked with the head of the prisons yesterday, he didn't know about it. The 
point is, we have a way of doing without cash, if people would just keep 
their word. So, Mr. Speaker, this is redundant and to me and no is a no 
brainer because there should not be no cash bail. You've got to have skin in 
the game. And right now, people are not showing up, even if they're poor or 
they're rich. This is not the way we should be going. Thank you." 

 Representative Matsumoto rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye 
vote with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Ganaden rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "In strong support, Mr. Speaker. In response to the representative from 
District 18, this is not affecting cash bail. It still remains in the purview of 
the issuing court to issue bail if they decide to. Members of the CMV and 
Judiciary Committees last week heard from the National Conference of State 
Legislatures regarding numerous best practices happening around the 
country, regarding how we treat those who are charged with crimes but who 
are not yet convicted. This does work, as seen through around the country. 
We also need to start making moves towards remedying the ill effects of the 
war on drugs. I have much more to say on this, but I suppose I'll wait until 
third reading. Thank you so much." 

 Representative Quinlan rose to speak in opposition to the measure, 
stating:  

 "In opposition, Mr. Speaker. I think there are a lot of really great ideas 
contained in this bill, but I do have some issues with the part three, so I'll be 
a no for now. Thank you." 

 Representative Holt rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Gates rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Tam rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote with 
reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Kapela rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. Strong support. I would just like the words of 
the representative from Kalihi inserted into the Journal as if they were my 
own," and the Chair "so ordered."  (By reference only.)  

 Representative Souza rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 1336, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CRIMINAL JUSTICE REFORM," passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Judiciary & 
Hawaiian Affairs, with Representatives Matsumoto, Souza, and Tam voting 
aye with reservations, with Representatives Alcos, Garcia, Gates, Holt, 
Pierick, Quinlan, and Ward voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 361) recommending 
that H.B. No. 164, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 164, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PROFESSIONAL LICENSE FEE RENEWALS," passed Second Reading 
and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 362) recommending 
that H.B. No. 187, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 187, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce, seconded by 
Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  
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 Representative Ward rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote with 
reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 187, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO RENEWABLE ENERGY," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Consumer Protection & 
Commerce, with Representative Ward voting aye with reservations, with 
Representatives Alcos, Garcia, and Pierick voting no, and with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 363) recommending 
that H.B. No. 854, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 854, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
DISLOCATED WORKERS," passed Second Reading and was referred to 
the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 364) recommending 
that H.B. No. 987, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 987, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
LABOR DATA COLLECTION," passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 365) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1000, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1000, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 366) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1001, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1001, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 367) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1002, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1002, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 368) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1003, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 

H.B. No. 1003, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 369) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1004, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1004, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 370) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1005, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1005, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 371) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1006, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1006, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 372) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1007, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1007, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 373) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1008, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1008, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 374) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1009, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1009, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 
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 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 375) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1010, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 1010, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Matsumoto rose to disclose a potential conflict of interest, 
stating: 

 "Ruling on a potential conflict. My husband and my brother are 
firefighters," and the Chair ruled, "no conflict," and that the ruling would 
extend through sine die. 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 1010, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 376) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1011, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1011, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 377) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1012, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1012, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT COST ITEMS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 378) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1013, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1013, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE REPEAL OF ACT 192, SESSION LAWS OF HAWAII 2007," passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 379) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1014, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1014, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT SYSTEM DISABILITY RETIREMENT," 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 380) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1138, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1138, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EMPLOYEES OF HAWAII HEALTH SYSTEMS CORPORATION," 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Matayoshi, for the Committee on Labor & Government 
Operations, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 381) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1370, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1370, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE STATE ARCHIVES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 382) recommending that H.B. No. 680, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 680, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII PUBLIC HOUSING AUTHORITY," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 383) recommending that H.B. No. 648, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 648, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
KUPUNA HOUSING," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 384) recommending that H.B. No. 217, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Consumer Protection & Commerce. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 217, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce, seconded by 
Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Kapela rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
her, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 217, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO HOME RENOVATIONS," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Consumer Protection & 
Commerce, with Representative Kapela voting no, and with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 385) recommending that H.B. No. 1395, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1395, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HOUSING," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 386) recommending that H.B. No. 674, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 
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 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 674, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII PUBLIC HOUSING AUTHORITY," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 387) recommending that H.B. No. 1244, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1244, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HOUSING," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Hashimoto, for the Committee on Housing, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 388) recommending that H.B. No. 543, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 543, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Kapela rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. No vote with a brief comment. This is a tax 
credit solely for rich people. The district that I represent, portions of my 
community don't even have access to clean water at all. Many people in my 
district live off of catchment, so that means that they're catching water off 
of their roof that goes into a tank and then they're then able to use that. We 
have no tax credits or tax breaks for those individuals, oftentimes people 
who are marginalized and come from very impoverished communities.  

 "I think that if we're going to move on a water credit, it should be equitable 
and we should make sure that the communities that are the most harmed 
have access to these things. However, if this is specifically to Red Hill, then 
we need to make sure that in this bill we provide the proof of harm so that 
we're making sure that that money is going towards families that may have 
been impacted by Red Hill. Thank you." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 543, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO TAXATION," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kapela voting 
no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 389) recommending that 
H.B. No. 485, HD 1, as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 485, HD 2 be referred to the Committee on 
Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Amato rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "In strong support." 

 Representative Pierick rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "No please. I don't believe it's wise to be encouraging our culture to 
change their gender when at their DNA level their gender cannot change." 

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Garcia rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "In opposition. Thank you, Mr. Speaker. This is changing a legal 
document, and the last I checked, legal documents are to reflect accurate 
information. If someone is born male or born female, that's what they are. I 

get there are trans individuals, but legal documents ought to report accurate 
information and not live in the world of the make believe. So, no vote." 

 Representative Hussey-Burdick rose to speak in support of the measure, 
stating:  

 "Mr. Speaker, in support. I have a biology degree and I studied sex and 
gender pretty extensively during my undergrad. I just think that maybe this 
body should be aware that a 2018 study by Horii, et al., published in the 
Gynecologic and Obstetric Pathology, Third Edition, shows that people with 
intersex parts have different XXXY genotypes, concluding that 
chromosomes do not necessarily dictate what genitals you get. From the 
study it says, based on external phenotype, two-thirds of true 
hermaphrodites are raised as males, despite the presence of an XX, female, 
karyotype in at least half of them. Other karyotypes are 46,XX/46,XY and 
46,XY. 

 "Mr. Speaker, according to the science, there are far more than two 
naturally occurring sexes, and perceived sex is actually a complicated mix 
of hormones and genotypes. As a biologist and a strong LGBTQ+ ally, I 
support the right of all humans to make decisions about their own body. 
Thank you." 

 Representative Matsumoto rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye 
vote with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Souza rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "In support, Mr. Speaker. In Hawai‘i we can already basically request a 
new birth certificate with the sex designation changed, so I don't see why it 
would not apply to marriage certificates as far as the gender change. Thank 
you." 

 Representative Perruso rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "In strong support. I'd like to have the words of the member from Kailua 
entered into the Journal as if they were my own," and the Chair "so ordered."  
(By reference only.)  

 Representative Kapela rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. Same request," and the Chair "so ordered."  (By 
reference only.)  

 Representative Ward rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote with 
reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 485, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MARRIAGE," was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representatives Matsumoto and Ward voting aye with 
reservations, with Representatives Alcos, Garcia, and Pierick voting no, and 
with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 390) recommending that 
H.B. No. 15, HD 1, as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 15, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
REAL PROPERTY LIENS," was referred to the Committee on Finance, 
with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 391) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1038, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1038, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HOMELAND SECURITY," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 
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 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 392) recommending that 
H.B. No. 567, HD 1, as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 567, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE DEPARTMENT OF HAWAIIAN HOME LANDS," was referred to 
the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 393) recommending that 
H.B. No. 384, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 384, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PARENTAGE," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 394) recommending that 
H.B. No. 445, HD 1, as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 445, HD 2 be referred to the Committee on 
Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 445, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CHILD SUPPORT," was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Garcia voting aye with 
reservations, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 395) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1145, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1145, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EQUITY," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 396) recommending that 
H.B. No. 719, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 719, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Kong rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 719, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC RECORDS," passed Second Reading 
and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kong 
voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 397) recommending that 
H.B. No. 979, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 979, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT MAKING 

APPROPRIATIONS FOR CLAIMS AGAINST THE STATE, ITS 
OFFICERS, OR ITS EMPLOYEES," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 398) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1260, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1260, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ADDRESS CONFIDENTIALITY," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 399) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1113, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1113, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE DRUG AND ALCOHOL TOXICOLOGY TESTING 
LABORATORY," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 400) recommending that 
H.B. No. 317, HD 1, as amended in HD 2, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 317, HD 2 be referred to the Committee on 
Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Ward rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 317, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO YOUTH FEES AND FINES," was referred to 
the Committee on Finance, with Representatives Alcos, Garcia, Pierick, and 
Ward voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tarnas, for the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 401) recommending that 
H.B. No. 997, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 997, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT PROPOSING 
AMENDMENTS TO ARTICLE VII, SECTIONS 12 AND 13, OF THE 
HAWAII CONSTITUTION TO EXPRESSLY PROVIDE THAT THE 
LEGISLATURE MAY AUTHORIZE THE COUNTIES TO ISSUE TAX 
INCREMENT BONDS AND TO EXCLUDE TAX INCREMENT BONDS 
FROM DETERMINATIONS OF THE FUNDED DEBT OF THE 
COUNTIES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee 
on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Belatti, for the Committee on Health & Homelessness, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 402) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1255, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 
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 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1255, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
SPECIAL PURPOSE REVENUE BONDS," passed Second Reading and 
was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Belatti, for the Committee on Health & Homelessness, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 403) recommending that 
H.B. No. 1263, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1263, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII ABLE SAVINGS PROGRAM," passed Second Reading 
and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Belatti, for the Committee on Health & Homelessness, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 404) recommending that 
H.B. No. 652, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 652, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CAREGIVERS," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Belatti, for the Committee on Health & Homelessness, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 405) recommending that 
H.B. No. 838, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 838, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
LONG-TERM CARE," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Belatti, for the Committee on Health & Homelessness, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 406) recommending that 
H.B. No. 872, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 872, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII HEALTHY AGING PARTNERSHIP," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Lowen and Woodson, for the Committee on Energy & 
Environmental Protection and the Committee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 407) recommending that H.B. No. 896, as 
amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 896, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Lowen, for the Committee on Energy & Environmental 
Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 408) recommending 
that H.B. No. 194, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 194, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
EFFICIENCY STANDARDS," passed Second Reading and was referred to 

the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Lowen, for the Committee on Energy & Environmental 
Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 409) recommending 
that H.B. No. 192, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 192, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ENERGY EFFICIENCY," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Consumer Protection & Commerce, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Lowen, for the Committee on Energy & Environmental 
Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 410) recommending 
that H.B. No. 441, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 441, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Pierick rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 441, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CLIMATE EQUITY," passed Second Reading 
and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Alcos 
voting aye with reservations, with Representatives Garcia and Pierick voting 
no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Lowen, for the Committee on Energy & Environmental 
Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 411) recommending 
that H.B. No. 188, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 188, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 188, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CARBON SEQUESTRATION," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Garcia voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Lowen, for the Committee on Energy & Environmental 
Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 412) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1505, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1505, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HAWAII EMPLOYER-UNION HEALTH BENEFITS TRUST 
FUND," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Lowen, for the Committee on Energy & Environmental 
Protection, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 413) recommending 
that H.B. No. 1506, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 



 2 0 2 3  HOUSE J OURN AL –  1 8 TH DAY  1 7 9  
 
H.B. No. 1506, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT SYSTEM OF THE STATE OF 
HAWAII," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 414) recommending that H.B. No. 1356, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1356, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
MEDICAID PATIENT CARE," passed Second Reading and was referred 
to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 415) recommending that H.B. No. 1343, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committees be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 1343, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Pierick rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "No please. I'd like to thank the representatives introducing this measure. 
I do support contraception. But, if this measure would include abortion, that 
goes against my belief. My understanding is that life begins at conception, 
and when a heartbeat begins to be at around five and a half to six weeks, 
that's a very precious thing. And it's my desire to save human life, including 
life within the womb. So that's why I'm voting no on this measure." 

 Representative Nakamura rose to a point of order, stating:  

 "Point of order. The previous speaker should address the bill at hand." 

 Representative Garcia rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "Addressing the bill at hand, in opposition. This expands reproductive 
health care access, which is a code word for abortion services, statewide. 
So, no vote." 

 Representative Alcos rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Matsumoto rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye 
vote with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Kapela rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. Strong support. I would like to clarify for 
members who may not understand that reproductive justice is more than just 
abortion access. Reproductive justice means access to women's health care. 
It means access to being able to know how your body is operating. Being 
able to understand if you ever have any issues, how to take care of those 
problems.  

 "On the neighbor islands, we don't have access to reproductive health at 
all. It's very difficult in many areas and in rural communities, you barely 
have access to a doctor. So, having a care access office that makes sure that 
in every single community, women can understand how to care for their 
bodies, whether it's a cancer screening or a mammogram, that's what 
reproductive justice is, not just abortion access." 

 Representative Mizuno rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. In support. I wanted to thank the members of 
this body for saying some really good arguments on this and many other 
bills. So, I'm going to state something that didn't come from me, but I heard 
from a very intelligent colleague of ours. My body, my choice. Thank you, 
Mr. Speaker." 

 Representative Marten rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, in strong support. I would like the have the words of the 
representative from Kaʻū entered into the Journal as if they were my own," 
and the Chair "so ordered."  (By reference only.)  

 Representative Souza rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Ganaden rose in support of the measure and asked that the 
remarks of Representative Kapela be entered into the Journal as his own, 
and the Chair "so ordered."  (By reference only.)  

 Representative Ward rose and asked that the Clerk record a no vote for 
him, and the Chair "so ordered."  

 Representative Tam rose in support of the measure and asked that the 
remarks of Representative Kapela be entered into the Journal as his own, 
and the Chair "so ordered."  (By reference only.)  

 Representative Perruso rose to speak in support of the measure, stating:  

 "In strong support and I'd also like the words of the representative from 
District 5 entered into the Journal as if they were my own," and the Chair 
"so ordered."  (By reference only.)  

 Representative Lamosao rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for her, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.B. No. 1343, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO REPRODUCTIVE HEALTH CARE ACCESS," 
passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representatives Lamosao, Matsumoto, and Souza voting aye with 
reservations, with Representatives Alcos, Garcia, Pierick, and Ward voting 
no, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 416) recommending that H.B. No. 1341, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committees be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 1341, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Garcia rose and asked that the Clerk record an aye vote 
with reservations for him, and the Chair "so ordered." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.B. No. 1341, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MEDICAID," passed Second Reading and was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative Garcia voting 
aye with reservations, and with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 417) recommending that H.B. No. 916, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 916, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
SOCIAL SERVICES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 418) recommending that H.B. No. 883, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 883, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HEALTH," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 
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 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 419) recommending that H.B. No. 223, HD 1, as 
amended in HD 2, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 223, HD 2, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HUMAN SERVICES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 420) recommending that H.B. No. 1369, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1369, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
NURSING FACILITIES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representatives Mizuno and Belatti, for the Committee on Human 
Services and the Committee on Health & Homelessness, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 421) recommending that H.B. No. 1368, as amended 
in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committees was adopted and 
H.B. No. 1368, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE HOSPITAL SUSTAINABILITY PROGRAM," passed Second 
Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with Representative 
Kitagawa being excused. 

 Representative Tam, for the Committee on Culture, Arts & International 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 422) recommending that 
H.B. No. 105, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 105, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
LICENSE PLATES," passed Second Reading and was referred to the 
Committee on Judiciary & Hawaiian Affairs, with Representative Kitagawa 
being excused. 

 Representative Tam, for the Committee on Culture, Arts & International 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 423) recommending that 
H.B. No. 269, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 Representative Nakamura moved that the report of the Committee be 
adopted, and that H.B. No. 269, HD 1 pass Second Reading and be referred 
to the Committee on Finance, seconded by Representative Morikawa. 

 Representative Kapela rose to speak in opposition to the measure, stating:  

 "Thank you, Mr. Speaker. In opposition with a brief comment. I 
appreciate the chair for his amendments to the measure. However, as a 
performing artist myself and as a performing arts educator, I feel that this 
bill could potentially limit more access to performing arts on neighbor 
islands and in rural communities. So, that's my no vote. Thank you." 

 The motion was put to vote by the Chair and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.B. No. 269, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII THEATRE CENTER," passed 
Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on Finance, with 
Representative Kapela voting no, and with Representative Kitagawa being 
excused. 

 Representative Tam, for the Committee on Culture, Arts & International 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 424) recommending that 
H.B. No. 474, as amended in HD 1, pass Second Reading and be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

 On motion by Representative Nakamura, seconded by Representative 
Morikawa and carried, the report of the Committee was adopted and 
H.B. No. 474, HD 1, entitled:  "A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE STATE OF HAWAII MUSEUM OF NATURAL AND CULTURAL 
HISTORY," passed Second Reading and was referred to the Committee on 
Finance, with Representative Kitagawa being excused. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

 By unanimous consent, the following resolution (H.R. No. 15) and 
concurrent resolution (H.C.R. No. 15) were referred to Printing and further 
action was deferred: 

    H.R. No. 15, entitled:  "HOUSE RESOLUTION URGING AND 
APPLYING TO THE CONGRESS OF THE UNITED STATES UNDER 
THE PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE V OF THE CONSTITUTION OF THE 
UNITED STATES FOR THE CALLING OF A CONVENTION OF THE 
STATES, LIMITED TO PROPOSING AMENDMENTS TO THE 
CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES THAT LIMIT THE 
TERMS OF OFFICE FOR OFFICIALS OF THE FEDERAL 
GOVERNMENT AND MEMBERS OF CONGRESS," was offered by 
Representative Kong. 

    H.C.R. No. 15, entitled:  "HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
URGING AND APPLYING TO THE CONGRESS OF THE UNITED 
STATES UNDER THE PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE V OF THE 
CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES FOR THE CALLING OF A 
CONVENTION OF THE STATES, LIMITED TO PROPOSING 
AMENDMENTS TO THE CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES 
THAT LIMIT THE TERMS OF OFFICE FOR OFFICIALS OF THE 
FEDERAL GOVERNMENT AND MEMBERS OF CONGRESS," was 
offered by Representative Kong. 

ADJOURNMENT 

 At 12:32 p.m., on motion by Representative Morikawa, seconded by 
Representative Garcia and carried, the House of Representatives adjourned 
until noon tomorrow, Wednesday, February 15, 2023.  (Representative 
Kitagawa was excused.) 


