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FIFTIETH DAY 

Friday, April 10, 1987 

The House of Representatives of 
the Fourteenth Legislature of the 
State of Hawaii, Regular Session of 
1987, convened at 11: 05 o'clock 
a.m., with the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked 
by the Reverend Dale Guidry, 
Associate Pastor, Co-Cathedral of 
St. Theresa, after which the Roll 
was called showing all members 
present with the exception of 
Representatives Arakaki, Crozier, 
Fukunaga, Horita, Peters, Tam 
and Yoshimura who were excused. 

The Clerk proceeded to read the 
Journals of the House of Represen­
tatives of the Forty-Sixth and 
Forty-Seventh Days. 

On motion by Representative 
Apo, seconded by Representative 
Anderson and carried, reading of 
the Journals was dispensed with 
and the Journals of the Forty­
Sixth and Forty-Seventh Days 
were approved. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications 
from the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 
644 to 746a) were read by the 
Clerk and were placed on file: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 644) informing the 
House that the Senate has disa­
greed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to Senate Bill No. 
35, SD2, and has requested a 
conference on the subject matter 
thereof, in consequence of which 
the President has, on April 7, 
1987, appointed as Managers on 
the part of the Senate for the 
consideration of said amendments 
Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; Holt 
and A. Kobayashi. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 645) informing the 
House that the Senate has disa­
greed to the amendments proposed 
by the House to Senate Bill No. 5, 
SD2, ( HD3) , and has requested a 
conference on the subject matter 
thereof, in consequence of which 
the President has, on April 9, 
1987, appointed as Managers on 
the part of the Senate for the 
consideration of said amendments 
Senators Menor/Yamasaki, Co-Chair­
men; J. Wong, Hee and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Crozier/­
Hagino I Metcalf I Souki, Co-Chairmen; 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House . 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 646) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 24, SDl, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair 
and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Hagino, Hiraki 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 647) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 33, SDl, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Blair, B. Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hiraki, Yoshi­
mura and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. Ne,. 648) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 92, (HDl), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Matsuura, Chairman; Blair, 
Hagino and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Levin, 
Chairman; Andrews, D. Ige, Tajiri 
and Pfeil as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 649) informing the 
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House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 97, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, J. Wong and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Cachola, Hayes, Yoshimura 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 650) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 109, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B. Kobayashi, Chair­
man; Solomon and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Leong and 
Cavasso as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 651) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 141, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; Mizugu­
chi, Aki, Blair, Fernandes-Salling, 
Hagino, B. Kobayashi, Matsuura, 
Nakasato, Young, Henderson, Ikeda 
and A Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Souki, 
Chairman; Fukunaga, Arakaki, Ho­
rita, D. Ige, M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, 
Kawakami, Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, 
Cavasso, Isbell and Marumoto as 
Managers on the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 652) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 154, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 

has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Hee, Holt, Kuroda and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Hayes, Hiraki 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 653) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 183, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Nakasato, Chairman ; 
Mizuguchi and Reed, 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine, 
Chairman; Hirono, Horita, Taniguchi 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 654) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 241, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
men ts Senators Fernandes Salling, 
Chairman; Chang, Hee and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Bellinger, 
Chairman; Cachola, Crozier, Horita 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 655) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 242, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Aki, Chairman; Fer­
nandes Salling, Matsuura and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives D. Ige, 
Chairman; Bunda, Kanoho, Say and 
Isbell as Managers on the part of the 
House. 
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A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 656) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 255, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Hee, Chairman; Cobb, 
Kuroda, J. Wong and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hayes, Hirono, Shi to and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 657) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 261, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators N akasato, Chairman; 
Hee, B . Kobayashi and Reed. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 658) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 320, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Mizuguchi, Aki, Blair, Fernandes 
Salling, Hagino, B. Kobayashi, Mat­
suura, Nakasato, Young, Henderson, 
Ikeda and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Souki, 
Chairman; Fukunaga, Arakaki, Ho­
rita, D. Ige, M. Ige, Ibara, Kanoho, 
Kawakami, Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, 
Cavasso, Isbell and Marumoto as 
Managers on the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 659) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 341, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair 

and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hayes, 
and Hemmings as Managers 
part of the House. 

Hirono, 
Hiraki 

on the 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 660) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 348, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Cobb, B. Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Cachola, Hiraki 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 661) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 350, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B . Kobayashi, Chair­
man; Solomon and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Leong and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 662) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 356, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Aki, Chairman; Mat­
suura and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Levin/Fu­
kunaga, Co-Chairmen; D. Ige, Lee 
and Pfeil as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 663) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
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to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 361, SD3, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Blair, Cobb and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Andrews, Hiraki 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 664) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 389, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
men ts Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair 
and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 665) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 398, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Aki, Matsuura and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Honda/­
Levin/Souki, Co-Chairmen; Say and 
Pfeil as Managers on the part of the 
House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 666) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendm(lnts proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 420, SD1, 
(HD1), and has ' requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April' 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Aki, Chairman; Young 
and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hayes, Hiraki, Shito and 
Jones as Managers on the part of the 
House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 667) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 431, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Holt, J. Wong and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Andrews, Bellinger, Ca­
chola and Jones as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 668) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 432, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Nakasato and Henderson. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, 
Yoshimura and Marumoto as Managers 
on the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 669) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 441, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair 
and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hayes, Hiraki, Peters and 
Jones as Managers on the part of the 
House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 670) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
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House to Senate Bill No. 445, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Kuroda and Ikeda; 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono/Met­
calf, Co- Chairmen; Hagino, Hiraki 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 671) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 447, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Cobb, Chairman; Kuroda and 
A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 672) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 456, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Holt, Chairman; 
Solomon and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Bunda/­
Oshiro, Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, 
Hashimoto and O'Kieffe as Managers 
on the part of the House . 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 673) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 469, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Chang, Matsuura and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 

appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Cachola, Hiraki, Yoshimura 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 674) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 481, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Matsuura, Chairman; 
Aki, Mizuguchi and Henderson. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Andrews/­
Levin, Co-Chairmen; D. Ige, Kanoho 
and O'Kieffe as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 675) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 486, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Fernandes Salling, Mc Murdo 
and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Andrews, Bellinger, Yoshi­
mura and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 676) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 515, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
B. Kobayashi, McMurdo and Hender­
son. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Ha­
gino/ Souki, Co-Chairmen; Arakaki 
and Cavasso as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 677) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
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House to Senate Bill No. 518, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; B. 
Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Hi­
rono, Co-Chairmen; Arakaki, Hiraki 
and Ribellia as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 678) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 526, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair 
and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Hagino, Hiraki 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 679) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 545, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Blair, B. Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hayes, Hiraki 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 680) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 548, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Aki, 
Solomon, J. Wong and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 

appointed Representatives Levin/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; D. Ige, Kanoho 
and Pfeil as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 681) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 559, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has , on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Aki, Chairman; Young 
and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Levin/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Kanoho, Tajiri 
and Isbell as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 682) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 575, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has , on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Menor, McMurdo and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hayes, Hiraki 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 683) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 576, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Holt, 
Menor, McMurdo and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hayes, Hiraki 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Corn. No. 684) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 619, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer-
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ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hagino, Chairman; 
Nakasato and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hayes, Kawakami 
and Ribellia as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 685) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 630, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B. Kobayashi, Chair­
man; Solomon and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Leong, Tom and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 686) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 767, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Holt, 
Kuroda, J. Wong and A. Kobayashi. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 687) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 769, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, McMurdo, Menor and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hayes, Peters, Yoshimura 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 688) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 

to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 774, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Solomon, Chairman; 
Holt and Henderson. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Taniguchi, 
Chairman; Crozier, Oshiro, Say and 
O'Kieffe as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 689) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 785, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in con­
sequence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Hee, Chairman; Holt, Ku­
roda, Menor and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Cachola, Peters, Yoshimura 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 690) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 787, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Kuroda, Mizuguchi and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Tam/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Lee, Honda and 
O'Kieffe as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 691) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 792, (HD2), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; Mc­
Murdo and Henderson. 
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In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf/ -
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Peters, Yoshi­
mura and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 692) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 797, SDl, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Kuroda, Menor and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hiraki, Hirono, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 693) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 801, SDI, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Menor, Solomon and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hiraki, Hirono, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 694) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 808, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on . April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Blair, Cobb, Matsuura and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Hiraki 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 695) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 815, SD1, 

(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of. the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Blair, B. Kobayashi, Matsuura and 
Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Hi­
rono, Co-Chairmen; Hiraki, Tom and 
Ribellia as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 696) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 832, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Hee, Chairman; Holt, Ku­
roda, J. Wong and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hirono , Takamine 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 697) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 847, SDI, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Cobb, 
Kuroda, J. Wong and George . 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Cachola, Peters, Shi to and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 698) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 915, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Mizuguchi, Chairman; 
Fernandes Salling, Hagino and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
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appointed Representatives Tam, 
Chairman; Honda, Lee, Oshiro, and 
Pfeil as Managers on the part of the 
House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 699) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 957, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Menor, Chairman; J. 
Wong and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hagino, 
Chairman; Arakaki, Metcalf, Tom and 
Cavasso as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 700) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 978, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Chang and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Andrews, Hiraki 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 701) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 986, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Blair, B. Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 702) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 994, SD 1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer-

ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B. Kobayashi, Chair­
man; Matsuura and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Leong 
and Ribellia as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 703) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1000, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Nakasato, Chairman; 
Yamasaki and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Horita, Tani­
guchi and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 704) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1007, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B. Kobayashi, 
Chairman; Matsuura and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shon/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Hayes, Leong and 
Cavasso as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 705) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1068, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Hee, Chairman; Chang, 
McMurdo, J. Wong and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Andrews, Bellinger, Taka-
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mine and Hemmings as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 706) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1072, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Nakasato, Chairman; 
B. Kobayashi and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, 
Crozier and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 707) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1142, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Hee, Chairman; Kuroda, 
Menor and Solomon. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hiraki, Shito and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 708) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1143, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; Hee, 
Kuroda, Menor and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Cachola, Tung­
palan and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 709) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1154, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 

has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Chang and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Levin/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; D. Ige, Kanoho 
and O'Kieffe as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 710) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1163, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Holt, 
Kuroda, J. Wong and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Andrews, Hagino 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 711) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1164, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hagino, Chairman; 
Solomon and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Andrews/­
Honda/Souki, Co-Chairmen; Kanoho 
and Pfeil as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 712) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1172, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Fernandes Salling, 
Chairman; Holt, Kuroda and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Oshiro/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, Ibara 
and Marumoto as Managers on the 
part of the House. 
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A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 713) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1173, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Cobb, Chairman; Kuroda and 
A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 714) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 117 4, SD 1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Nakasato, Chairman; 
Mizuguchi and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine, 
Chairman; Crozier, Horita, Taniguchi 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 715) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1192, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Holt and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Cachola/­
Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; Horita, 
Ihara and Jones as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 716) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1201, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend-

ments Senators Hee, Chairman; 
Chang, Menor, McMurdo and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hiraki, Yoshimura 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 717) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1202, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Cobb, 
McMurdo, J. Wong and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Andrews, Shito, Yoshimura 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 718) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1218, (HDl), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Mizuguchi, Chairman; Mc­
Murdo, J. Wong and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Hagino, Co-Chairmen; Arakaki, 
Bellinger and Medeiros as Managers 
on the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 719) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1278, (HDl), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair and 
Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Cachola, Hayes, Hiraki and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 720) informing the 
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House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1288, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; Blair 
and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono / -
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, Hiraki 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 721) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1289, SDl, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Nakasato and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hiraki, Shito 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 722) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1318, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Aki, Young and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hagino/­
Shito/Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; Ara­
kaki and Ribellia as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 723) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1325, SDl, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Aki, Chairman; Fernan­
des Salling and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Levin, 
Chairman; n: Ige, Kanoho, Say and 
Pfeil as Managers on the part of _ the 
House. · 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 724) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1338, SDl, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Nakasato and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Hiraki, Shito and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 725) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1367, SDl, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Nakasato and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Ihara, Tung­
palan and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 726) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1395, SDl, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Fernandes Salling and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hagino, Hiraki 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 727) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1399, SDl, 
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(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Nakasato, Chairman; 
B. Kobayashi and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Ihara, Tung­
palan and Yoshimura as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 728) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1424, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Hee, McMurdo, J. Wong and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf I -
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Taka­
mine and Hemmings as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 729) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1443, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Hee, McMurdo, J. Wong and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Taka­
mine and Hemmings as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 730) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1446, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B. Kobayashi, Chair­
man; McMurdo and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 

Chairman; Cachola, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 731) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1472, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Hee, Chairman; Holt, 
Kuroda, J. Wong and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Peters, Yoshi­
mura and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 732) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1500, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a · confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Mizuguchi, Nakasato and Henderson. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Tungpalan, 
Yoshimura and Medeiros as Managers 
on the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 733) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1525, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Cobb, Chairman; 
Blair, Nakasato and Ikeda. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Hiraki, Shito and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 734) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1660, (HD1), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse-



634 HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 0 t h DAY 

quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; Mizugu­
chi, Aki, Blair, Fernandes Salling, 
Hagino, B. Kobayashi, Matsuura, 
Nakasato, Young, Henderson, Ikeda 
and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Souki, 
Chairman; Fukunaga, Arakaki, Ho­
rita, D. Ige, M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, 
Kawakami, Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, 
Cavasso, Isbell and Marumoto as 
Managers on the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 735) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1673, SD1, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Blair, Nakasato and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Horita, Tani­
guchi and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 736) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1713, SD2, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Blair and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Ihara, Oshiro 
and Marumoto as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 737) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1718, ( HD 1) , 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Nakasato, Chairman; Mizugu­
chi and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine /­
Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; Hirono, 
Ihara and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 738) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1720 , (HD2), 
and has requested a conference on 
the subject matter thereof, in conse­
quence of which the President has, 
on April 9, 1987, appointed as Man­
agers on the part of the Senate for 
the consideration of said amendments 
Senators Menor, Chairman; J. Wong 
and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/ ­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Cachola, Yoshi­
mura and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com . No. 739) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed f>y the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1729, SD1, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators B. Kobayashi, Chair­
man; Blair, George and Young. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Shito/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Arakaki, Leong 
and Ribellia as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 7 40) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1735, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Hee and Mizuguchi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, Hayes 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com . No. 741) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1744, SD1, 
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(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Nakasato and A. Kobayashi. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Takamine/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Hirono, Tani­
guchi and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 742) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1747, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Hagino and Reed. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Andrews/­
Takamine/Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; 
Say and Pfeil as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 7 43) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1748, SDl, 
(HD1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Fernandes Salling, Holt and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Oshiro/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; !hara, Tung­
palan and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 7 44) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1750, SDl, 
(HDl), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
Fernandes Salling, Holt and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Oshiro/-

Souki, Co-Chairmen; !hara, Tung~ 
palan and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 745) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1751, SD2, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Yamasaki, Chairman; 
McMurdo, Mizuguchi and Henderson. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Hagino/­
Shito/Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; Ara­
kaki and Ribellia as Managers on the 
part of the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 746) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1765, SDl, 
(HD2), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has, on April 9, 1987, appointed as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments Senators Holt, Chairman; Blair 
and George. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Levin/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Bunda, Honda 
and Isbell as Managers on the part of 
the House. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 746A) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 993, SD 1 
(HD 1), and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter thereof, in 
consequence of which the President 
has this day appointed Senators B. 
Kobayashi, Chairman; Matsuura and 
George as Managers on the part of 
the Senate for the consideration of 
said amendments. 

In accordance therewith, the Chair 
appointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hiraki, Hirono, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House. 

At this time, the Chair directed the 
Clerk to note the presence of Repre­
sentatives Arakaki, Crozier, Horita, 
Peters and Yoshimura. 

The following introductions were 
made to the members of the House: 
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Representative Bellinger introduced 
his son, Ethan, who was among 12 
students from Kapunahala Elementary 
School accompanied by their teachers, 
Nina Rubinelli, Renee Fonoimoana, 
Cindy Tamashiro and Murdock and 
Lani Zablan. 

Representative Pfeil introduced 5 
civic leaders from Molokai, "who are 
here to testify in favor of a resolu­
tion to study a greater decision-mak­
ing role for Molokai," as follows: Mr. 
Bob Johnson, director of the Molokai 
Community Service Council; Mr. Dave 
Foster, community planner for Molokai 
Economic Justice Council, "whose wife 
has organized Molokai's successful 
alternative birthing program", ; Ms. 
Kaye Waldorf, "who is testifying for 
the United Church of Christ and is 
also doing excellent work for the soil 
conversation service and is a pioneer 
in farming in Molokai and is greatly 
responsible for the success of the 
many seed corn operations on Molo­
kai"; Ms. Noelani Joy, homestead 
farmer who has been active in im­
proving the administration of the 
Molokai irrigation system; and Helen 
O'Connor, an intern with the office of 
Social Ministries, Catholic Diocese, 
and who is a community volunteer and 
advocate for improved health care for 
Hawaiians. 

Representative Crozier introduced 
Randy Ann Rodrigues, Angela Tachet 
and Carrie Nakasone, students from 
Ilima Intermediate School. 

Representative Hagino introduced 57 
fifth grade students from Kuhio 
School accompanied by their teachers, 
Mrs. Ho and Mr. Yanaga; and parent, 
Mrs. Quinn. 

Representative Say introduced 14 
students from the Kaimuki Alternative 
Learning Center accompanied by Ms. 
Kathleen Oshiro, Michael Lee and Mr. 
Lafuaavaa. 

Representative Oshiro introduced 35 
students from Poakea Elementary 
School who were accompanied by their 
teachers, Ms. Uedoi and Ms. Kamita. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

DEFERRED RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions ( H. R. 
Nos. 329 to 333; 335 to 354) and 
concurrent resolutions ( H. C.R. Nos. 
195 to 214 and S.C.R. No. 19) were 
disposed of as follows: 

H.R. Nos. Referred to: 

329 Committee on Water, Land 

Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

330 · Committee on Judiciary 

331 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

332 Committee on Transportation 

333 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

335 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

336 Committee on Transportation 

337 Committee on Judiciary 

338 Committee on Transportation 

339 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

340 Committee on Health, then 
to the Committee on Finance 

341 Committee on Health 

342 Committee on Health 

343 Committee on Transportation 

344 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

345 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

346 Committee on Transporta-
tion, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

347 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

348 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

349 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

350 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

351 Jointly to the Committees on 
Housing and Community Development 
and Consumer Protection and Com­
merce 

352 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

353 Committee on Tourism 

354 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 
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H.C.R. Nos. 

195 Committee on Transportation 

196 Committee on Transportation 

197 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

198 Committee on Transportation 

199 Committee on Judiciary 

200 Committee on Transportation 

201 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

202 Committee on Health, then 
to the Committee on Finance 

203 Committee on Health 

204 Committee on Health 

205 Committee on Transportation 

206 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

207 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

208 Committee on Transporta-
tion, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

209 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

210 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

211 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

212 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

213 Committee on Finance, then 
to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

214 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

S.C.R. No. 

19 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
certain resolutions out of order. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions 
Nos. 459 to 461) were read 
Clerk and were disposed of 
lows: 

(H.R. 
by the 
as fol-

A resolution (H.R. No. 459) congra­
tulating Danny Kaleikini on completing 
his Twentieth year of entertaining at 
the Kabala Hilton Hotel was jointly 
offered by Representatives Anderson, 
Peters, Kihano, Crozier, Apo, Ka­
noho, Leong, Tungpalan, Kawakami, 
Andrews, Arakaki, Bunda, Cavasso, 
Hagino, Hashimoto, Hayes, Hemmings, 
Hiraki, Hirono, Honda, M. Ige, 
Isbell, Jones, Lee, Liu, Marumoto, 
Medeiros, Okamura, Oshiro, Ribellia, 
Shito and Shon. 

On motion by Representative Ander­
son, seconded by Representative 
Peters and carried, H.R. No. 459 was 
adopted. 

Representative Anderson then rose 
and stated: 

"Mr. 
Peters, 
morning. 

Speaker, 
I'm a 

like 
little 

Representative 
choked this 

"I've always wondered, how do you 
thank a person that you've known for 
over 20 years for the work that he's 
done not only for the Hawaiians but 
for the people of Hawaii? I've only 
been able to honor Danny a couple of 
times. Today, I wanted to make sure 
that during the 'Year of the Hawai­
ian,' that we did a little something. 

"You go back and remember, years 
ago, Danny used to have a T. V. 
show. He used to take the camera, 
go all over this state to show people 
the beauty that we had here in 
Hawaii. He was also one who was 
never afraid to bring out new enter­
tainers to make sure that they had 
the exposure that he could, make 
sure that everybody could look at the 
best entertainment that we had to 
offer here in this state. Most of us, 
I think, are a little afraid at times of 
competition. Danny never felt that 
way. 

"Just recently, very graciously, he 
gave the Kailua Hawaiian Civic Club 
Scholarship Fund $500. 00. He's 
always trying to help and for that 
reason, we're very honored to have 
Danny here today." 

At this time, Representative Ander­
son introduced the honoree, Mr. 
Danny Kaleikini, who was accompanied 
by his wife, Jacqueline; their son, 
Danjacques; daughter , Keikilani; and 
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secretary, Ms. Sheri Zigler. 

Floral leis were presented to the 
honorees by Representatives Isbell, 
Liu, Marumoto, Medeiros and Ribellia 
and a certified copy of the resolution 
was presented to Mr. Kaleikini by 
Representative Anderson. 

Representative Peters then rose to 
add a few remarks and stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, contrary to popular 
belief, I'm not all choked up; I did 
want to say a few words in behalf of 
brother Danny--we all refer to him as 
brother Danny. 

"I'm not sure if you realize that two 
years ago, he did have an aspiration 
to run for lieutenant governor. And 
he came to see me and he said, 
'brother, if I ran for lieutenant 
governor, could I also keep my job at 
night at the Kahala Hilton?' and I 
said, 'gee, I wasn't sure if you could 
accomplish that.' Putting that aside, 
however, brother Danny's aloha and 
his love transcends all political lines, 
and it obviously transcends cultural 
lines as well because he truly loves 
people; he is truly the 'Ambassador 
of Aloha,' for Hawaii. 

"Danny, to you and your family, 
Aloha, and God Bless you." 

At 11 : 30 o'clock a.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
extending our aloha to our honorees 
this morning. 11 

Upon reconvening at 11: 43 o'clock 
a.m., Representative Horita , on a late 
introduction, introduced a group of 
fifth grade students from Aliamanu 
Elementary School accompanied by 
their teacher, Ms. May Murabayashi. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 460) honor­
ing Isamu Noguchi, a visionary and 
legendary figure in art was jointly 
offered by Representatives Hagino 
and Taniguchi. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Taniguchi and carried, H.R. No. 460 
was adopted. 

Representative Hagino then rose 
and stated: 

"Recently, Mr. Speaker and fellow 
colleagues and members of the gal­
lery, we have heard about the sale of 
a work of art by Vincent Van Gogh, 
entitled, 'Sunflowers,' which was then 
sold for an unheard price of 39. 9 
million dollars. What is remarkable 

about the sale price is the fact that 
in his lifetime Van Gogh may have 
sold, at most, 1 to 3 of his canvas­
ses ; in fact, many art historians 
believe that he may not have made a 
single sale within his lifetime. 

"I think the lesson of this recent 
story of Van Gogh is simply this: We 
do not pay enough gratitude and 
respect, or show enough appreciation 
to our artist and art visionaries in 
their lifetime. When an artist creates 
a work of art, that work of art will 
endure for hundreds of years. That 
work will inspire, entertain and 
educate generations upon generations 
of people. Because of this enduring 
legacy that an artist gives to all of 
us, we must take it upon ourselves to 
find the time to say a simple, 'thank 
you,' over and over and over again, 

"Today, we take this opportunity to 
thank and to recognize a great artist. 
We are recognizing today, Mr. Isamu 
Noguchi, an artist who ranks with 
Picasso, and more, as one of the 
great artists and sculptors of the 
Twentieth century. His body of 
works will endure for hundreds of 
years. He will be recognized as part 
of a lineage of great masters that 
reaches as far back as Michaelangelo. 

"The resolution that we have just 
adopted does not say enough about 
Mr . Noguchi. Indeed, it would be 
impossible for any resolution to 
incorporate all of the great achieve­
ments of this man. He has created 
many works--other works--too numer­
ous to mention in the resolution, such 
as, the indoor granite mountain in the 
Sogetsu School in Tokyo and the 
water fountain at the Detroit Renais­
sance Center. Currently, he is 
engaged on another public monumental 
work of art for the city of Miami 
which is on a 28-acre parcel of land. 

"The resolution, also, does not list 
many of the accolades that he has 
received. For example, several years 
ago, he was designated a 'living 
treasure' by Hawaii's own Honpa 
Hongwanji. Later this year, on June 
18th, he will be honored by the 
President of the United States for his 
great achievements for art and as 
America's greatest living artist. And 
indeed, no resolution can list all of 
his works because this man is still 
creating and designing, constructing 
and sculpting. Although he is 82 
years of age, he continues to work to 
produce and to inspire all of us." 

At this time, the honoree, Mr. 
Noguchi, was introduced by Represen­
tative Hagino and was asked to stand 
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and be recognized. Accompanying 
Mr. Noguchi were Mr. Sean Brown, 
"a fine young sculptor from Hawaii"; 
Dr. Franklin Odo, chairperson for the 
State Foundation of Culture and the 
Arts; Mr. Ron Yamakawa, staffperson 
on the State Foundation of Culture 
and the Arts; and Mr. George Ellis, 
director of the Honolulu Art Academy. 

A certified copy of the resolution 
was presented to Mr. Noguchi by 
Representative Taniguchi and floral 
leis were presented to the honoree by 
Representative Horita; to Mr. Brown 
by Representative Hirono; to Mr. Ellis 
by Representative Kawakami; to Mr. 
Yamakawa by Representative Hayes; 
and to Dr. Odo by Representative 
Marumoto. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 461) recog­
nizing Mr. Tony Curtis for his world 
premiere exhibition of original and 
creative paintings, drawings, and 
assemblages on April 10, 1987, in 
Honolulu, Hawaii, was jointly offered 
by Representatives Say, Marumoto, 
Alcon, Anderson, Andrews, Apo, 
Arakaki, Bellinger, Bunda, Cachola, 
Cavasso, Crozier, Fukunaga, Hagino, 
Hashimoto, Hayes, Hemmings, Hiraki, 
Hirono, Honda, Horita, D. Ige, M. 
Ige, Ihara, Isbell, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Lee, Leong, Levin, Liu, Medeiros, 
Metcalf, Okamura, O'Kieffe, Oshiro, 
Peters, Pfeil, Ribellia, Shito, Shon, 
Souki, Tajiri, Takamine, Tam, Tani­
guchi, Tom, Tungpalan, Yoshimura 
and Kihano. 

On motion by Representative Say, 
seconded by Representative Marumoto 
and carried, H.R. No. 461 was 
adopted. 

Representative Say then rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker and members of this 
House, visitors from the State of 
Hawaii, ladies and gentlemen: I have 
a very special guest here with whom I 
would like to wish to introduce to all 
of you. You may know him because 
you've seen him on television, you've 
seen him in the theatres, you've seen 
him on the billboards, and you've 
seen him before as a con artist, a 
magician, a convict, and a prison 
escapee and last, but not least, a 
father. 

"Ladies 
aside, and 
honor, let 
him." 

and gentlemen, humor 
with great respect and 

me introduce to you to 

At this time, Representative Say 
introduced the honoree, Mr. Tony 
Curtis, who was accompanied by his 

son, Nicholas; Mr. Bill Mett, presi­
dent of the Center Art Gallery; Ms. 
Lynn Cook, executive director of the 
Visitor Industry Education Council; 
and Mr. Michael Patrick, marketing 
director of Center Art Gallery. 

Floral leis were presented to Mr. 
Curtis by Representative Marumoto; 
to Nicholas by Representative Hashi­
moto; to Mr. Mett by Representative 
Kawakami; to Ms. Cook by Representa­
tive Taniguchi; and to Mr. Patrick by 
Representative Horita. A certified 
copy of the resolution and a Certi­
ficate of Recognition was presented to 
Mr. Curtis by Representatives Bunda 
and Metcalf, respectively. 

Representative Say also recognized 
several friends and family members of 
Mr. Curtis who were seated in the 
gallery and also film crews from the 
series, "The Rich and the Famous," 
and a West Germany film company who 
is doing a series on Mr. Curtis. 

At 11:52 o'clock a.m, the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
extending our warm aloha to our 
honorees this morning." 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:04 o'clock p.m. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No, 1147) recommending that H.R. 
No. 169, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, H.R. No. 169, 
HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE UNITED 
STATES DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPOR­
TATION GRANT ALL NIPPON AIR­
WAYS (ANA) A SCHEDULED ROUTE 
TO HAWAII", was adopted. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1148) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 30, SDl, be adopted, 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, S. C.R. No. 
30, SDl, entitled: "SENATE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORTATION AND THE 
DEPARTMENT OF STATE TO GRANT 
ALL NIPPON AIRWAYS (ANA) A 
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SCHEDULED ROUTE TO HAWAII", was 
adopted. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Pfeil: "May I an­
nounce that there will be commemora­
tive services remembering and honor­
ing Kalaupapa's Father Damien today 
at noon--so it has just started, as 
you hear. Bishop Ferrario and 
Governor Waihee and other luminaries 
are scheduled to speak. The service 
is part of the Damien celebration and 
it's being held at the Damien statue 
at the Capitol. " 

Representative Tungpalan: "There 
will be a policy meeting shortly after 
the session in the Policy Room for 
policy members." 

Representative Shito : "I want to 
announce that the conferees on H.B. 
Nos. 11 and 310 will be meeting on 
Monday at 2: 00 o'clock p. m. , in 
Conference Room 416." 

Representative Bunda: "The Com­
mittee on Ocean and Marine Resources 
will be having a hearing on Monday at 
8:30 o'clock a.m., in Room 328 on 
various resolutions. " 

APPOINTMENT OF 
CONFERENCE COMMITTEES 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
2, ( SDl) , and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
4, HD2, ( SDl), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Hagino, Hayes, Hiraki and Hemmings 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B . No. 
11, HD2, (SDl), and the request for 

a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shito/Fukunaga, 
Co- Chairmen; Hayes, Tom and Ribellia 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
14, HD2, ( SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Honda/ Souki, Co-
Chairmen; Hashimoto, Lee and 
O'Kieffe as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
15, HD2, ( SDl) , and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Cachola/Fukunaga, 
Co-Chairmen; Crozier, Horita and 
Marumoto as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
16, HD2, ( SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Cachola/ Fukunaga, 
Co-Chairmen; Horita, lhara and Jones 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
35, HDl, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Levin/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; D. Ige, Lee, and Pfeil as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
37, HDl, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Levin/Metcalf, Co­
Chairmen; Fukunaga, D. Ige and 
Isbell as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
40, HD2, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine/ Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Hirono, Ihara and 
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Marumoto as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
42, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine I Hirono /­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Horita and Pfeil 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
46, HD2, ( SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon/Metcalf, Co­
Chairmen; Hagino, Leong and Cavasso 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
49, HD1, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
121, HDl, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Bellinger, Hiraki, Hirono and Medei­
ros as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
150, HD2, ( SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf I Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Peters, Yoshimura and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B . No. 
208, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Hiraki, Hirono, Takamine and Medei­
ros as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
239, HD3, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Bunda/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Hashimoto, Kanoho and 
Pfeil as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
250, HD2, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Bellinger, Hayes, Hiraki and Hem­
mings as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B . No. 
285, ( SDl), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Andrews, Hayes, Hiraki and Jones as 
Managers on the part of t .he House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
287, HDl, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
310, (SD2), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shito/Fukunaga, 
Co-Chairmen; Hayes, Tom and Ribellia 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
313, HD2, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 
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In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
317, HDl, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
318, HDl, ( SDl) , and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
319, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. I ge, 
M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
320, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
321, HD1, ( SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 

vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
322, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, !hara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
323, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
324, HD1, ( SD1) , and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. I ge, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
325, HD1, ( SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
326, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
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proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
327, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
328, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
369, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine/ Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Horita, Taniguchi and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H, B, No. 
371, HD1, ( SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine, Chairman; 
Cachola, Oshiro, Tungpalan and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
377, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Andrews, Chairman; 
Hiraki, Honda, Kanoho and Pfeil as 
Managers on the part of . the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
378, HD2, ( SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Andrews I Shon/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; D. Ige and Pfeil 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 

vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B . No. 
410, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Hiraki, Shito and Hemmings 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
418, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Souki, Chairman; 
Fukunaga, Arakaki, Horita, D. Ige, 
M. Ige, Ihara, Kanoho, Kawakami, 
Leong, Tajiri, Tungpalan, Cavasso, 
Isbell and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H, B. No. 
421, HD2, ( SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Levin /Metcalf, Co­
Chairmen; Bellinger, Hiraki and Jones 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
444, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine, Chairman; 
Hirono, Horita, Taniguchi and Ander­
son as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
445, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine I Hirano/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Horita and Tani­
guchi as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference .. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
459, HD1, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hagino/Metcalf, 
Co-Chairmen; Arakaki, Shon and 
Ribellia as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
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464, HDl, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon/Metcalf, Co­
Chairmen; Leong, Tom and Hemmings 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
489, HDl, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Bellinger, Hiraki, Yoshimura and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
492, HDl, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Cachola, Hiraki, Shito and Medeiros 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
498, HDl, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Hayes, Hiraki, Shi to and Hemmings as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
520, HDl, ( SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono/Metcalf, 
Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Hiraki and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
521, ( SDl), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Hayes, Hiraki, Peters and Jones as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
536, HDl, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hagino/ Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Arakaki, Tom and Hem-

mings as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
540, (SDl), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Bunda/Oshiro, Co­
Chairmen; Bellinger, Hashimoto and 
O'Kieffe as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
581, HDl, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Leong, Metcalf and Cavasso 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
652, HD2, ( SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Andrews/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Hashimoto, Kanoho and 
Isbell as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
654, HDl, (SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Andrews/Levin, 
Co-Chairmen; D. Ige, Kanoho and 
Isbell as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
680, HDl, ( SDl), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon/Metcalf, Co­
Chairmen; Hagino, Leong and Hem­
mings as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
681, (SDl), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon, Chairman; 
Arakaki, Hagino, Leong and Hemmings 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
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proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
706, HD1, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine I Fukunaga, 
Co-Chairmen; Horita, Taniguchi and 
Marumoto as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
735, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Andrews/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Kanoho, Lee and 
O'Kieffe as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
737, HD2, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Oshiro/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Bellinger, Ihara and Maru­
moto as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
741, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Oshiro, Chairman; 
Bellinger, Crozier, Horita and Jones 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B • No. 
750, HD1, ( SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Taniguchi/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Horita, Say and Ribellia 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
775, HD1, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Andrews, Bellinger, Yoshimura and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
853, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 

Bellinger, Hayes, Hiraki and Jones as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
854, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Bellinger, Hayes, Hiraki and Medeiros 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
872, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf I Hirono, 
Co-Chairmen; Hiraki, Takamine and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
889, HD2, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon/Metcalf, Co­
Chairmen; Hagino, Leong and Ribellia 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
896, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Hayes, Hiraki, Peters and Medeiros as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
903, HD1, (SD1), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Andrews, Bellinger, Hayes and Medei­
ros as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
922, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Andrews, Bellinger, Hayes and Medei­
ros as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
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vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
951, HD1, (SD2), and the request for 
a conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Hagino, Peters and Hem­
mings as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1002, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Cachola, Hagino, Takamine and Medei­
ros as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference . 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1025, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Shon, Chair­
man; Arakaki, Hagino, Leong and 
Ribellia as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1073, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Cachola, Hagino, Hiraki 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1078, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Levin/Fuku­
naga, Co-Chairmen; D. Ige, Lee and 
Isbell as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1138, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Levin I Souki, Co­
Chairmen; D. Ige, Tajiri and Isbell as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1156, (SD2), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 

Representatives Crozier/Yoshimura/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Ibara and Medei­
ros as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1209, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Andrews/Met­
calf, Co-Chairmen; Honda, Say and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1222, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono/Metcalf, 
Co-Chairmen; Hagino, Hiraki and 
Medeiros as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No, 
1227, HD2, (SD2), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Levin/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Hashimoto, D. lge and 
O'Kieffe as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B . No. 
1244, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1251, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hiraki, Hirono, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1270, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Metcalf, Chairman; 
Hagino, Hayes, Hiraki and Medeiros 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 
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In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H, B, No, 
1315, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Oshiro/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, Ihara and 
Marumoto as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1361, HD2, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Cachola/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Horita, Tung­
palan and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House at such con­
ference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1365, HD2, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Cachola/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Horita, Yoshi­
mura and Jones as Managers on the 
part of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1421, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Cachola/­
Souki, Co-Chairmen; Horita, Ihara 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference, 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1468, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Andrews/­
Honda/Levin, Co-Chairmen; Kanoho 
and O'Kieffe as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1469, HD2, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Metcalf/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Bellinger, Hayes and 
Jones as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference, 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1484, HD2, (SD2), and the request 

for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hagino/­
Shito/Metcalf, Co-Chairmen; Arakaki 
and Ribellia as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1487, (SD2), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Shon/Metcalf, Co-
Chairmen; Arakaki, Hagino and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1499, HD2, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Takamine/­
Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; Hirono, 
Ihara and Medeiros as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1500, HD1, (SD2), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Takamine/­
Fukunaga, Co-Chairmen; Crozier, 
Horita and Marumoto as Managers on 
the part of the House at such confer­
ence. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1510, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hagino/Met­
calf; Co-Chairmen; Hayes, Tom and 
Ribellia as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1514, HD2, (SD2), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments. the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hagino I Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Arakaki, Kawakami and 
Ribellia as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1517, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Oshiro/Souki, Co-
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Chairmen; Ibara, Tungpalan and 
Marumoto as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1519, ( SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Oshiro/Souki, Co­
Chairmen; Ibara, Tungpalan and 
Marumoto as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1521, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Cachola, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B, No, 
1524, HD2, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Hiraki, Takamine and 
Jones as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1525, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Bellinger, Hiraki 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1529, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Hiraki, Shito 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 
part of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1530, HD1, ( SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Hiraki, Shito and 
Jones as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 

vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B . No. 
1531, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Hiraki, Shito, Peters and Medeiros as 
Managers on the part of the House at 
such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1532, HD1, (SD2), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hiraki, Shito, Yoshimura 
and Jones as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1585, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Hayes, Hiraki, Takamine 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference, 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1587, ( SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine/Hirono, 
Co-Chairmen; Horita, Taniguchi and 
Anderson as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1595, ( SD2), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
Representatives Takamine I Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Cachola, Ihara and 
Jones as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H, B, No. 
1601, HD1, (SD1), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Levin/Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Bunda, Kanoho and 
Pfeil as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1656, (SD1), and the request for a 
conference on the subject matter of 
said amendments, the Chair appointed 
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Representatives Hirono, Chairman; 
Hagino, Hiraki, Shi to and Hemmings 
as Managers on the part of the House 
at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1795, HDl, (SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Shi to I Souki, 
Co-Chairmen; Arakaki, Hayes and 
Ribellia as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1841, HD2, ( SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Levin/Fuku­
naga, Co-Chairmen; Bunda, Say and 
Isbell as Managers on the part of the 
House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1849, HDl, (SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Levin/ An­
drews, Co-Chairmen; Bunda, D. Ige 
and Isbell as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1857, HD2, ( SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono/Met­
calf, Co- Chairmen; Hiraki, Shito and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
1861, HDl, (SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Bellinger, Cachola, Hiraki 
and Medeiros as Managers on the part 
of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B.. No. 
1907, HDl, (SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Metcalf, 
Chairman; Hagino, Hirono, Takamine 
and Hemmings as Managers on the 

part of the House at such conference. 

In accordance with the disagreeing 
vote of the House to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H. B . No. 
1931, HDl, (SDl), and the request 
for a conference on the subject matter 
of said amendments, the Chair ap­
pointed Representatives Hirono, 
Chairman; Andrews, Hiraki, Shito and 
Hemmings as Managers on the part of 
the House at such conference. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications from 
the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 746b to 
746d) were read by the Clerk and 
were placed on file: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 746b) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 1126, SD 1, 
(HD 1), and will name the conferees 
at a later date, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 746c) informing the 
House that the Senate has disagreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
House to Senate Bill No. 634, SD 1 
( HD 1) , and has requested a confer­
ence on the subject matter of said 
amendments, in consequence of which 
the President has, on April 9, 1987, 
appointed Senators Yamasaki, Chair­
man; Mizuguchi, Nakasato and Ikeda 
as Managers on the part of the Senate 
at such conference, was placed on 
file .. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 746d) informing the 
House that pursuant to the disagree­
ment of the Senate to the amendments 
proposed by the House to Senate Bill 
No. 1126, SD 1, (HD 1), and the 
request for a conference on the 
subject matter of said amendments, 
the President has, on April 10, 1987, 
appointed Senators B. Kobayashi, 
Chairman; McMurdo and George as 
Managers on the part of the Senate 
for the consideration of said amend­
ments, was placed on file. 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 12:17 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Anderson and carried, 
the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11:00 o'clock a.m., 
Monday, April 13, 1987. 
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FIFTY-FIRST DAY 

Monday, April 13, 1987 

The House of Representatives of the 
Fourteenth Legislature of the State of 
Hawaii, Regular Session of 1987, 
convened at 11:15 o'clock a.m., with 
the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked by 
Reverend Max Beery, Pastor of Christ 
United Methodist Church, after which 
the Roll was called showing all mem­
bers present with the exception of 
Representatives Bunda, Fukunaga, 
Hagino, Horita and Medeiros, who 
were excused. 

By unanimous consent, reading of 
the Journal of the House of Represen­
tatives of the Fiftieth Day was de­
ferred. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications from 
the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 747 and 
748) were read by the Clerk and were 
disposed of as follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 747) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 17, 
SD 1, clarifying the intent of the 
Legislature with respect to the 
Diamond Head State Monument, which 
was adopted by the Senate on April 
10, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 748) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 27, 
SD 1, requesting the United States 
Congress to recognize and support 
the University of Hawaii as a primary 
institution for education and training 
of Pacific Island Nations, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 10, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, further 
action on S.C.R. Nos. 17, SD 1, and 
27, SD 1, was deferred. 

At this time, the following intro­
ductions were made to the members of 
the House: 

Representative Apo introduced three 
government officials from the Con­
gress of the Federated States of 
Micronesia, as follows: Henry 
Asugar, Chief Clerk; Mitchuo Daniel, 
Ass't Chief Clerk; and Edigar Isaac, 
Ass't Director of Administration, 
stating: "I think, largely, our 
experience and particularly that of 

the federal government has been one 
of relative sensitivity to the issues of 
emerging Pacific Island nations. 
Hawaii, however, I think stands out 
as being ready and willing and able 
to provide certain kinds of assistance 
as these nations become industrialized 
and as they develop. These gentle­
men are here because we are provid­
ing some staff training for them to 
better function and improve the 
quality of the Congress that they 
represent. 11 

Representative Tungpalan intro-
duced 140 eighth grade students from 
Highlands Intermediate School. They 
were accompanied by their teachers, 
Mrs. Karen Kawakami, Mrs. Carol 
Oda, Mr. Gregg Yamate, Mrs. 
Marjorie Okuhara, Miss Joann Higa 
and Miss Lori Nagamine; and parents, 
Mrs. Leona Yamatsuka, Mrs. Naka­
sone, Mrs. Erb and Mrs. Lassery. 

Representative Tungpalan then 
introduced Leila Erb, the runner-up 
in the Spelling Bee. 

At 11:20 o'clock a.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

Upon reconvening at 11: 40 o'clock 
a.m., the Chair directed the Clerk to 
note the presence of Representatives 
Fukunaga, Horita and Medeiros. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

DEFERRED RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions (H.R. 
Nos. 356 to 458) and concurrent 
resolutions (H.C.R. Nos. 215 to 282 
and S.C.R. No. 17) were disposed of 
as follows: 

H.R. Nos. Referred to: 

356 Committee on In tergovern-
mental Relations 

357 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

358 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

359 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

360 Jointly to the Committees on 
Housing and Community Development 
and Consumer Protection and Com­
merce 
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361 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

362 Committee on Transportation 

363 Jointly to the Committees on 
Housing and Community Development 
and Consumer Protection and Com­
merce 

364 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

365 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

366 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

367 Committee on Transportation 

368 Jointly to the Committees on 
Housing and Community Development 
and Consumer Protection and Com­
merce 

369 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

370 Committee on Transportation 

371 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

372 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

373 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

374 Committee on Education 

375 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

376 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

377 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

378 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

379 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

380 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

381 Committee on Education 

382 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 

383 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

384 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

385 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

386 Committee on Finance, then 
to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

387 Committee on Health, then 
to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

388 Committee on Health 

389 Committee on Health 

390 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

391 Committee on Judiciary, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

392 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

393 Committee on Judiciary 

394 Committee on Judiciary, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

395 Committee on Judiciary, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

396 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

397 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

398 
vices 

Committee on Human Ser-

399 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

400 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

401 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

402 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

403 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 
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404 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

405 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

406 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

407 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

408 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

409 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

410 Committee on Legislative 
Management 

411 Committee on Agriculture, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

412 Committee on Education 

413 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

414 Committee on Education 

415 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

416 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

417 Committee on Education 

418 Committee on Education 

419 Committee on Education 

420 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

421 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

422 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

423 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

424 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 
the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

425 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 

the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

426 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 
the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

427 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

428 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

429 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion, the to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 

430 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

431 Committee on Transportation 

432 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

433 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

434 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 
the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

435 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

436 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

437 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

438 Committee on Transportation 

439 Committee on Transportation 

440 Committee on Agriculture 

441 Committee on Education 

442 Committee on Education 

443 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

444 Committee on Education 

445 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Higher Education and 
the Arts 

446 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion, then to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 
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447 Jointly to the Committees on 
Judiciary and Consumer Protection 
and Commerce 

448 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

449 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

450 Committee on Education 

451 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

452 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

453 Jointly to the Committees on 
Agriculture and Water, Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

454 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

455 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion, then to the Committee on 
Water, Land Use, Development and 
Hawaiian Affairs 

456 Committee on Legislative 
Management 

457 Committee on Education 

458 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

H.C.R. Nos. 

215 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

216 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

217 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

218 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

219 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

220 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

221 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

222 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

223 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

224 Committee on Education 

225 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

226 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

227 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

228 Committee on Education 

229 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 

230 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

231 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

232 Committee on Health 

233 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

234 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

235 Committee on Human Ser-
vices 

236 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec-
tion 

237 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

238 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

239 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

240 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources 

241 Committee on Ocean and 
Marine Resources, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

242 Committee on Ocean and 
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Marine Resources 

243 Committee on Water, Land 
Us~, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

244 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

245 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts 

246 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

247 Committee on Legislative 
Management 

248 Committee on Agriculture, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Managemet 

249 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

250 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

251 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

252 Committee on Education 

253 Committee on Education, 
then to the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

254 Committee on Education 

255 Committee on Education 

256 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

257 Committee on Higher Educa-
tion and the Arts, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

258 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

259 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

260 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 
the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

261 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 
the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

262 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 

the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

263 Committee on Human Ser-
vices, then to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 

264 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion, then to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 

265 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

266 Committee on Transportation 

267 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

268 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce, then to 
the Committee on Legislative 
Management 

269 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

270 Committee on Transportation 

271 Committee on Transportation 

272 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development, then to the 
Committee on Legislative Management 

27 3 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion, then to the Committee on 
Legislative Management 

274 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

275 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, then to the Committee on 
Finance 

276 Committee on Education 

277 Committee on Housing and 
Community Development 

278 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

279 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion, then to the Committee on 
Water, Land Use, Development and 
Hawaiian Affairs 

280 Committee on Legislative 
Management 

281 Committee on Education 
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282 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

S.C.R. No, 

17 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were suspend­
ed for the purpose of considering a 
bill on Final Reading on the basis of 
a modified consent calendar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

Representative Cachola moved that 
the report of the Committee be 
adopted and S.B. No. 735, SD 2, HD 
2, CD 1, having been read through­
out, pass Final Readin~, seconded by 
Representative Souki. 

Representative Hemmings rose to 
speak in favor of the bill, stating: 

"I am very pleased to express 
strong and positive support of this 
bill which appropriates funds for the 
promotion of the 1990 America's Cup 
in Hawaiian Waters, and in doing so, 
I must commend in a non-partisan way 
and extend my congratulations to 
Governor John Waihee. Governor 
Waihee has displayed imaginative and 
decisive leadership in promoting the 
America's Cup yacht race. 

"In addressing this bill, I would 
like to note that the Governor, in a 
recent speech, has acknowledged a 
'hidden' industry that is already a 
significant contributor to our 
economy, and I might add, to a 
healthy Hawaiian lifestyle. That 
industry is sports and recreation. 

"In passing this legislation, we will 
facilitate the growth of the sports 
industry in our State. Sports and 
recreation expenditures may already 
surpass pineapple and sugar in gross 
revenues generated. The America's 
Cup alone would more than double, in 
a year, the gross revenue generated 
by those two industries. 

"The point is that we are already in 
the sports business. It is healthy, it 
is prosperous, it complements our 
lifestyles, and it complements our 
tourist industry. 

"The fact that the Governor recom­
mends passage of this bill signals the 
international sports community that 
Hawaii is one of the great sports 
playgrounds of the world. In fact, I 
think it can safely be said that we 
are one of the sports capitals of the 
world. Let's do everything we can to 
bring the America's Cup to Hawaii. 

"I urge your support of this bill." 

Representative Anderson rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, I would like to speak 
in favor of the bill, however, I do 
have some reservations. 

"Mr. Speaker, I am reading the bill 
and it says that this $300,000 is 
supposed to be used for an impact 
statement, environmental assessment, 
necessary planning, analyses and 
promotions. I don't know where 
$300,000 came from, Mr . Speaker, but 
I am not really sure if that's going to 
be enough money. 

"What bothers me even more is that 
there is a bill right now whereby we 
could use $15-million for the HVB. 
If, in fact, that's going to the De­
partment of Planning and Economic 
Development and they are going to 
say that they could possibly use some 
of that money to offset this because it 
is tourist-oriented, it would bother 
me, being that we have already 
planned on marketing and other areas 
for the tourist industry to move 
forward. And if we are going to 
utilize money, and taking it from one 
program and putting it to another, I 
really don't know if we are doing 
justice to the tourist industry itself. 

"Again, I would hope when we go 
into conference, that we would look at 
the overall picture and not just 
what's there immediately because I 
don't know if $300,000 is really going 
to do the job. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

Representative Hayes rose and 
stated: 

"I recently sent a questionnaire to 
my constituents. So far, we received 
450 replies. One of the questions 
was, 'Do you support America's Cup 
in Hawaii?' and ... 

At this point, Representative 
Anderson interrupted on a point of 
order and said: 

"She speaking on behalf of the bill 
-- for or against?" 
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Representative Hayes answered: 

"Yes, I am speaking in support of 
the bill. 

"All but about three of the replies 
were in favor of holding the America's 
Cup in Hawaii. 

"Thank you." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted, and S. B. No. 
735, SD 2, HD 2, CD 1, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT MAKING AN 
APPROPRIATION FOR THE SUPPORT 
OF THE 1990 AMERICA'S CUP IN 
HAWAIIAN WATERS", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 49 ayes, with 
Representatives Bunda and Hagino 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. No. 735 had passed 
Final Reading at 11:46 o'clock a.m. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1147) 
recommending that H.R. No. 15, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 15, HD 1, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY FOCUSING ON 
LONGER SCHOOL HOURS AND A 
LONGER SCHOOL YEAR FOR 
HAWAII'S PUDLIC SCHOOLS", was 
adopted. 

Representatives Cachola and Levin, 
for the Committees on Tourism and 
Water, Land Use, Development and 
Hawaiian Affairs, presented a joint 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1148) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 70, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Cachola, seconded by Representative 
Levin and carried, the joint report of 
the Committees was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 70, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
PLANNING AND ECONOMIC DEVELOP­
MENT TO CONDUCT A STUDY ANA­
LYZING THE FEASIBILITY OF 
HAVING HAWAII AS THE NEXT 
DEFENSE SITE FOR AMERICA'S 
CUP", was adopted. 

Representative Cachola, for the 

Committee on Tourism, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1149) 
recommending that H.R. No. 128, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Cachola, seconded by Representative 
Honda and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
128, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE CONGRES­
SIONAL DELEGATION TO CONTINUE 
ITS EFFORTS TO CONVINCE THE 
U.S. DEPARTMENT OF IMMIGRATION 
AND NATURALIZATION TO INCREASE 
THE STAFFING OF IMMIGRATION 
OFFICERS AT THE HONOLULU INTER­
NATIONAL AIRPORT TO EXPEDITE 
SERVICE TO TOURISTS ARRIVING IN 
HAWAII FROM FOREIGN COUNTRIES", 
was adopted. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1150) 
recommending that H.R. No. 151 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H. R. No. 151, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
FEASIBILITY OF REGULATING PET 
LODGES", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1151) recommending 
that H. R. No. 167 be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 167, entitled: HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
EXTENDING DISABILITY BENEFITS 
TO GOVERNMENT VOLUNTEERS", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1152) recommending 
that H.R. No. 34 be referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 34, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION URGING THE CONGRESS OF 
THE UNITED STATES TO REINSTATE 



HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 l s t DAY 657 

THE THREE-YEAR BASIS RECOVERY 
RULE FOR EMPLOYEE CONTRI­
BUTIONS TO RETIREMENT PLANS", 
was referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1153) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 21 be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 21, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION URGING 
THE CONGRESS OF THE UNITED 
STATES TO REINSTATE THE THREE­
YEAR BASIS RECOVERY RULE FOR 
EMPLOYEE CONTRIBUTIONS TO 
RETIREMENT PLANS", was referred 
to the Committee on Finance, 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand, 
Com. Rep. No. 1154) recommending 
that H.R. No. 84, as amended in HD 
1, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance, 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H, R, 
No. 84, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEVELOPMENT OF A PLAN OR 
ACTION FOR REGULAR MAINTE­
NANCE OF PUBLIC FACILITIES", was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1155) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 47, as amended in 
HD 1, be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 47, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEVELOPMENT OF 
A PLAN OR ACTION FOR REGULAR 
MAINTENANCE OF PUBLIC FACILI­
TIES", was referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTION 

A resolution (H.R. No. 462) wish­
ing the Hokule'a crew members a safe 
journey home from their two-year 

historic voyage into the South Pacific 
was jointly offered by Representatives 
Crozier, Kanoho, Tungpalan, Peters, 
Anderson, Leong and Apo and was 
read by the Clerk, 

On motion by 
Crozier, seconded by 
Anderson and carried, 
was adopted, 

Representative 
Representative 
H.R. No. 462 

At this time, Representative 
Anderson rose on a point of informa­
tion and inquired: 

"Could you tell me in what direction 
should go to find out on a lot of 

our legislation that says if there is 
money appropriated, it will be so 
much or as much as necessary 
where do we ever find out where 'as 
much as necessary' is? Could it be 
more than the original amount that we 
intended, and where would I go to -­
the AG's office, or Budget and 
Finance, or DAGS for that informa­
tion? 

"In this particular case, Mr. 
Speaker, I am looking at again, 
because we just passed for America's 
Cup -- 'BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED 
that the Legislature is prepared to 
appropriate the sum of $30-million, or 
as much as is necessary, for biennium 
years 1987-89, for the construction of 
facilities, . . ' If, in fact, we don't 
have enough money on $30-million, 
how much does 'or as much as is 
necessary' mean and where do we find 
that out? Can a department go above 
us and appropriate more than the 
original amount?· Or, what depart­
ment will we find that?" 

At this point, Representative Apo 
asked for a recess and at 11:51 
o'clock a,m,, the Chair declared a 
recess, subject to the call of the 
Chair. 

Upon reconvening at 11: 55 o'clock 
a.m., Representative Anderson con­
tinued his inquiry: 

"Mr. Speaker, my question was 
asked and I have also been asked, 
you know, how come I am making 
these kinds of observations? I think, 
in the past, I was always told, later 
on, by and by we will get the in­
formation and, you know, by and by 
only meant for Whitney Anderson, and 
as Minority Floor Leader, I have a 
responsibility to try and get in­
formation for everybody, In fact, 
am willing to share with both sides. 

"So I do thank you and it is my 
inquisitive Portuguese side; it's what 
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they're asking me -- that is, trying 
to find out the questions. 

"Thank you very much." 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Oshiro rose and 
requested waiver of the 48-hour 
notice for hearings on H.R. No. 431 
and H.C.R. No. 266, requesting a 
study to improve the transportation 
access system to Leeward Community 
College and West Oahu College, and 
the Chair "so ordered." 

Representative Oshiro: "These two 
measures will be added to our Trans­
portation hearing agenda for Wednes­
day, April 15th, 8: 00 in the morning, 
in Conference Room 310. Also, your 
Conference Committee on the following 
bills: H.B. Nos. 1519, 741, 1517, 
1315 and S. B. No. 241, will be hold­
ing a joint conference tomorrow 
afternoon, 3: 00 p. m. , Senate Con­
ference Room No. 6." 

Representative Hiraki: "Your 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce will be having a hearing 
this afternoon at 1: 30 in Conference 
Room 328. Decision-making to follow 
if time permits. We will also be 
considering decision-making on Senate 
Bill 1286, SD 1. 11 

Representative Fukunaga: "Your 
Committee on Finance will be holding 
an informational meeting this after­
noon at 1: 30, Room 306." 

Representative D. Ige: "Your 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs will be 
having a public hearing tomorrow 
morning at 8:30 a.m. in Conference 
Room 328. Decision-making to follow 
it time permits." 

Representative Shito: "Your con-

ferees on H.B. No. 11 and H.B. No. 
310 will meet this afternoon at 2: 00 
p.m. in Conference Room 416. 11 

Representative Okamura: "There 
will be a Majority caucus tomorrow 
morning at 8:30 a.m., and also at 
7: 00 p.m. tomorrow." 

At 11:56 o'clock a.m., Representa­
tive Okamura asked for a recess and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12: 02 o'clock p. m. 

At this time, Representative Apo 
gave notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. Nos. 3, HD 2; 5, HD 1; 62, 
HD l; 81, HD 1; 211, HD 1; 220; 
223, HD 1; 230, HD 1; 254, HD 1; 
331; 375, HD 2; 380, HD 1; 391, HD 
1; 413, HD 1; 428, HD l; 430, HD l; 
453; 463; 497, HD 1; 518, HD l; 528, 
HD 1; 537, HD 2; 541; 578, HD l; 
586, HD 1; 592; 598, HD 1; 736, HD 
1; 890; 891; 898; 999, HD 1; 1013, 
HD 1; 1041, HD 1; 1079; 1102; 1150, 
HD 2; 1151, HD l; 1158, HD 1; 1173; 
1176, HD l; 1230, HD l; 1246, HD l; 
1331; 1357, HD l; 1467, HD 1; 1486, 
HD 1; 1502, HD 2; 1583, HD l; 1590, 
HD l; 1617, HD 1; 1688; 1726, HD 1; 
1738, HD 2; 1740; 1796, HD 1; 1889, 
HD l; 1924; and 1935, HD 1. 

At 12:14 o'clock p.m., Represen­
tative Metcalf asked for a recess and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:15 o'clock p.m. 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 12:17 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Anderson and carried, 
the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11: 30 o'clock a. m. 
tomorrow, Tuesday, April 14, 1987. 
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FIFTY-SECOND DAY 

Tuesday, April 14, 1987 

The House of Representatives of 
the Fourteenth Legislature of the 
State of Hawaii, Regular Session of 
1987, convened at 11:45 o'clock 
a. m., with the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked 
by the Reverend Cipriano Paso­
quen, Pastor, Filipino United 
Church of Christ, after which the 
Roll was called showing all mem­
bers present with the exception of 
Representatives Anderson, Peters 
and Taniguchi who were excused. 

By unanimous consent, reading 
and approval of the Journal of the 
House of Representatives of the 
Fifty-First Day was deferred. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications 
from the Senate (Sen. Com. 'Nos. 
749 and 750) were read by the 
Clerk and were disposed of as 
follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 749) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
18, requesting the State to divest 
state moneys from South African 
investments, which was adopted by 
the Senate on April 13, 1987, was 
placed on file . 

By unanimous consent, 
action on S.C.R. No. 
deferred. 

further 
18 was 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 750) informing the 
House that pursuant to the disa­
greement of the House to the 
amendments proposed by the 
Senate to the following House Bills 
and the request for a conference 
on the subject of said amendments, 
the President has, on April 13, 
1987, appointed Managers on the 
part of the Senate for the consid­
eration of said amendments, was 
placed on file : 

H.B. No. 2, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Naka­
sato, Young, Henderson, Ikeda 
and A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 4, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, Solomon, J. Wong 
and George. 

H.B. No. 11, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Chang, 
Chairman; Aki, B. Kobayashi, Matsu­
ura and Menor. 

H.B. No. 14, HD2, SDl : 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Matsuura and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 15, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Holt and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 16, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Y ama-
saki, Chairman; Holt and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 35, HDl, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Hagino, Matsu­
ura and A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 37, HDl, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Aki, Holt, Solomon and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 40, HD2, SD2 : 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Blair and George. 

H.B. No. 42, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Y ama­
saki, Chairman; Nakasato and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 46, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: 
Kobayashi, Chairman; 
George. 

H.B. No. 49, HDl, SD2: 

Senators 
Solomon 

B. 
and 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, Hee, B. 
Kobayashi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, 
Nakasato, Young, Henderson, Ikeda 
and A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 121, HDl, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, Holt, Solomon and 
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George. 

H.B. No. 150, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees.: Senators McMurdo, 
Chairman; Yamasaki and Henderson. 

H.B. No. 208, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: 
Chairman; Chang, 
and Reed. 

Senators Hee, 
Menor, Solomon 

H.B. No. 239, HD3, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Matsuura, Solomon 
and A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 250, HD2, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Blair, Chang, J. Wong and 
Reed. 

H.B. No. 285, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cop b, 
Chairman; B. Kobayashi and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 287, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 310, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Chang, 
Chairman; Blair, J. Wong, Young and 
A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 313, HD2, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Y ama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B . Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, N akasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 317, HDl, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 318, HDl, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer-
nan des Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya-
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 

Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 319, HD1, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 320, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 321, HDl, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 322, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, N akasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 323, HD1, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 324, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B . Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 325, HD1, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 326, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer-
nan des Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya-
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 



HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 2 n d DAY 661 

Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 327, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki , Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 328, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman ; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B . Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura, Mizuguchi, Nakasato, 
Young, Henderson , Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 369, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators N aka-
sato, Chairman; Mizuguchi and Reed. 

H.B. No. 371, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Naka-
sato, Chairman; Mizuguchi and Reed. 

H. B. No. 377, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hagino, 
Chairman; Menor and Reed. 

H.B. No. 378, HD2, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
Kobayashi, Chairman; 
George. 

Senators B. 
Matsuura and 

H.B. No. 410, HD1, SD1 : 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair, Hee and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 418, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Blair, Fer­
nandes Salling, Hagino, B. Kobaya­
shi , Matsuura , Mizuguchi, Nakasato , 
Young, Henderson, Ikeda and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 421, HD2, SD1 : 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, Cobb, Kuroda and 
George. 

H.B. No. 444, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Naka-
sato, Chairman; Mizuguchi and Reed. 

H.B. No. 445, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
sato, Chairman; B. 

Senators Naka­
Kobayashi and 

Reed. 

H.B. No. 459, HD1, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, McMurdo, J. Wong 
and Reed. 

H.B. No. 464, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
Kobayashi, Chairman; 
George. 

Senators 
Solomon 

H.B. No. 489, HD1, SD1: 

B. 
and 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; B. Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

H.B. No . 492, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; B. Kobayashi, Kuroda and 
Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 498, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; B. Kobayashi and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 520, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees : Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Kuroda and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 521, SD1 : 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair, B. Kobayashi and 
A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 536, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Menor, 
Chairman; J. Wong and Reed. 

H.B. No. 540, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Holt, 
Chairman; Solomon and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 581, HD1, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Blair, Hee, J. Wong 
and A. Kobayashi. · 

H.B. No. 652, HD2, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Hagino and George. 

H.B. No. 654, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Y ama-
saki, Chairman; Hagino and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 680, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators B. 
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Kobayashi, Chairman; Solomon and 
George. 

H.B. No. 681, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators B. 
Kobayashi, Chairman; Blair, Matsuura 
and George. 

H.B. No. 706, HD1, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators 
saki/ Nakasato, Co-Chairmen; 
and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 735, HD1, SD1: 

Yama­
Blair 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Hagino and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 737, HD2, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
saki, Chairman; 
and George. 

Senators 
Fernandes 

H.B. No. 741, HD1, SD1: 

Yama­
Salling 

Senate Conferees: Senators Fernan­
des Salling, Chairman; Kuroda and 
Reed. 

H.B. No. 750, HD1, SD2: 

Senate Conferees : 
saki, Chairman; 
Kobayashi. 

Senators Yama­
Kuroda and A. 

H.B. No. 775, HD1, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, Fernandes Salling, 
McMurdo and Reed. 

H.B. No. 853, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, McMurdo, J, Wong 
and George. 

H.B. No. 854, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair, B. Kobayashi and 
Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 872, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; B. Kobayashi and A, 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 889, HD2, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
Kobayashi, Chairman; 
George. 

Senators B. 
McMurdo and 

H.B. No. 896, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 903, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
Chairman; Chang, 
and George. 

Senators Hee, 
Kuroda, Solomon 

H.B. No. 922, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Cobb, Holt, Kuroda and 
Reed. 

H.B. No. 951, HD1, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Blair, Hee, J. Wong 
and A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1002, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: 
Chairman; Kuroda, 
and Reed. 

Senators 
McMurdo, 

H.B. No. 1025, HD1, SD1: 

Hee, 
Menor 

Senate Conferees: 
Kobayashi, Chairman; 
George. 

Senators B. 
McMurdo and 

H.B. No. 1073, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1078, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Aki, 
Chairman; Matsuura and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 1138, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Matsuura and 
A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1156, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Blair and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1209, HD1, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hagino, 
Chairman; Nakasato and Reed. 

H.B. No. 1222, SD1: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Blair, 
Chairman; Young and George. 

H.B. No. 1227, HD2, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Chang and Ikeda. 
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H.B. No. 1244, HD!, SD!: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair, Nakasato and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1251, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: 
Chairman; Chang, 
and George. 

Senators Hee, 
Menor, Solomon 

H.B. No. 1270, SDI: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, Holt, J. Wong and 
George. 

H.B. No. 1315, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Fernan­
des Salling, Chairman; Holt, Kuroda 
and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1361, HD2, SDI: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Holt and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 1365, HD2, SDI: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Holt and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 1421, HDl, SD!: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Holt and George. 

H.B. No. 1468, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Matsu­
ura, Chairman; Aki and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 1469, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Hee and Mizuguchi. 

H.B. No. 1484, HD2, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: 
Kobayashi, Chairman; 
and George. 

H.B. No. 1487, SD2: 

Senators B. 
Blair, Young 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Chang, B . Kobayashi, J. 
Wong and Reed. 

H.B. No. 1499, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators N aka-
sato, Chairman; Mizuguchi and Reed. 

H.B. No. 1500, HDl, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; Chang, Nakasato and 

A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1510, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators B. 
Kobayashi/McMurdo, 
and George. 

Co-Chairmen; 

H.B. No. 1514, HD2, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama­
saki, Chairman; McMurdo and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1517, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators 
saki, Chairman; Fernandes 
Holt and George. 

H.B. No. 1519, SDI: 

Senate Conferees: Senators 
saki, Chairman; Fernandes 
Holt and George. 

H.B. No. 1521, HDl, SDI: 

Yama­
Salling, 

Yama­
Salling, 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Nakasato and George. 

H.B. No. 1524, HD2, SD!: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Cobb and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1525, HDl, SD!: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair, Chang, B. Kobaya­
shi, Matsuura and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1529, HDl, SDI: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Nakasato and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1530, HDl, SD!: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1531, SDI: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1532, HDl, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1585, HDl, SD!: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Blair and A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1587, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Naka-
sato, Chairman; Mizuguchi and Reed. 
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H.B. No. 1595, SD2: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Nakasato and Reed. 

H.B . No. 1601, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Aki, 
Chairman; Fernandes Salling and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1656, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Nakasato and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1795, HDl, SDl : 

Senate Conferees : Senators Yama-
saki, Chairman; Aki and Ikeda. 

H.B. No. 1841, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Y ama­
saki, Chairman; Aki, Matsuura and 
A. Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1849, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hagino, 
Chairman ; Solomon and Reed. 

H.B. No. 1857, HD2, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman ; Nakasato and A. Kobaya­
shi. 

H.B. No. 1861, HDl, SDl : 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; B. Kobayashi and A. 
Kobayashi. 

H.B. No. 1907, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Hee, 
Chairman; Holt, Kuroda, J. Wong and 
George. 

H. B. No. 1931, HDl, SDl: 

Senate Conferees: Senators Cobb, 
Chairman; Nakasato and Ikeda. 

At this time, the following intro­
ductions were made to the members of 
the House : 

Representative Shon introduced 
National Assemblyman , Mr. Kim Jung 
Yu, "a very distinguished political 
leader from Korea. Our visitor today 
has been a national assemblyman for a 
number of years; he's been involved 
in a special committee involving 
constitutional amendment reform and 
ad hoc committee on campus issues. 
He is one of the members of the 
opposition parties in Korea--which 

gives Korea's democracy more 
strength--and since he's been visiting 
the United States, there's been 
changes in party structure and he is 
now a member of a brand new party, 
the Unification Democratic Party . 

Accompanying Mr. Kim were the 
Reverend Samuel Lee and Clifton 
Forrestor of the U. S. Information 
Agency. 

Representative Hiraki introduced 34 
fourth grade students from Royal 
Elementary School "a school which is 
148 years old and was first opened in 
1839 , making it the second oldest 
school in Hawaii." The students were 
accompanied by their teacher , Ms. 
Karen Ginoza. 

The Chair, at this time, directed 
the Clerk to note the presence of 
Representatives Peters and Taniguchi. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

COMMITTEE REASSIGNMENTS 

The following resolutions ( H. R. 
Nos. 315; 416; 433; and 443) and 
concurrent resolutions (H.C.R . Nos. 
191 ; 249; 253; and 257) were re-re­
ferred as follows: 

H.R. Nos. Re-referred to: 

315 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Manage­
ment 

416 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Manage­
ment 

433 Jointly to the Committees on 
Water, Land Use, Development and 
Hawaiian Affairs; Housing and 
Community Development; Transporta­
tion; and Legislative Management 

443 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Manage­
ment 

H. C.R. Nos. 

191 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Manage­
ment 

249 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Manage­
ment 

253 Jointly to the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Manage­
ment 
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257 Jointly to the Committees on 
Housing and Community Development 
and Legislative Management 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Liu and 
carried, the rules were suspended for 
the purpose of considering certain 
resolutions out of order. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions ( H. R. 
Nos. 463 and 464) were read by the 
Clerk and were disposed of follows: 

A resolution (H.R. No. 463) com­
memorating the 115th Anniversary of 
Hale'iwa Elementary School was of­
fered by Representative Leong. 

On motion by Representative Leong, 
seconded by Representative Bunda 
and carried , H.R . No. 463 was 
adopted. 

Representative Leong then rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, the resolution speaks 
for itself. I would just like to add a 
few lines to it. 

"The Haleiwa Elementary School has 
provided outstanding educational 
services to a large number of our 
youths in our district for a hundred 
and fifteen years . 

"Also included in this school and its 
history, our own Representative 
Bobby Bunda's families have deep 
roots in the Waialua and Haleiwa 
districts. Also, I would like to 
mention several outstanding people 
who are here with us today to witness 
this celebration." 

At this time, Representative Leong 
introduced the honorees who were 
asked to stand and be recognized. 
They are as follows: Mrs. Eiko 
Eckhart , principal, and Mr. Kevin 
Murata, president of the student 
council. Also recognized by Repre­
sentative Leong and who were seated 
in the gallery were Mr . Les Murata, 
president of the P. T. S. A.; Karen 
Corpuz, secretary of the student 
council; Nicole Garcia, vice president 
of the student council; and Mrs. 
Ethel Yamamoto, advisor for the 
student council. 

Floral leis were presented to Mrs. 
Eckhart by Representative Bunda and 
to Mr. Murata by Representative 

Hashimoto. Certified copies of the 
resolution were presented to the 
honorees by Representative Leong. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 464) recog­
nizing and commending Leihoku Ele­
mentary School for its Ungraded 
Language Arts Program and member­
ship and participation in the National 
Elementary School Consortium was 
jointly offered by Representatives 
Peters and Apo. 

On motion by Representative 
Peters, seconded by Representative 
Apo and carried, H.R. No. 464 was 
adopted. 

Representative Apo then rose and 
stated : 

"Mr. Speaker, the rather lengthy 
resolution, I think, speaks for itself. 

"I'm very proud of the work that 
these three people have accomplished 
at Leihoku. Sometimes, Mr. Speaker, 
I think we get wrapped up with the 
notion that the more money we throw 
at the education problem the better it 
gets when, in fact, a little creativity, 
innovation and determination at the 
school level can bring about some 
amazing results and in the climate and 
the community in which these people 
have to operate, I think that what 
they have achieved is truly outstand­
ing and they have, in fact, made a 
huge dent without any extra alloca­
tions or resources--just simply with 
their desire and determination--to 
make it a better school. " 

Representative Apo then introduced 
"the three key people involved in 
establishing the ungraded language 
arts program," as follows: Mr. Roy 
Nakamura, former principal of the 
school but "who is now at Pearl City 
Highlands"; Ms. Chieko Higuchi and 
Mrs. Amy Martinson, instructors in 
the Ungraded Language Arts Pro­
gram. 

Floral leis were presented to Mr. 
Nakamura by Representative Tung­
palan; to Ms. Higuchi by Representa­
tive Okamura; and to Mrs. Martinson 
by Representative Alcon. Certified 
copies of the resolution were pre­
sented to the honorees by Represen­
tative Peters. 

At 12:07 o'clock p.m. the Chair 
declared a recess , subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
extending our warm aloha to our 
honorees this morning." 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:23 o'clock p.m. 
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STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1156) recommending that H.R. 
No. 252, as amended in HDl, be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 252, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING CERTAIN 
INTERIM STUDIES BY THE HOUSE 
COMMITTEE ON HUMAN SERVICES", 
was referred to the Committee on 
Legislative Management. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1157) 
recommending that H. C.R. No. 116 be 
referred to the Committee on Legisla­
tive Management. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
116 entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
APPOINTMENT OF A JOINT LEGIS­
LATIVE INTERIM COMMITTEE TO 
RECOMMEND IMPROVEMENTS TO THE 
EXECUTIVE BUDGET SYSTEM", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1158) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 7 be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 7 entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING A STUDY TO INVESTI­
GATE THE EXTENSION OF HAWAII'S 
EMPLOYEE BENEFIT PROGRAMS TO 
PART-TIME CASUAL AND TEMPOR­
ARY EMPLOYEES", was referred to 
the Committee on Legislative Manage­
ment. 

At 12:24 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Apo asked for a recess, and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12: 30 o'clock p. m. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Liu and 
carried, the rules were suspended for 
the purpose of considering bills on 
Final Reading on the basis of a 
modified consent calendar. 

DISPOSITION OF MATTERS 
PLACED ON CLERK'S DESK 

By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
62, HDl, SDl; 408, HDl, SDl; 413, 
HDl, SDl; 516, HDl, SDl; and 518, 
HD 1, SD 1, were taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 62, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 62, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
FRAUDULENTLY OBTAINED TELE­
COMMUNICATIONS OR CABLE TELE­
VISION SERVICES", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 408, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 408, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HORIZONTAL PROPERTY REGIMES", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 413, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 413, HD1, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PHARMACY", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 62; 408; and 413 
had passed Final Reading at 12: 33 
o'clock p.m. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 516, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 516, HD1, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CABLE SYSTEMS", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
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a vote of 48 ayes to 2 noes, with 
Representatives Liu and O'Kieffe 
voting no, and with Representative 
Anderson being excused, 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 518, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 518, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
COLLECTION", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 516 and 518 had 
passed Final Reading at 12: 34 o'clock 
p.m. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1528, HDl, 
deferred one day. 

action on 
SDl, was 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
81, HDl, SD!; 486, HD!, SDl; 497, 
HDl, SD!; and 528, HDl, SDl, were 
taken from the Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 81, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 81, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
LIENS", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused, 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 486, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 486, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
REAL ESTATE TRANSACTIONS", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 81 and 486 had 
passed Final Reading at 12: 36 o'clock 
p.m. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 497, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 497, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 

CEMETERIES", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 528, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 528, HDl, SD1, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
INDUSTRIAL LOAN COMPANIES", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos, 497 and 528 had 
passed Final Reading at 12: 37 o'clock 
p.m. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
H.B. No, 736, HDl, SD2, was de­
ferred one day, 

By unanimous consent, H.B . No. 
1246, HDl, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 1246, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 1246, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
UNFAIR INSURANCE PRACTICES AND 
FRAUDS", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1257, HDl, 
deferred one day. 

action on 
SDl, was 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1935, HDl, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hh:aki and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 1935, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 1935, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CORPORATIONS", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 1246 and 1935 
had passed Final Reading at 12: 38 
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o'clock p. m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
3, HD2, SD1; 331, SD2; and 1079, 
SDI, were taken from the Clerk's 
desk. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 3, HD2, 
and H.B. No. 3, HD2, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
SECTIONS 701-107, 701-108, 
706-606. 5, 706-610, 706-640, 706-656, 
707-700, 707-702, 707-711, 707-730, 
707-731, AND 707-732", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 50 ayes, with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 331 and 
H.B. No. 331, SD2, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
INTOXICATING LIQUOR", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, with 
Representative Anderson being ex­
cused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 3 and 331 had 
passed Final Reading at 12: 39 o'clock 
p.m. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1079 and 
H.B. No. 1079, SDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PATERNITY ACTION", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 50 ayes, with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1079 had passed 
Third Reading at 12:40 o'clock p.m. 

By 
1357, 
SD1, 
desk. 

unanimous consent, H. B . Nos. 
HDl, SDl, and 1726, HDl, 

were taken from the Clerk's 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1357, 
HDl, and H.B. No. 1357, HD1, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 

RELATING TO CONTESTED CASES", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 46 ayes to 
4 noes, with Representatives Isbell, 
Lee, Levin and Shon voting no, and 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1726, 
HD1, and H.B. No. 1726, HDl, SD1, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO FIREARMS AND AMMU­
NITION", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 49 ayes to 1 no, with Representa­
tive Liu voting no, and with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 1357 and 1726 
had passed Final Reading at 12: 41 
o'clock p.m. 

At 12:41 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Okamura asked for a recess, and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:45 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
H.B. No. 223, HDl, SDl, was de­
ferred one day. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
428, HDl, SD1, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. lge 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 428, HDl, and H.B. No. 
428, HD1, SD1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC 
LANDS", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
H.B. No. 578, HDl, SDl, was de­
ferred one day. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
892, HDl, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Repres~ntative D. Ige 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
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amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B . No. 892, HDl, and H.B. No, 
892, HDl, SDl, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO SALE OF 
HUNTING LICENSES", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 50 ayes, with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 428 and 892 had 
passed Final Reading at 12 : 46 o'clock 
p.m. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1230, HDl, 
deferred one day. 

action on 
SDl , was 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1502, HD2, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1502, HD2, and H.B. 
No. 1502, HD2, SDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CAPITAL LOAN PROGRAM", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, with 
Representative Anderson being ex­
cused. 

By unanimous 
H.B. No. 1740, 
one day. 

consent, action on 
SDl, was deferred 

By unanimous consent, H.B . No. 
1889, HDl, SDl , was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1889, HDl , and H.B. 
No. 1889, HDl, SDl, entitled : "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PERMITS FOR ARCHAEOLOGICAL 
WORK", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 1502 and 1889 
had passed Third Reading at 12:47 
o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous 
H.B. No. 1924, 
one day. 

consent, action on 
SDl, was deferred 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 

541, SDl; 1041, HDl, SDl; 999, HDl, 
SDl; 1176, HDl, SDl; 1590, HDl, 
SDl; and 1688, SDl, were taken from 
the Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative Hashimoto 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H. B. No. 541, and H.B. No. 541, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PRIVATE USE OF 
OCEAN WATERS AND NAVIGABLE 
STREAMS", having been read through­
out , passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes , with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 541 had passed 
Final Reading at 12 : 48 o'clock p. m. 

On motion by Representative Levin , 
seconded by Representative Oshiro 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1041, HDl, and H.B. 
No. 1041, HDl, SDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ENFORCEMENT", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1041 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:49 o'clock p.m. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro , seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 999, HDl, 
and H.B. No. 999, HDl, SDl, enti­
tled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT RE­
LATING TO FRAUDULENT USE OF 
PLATES", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1176, 
HDl, and H.B. No. 1176, HDl, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO DEALERS IN NEW 
MOTOR VEHICLES" , having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B . No. 1590, 
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HDl, and H.B. No. 1590, HDl, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO HIGHWAY SAFETY", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 999, 1176 and 
1590 had passed Final Reading at 
12:50 o'clock p.m. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1688 and 
H.B. No. 1688, SDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
UNIFORM AERONAUTICS ACT 
(MODIFIED)", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 48 ayes to 2 noes, with 
Representatives Levin and Lee voting 
no, and with Representative Anderson 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1688 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:51 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
H.B. No. 211, HDl, SDl, was de­
ferred one day. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
375, HD2, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 375, HD2, and H.B. No. 
375, HD2, SDl, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO CHEMI­
CAL CONTAMINATION OF WATER 
RESOURCES", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 375 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:52 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
598, HDl, SDl; 890, SDl; 1102, SDl, 
were taken from the Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H. B. No. 598, HDl, and H.B. No, 
598, HDl, SDl, entitled: "A BILL 

FOR AN ACT RELATING TO PERSONS 
WITH DEVELOPMENTAL DISABILITIES 
OR MENTAL RETARDATION", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, with 
Representative Anderson being ex­
cused, 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong· 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 890 and H.B. No. 890, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO MENTAL 
HEALTH", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 598 and 890 had 
passed Final Reading at 12: 53 o'clock 
p.m. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1102 and H.B. No. 1102, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO CONTROLLED 
SUBSTANCES", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1151, HDl, 
deferred one day. 

action on 
SDl, was 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1486, HDl, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1486, HDl, and H.B. 
No. 1486, HDl, SDl, entitled : "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
SAFE DRINKING WATER", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, with 
Representative Anderson being ex­
cused. 

The Chair directed the 
note that H.B. Nos. 1102 
had passed Final Reading 
o'clock p. m. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1617, HDl, 
deferred one day. 

Clerk to 
and 1486 
at 12:54 

action on 
SDl, was 
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By unanimous consent, action on 
H.B. No, 463, SDl, was deferred one 
day. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
391, HDl, SDl; 592, SDl; and 898, 
SDl, were taken from the Clerk's 
desk. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 391, HDl, and H.B. No. 
391, HDl, SDl, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO HOUS­
ING", having been read throughout, 
passed Final Reading by a vote of 49 
ayes to 1 no, with Representative 
Hemmings voting no, and with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 592 and H.B. No. 592, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO RENTAL HOUS­
ING", having been read throughout, 
passed Final Reading by a vote of 50 
ayes, with Representative Anderson 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 391 and 592 had 
passed Final Reading at 12 : 55 o'clock 
p.m. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried·, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 898 and H.B. No. 898, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO HOUSING", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 898 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:56 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. 
1158, HDl, SDl; 1796, HDl, 
and H.B. No. 430, HDl, SDl, 
taken from the Clerk's desk. 

Nos. 
SDl; 
were 

On motion by Representative Shi to, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1158, HDl, and H.B. 
No. 1158, HDl, SDl, entitled: 11 A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 

ASSISTANCE TO DISPLACED PER­
SONS 11 , having been read throughout, 
passed Final Reading by a vote of 50 
ayes, with Representative Anderson 
being excused. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1796, HDl, and H.B. 
No. 1796, HDl, SDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HOUSING", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 1158 and 1796 
had passed Final Reading at 12: 57 
o'clock p.m. 

On motion by Representative Ara­
kaki, seconded by Representative 
Andrews and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 430, HDl, 
and H.B. No. 430, HDl, SDl, enti­
tled : "A BILL FOR AN ACT RE­
LATING TO HANDICAPPED PER­
SONS", having been read throughout, 
passed Final Reading by a vote of 50 
ayes, with Representative Anderson 
being excused. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1150, HD2, 
deferred one day. 

action on 
SDl, was 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1331, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Ara­
kaki, seconded by Representative 
Andrews and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1331 and 
H.B. No. 1331, SDl, entitled: 11 A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CHILD SUPPORT ENFORCEMENT 
AGENCY", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 430 and 1331 had 
passed Final Reading at 12: 58 o'clock 
p.m. 

By unanimous consent, 
H.B. No. 1511, HDl, 
deferred one day. 

action on 
SDl, was 
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By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
5, HDl, SDl; 1013, HDl, SDl; and 
251, HDl, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 5, HDl, 
and H.B. No. 5, HDl, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE WHISTLEBLOWERS' PROTECTION 
ACT", having been read throughout, 
passed Final Reading by a vote of 50 
ayes, with Representative Anderson 
being excused. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1013, 
HDl, and H.B. No. 1013, HDl, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO MATERIAL AND LA­
BOR USED ON PUBLIC WORKS", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 251, HDl, 
and H.B. No. 251, HDl, SDl, enti­
tled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT RE­
LATING TO PUBLIC CONTRACTS", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 5; 1013; and 251 
had passed Final Reading at 12: 59 
o'clock p.m. 

At 12:59 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Apo asked for a recess, and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1:05 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1738, HD2, SDl, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Shon and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 1738, HD2, and 
H.B. No. 1738, HD2, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 

EMPLOYMENT FOR THE CHRONI­
CALLY MENTALLY ILL", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 50 ayes, with Rep­
resentative Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1738 had passed 
Final Reading at 1:06 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
220, SDl, was taken from the Clerk's 
desk. 

Representative Takamine moved that 
the House agree to the amendments 
proposed by the Senate to H.B. No. 
220 and H.B. No. 220, SDl, having 
been read throughout, pass Final 
Reading, seconded by Representative 
Hirono. 

Representative Cavasso then rose to 
speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, this is the practice 
of psychology and dealing with it is 
not measurable as are other medical 
procedures; therefore, this is subject 
to gross abuse in our economy, and I 
believe it is a mistake and, therefore, 
vote against it, Mr. Speaker." 

Representative Metcalf then rose to 
speak in support of the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, Representative 
Cavasso has convinced me--I'm chang­
ing my vote--I'm supporting the 
measure." 

Representative Tungpalan then rose 
to speak in favor of the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I would just like to 
thank the chairmen of the various 
committees who heard this measure. I 
know it's a controversial one and a 
lot of people are holding their breaths 
to see if everything will go well, 

"Because of our amendments made 
in 1985 and subsequent amendments 
made the following year, I do believe 
that this is a well-regulated system. 
Indeed, there are treatment schedules 
and fee schedules that will contain 
the cost. This was done because we 
did recognize in 1985 that one-third 
of the costs of workers compensation 
could be attributed to the cost of 
medical care and, as such, the Legis­
lature did what was necessary and 
implemented rules and regulations that 
now actually determine, by weeks, 
the amount of time for each injury 
and illness that is compensable under 
the workers compensation. Should a 
person want to go beyond the sche­
duled treatment, he would have to 
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obtain the approval of the Department 
of Labor; so in no way could anyone, 
who is a medical provider under 
workers' compensation, go beyond and 
abuse the system. 

"Also, the psychologists are cur­
rently designated as medical provi­
ders; they are not designated in the 
section that we are amending but, 
currently, if referred to, they may 
treat patients under workers compen­
sation. They have direct access to 
patients who come to them and are 
compensated by H.M.S.A. and 
CHAMPUS. 

"So I don't believe that we are, as 
the former speaker said, going in the 
wrong direction. I do believe that 
this is a measure that is prudent 
and justified. 

"Thank you." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and the House agreed to 
the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 220 and H.B. No. 
220, SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO WORKER'S 
COMPENSATION", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 44 ayes to 6 noes, with 
Representatives Cachola, Cavasso, 
Hemmings, Jones, Kanoho and 
O'Kieffe voting no, and with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 220 had passed 
Final Reading at 1:10 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
254, HD1, SD2, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Hashimoto and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 254, HD1, 
and H.B. No. 254, HD1, SD2, enti­
tled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT RE­
LATING TO THE SHORELINE", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 47 ayes to 3 
noes, with Representatives Cavasso, 
Jones and Medeiros voting no, and 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1583, HD1, SD1, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Oshiro and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 

Senate to H.B. No. 1583, HD1, and 
H.B. No. 1583, HD1, SD1, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT STATE­
MENTS", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
380, HD1, SD1, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the House agreed 
to the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 380, HD1, and 
H.B. No. 380, HD1, SD1, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE ENVIRONMENT", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 50 ayes, with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 254; 1583; and 
380 had passed Final Reading at 1: 11 
o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
586, HD1, SD2, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Hashi­
moto, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 586, HD1, 
and H.B. No. 586, HD1, SD2, enti­
tled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT RE­
LATING TO AQUACULTURE", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, with 
Representative Anderson being ex­
cused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 586 had passed 
Final Reading at 1:12 o'clock p.m. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
H.B. No. 891, SD1, was deferred one 
day. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
1467, HD1, SD1, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1467, HD1, and H.B. 
No. 1467, HD1, SD1, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PLANT AND ANIMAL LIFE, SEEDS 
AND SOILS", having been read 
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throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 5.0 ayes, with Representa­
tive Anderson being excused. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
230, HDl, SD1, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 

On motion by Representative Tani­
guchi, seconded by Representative 
Say and carried, the House agreed to 
the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 230, HDl, and 
H.B. No. 230, HD1, SDl, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ART IN STATE BUILDINGS", having 
been read throughout, passed Final 
Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, with 
Representative Anderson being ex­
cused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 1467 and 230 had 
passed Final Reading at 1: 13 o'clock 
p.m. 

By unanimous consent, H.B. Nos. 
453, SDl; 537, HD2, SDl; and 1173, 
SDl, were taken from the Clerk's 
desk. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 453 and H.B. No. 453, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO EMPLOYEES' 
RETIREMENT SYSTEM", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 50 ayes, with Repre­
sentative Anderson being excused. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 537, HD2, and H.B. No. 
537, HD2, SDl, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TAX 
RELIEF FOR NATURAL DISASTER 
LOSSES", having been read through­
out, passed Final Reading by a vote 
of 50 ayes, with Representative 
Anderson being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. Nos. 453 and 537 had 
passed Final Reading at 1: 14 o'clock 
p.m. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1173 and H.B. No. 1173, 
SDl, entitled : "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO DOG LICENSE", 
having been read throughout, passed 

Final Reading by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Anderson being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H. B . No. 117 3 had passed 
Final Reading at 1:15 o'clock p.m. 

At 1: 15 o'clock p. m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1:17 o'clock p.m. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Okamura: "There 
will a closed Majority caucus this 
evening at 8: 00 o'clock p. m. , to go 
over Third Reading bills on Senate 
bills with Senate amendments with no 
House drafts. The Order of the Day 
for tomorrow will be circulated to 
your offices by 1: 45 this afternoon." 

At 1:17 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Liu asked for a recess, and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1: 18 o'clock p. m. 

Representative Shon: "I would like 
to announce that we will be having 
our conference committee between the 
Health and Judiciary Committees 
starting at 1: 30 or very soon anyway 
on a number of bills--H.B. No. 464, 
smoking in public places; S.B. No. 
350, smoking in the workplace; H.B. 
No. 889; S.B. No. 1007; and H.B. 
No. 1025. Those members who are 
members of those committees, please 
report to Senate Conference Room 5." 

Representative Oshiro: "We will 
have a joint conference on the fol­
lowing bills this afternoon: H. B. Nos. 
1519; 741; 1517; 1315; and S.B. No. 
241. Conference will be held at 3: 00 
o'clock p.m., in Senate Conference 
Room 6." 

Representative Lee: "The Commit­
tee on Education will hold a public 
hearing on a number of resolutions 
this afternoon in Room 310 at 1: 30 
with decision making to follow." 

Representative Hiraki: "The Com­
mittee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce will be beginning confer­
ence today starting at 2: 00 o'clock in 
House Conference Room 314. We will 
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be conferencing on bills relating to 
consumer protection and relating to 
property." 

Representative Shito: "Mr. 
Speaker, your conferees on H.B. No. 
1795 will meet this afternoon at 3: 00 
o'clock p.m., in Room 416; and also, 
tomorrow, the conferees for S. B. No. 
1318 will meet at 6:00 o'clock p.m., in 
Senate Conference Room 6. " 

Representative Liu: 
a Republican caucus 
session." 

''There will be 
right after 

The Chair then announced: 

"All conferees be available for your 
conference committees. If you are 
not in the building at anytime, could 
you have the courtesy of notifying 
the chairmen of the committee as to 
your whereabouts where you can be 
reached." 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 1:20 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Liu and carried, the 
House of Representatives adjourned 
until 11:00 o'clock a.m., tomorrow, 
Wednesday, April 15, 1987. 
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FIFTY-THIRD DAY 

Wednesday, April 15, 1987 

The House of Representatives of the 
Fourteenth Legislature of the State of 
Hawaii, Regular Session of 1987, 
convened at 11:15 o'clock a.m., with 
the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked by 
Reverend Abraham Akaka, Pastor 
Emeritus of Kawaiahao Church, after 
which the Roll was called showing all 
members present with the exception of 
Representatives Bunda, Fukunaga, 
Ibara, Peters, Pfeil and Taniguchi, 
who were excused. 

The Clerk proceeded to read the 
Journals of the House of Representa­
tives of the Forty-Eighth, Forty­
Ninth and Fiftieth Days. 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, reading of the Journals 
was dispensed with and the Journals 
of the Forty-Eighth, Forty-Ninth and 
Fiftieth Days were approved. 

GOVERNOR'S MESSAGES 

The following messages from the 
Governor (Gov. Msg. Nos. 115 to 
119) were read by the Clerk and were 
disposed of as follows: 

A message from the Governor (Gov. 
Msg. No. 115) transmitting copies of 
the 1986 Report to the Legislature by 
the Office of Community Services, 
Department of Labor and Industrial 
Relations, was placed on file. 

A message from the Governor (Gov. 
Msg. No. 116) transmitting copies of 
a report prepared by the Department 
of Planning and Economic Develop­
ment, Attorney General, and Land 
and Natural Resources, in response to 
S.C.R. No. 36, SD 1, HD 1, request­
ing a report on possible state and 
federal governmental actions to 
achieve an effective management role 
for the State of Hawaii in the 
Exclusive Economic Zone, was placed 
on file. 

A message from the Governor (Gov. 
Msg. No. 117) transmitting copies of 
a report prepared by the Department 
of Taxation, regarding the general 
excise tax on mainland contractors, 
pursuant to House Concurrent Resolu­
tion No. 133 and House Resolution 
No. 208, adopted by the 1986 legis­
lative session, was placed on file. 

A message from the · Governor (Gov. 
Msg. No. 118) transmitting copies of 
the 1986 Annual Report of the De­
partment of Planning and Economic 
Development, was placed on file. 

A message from the Governor (Gov. 
Msg. No. 119) transmitting copies of 
a report prepared by the Department 
of Planning and Economic Development 
on its loan programs, as required 
under the following statutes: Section 
210-8, HRS, requires an annual 
report on the progress made under 
Chapter 210, the Hawaii Capital Loan 
Program; Section 189-26, HRS, re­
quires an annual report on the prog­
ress made under Chapter 189, Part 
II, the Large Fishing Vessel Pur­
chase, Construction, Renovation, 
Maintenance and Repair Loan Pro­
gram; Section 189-46, HRS, requires 
an annual report on the progress 
made under Chapter 189, Part IV, the 
Hawaii Small Fishing Vessel Loan 
Program; Section 209-5, HRS, re­
quires an annual report from the 
Rehabilitation Coordinator. Since 
DPED administers the Disaster Com­
mercial and Personal Loan Program, 
an annual report on its progress is 
presented; Chapter 211E, HRS, does 
not require an annual report, how­
ever, DPED included the Hawaii 
Invention Development Loan Program 
as part of their loan annual report; 
was placed on file. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications from 
the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 751 and 
752) were read by the Clerk and were 
disposed of as follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 751) informing the 
House that the President has, on 
April 13, 1987, added Senator Aki as 
an additional member on the part of 
the Senate at the conference on House 
Bill No. 11, HD 2, SD 1, was placed 
on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 752) informing the 
House that the President has, on 
April 14, 1987, added Senator Yama­
saki as an additional member on the 
part of the Senate at the conference 
on House Bill No. 37, HD 1, SD 2, 
was placed on file. 

MISCELLANEOUS COMMUNICATION 

A communication from Cherry Mata-
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no, Administrative Assistant to 
Senator Spark Matsunaga (Misc. Com. 
No. 3) acknowledging receipt of a 
copy of House Resolution No. 57, was 
placed on file. 

At this time, the following intro­
ductions were made to the members of 
the House: 

Representative Crozier introduced 
Gigi Vargas from Costa Rica, Bebi 
Back from Germany, Alexander Kunz 
from Germany, Amaya Pena from 
Spain, Floren Bedding from Switzer­
land, Jasa Galovic from Yugoslavia; 
and Patrick Perkins, Kelly Wong and 
Crissy Makaweo from Hawaii who will 
be going to Japan, Spain and Europe, 
stating: 

"Every year, for the past three 
years, I have had the opportunity to 
introduce a special group of students 
that I have become very close to. 
Mr. Speaker, as you remember, a few 
years back when my daughter was in 
high school, she was an exchange 
student to Samoa, and the following 
year I had an Italian girl staying with 
us for a year, and that was part of 
the group called AFS, and ever since 
then, students from around the 
world, stay at different homes with 
families and what happens in Hawaii 
is, during the Spring vacation, these 
students from all over the world who 
are staying in the Western United 
States, come to Hawaii for a week. 
What is so unique or so terrific about 
this whole program, Mr. Speaker, is 
that these students come, not only 
from different locations, but from 
different political organizations. This 
year, we have those brought up 
under a form of democracy, we have 
some that's brought up under a 
monarchy, and also we have one 
that's been educated under commu­
nism, and that's terrific so that all of 
these people can get together and see 
that we are really not that much 
different we're still human 
beings." 

Representative Cavasso introduced 
Miss Margaret Vikers, "an Indian from 
Canada who worked as my special aide 
for two years. . a very special 
person, someone who is an interna­
tional person as well. She is a 
member of the Shimshian Indian 
Nation of British Columbia and 
Canada, President of the Professional 
League of Women of British Columbia, 
founding member of the British Colum­
bia Native Teachers' Association, and 
currently specializes in socio-economic 
development as a consultant with her 
company." 

Representative Marumoto introduced 
Mrs. Mary Y ort, "an old friend of 
mine. Her roots go very deep into 
Hawaii's history. Her family has been 
here for generations." 

Representative 
Laura and Kathy 
employed by the 
Company. 

Apo introduced 
from Kauai who are 
N apalii Coast Zodiac 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
certain resolutions. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions 
Nos. 465 and 466) were read 
Clerk and were disposed of 
lows: 

(H.R. 
by the 
as fol-

A resolution (H.R. No. 465) honor­
ing the "Just Say No" program was 
jointly offered by Representatives 
Okamura, Cachola, Alcon, Anderson, 
Crozier, Hemmings, Lee, Liu, 
O'Kieffe, Ribellia, Tajiri and Tam. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Cachola and carried, H.R. No. 465 
was adopted, 

Representative Okamura proceeded 
to introduce the honorees, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker and members of the 
House, we are very much aware of 
the widespread drug problem through­
out America as well as here in Hawaii. 
This problem is most painful to con­
template when we realize that, for our 
youth, the use of drugs has become a 
means of acceptance, a way to es­
cape, and tragically for many, it has 
become a way of life. " 

"With us today are a group of very 
special people who, instead of just 
thinking about it, have involved 
themselves in s2reading the message 
that our children can "just say no" to 
drugs and to the tragic consequences 
that result from drug-taking. " 

Representative Okamura then asked 
the following honorees to stand to be 
recognized: Kekoa Kaapu, "the very 
hardworking voluntary full-time 
Chairperson of Just Say No Hawaii"; 
Beth Schecter, National Program 
Director of the Just Say No Founda-



678 HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 3 r d DAY 

tion; Hugh Vasquez, National Just 
Say No Trainer/Consultant; and 
Miss Marsha Mayfield, representing 
the 30,000 students who are partici­
pating in this program in Hawaii, and 
a student at St. Elizabeth School, 
and captain and founder of her school 
chapter. 

Carnation leis were presented to 
Mr. Kaapu by Representatives Tung­
palan; to Miss Schecter by Represen­
tative Hiraki; to Mr. Vasquez by 
Representative Kawakami; and to Miss 
Mayfield by Representative Alcon. 
Certified copies of the resolution were 
presented to the honorees by Repre­
sentative Okamura. 

Representative Okamura then asked 
Mr. Ted Cook, honorary Board mem­
ber of Just Say No Hawaii, and a 
group of students representing 
vanous schools in Hawaii who are 
participants in the Just Say No 
program, who were seated in the 
gallery, to stand to be recognized. 

Representative Crozier then 
the students from Mauka-Lani 
in Makakilo together with 
teacher, Mrs. Yee; and Mr. 
Kaapu, Jr. 
to stand to be recognized. 

asked 
School 

their 
Kekoa 

A resolution (H.R. No. 466) con­
gratulating Aloha Magazine on its 
tenth anniversary was jointly offered 
by Representatives Hemmings and 
Cachola. 

On motion by Representative Hem­
mings, seconded by Representative 
Cachola and carried, H.R. No. 466 
was adopted. 

Representative Hemmings proceeded 
to introduce the honorees, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, it gives me pleasure 
to introduce a local publishing 
business that has served our State so 
well, and it gives me greater pleasure 
to introduce the publisher of that 
magazine," and asked Mr. Rick Davis 
and Mrs. Rita Ariyoshi, founding 
editor, to stand to be recognized. 

Representative Hemmings then asked 
Mrs. Valerie Davis, wife of Rick 
Davis, who was seated in the gallery, 
to stand to be recognized. 

Crown flower leis were presented to 
Mr. Davis by Representative Marumoto 
and to Mrs. Ariyoshi by Representa­
tive Cachola. Representative Hem­
mings presented Mr. Davis with a 
certified copy of the resolution. 

At 11:38 o'clock, the Chair declared 

a recess, subject to the call of the 
Chair, "for the purpose of greeting 
our honorees with our warm aloha." 

Upon reconvening at 12: 50 o'clock 
p. m. , the Chair directed the Clerk to 
note the presence of Representatives 
Bunda, Fukunaga, Ibara and Peters. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
bills on Final and Third Readings on 
the basis of a modified consent 
calendar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

H.B. No. 1528, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 736, HD 1, SD 2: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1257, HD l, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 223, HD 1, SD 1: 

Representative Levin moved that the 
House agree to the amendments pro­
posed by the Senate to H.B. No. 223, 
HD 1, and H.B. No. 223, HD 1, SD 
1, having been read throughout, pass 
Final Reading. 

At 12:52 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

Upon reconvening at 12: 55 o'clock 
p.m., Representative D. Ige seconded 
the motion. 

Representative Tungpalan rose to 
speak in favor of the bill, stating: 

"This measure is a product of the 
joint efforts of the Governor and his 
administration, the film industry, 
business and labor and the Legisla­
ture. 

"This bill's presence here today is 
a good example of what can happen 
when people think positively and act 
accordingly. 
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"Mr. Speaker, I want to especially 
thank Mrs. Bette Tatum whose NFIB 
survey revealed the need to stream­
line and establish a film permitting 
system and Chairman Andrew Levin 
and Vice Chairman David Ige and 
their capable and astute members of 
the Water, Land Use, Development 
and Hawaiian Affairs Committee for 
recognizing a 'gem' in the rough and 
polishing it to perfection and bril­
liance! 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker and my 
colleagues." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and the House agreed to 
the amendments proposed by the 
Senate to H.B. No. 223, HD 1, and 
H.B. No. 223, HD 1, SD 1, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
FILM PRODUCTION", having been 
read throughout, passed Final Read­
ing by a vote of 49 ayes, with 
Representatives Pfeil and Taniguchi 
bemg excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 223 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:56 o'clock p.m. 

H.B. No. 578, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1230, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1740, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1924, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 211, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1151, HD 1, SD 1: 

Bv unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

At 12:58 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1:02 o'clock p.m. 

H.B. No. 1617, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 463, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1150, HD 2, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

At 1: 03 o'clock p. m. , the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1:04 o'clock p.m. 

H.B. No. 1511, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 891, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1159) recommending that S.B. 
No. 594, SD 1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 594, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO HAWAII HOUSING 
AUTHORITY--HOUSING PROJECTS", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and Tani­
guchi being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 594 had passed 
Third Reading at 1 : 05 o'clock p. m. 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1160) recommending 
that S.B. No. 323 pass Third Read-
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ing. 

Representative Okamura moved that 
the report of the Committee be 
adopted and S.B. No. 323, having 
been read throughout, pass Third 
Reading, seconded by Representative 
Alcon. 

Representative Cavasso rose to 
speak against the bill, stating: 

"The loyalty oath is good and the 
authority to waive that oath rests 
with the Governor right now and as 
the highest elected official of our 
State, it is appropriate that it should 
rest with him to waive that loyalty 
oath. The oath simply says two 
things. It says that, 'I solemnly 
swear that I will support and defend 
the Constitution of the United States, 
and the Constitution of the State of 
Hawaii.' The Constitution of Hawaii 
is the highest law of our State; the 
Constitution of the nation is the 
highest law of our nation. It seems 
reasonable that we should expect 
people who work in our community, 
our State and our nation to uphold 
the supreme laws of our land. 

"There are situations when we have 
a guest, a guest speaker, or profes­
sor or such that, for special reasons, 
where he would have problems with 
his own country if he stated that he 
would affirm or uphold the Constitu­
tion of our State or nation, and in 
those cases, the Governor should 
have the authority to waive and the 
law gives him that authority. 

"This is going further. It is 
giving that authority to the Board of 
Regents of the University of Hawaii, 
a non-elected body by the people of 
Hawaii, and I believe that it is unwise 
to further dilute the responsibility to 
enforce and uphold the Constitution 
of Hawaii and the United States. 
That authority should rest with the 
Governor and should not be diluted 
and placed in lower bodies. 

"I think that it is a mistake, and 
particularly in light of some of the 
problems we are having with loyalty 
and the situation overseas with the 
consulate and the problems with the 
marines and such, and I think this 
would be a step in the wrong direc­
tion. I have an uneasy sense here 
about taking this authority away from 
the Governor. He can handle it; he 
has handled it in the past and should 
be allowed to continue to handle it. 

"I am voting no and ask others with 
the same reservation, keep this 
authority in the hands of the Gover-

nor only. The laws of the land . 
. the Constitution is too important to 
threaten or dilute in any way." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No, 
323, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE LOYALTY OATH", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 45 ayes 
to 4 noes, with Representatives 
Anderson, Cavasso, Jones and 
Ribellia voting no, and Representa­
tives Pfeil and Taniguchi being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 323 had passed 
Third Reading at 1: 07 o'clock p. m. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1161) 
recommending that S. B. No. 303 pass 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and S. B. No. 303, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO HEALTH REQUIRE­
MENTS FOR ENTRY TO SCHOOL", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and Tani­
guchi being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1162) 
recommending that S. B. No. 91 pass 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 91, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ORCHARDS", having 
been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, with 
Representatives Pfeil and Taniguchi 
being excused, 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 303 and 91 had 
passed Third Reading at 1: 08 o'clock 
p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1163) 
recommending that S. B. No. 983 pass 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 983, 
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entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE PUBLIC EM­
PLOYEES HEALTH FUND", having 
been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, with 
Representatives Pfeil and Taniguchi 
being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1164) 
recommending that S.B. No. 611, SD 
1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 611, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO SERVICE­
CONNECTED OCCUPATIONAL DISABIL­
ITY RETIREMENT", having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading by 
a vote of 49 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Pfeil and Taniguchi being 
excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1165) 
recommending that S.B. No. 311, SD 
1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 311, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC EM­
PLOYEES IN THE EXCLUDED MANA­
GERIAL COMPENSATION PLAN", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and 
Taniguchi being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 983, 611 and 311 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 09 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1166) 
recommending that S. B. No. 301, SD 
1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 301, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE PUBLIC 
EMPLOYEES HEALTH FUND", having 
been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, with 
Representatives Pfeil and Taniguchi 
being excused. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 

report (Stand. Com, Rep. No. 1167) 
recommending that S.B. No. 351, SD 
1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
351, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO ANIMALS", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and 
Taniguchi being excused. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1168) 
recommending that S. B. No, 434 pass 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
434, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO PENALTIES", having 
been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, with 
Representatives Pfeil and Taniguchi 
being excused, 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 301, 351 and 434 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 10 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No, 1169) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1442, SD 
2 , pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1442, SD 2, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MOPEDS", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and 
Taniguchi being excused. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep, No. 1170) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1530, SD 
1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1530, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CORREC-
TIONS", having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading by 
a vote of 49 ayes, with Representa­
tives Pfeil and Taniguchi being 
excused. 
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The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 1442 and 1530 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 11 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1171) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1643, SD 
1 , pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1643, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO ZONING", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and 
Taniguchi being excused. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1172) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1704 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1704, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII 
ST A TE GU ARD", having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading by 
a vote of 49 ayes, with Representa­
tives Pfeil and Taniguchi being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 1643 and 1704 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 12 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1173) recommending 
that S.B. No. 58 pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
58, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE LANDLORD­
TENANT CODE", having been read 
throughout, passed Third Reading by 
a vote of 49 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Pfeil and Taniguchi being 
excused. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1174) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1323, SD 1, pass Third 
Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro-

no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1323, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO LIMITED­
EQUITY HOUSING COOPERATIVES", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 49 ayes, 
with Representatives Pfeil and 
Taniguchi being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 58 and 1323 had 
passed Third Reading at 1: 13 o'clock 
p.m. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
majority of the Committee on Human 
Services, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1175) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1435 pass Second 
Reading and be placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and S.B. No. 1435, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PSYCHOLOGY", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1176) recom­
mending that S.B. No. 258, SD 1, 
pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 258, 
SD 1, entitled: 11 A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO FOOD, DRUGS, 
AND COSMETICS", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1177) recom­
mending that S.B. No. 1733, SD 1, 
pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1733, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CONTROLLED 
SUBSTANCES", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Shon, for the ma­
jority of the Committee on Health, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
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Rep. No. 1178) recommending that 
S.B. No. 349, SD 1, pass Second 
Reading and be placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the ma­
jority of the Committee was adopted 
and S.B. No. 349, SD 1, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE DIRECTOR OF HEALTH", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1179) recommending that S. B. 
No. 1749, SD 1, pass Second Reading 
and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 1749, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TRAFFIC 
SAFETY", passed Second Reading and 
was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1180) recommending that S.B. 
No. 239, SD 1, pass Second Reading 
and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1180 and S.B. No. 239, SD 
1, were recommitted to the Committee 
on Transportation. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1181) recommending that S.B. 
No. 156, SD 1, pass Second Reading 
and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 156, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO SAL­
VAGED VEHICLES", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1182) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1176, SD 1, pass 

Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 1176, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO COLLEC­
TIVE BARGAINING", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1183) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1388, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 1388, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC 
OFFICERS AND EMPLOYEES", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1184) recommending 
that S.B. No. 999 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 999, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO REEMPLOYMENT 
AND RECALL LISTS", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1185) recommending 
that S. B. No. 310 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 310, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE BOILER AND 
ELEVATOR, SAFETY LAW", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1186) recommending 
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that S.B. No. 307, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 307, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO JOB 
APPLICATION PROCESSING FEES", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1187) recommending 
that S.B. No. 309, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 309, SD 1, entitled : "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE 
HAWAII OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND 
HEALTH LAW", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representatives Hirono and Metcalf, 
for the Committees on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce and Judici­
ary, presented a joint report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1188) recommending 
that S.B. No . 448, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the joint report 
of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 448, SD 1, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
CONSUMER PROTECTION", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading . 

Representatives Hirono and Metcalf, 
for the Committees on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce and Judici­
ary, presented a joint report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1189) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1001, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the joint report 
of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 1001, SD 1, entitled : "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PEST CONTROL OPERATORS", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1190) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1224, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1224, SD 1, entitled: 11 A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO MEDICINE", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1191) recommending 
that S.B. No. 444, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
444, SD 1, entitled : "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO BARBERING", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono , for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1192) recommending 
that S.B. No. 393, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
393, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO VETERINARY 
MEDICINE", passed Second Reading 
and was placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading . 

Representatives Hirono and Metcalf, 
for the Committees on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce and Judici­
ary, presented a joint report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1193) recommending 
that S.B. No. 419 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, the joint report 
of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 419, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO THE 
RESIDENTIAL LANDLORD-TENANT 
CODE", passed Second Reading and 
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was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1194) recommending 
that S.B. No. 522 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report · of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
522, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CLOSED BANKS", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com . Rep. No. 1195) recommending 
that S.B. No. 525, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
525, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1196) recommending 
that S.B. No. 632, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
632. SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1197) recommending 
that S.B. No. 727, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
727, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INTOXI-

CA TING LIQUOR 11 , passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1198) recommending 
that S.B. No. 877, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
877, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INTOXI­
CATING LIQUOR 11 , passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1199) recommending 
that S.B. No. 956, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
956, SD l, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CONSUMER 
COMMODITIES", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1200) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1023, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1023, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INTOXI­
CATING LIQUOR", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1201) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1526, SD 2, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1526, SD 2, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
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AN ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1202) recommending 
that S. B. No. 450 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
450, entitled: 11 A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO OSTEOPATHY", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1203) recommending 
that S.B. No. 451 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
451, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO LICENSING OF PSY­
CHOLOGISTS", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1204) recommending 
that S.B. No. 521 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No . 
521, entitled : "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CONTRACTORS", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1205) recommending 
that S.B. No. 452, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
452, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 

AN ACT RELATING TO DENTAL 
HYGIENISTS", passed Second Reading 
and was placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1206) recommending 
that S. B. No. 11, SD 1, pass Second 
Reading and be placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
11, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO HORIZONTAL 
PROPERTY REGIMES", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1207) recommending 
that S.B. No. 216, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
216, SD l, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO INTOXI­
CATING LIQUOR", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1208) recommending 
that S. B. No. 368 pass Second Read­
ing and be placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
368, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ADVERTISING IN 
CONNECTION WITH CREDIT SALES", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1209) recommending 
that S.B. No. 366, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hira­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
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Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
366, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO TIME 
SHARING", passed Second Reading 
and was placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No, 1210) recommending 
that S.B. No. 365, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading, 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
365, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PHYSICAL 
THERAPY", passed Second Reading 
and was placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1211) 
recommending that S.B. No. 856, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
856, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO ORGANIZED 
CRIME", passed Second Reading and 
was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1212) 
recommending that S.B. No. 66 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
66, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE JUDICIARY", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1213) 
recommending that S.B. No. 65 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading, 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
65, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 

RELATING TO 
passed Second 
placed on the 
Reading. 

FAMILY 
Reading 

calendar 

COURT", 
and was 

for Third 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1214) 
recommending that S. B. No. 45 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried·, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
45, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO LEGAL STATUS OF 
PERSONS", passed Second Reading 
and was placed on the calendar for 
Third Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No, 1215) 
recommending that S. B, No. 125 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading, 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
125, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TORTS", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading, 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1216) 
recommending that S. B. No. 784 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S, B, No. 
784, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO GAMBLING OF­
FENSES", passed Second Reading and 
was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1217) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1095, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1095, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PENAL RE­
SPONSIBILITY AND FITNESS TO 
PROCEED", passed Second Reading 
and was placed on the calendar for 
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Third Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1218) 
recommending that S.B. No. 436, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
436, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO AMENDING 
VARIOUS PROVISIONS OF THE 
HAWAII REVISED STATUTES TO 
CORRECT REFERENCES TO RE-
PEALED CHAPTER 191, HAWAII 
REVISED STATUTES", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1219) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1145 
pass Second· Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Crozier rose to 
speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, in my office I have, 
above the inner door, a quote from 
Chief Justice Lewis Brandeis which he 
stated in 1928 and it goes: 'The 
greatest danger to liberty lurks in 
insidious encroachment by men of 
zeal, well-meaning, but without 
understanding.' 

"Mr. Speaker, this bill represents a 
well-meant intent to become more 
efficient in the election process. 
However, I think it goes a little bit 
too far. It does two things, sir. 
First of all, it gives the Lieutenant 
Governor the right to combine both 
charter amendments and constitutional 
amendments on the same card. What 
happens then, sir, is you mix, or 
you co-mingle, State issues and City 
and County issues. I can see people 
making· judgment decisions in the 
ballot box and being confused on 
what they are voting on, what 
government they are voting for or 
against, or the issue which relates to 
whatever government. 

"The other concern , sir, is on the 
ballots for the Primary Elections 
where you are going to include pri­
marily for the minor parties 
Libertarian Parties -- put them on the 
same ballot as the non-partisan bal­
lots. You know , there are a few . 

"I also can see the potential for 
confusion from the voters. Mr. 

Speaker, maybe some of the more 
mature members can remember when 
we had the open primary prior to 
having the closed primary. I remem­
ber my Mom and my Dad and my 
uncles and aunties talking about how 
people spoiled their ballots because 
they didn't realize they were not 
allowed to cross over. In the Pri­
mary, you're just supposed to go 
down one column but some people 
accidentally made the mistake and 
jumped over and that nullified their 
ballots. 

"Mr. Speaker, what we are sup­
posed to be doing, when it comes to 
voting, we are supposed to minimize 
any chances of error. You know, 
there is an old saying that all of us 
use when we campaign and we all 
should use all the time and that's the 
'kiss' formula keep it simple, 
stupid! Okay, we got to keep it 
simple so that we don't make mis­
takes, and if we have the potential of 
making mistakes, we are supposed to 
keep it simple so that the voters also 
will not make mistakes. 

"Members, realize this is on 
Second Reading but I would like for 
you folks to pay attention and take a 
look at this bill and tomorrow, when 
we vote on Third Reading, you'll 
understand where I'm coming from. 

"Thank you very much, sir." 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1145, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO BALLOTS", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1220) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1139 
pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1139, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT PROPOSING AN AMENDMENT TO 
ARTICLE II, SECTION 1, OF THE 
HAWAII CONSTITUTION, TO CHANGE 
THE RESIDENCY QUALIFICATION 
FOR VOTING", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
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report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1221) 
recommending that S. B. No. 82 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 82, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TAXATION", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1222) 
recommending that S.B. No. 81, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 81, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO TAXATION", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1223) 
recommending that S. B. No. 140 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 140, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ACT 347, SESSION 
LAWS OF HAWAII", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1224) 
recommending that S. B. No, 138, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 138, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE GENERAL 
FUND EXPENDITURE CEILING", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand . Com. Rep. No. 1225) 
recommending that S.B. No. 143 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 

calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 143, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TAXATION", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1226) 
recommending that S.B. No. 370, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 370, 
SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PRIVATE 
ACTIVITY BONDS", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1227) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1757, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1757, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO CAPITAL 
LOAN PROGRAM", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Levin, for the 
majority of the Committee on Water, 
Land Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1228) recommending 
that H.R. No. 30, as amended in HD 
l, be referred to the Committee on 
Intergovernmental Relations. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the ma­
jority of the Committee was adopted 
and H.R. No. 30, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF LAND AND 
NATURAL RESOURCES TO TRANSFER 
LAND AT THE 'OLD GOVERNMENT 
ROAD' ON DIAMOND HEAD TO THE 
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU", 
was referred to the Committee on 
Intergovernmental Relations. 

Representative Levin, for the 
majority of the Committee on Water, 
Land Use, Development and Hawaiian 
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Affairs, presented a report (Stand. 
Corn. Rep. No. 1229) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 18, as amended in 
HD 1, be referred to the Committee 
on Intergovernmental Relations. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the ma­
jority of the Committee was adopted 
and H.C.R. No. 18, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
LAND AND NATURAL RESOURCES TO 
TRANSFER LAND AT THE 'OLD 
GOVERNMENT ROAD' ON DIAMOND 
HEAD TO THE CITY AND COUNTY 
OF HONOLULU", was referred to the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Corn. Rep. No. 1230) 
recommending that H.R. No. 268, as 
amended in HD 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 268, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING THAT THE IN­
VADING BROWN TREE SNAKE BE 
ERADICATED FROM GUAM BY A 
QUARANTINE PROGRAM FOR HAWAII 
AND U.S. TERRITORIES", was re­
ferred to the Committee on Finance. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Corn. Rep. No. 1231) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 156, 
as amended in HD 1, be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
156, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THAT THE INVADING BROWN TREE 
SNAKE BE ERADICATED FROM GUAM 
BY A QUARANTINE PROGRAM FOR 
HAWAII AND U.S. TERRITORIES", 
was referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Corn. Rep. No. 1232) 
recommending that H.R. No. 216, as 
amended in HD 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 216, 

HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
FUTURE OF THE SUGAR INDUSTRY 
IN HAWAII", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1233) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 124, 
as amended in HD 1, be referred to 
the Committee on Legislative Manage­
ment. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
124, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY OF THE FUTURE OF THE 
SUGAR INDUSTRY IN HAWAII", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Corn. Rep. 
No. 1234) recommending that H.R. 
No. 213, as amended in HD 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Higher 
Education and the Arts. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 213, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF URBAN AND REGIONAL 
PLANNING OF THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII TO CONTINUE AND COM­
PLETE ITS STUDY ON THE FEA­
SIBILITY OF SETTING ASIDE STATE 
LANDS FOR THE PRACTICE OF 
SUBSISTENCE LIFESTYLES BY CER­
TAIN RESIDENTS", was referred to 
the Committee on Higher Education 
and the Arts. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1235) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 122, as amended in HD 
1, be referred to the Committee on 
Higher Education and the Arts. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
122, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF URBAN AND 
REGIONAL PLANNING OF THE UNI­
VERSITY OF HAWAII TO CONTINUE 
AND COMPLETE ITS STUDY ON THE 
FEASIBILITY OF SETTING ASIDE 
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ST A TE LANDS FOR THE PRACTICE 
OF SUBSISTENCE LIFESTYLES BY 
CERTAIN RESIDENTS", was referred 
to the Committee on Higher Education 
and the Arts. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1236) recommending that H.R. 
No. 260, as amended in HD 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 260, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING THE LEGISLATIVE 
REFERENCE BUREAU TO STUDY THE 
STATE OF SMALL BUSINESS IN 
HAWAII", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1237) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 147, as amended in HD 1, be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
147, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE 
BUREAU TO STUDY THE STATE OF 
SMALL BUSINESS IN HAWAII", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
majority of the Committee on Labor 
and Public Employment, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1238) 
recommending that H.R. No. 135 be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and H.R. No. 135, entitled: 
"HOUSE RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
STATE AGENCIES TO DIVEST STATE 
MONEYS FROM SOUTH AFRICAN 
INVESTMENTS", was referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
majority of the Committee on Labor 
and Public Employment, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1239) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 74 be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and H.C.R. No. 74, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING STATE AGENCIES TO 
DIVEST STATE MONEYS FROM 
SOUTH AFRICAN INVESTMENTS", 
was referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTION 

A resolution (H.R. No. 467) honor­
ing the veterans of the Abraham 
Lincoln Battalion on the 50th an­
niversary of its founding was jointly 
offered by Representatives Hagino, 
Andrews, Bunda, Cachola, Crozier, 
Fukunaga, Hashimoto, Hayes, Hiraki, 
Hirono, Honda, D. Ige, Isbell, 
Kanoho, Lee, Leong, Liu, Metcalf, 
O'Kieffe, Oshiro, Pfeil, Say, Shito, 
Shon, Souki and Tajiri and was read 
by the Clerk. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Metcalf and carried, H. R. No. 467 
was adopted. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of reconsid­
ering action previously taken. 

RECONSIDERATION OF 
ACTIONS TAKEN 

Representative Shito moved that the 
House reconsider its action taken 
previously in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to House Bill No. 1795, HD 1, 
seconded by Representative Souki and 
carried. 

At 1:30 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

Upon reconvening at 1: 31 o'clock 
p.m., Representative Shito gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to House Bill No. 1795, HD 1. 

Representative Shon moved that the 
House reconsider its action taken 
previously in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to House Bill No. 46, HD 2, seconded 
by Representative Fukunaga and 
carried. 
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Representative Shon then gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to House Bill No. 46, HD 2. 

Representative Honda moved that 
the House reconsider its action taken 
previously in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to House Bill No. 14, HD 2, seconded 
by Representative Fukunaga and 
carried. 

Representative Honda then gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to House Bill No. 14, HD 2. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

At this time, the following an­
nouncements were made to the mem­
bers of the House : 

Representative Hagino: "In a few 
minutes, there will be a Judiciary 
Committee hearing in Room 328 this 
afternoon. Decision- making to fol­
low." 

Representative Hayes: "Your 
Housing Committee will be meeting 
tomorrow afternoon at 1: 30 in Room 
416. Decision- making will follow if 
time permits." 

Representative Fukunaga : "Your 
Committee on Finance will have 
decision-making this afternoon on bills 
previously heard at 1 : 30 in Room 
306." 

Representative Tungpalan: "This is 
to alert the Policy members that there 
will be a very important Policy 
meeting tonight from 7: 00 to 8: 00." 

Representative Hiraki: "Your 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce will begin Conference 
Committee meetings from 3: 00 to 6: 00 
in Senate Conference Room 3, on bills 
relating to banking, credit cards and 
licensees. We will then be moving to 
Senate Conference Room 6 at 6: 00 
p. m. to discuss bills relating to the 
residential landlord-tenant code; and 
at 8: 30 we will be moving over to 
Senate Conference Room 3 to discuss 
bills relating to insurance." 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 1:32 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo , seconded by 
Representative Anderson and carried, 
the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11:00 o'clock a.m. 
tomorrow, Thursday, April 16, 1987. 
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FIFTY-FOURTH DAY 

Thursday, April 16, 1987 

The House of Representatives of 
the Fourteenth Legislature of the 
State of Hawaii, Regular Session of 
1987, convened at 11: 16 o'clock 
a. m., with the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked 
by the Reverend Renate Rose, 
Association Minister, Oahu Asso­
ciation of the United Church of 
Christ, after which the Roll was 
called showing all members present 
with the exception of Representa­
tives Alcon, Arakaki, Horita, D. 
Ige, Ibara, Say, Souki and Tajiri 
who were excused. 

By unanimous consent, reading 
and approval of the Journal of the 
House of Representatives of the 
Fifty-Third Day was deferred. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications 
from the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 
753 and 754) were read by the 
Clerk and were disposed of as 
follows: 

A communication from the 
Senate (Sen. Com. No. 753) trans­
mitting Senate Concurrent Resolu­
tion No. 35, SDl, requesting a 
study on the feasibility of man­
dating motor vehicle insurance 
premium discounts for safe driving 
courses, which was adopted by the 
Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 35, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 754) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
37, SD1, requesting a study to 
review the laws and procedures 
regarding professional peer review 
in Hawaii, which was adopted by 
the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S. C.R. No. 37, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

At this time, the following 
introductions were made to the 
members of the House: 

Representative Yoshimura, on 

behalf of Representative Alcon and 
himself, introduced fifty-four 
fourth grade students from Kalihi­
Waena School accompanied by their 
teachers, Mrs. Sally Tokita, Mrs. 
Rita Meheula and Mrs. Jean No­
wiki. 

Representative Hagino, on behalf of 
Representative Taniguchi and himself, 
introduced fifty-five students from 
the Hawaiian Studies class of Mid­
Pacific Institute accompanied by their 
teacher, Anson Chong, "a former 
colleague in this Legislature. 11 

Representative Lee introduced 200 
members of the Mililani High School 
Band, "they can't fit in here today; 
they're outside preparing for the 
noon concert. " The band will repre­
sent Hawaii at the 200th anniversary 
celebration of the U.S. Constitution." 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

DEFERRED RESOLUTIONS 

The following Senate concurrent 
resolutions were disposed of as fol­
lows: 

S.C.R. Nos. Referred to: 

18 Committee on Finance 

35 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

37 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

COMMITTEE REASSIGNMENTS 

The following resolutions and con­
current resolutions were re-referred 
as follows: 

H.R. Nos. Re-referred to: 

347 Committee on Planning, 
Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

352 Jointly to the Committees on 
Planning, Energy and Environmental 
Protection and Consumer Protection 
and Commerce 

397 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Environmental 
Protection 

H.C.R. Nos. 

209 Committee on Planning, 
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Energy and Environmental Protec­
tion 

212 Jointly to the Committees on 
Planning, Energy and Environmental 
Protection and Consumer Protection 
and Commerce 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
a certain resolution out of order. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTION 

The following resolution (H.R. No. 
468) was read by the Clerk and 
disposed of as follows: 

A resolution ( H. R. No. 468) congra­
tulating and honoring Deborah McCol­
lough Kamisato was jointly offered by 
Representatives Lee, O'Kieffe and 
Kihano. 

On motion 
seconded by 
and carried, 
adopted. 

by Representative Lee, 
Representative O'Kieffe 

H.R. No. 468 was 

Representative Lee then rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, it's my pleasure and 
honor today to introduce the new 
generation of people in Mililani. You 
have seen the first graders of Mili­
lani, the high school band, the senior 
citizens. And today, it's the turn 
for the young, rising new leaders, 
and I can speak about Deborah with a 
great deal of fondness that she is 
going to represent us in Mililani in 
the future. 

"When she won election to the board 
of directors of the Mililani Town 
Association, it marked, I think, the 
maturation of our society in Mililani 
by the fact that she was born and 
raised there, went through the public 
schools, is a product of the Univer­
sity of Hawaii, and now she has 
embarked on a new career." 

Representative Lee then introduced 
the honoree, Ms. Kamisato who was 
asked to stand and be recognized. 
Accompanying Ms. Kamisato were her 
father, Arte, from Waimea; her sis­
ter, Donna, a student at Chaminade, 
and a very good friend and campaign 
manager, Leona Soto. 

Representative O'Kieffe then rose to 
add these comments: 

"Mr. Speaker, it is my pleasure to 
assist Representative Lee in his 
presentation. 

"It's always nice to have a friend 
who, being the father, did have 
something to do with the honoree 
today. 

"Her father and sister are neigh­
bors of mine from Kamuela and I 
would like to take this moment to 
thank them very much for the maile 
lei which is just another example of a 
good thing that comes from the Big 
Island. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

Floral leis were presented to the 
honoree by Representative Hiraki; to 
Donna by Representative Liu; to Mr. 
McCollough by Representative Maru­
moto; and to Ms. Soto by Representa­
tive O'Kieffe. A certified copy of the 
resolution was presented to Ms. 
Kamisato by Representative Lee. 

At 11:28 o'clock a.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
extending our warm welcome to our 
honorees this morning. " 

Upon reconvening at 12: 01 o'clock 
p. m. , the Chair directed the Clerk to 
note the presence of Representatives 
Horita, D, Ige, Souki and Tajiri. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representatives Apo, 
seconded by Representatives Ander­
son and carried, the rules were 
suspended for the purpose of consid­
ering bills on Third and Final Read­
ing on the basis of a modified consent 
calendar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

H.B. No. 1528, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 736, HDl, SD2, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1257, HDl, SD1, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 



HOUSE JOURNAL ~ 5 4 t h DAY 

deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 578, HD1, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1230, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 1740, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 1924, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 211, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 1151, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1617, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 463, SDl, on Final Read­
ing: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1150, HD2, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1511, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

H.B. No. 891, SDl, on Final Read­
ing: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred until April 27, 1987. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1240) recommending that H.R. 
No. 113, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 113, HD1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING CONSID­
ERATION OF THE ESTABLISHMENT 
OF AN AIRCRAFT MAINTENANCE 
OPERATION", was adopted. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1241) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 60, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 60, HD1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING CONSIDERATION OF 
THE ESTABLISHMENT OF AN AIR­
CRAFT MAINTENANCE OPERATION", 
was adopted. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1242) recommending 
that H.R. No. 90 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 90 entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION RELATING TO INCREASING 
RECOGNITION FOR HAWAII NA-
TIONAL GUARD MEMBERS", was 
adopted. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor an Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1243) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 50 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 50 entitled: "HOUSE 
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CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RELAT­
ING TO INCREASING RECOGNITION 
FOR HAWAII NATIONAL GUARD 
MEMBERS", was adopted. 

Representatives Crozier and Tam, 
for the Committees on Intergovern­
mental Relations and Education, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1244) recommending that 
H.R. No. 179, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Cro­
zier. seconded by Representative Tam 
and carried. the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H. R. No. 
179, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING INFORMATION 
FROM THE CAMPBELL ESTATE CON­
CERNING THE EDUCATIONAL NEEDS 
CREATED BY THEIR EWA DEVELOP­
MENT PLANS", was adopted. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1245) recommending that H. R. 
No. 232 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 232 entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
THE NECESSITY AND FEASIBILITY 
OF MANDATORY REPORTING AND 
FOLLOW-UP OF SUSPECTED ABUSE 
OR NEGLECT OF DEPENDENT OR 
FRAIL ADULTS WHO ARE UNDER 
SIXTY-FIVE YEARS OF AGE", was 
adopted. 

Representatives Hagino and Shon, 
for the Committees on Human Services 
and Health, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1246) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 204, as 
amended in HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino. seconded by Representative 
Shon and carried, the joint report of 
the Committees was adopted and H. R. 
No. 204, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
OF THE WAYS IN WHICH THE STATE 
CAN ASSIST THE OPERATIONS OF 
ADULT RESIDENTIAL CARE HOMES", 
was adopted. 

Representatives Honda and Oshiro, 
for the Committees on Agriculture and 
Transportation, presented a joint 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1247) 
recommending that H.R. No. 138 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Oshiro 

and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
138 entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY TO DETER­
MINE THE FEASIBILITY OF IM­
PROVING AIR FREIGHT FACILITIES 
AND EXPANDING REEFER FACILITIES 
AT GENERAL LYMAN FIELD IN HILO, 
HAWAII", was adopted. 

Representatives Honda and An­
drews, for the Committees on Agri­
culture and Planning, Energy and 
Environmental Protection, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1248) recommending that H.R. No. 
257, as amended in HDl. be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Andrews 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
257, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF AGRICULTURE TO EVAL­
UATE ITS PRODUCE, FEED, EGG, 
MEAT AND POULTRY INSPECTION, 
PESTICIDE ENFORCEMENT AND 
PLANT QUARANTINE PROGRAMS", 
was adopted. 

Representatives Honda and An­
drews, for the Committees on Agri­
culture and Planning. Energy and 
Environmental Protection, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1249) recommending that H. C.R. No. 
148, as amended in HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Andrews 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 148, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
AGRICULTURE TO EVALUATE ITS 
PRODUCE, FEED, EGG, MEAT AND 
POULTRY INSPECTION, PESTICIDE 
ENFORCEMENT AND PLANT QUARAN­
TINE PROGRAMS", was adopted. 

Representatives Taniguchi and Tam, 
for the Committees on Higher Educa­
tion and the Arts and Education. 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1250) recommending that 
H.R. No. 108 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tani­
guchi, seconded by Representative 
Tam and carried. the joint report of 
the Committees was adopted and H. R. 
No. 108 entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF EDUCATION AND THE 
UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII TO CON­
DUCT A JOINT STUDY OF ADULT 
EDUCATION EFFORTS", was adopted. 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
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Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1251) recommending 
that H.R. No. 188 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tani­
guchi, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 188 entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING THE UNIVER­
SITY OF HAWAII TO DEVELOP AND 
IMPLEMENT AN EDUCATIONAL AS­
SESSMENT PROGRAM", was adopted. 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1252) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 110 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tani­
guchi, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 110 entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII TO DEVELOP AND IMPLE­
MENT AN EDUCATIONAL AS­
SESSMENT PROGRAM", was adopted. 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1253) recommending 
that H.R. No. 103, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tani­
guchi, seconded by Representative 
'Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 103, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION URGING THE BOARD 
OF REGENTS TO CONSIDER EST AB­
LISHING A PERMANENT CAMPUS FOR 
WEST OAHU COLLEGE", was adopted, 
with Representatives Hemmings and 
Liu registering a "no" vote. 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1254) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 56, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tani­
guchi, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 56, HDl, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
URGING THE BOARD OF REGENTS 
TO CONSIDER ESTABLISHING A 
PERMANENT CAMPUS FOR WEST 
OAHU COLLEGE", was adopted, with 
Representatives Hemmings and Liu 
registering a "no" vote. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1255) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 40, as amended in HDl, 
be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Fuku­
naga, seconded by Representative 
Souki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 40, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING A LEGISLATIVE AGENCY 
STUDY", was adopted. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1256) recommending that 
H.R. No. 12, HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Fuku­
naga, seconded by Representative 
Souki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
12, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING A FINAN­
CIAL, MANAGEMENT, AND PROGRAM 
AUDIT OF THE STATE FOUNDATION 
OF CULTURE AND THE ARTS", was 
adopted. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand . Com. 
Rep. No. 1257) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 5, HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Fuku­
naga, seconded by Representative 
Souki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 5, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING A FINANCIAL, MANAGE­
MENT, AND PROGRAM AUDIT OF 
THE STATE FOUNDATION ON CUL­
TURE AND THE ARTS", was adopted. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1258) recommending that 
H.R. No. 71, HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Fuku­
naga, seconded by Representative 
Souki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R . No. 
71, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING AN AUDIT OF 
ADMINISTRATIVE STAFFING IN THE 
STATE AND DISTRICT OFFICES OF 
THE DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION", 
was adopted. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
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Rep. No. 1259) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 43, HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Fuku­
naga, seconded by Representative 
Souki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 43, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING AN AUDIT OF ADMINI­
STRATIVE STAFFING IN THE STATE 
AND DISTRICT OFFICES OF THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION", was 
adopted. 

Representatives Bunda and Levin, 
for the Committees on Ocean and 
Marine Resources and Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian Af­
fairs, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1260) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 77, as 
amended in HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Bunda, seconded by Representative 
Levin and carried, the joint report of 
the Committees was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 77, HDl, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
AUTHORIZING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
LAND AND NATURAL RESOURCES TO 
DISPOSE BY WAY OF AN EASEMENT, 
CERTAIN GOVERNMENT SUBMERGED 
LANDS AND LANDS BENEATH TIDAL 
WATERS FOR PURPOSES OF CON­
STRUCTING CERTAIN OFFSHORE 
IMPROVEMENTS", was adopted. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1261) recommending 
that H.R. No. 157 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Bunda, seconded by Representative 
Hashimoto and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 157 entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING THE SUPPORT 
OF HAWAII'S CONGRESSIONAL DEL­
EGATION FOR THE RESTORATION OF 
FEDERAL FUNDS FOR OCEAN RE­
SEARCH", was adopted. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1262) recommending 
that H.R. No. 176, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Bunda, seconded by Representative 
Hashimoto and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 176, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION URGING CONGRES­
SIONAL SUPPORT FOR THE DEVEL­
OPMENT OF A STATE-OF-THE-ART 

APPLIED AQUACULTURE RESEARCH 
FACILITY AT THE OCEANIC IN­
STITUTE", was adopted. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1263) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 104, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Bunda, seconded by Representative 
Hashimoto and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 104, HDl, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
URGING CONGRESSIONAL SUPPORT 
FOR THE DEVELOPMENT OF A 
STATE-OF-THE-ART APPLIED AQUA­
CULTURE RESEARCH FACILITY AT 
THE OCEANIC INSTITUTE", was 
adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1264) recommending that H.R. 
No. 143, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 143, 
HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE ECONOMIC DEVEL­
OPMENT CORPORATION OF HONO­
LULU TO CATALOGUE HONOLULU'S 
SPACE-RELATED BUSINESS ASSETS 
AND PROMOTE THEM ON THE MAIN­
LAND AND ABROAD", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1265) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 81, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
81, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COR­
PORATION OF HONOLULU TO DATA­
LOGUE HONOLULU'S SPACE-RELATED 
BUSINESS ASSETS AND PROMOTE 
THEM ON THE MAINLAND AND 
ABROAD", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1266) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 55 be adopted. 
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On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
55 entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
ON THE FEASIBILITY OF A LAND 
EXCHANGE BETWEEN THE STATE 
AND ALEXANDER AND BALDWIN, 
INC., FOR THE PRESENT TWENTY­
FOUR ACRE SITE OF THE MAUI 
COUNTY FAIRGROUNDS IN KAHU­
LUI", was adopted. 

Representatives Metcalf and Tani­
guchi, for the Committees on Judi­
ciary and Higher Education and the 
Arts, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1267) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 21 be referred 
to the Committee on Legislative Man­
agement. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Taniguchi and carried, the joint 
report of the Committees was adopted 
and H.R. No. 21 entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
OF THE POSSIBLE FORMATION OF A 
SECOND PUBLIC DEFENDER PRO­
GRAM", was referred to the Com­
mittee on Legislative Management. 

Representatives Metcalf and Tani­
guchi, for the Committees on Judi­
ciary and Higher Education and the 
Arts, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1268) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 12 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Taniguchi and carried, the joint 
report of the Committees was adopted 
and H.C.R. No. 12 entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
POSSIBLE FORMATION OF A SECOND 
PUBLIC DEFENDER PROGRAM", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1269) 
recommending that H.R. No. 45 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
45 entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY ON THE 
FEASIBILITY OF LENGTHENING THE 
TERMS OF OFFICE OF ELECTED 
OFFICIALS AS A MEANS TO REDUCE 

CAMPAIGN SPENDING", was referred 
to the Committee on Legislative Man­
agement. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1270) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 26 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 26 entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY ON THE FEASIBILITY OF 
LENGTHENING THE TERMS OF OF­
FICE OF ELECTED OFFICIALS AS A 
MEANS TO REDUCE CAMPAIGN 
SPENDING", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1271) 
recommending that H. R. No. 47, as 
amended in HDl, be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
47, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING AN EXAMI­
NATION OF THE NEED FOR TWO 
LAND RECORDING SYSTEMS", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1272) 
recommending that H.C . R. No. 27, as 
amended in HDl, be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 27, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING AN EXAMINATION OF THE 
NEED FOR TWO LAND RECORDING 
SYSTEMS", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

THIRD READING 

At 12:12 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Apo asked for a recess, and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:15 o'clock p.m. 
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The following bills, which were on 
the calendar for Third Reading, were 
read throughout, and the following 
actions taken: 

S.B. No. 1435: 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, S.B. No. 1435, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO PSYCHOLOGY", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 42 ayes 
to 5 noes, with Representatives 
Anderson, Cachola, Cavasso, Hem­
mings and Peters voting no, and with 
Representatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara 
and Say being excused. 

S.B. No. 258, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, S.B. No. 258, SD1, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO FOOD, DRUGS, AND 
COSMETICS", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B . Nos . 1435 and 258 had 
passed Third Reading at 12: 17 o'clock 
p.m. 

S.B. No. 1733, SD1: 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, S.B. No. 1733, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CONTROLLED SUB­
STANCES", passed Third Reading by 
a vote of 47 ayes, with Representa­
tives Alcon, Arakaki, Ibara and Say 
being excused. 

S.B. No. 349, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, S.B. No. 349, SDl, 
entitled:. "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE DIRECTOR OF 
HEALTH", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 45 ayes to 2 noes, with 
Representatives Bunda and Peters 
voting no, and with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 1733 and 349 had 
passed Third Reading at 12: 18 o'clock 
p.m. 

S.B. No. 1749, SDl: 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, S.B. No. 1749, 
SDl, entitled: 11 A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO TRAFFIC SAFE­
TY", passed Third Reading by a vote 
of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki , Ibara and Say being 
excused. 

S.B. No. 156, SD1: 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, S.B. No. 156, 
SD1, entitled : "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO SALVAGED VEHI­
CLES", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 1749 and 156 had 
passed Third Reading at 12: 19 o'clock 
p.m. 

S.B. No. 1176, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, S.B. No. 
1176, SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO COLLECTIVE 
BARGAINING", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 46 ayes to 1 no, with 
Representative Peters voting no, and 
with Representatives Alcon, Arakaki, 
!hara and Say being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 1176 had passed 
Third Reading at 12:20 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 1388, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, S. B. No. 
1388, SDl, entitled: 11 A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC 
OFFICERS AND EMPLOYEES", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Alcon, Arakaki, 
!hara and Say being excused. 

S.B. No. 999: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, S.B. No. 999, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO REEMPLOYMENT AND 
RECALL LISTS", passed Third Read­
ing by a vote of 47 ayes, with Repre­
sentatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and 
Say being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
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note that S. B. Nos. 1388 and 999 had 
passed Third Reading at 12: 21 o'clock 
p.m. 

S.B. No. 310: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, S. B. No. 310, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE BOILER AND 
ELEVATOR SAFETY LAW", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 46 ayes 
to 1 no , with Representative Ander­
son voting no, and with Representa­
tives Alcon, Arakaki, Ibara and Say 
being excused. 

S.B. No. 307, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, S.B. No. 307, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO JOB APPLICA­
TION PROCESSING FEES", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Alcon, Arakaki , 
!hara and Say being excused. 

S.B. No. 309, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Yoshimura and carried, S.B. No. 309, 
SDl , entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE HAWAII 
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND 
HEALTH LAW", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 46 ayes to 1 no, with 
Representative Anderson voting no, 
and with Representatives Alcon, 
Arakaki, !hara and Say being ex­
cused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 310; 307; and 
309 had passed Third Reading at 
12:22 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 448, SDl : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

At 12:23 o'clock p.m . , Representa­
tive Liu asked for a recess, and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:24 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 1001, SDl : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1224, SDl : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 444 , SDl: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 393, SDl: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 419: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 522: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 525, SDl: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 632, SDl: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S . B. No. 727, SDl : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 877, SDl: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 956, SDl: 

By unanimous consent , action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1023, SDl : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1526, SD2: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 
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S.B. No. 450: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 451: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 521: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 452, SD1 : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 11, SD1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day, 

S.B. No. 216, SD1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 368: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 366, SD1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 365, SD1: 

By unanimous consent , action was 
deferred one day. 

S . B. No. 856, SD1 : 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 856, 
SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO ORGANJZED 
CRIME", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say being 
excused. 

S.B. No. 66: 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 66, 

entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE JUDICIARY", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Alcon, 
Arakaki, Ihara and Say being ex­
cused. 

S.B. No. 65 : 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 65, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO FAMILY COURT", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Alcon, 
Arakaki, Ihara and Say being ex­
cused. 

S . B. No. 45: 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S. B. No. 45, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE LEGAL STATUS 
OF PERSONS", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say 
being excused. 

S.B. No. 125: 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 125, 
entitled : "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TORTS", passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, with 
Representatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara 
and Say being excused. 

S.B. No. 784: 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 784, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO GAMBLING OF-
FENSES", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, !hara and Say being 
excused. 

S.B. No. 1095, SD1: 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 1095, 
SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO PENAL RESPON­
SIBILITY AND FITNESS TO PRO­
CEED", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, !hara and Say being 
excused. 

S.B. No. 436, SD1: 

On motion by Representative Met-
calf, seconded by Representative 
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Hagino and carried, S. B. No. 436, 
SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO AMENDING VAR­
IOUS PROVISIONS OF THE HAWAII 
REVISED STATUTES TO CORRECT 
REFERENCES TO REPEALED CHAP­
TER 191, HAWAII REVISED STA­
TUTES", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, !hara and Say being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 856; 66; 65; 45; 
125; 784; 1095; and 436 had passed 
Third Reading at 12; 33 o'clock p. m. 

S.B. No. 1145: 

Representative Metcalf moved that 
S.B. No. 1145 pass Third Reading, 
seconded by Representative Hagino. 

Representative Crozier then rose 
and requested that his oral remarks 
against the bill, which was stated 
yesterday, be again inserted into the 
Journal, and the Chair, noting that 
there were no objections, "so or­
dered." 

The 
Crozier, 
follows: 

remarks 
against 

of 
the 

Representative 
bill, are as 

"Mr. Speaker, in my office I have, 
above the inner door, a quote from 
Chief Justice Lewis Brandeis which he 
stated in 1928 and it goes: 'The 
greatest danger to liberty lurks in 
insidious encroachment by men of 
zeal, well-meaning, but without 
understanding.' 

"Mr. Speaker, this bill represents a 
well-meant intent to become more 
efficient in the election process. 
However, I think it goes a little bit 
too far. It does two things, sir. 
First of all, it gives the Lieutenant 
Governor the right to combine both 
charter amendments and constitutional 
amendments on the same card. What 
happens then, sir, is you mix, or 
you co-mingle, State issues and City 
and County issues. I can see people 
making judgment decisions in the 
ballot box and being confused on 
what they are voting on, what gov­
ernment they are voting for or 
against, or the issue which relates to 
whatever government. 

"The other concern, sir, is one the 
ballots for the Primary Elections 
where you are going to include pri­
marily for the minor parties--Liber­
tarian Parties--put them on the same 
ballot as the non-partisan ballots. 
You know, there are a few. 

"I also can see the potential for 
confusion from the voters. Mr. 
Speaker, maybe some of the more 
mature members can remember when 
we had the open primary prior to 
having the closed primary. I remem­
ber my Mom and my Dad and my 
uncles and aunties talking about how 
people spoiled their ballots because 
they didn't realize they were not 
allowed to cross over. In the Pri­
mary, you're just supposed to go 
down one column but some people 
accidentally made the mistake and 
jumped over and that nullified their 
ballots. 

"Mr. Speaker, what we are sup­
posed to be doing, when it comes to 
voting, we are supposed to minimize 
any chances of error. You know, 
there is an old saying that all of us 
use when we campaign and we all 
should use all the time and that's the 
'kiss' formula keep it simple, 
stupid! Okay, we got to keep it 
simple so that we don't make mis­
takes, and if we have the potential of 
making mistakes, we are supposed to 
keep it simple so that the voters also 
will not make mistakes. 

"Members, realize this is on 
Second Reading but I would like for 
you folks to pay attention and take a 
look at this bill and tomorrow, when 
we vote on Third Reading, you'll 
understand where I'm coming from. 

"Thank you very much, sir." 

Representative Liu then rose to 
speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I concur with the 
sentiments expressed by Representa­
tive Crozier yesterday, but also 
indicate that should this bill pass-­
just to reiterate for the record--! do 
think the intent is to not co-mingle 
the ballots or the names of candidates 
from the two major parties. I think 
it would be a mistake. I also have 
problems with even co-mingling the 
names of candidates on the minor 
parties or nonpartisans, and I think 
the committee report is unclear be­
cause it does talk about constitutional 
amendments and City and County 
amendments although the bill itself 
does not really mention those items. 
But if that is also the intent, I think 
the bill is unclear, the committee 
report is unclear and I would hope 
that the bill does not pass, but 
should it pass, I hope that the words 
that I just expressed will be consid­
ered as part of the legislative history 
of this measure. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker. " 
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Representative Marumoto then rose 
to speak against the measure, stat­
ing: 

"Mr. Speaker, I'm just wondering 
that if there was a major party where 
all the races did not fit on one ballot 
and it spilled over to a second ballot 
with some other parties, if there 
would be some violent objections to 
that, and I think that if people think 
in those terms, there would be more 
no votes, so I would strongly urge 
you to reconsider your vote on this 
particular measure. 

11 Thank you very much." 

Representative Lee then rose to 
speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I would like to rise 
to speak against the bill and associate 
myself with the remarks made by 
Representative Crozier. 

"I think the remarks are suffi­
ciently serious to warrant further 
consideration and study before we 
proceed with something so serious. 
There is something fundamental about 
voting. It should be clear and 
honest rather than something that is 
adopted in haste and simply to cut 
costs. 

"I would like to be recorded as 
opposing this bill, Mr. Speaker." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and S. B. No. 1145, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO BALLOTS", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 38 ayes 
to 9 noes, with Representatives 
Anderson, Crozier, Isbell, Lee, 
Leong, Liu, Marumoto, Medeiros and 
O'Kieffe voting no, and with Repre­
sentatives Alcon, Arakaki, !hara and 
Say being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. No. 1139 had passed 
Third Reading at 12:36 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 1139: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 82: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S.B. No. 82, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
TAXATION", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say 

being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 82 had passed 
Third Reading at 12:37 o'clock p.m. 

At 12:37 o'clock p.m., Represen­
tative Metcalf asked for a recess, and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:38 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 81, SD!: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S.B. No. 81, SD!, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO TAXATION", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Alcon, Arakaki, 
!hara and Say being excused. 

S.B. No. 140: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S. B. No. 140, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
ACT 347, SESSION LAWS OF HA­
WAII", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, !hara and Say being 
excused. 

S.B. No. 138, SD!: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S.B. No. 138, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE GENERAL FUND 
EXPENDITURE CEILING", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Alcon, Arakaki, 
Ihara and Say being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 81; 140; and 138 
had passed Third Reading at 12: 38 
o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 143: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S.B. No. 143, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
TAXATION", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say 
being excused. 

S.B. No. 370, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
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seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S.B. No. 370, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO PRIVATE ACTIVITY", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Alcon, 
Arakaki, I hara and Say being ex­
cused. 

S,B. No, 1757, SDl: 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, S.B. No. 1757, SDl, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CAPITAL LOAN PRO­
GRAM", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Alcon, Arakaki, !hara and Say being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 143; 370; and 
1757 had passed Third Reading at 
12:39 o'clock p.m. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1273) 
recommending that H.R. No. 395 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
395 entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING AN INVESTIGATION OF 
THE EXTENT OF TORT CLAIMS 
AGAINST NONPROFIT SPORTS OR­
GANIZATIONS AND THEIR VOLUN­
TEERS IN HAWAII AND ON THE 
MAINLAND", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No, 1274) 
recommending that H.R. No, 394 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management, 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
394 entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A REVIEW OF THE 
TREATMENT OF SPOUSE ABUSE IN 
HAWAII AND OTHER JURISDIC­
TIONS", was referred to the Com­
mittee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1275) 

recommending that H.R. No. 391 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
391 entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING AN INTERIM STUDY OF 
HAWAII LAWS PERTAINING TO THE 
RIGHT OF PRIVACY AND OPEN 
ACCESS TO GOVERNMENT RE­
CORDS", was referred to the Com­
mittee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1276) 
recommending that H.R. No. 293, as 
amended in HDl, be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
293, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING INTERIM 
HEARINGS AND REVIEW OF CHILD 
AND SPOUSE ABUSE TREATMENT 
AND PREVENTION LAWS AND PRO­
GRAMS", was referred to the Commit­
tee on Legislative Management, 

At 12:40 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Levin asked for a recess, and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:40 o'clock p.m. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No, 1277) recommending that H.C.R, 
No. 87, as amended in HDl, be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
87, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A FOLLOW-UP AUDIT OF THE OFFICE 
OF HAWAIIAN AFFAIRS", was re­
ferred to the Committee on Legislative 
Management. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1278) recommending that S.C.R. 
No. 13, SDl, as amended in HDl, be 
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referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Crozier, on behalf of 
all the veterans in the House, rose 
and requested for a conflict of in­
terest ruling, and the Chair ruled, 
"no conflict. 11 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. C.R. No. 
13, SDI, HDl, entitled: "SENATE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING THAT THE OFFICE OF 
THE LEGISLATIVE AUDITOR CON­
DUCT AN ASSESSMENT OF SUITABLE 
LAND SITES IN CENTRAL OAHU, 
APPROPRIATE FOR THE DEVEL­
OPMENT OF A STATE VETERANS 
CEMETERY", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Hagino: "The 
Committee on Human Services will be 
holding a public hearing on Monday, 
April 20, 1987, at 8:30 a,m., in 
Conference Room 416. Decision 
making to follow if time permits." 

Representative Hiraki: "The Com­
mittee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce will be having a public 
hearing this afternoon at 1: 30 in 
Conference Room 328. Decision 
making to follow if time permits." 

Representative Hayes: "The Com­
mittee on Housing is meeting--sche­
duled at 1: 30 p. m. , this afternoon in 
Room 416. Decision making will follow 
if time permits." 

Representative Tungpalan: "There 
will be a policy meeting immediately 
following this session. Lunch will be 
served at the expense of all the 
policy members. " 

Representative Bunda: "The Com­
mittees on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources and Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs and 
Transportation will be having a 
hearing on Saturday at 10: 00 o'clock 
a. m. , in Room 416 on various resolu­
tions. Decision making to follow if 
time permits. 11 

Representative Lee: "The Commit­
tee on Education will hold a public 
hearing on a long number of resolu­
tions this Saturday at 8: 30 o'clock 
a.m., in Room 328. Decision making 

to follow if time permits." 

Representative Crozier: "The 
Committees on Intergovernmental 
Relations and Water, Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs will 
have a hearing tomorrow at 8: 30 in 
the morning and then after that the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations will have hearings on other 
resolutions. 11 

Representative Levin: "May 
request the waiver of the 48-hour 
notice on several resolutions that we 
would like to have heard tomorrow 
and they have been posted, 11 and the 
Chair, "so ordered." 

"Mr. Speaker, we will have a 
hearing of the Water, Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs 
Committee tomorrow morning at 8: 45 
following the joint hearing with the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations. 11 

Representative D. Ige: "The 
Committees on Water, Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs, 
Housing and Community Development 
and Transportation will be holding a 
public hearing this afternoon at 1: 30 
p.m., in Conference Room 416. 
Decision making to follow if time 
permits." 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of reconsid­
ering action previously taken on a 
certain House Bill. 

RECONSIDERATION OF 
ACTION TAKEN 

Representative Hagino moved that 
the House reconsider its action pre­
viously taken in disagreeing to the 
amendments made by the Senate to 
H.B. No. 1510, HDl, seconded by 
Representative Okamura and carried. 

Representative Hagino then gave 
notice of his intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No, 1510, HDl. 

DISPOSITION OF MATTERS 
PLACED ON CLERK'S DESK 

By unanimous consent, H.B. No. 
46, HD2, SDI, was taken from the 
Clerk's desk. 
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On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Souki and 
carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 46, HD2, and H.B. No. 
46, HD2, SDl, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO TOBAC­
CO PRODUCTS", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 47 ayes, with Representa­
tives Alcon, Arakaki, Ihara and Say 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 46 had passed 
Final Reading at 12: 55 o'clock p. m. 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 12:56 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Anderson and carried, 
the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11:30 o'clock a.m., 
Monday, April 20, 1987. 
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FIFTY-FIFTH DAY 

Monday, April 20, 1987 

The House of Representatives of the 
Fourteenth Legislature of the State of 
Hawaii, Regular Session of 1987, 
convened at 11:45 o'clock a.m., with 
the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked by 
Mr. Tony Pelle, a member of the 
National Hawaii Baha'i Assembly, after 
which the Roll was called showing all 
members present with the exception of 
Representatives Fukunaga, Peters and 
Taniguchi, who were excused. 

By unanimous consent, reading and 
approval of the Journal of the House 
of Representatives of the Fifty-Fourth 
Day was deferred. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications from 
the Senate (Sen. Com. No. 755 to 
796) were read by the Clerk and were 
disposed of as follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 755) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 67, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 67, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 756) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 162 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 162, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 757) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 268 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 268, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 758) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 337, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 337, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 759) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 

by the House to S.B. No. 379, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 379, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 760) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 414 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 414, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 761) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 442 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 442, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 762) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 492, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 492, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 763) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 539, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 539, SD 1, HD l, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 764) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 565, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 565, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 765) informing the 
House that the amendments prpposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 568, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No, 568, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 766) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 589 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 589, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file . 
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A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 767) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 590, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 590, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 768) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 778 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 778, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 769) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 800, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 800, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 770) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 827, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 827, SD 1, HD 2, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 771) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 830, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 830, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 772) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 833, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 833, SD 1, HD l, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 773) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 934, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 934, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 774) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 959, SD l, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 959, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 775) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 979, SD 1, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 979, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 776) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 980, SD l, 
were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 980, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 777) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 982 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 982, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file . 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 778) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 997 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 997, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file . 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 779) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1024, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1024, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 780) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1079, SD 
l, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1079, SD l, HD l, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file, 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 781) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1146 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 1146, HD 2, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 782) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No, 1156, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1156, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 
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A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 783) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 1277, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1277, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 784) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1342, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1342, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 785) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 1372, SD 
2, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1372, SD 2, HD 2, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 786) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No, 1451, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1451, SD 1, HD 2, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 787) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1458, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1458, SD 1, HD 2, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 788) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 1518, SD 
2, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1518, SD 2, HD l, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 789) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1627, SD 
2, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1627, SD 2, HD 2, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 7 90) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 1708, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1708, SD 1, HD 2, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 791) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1711, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1711, SD 1, HD l, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 792) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 1722 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 1722, HD 1, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 793) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S. B. No. 1726 were 
agreed to by the Senate, and S. B. 
No. 1726, HD 2, passed Final Reading 
in the Senate on April 15, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 794) informing the 
House that the amendments proposed 
by the House to S.B. No. 1740, SD 
1, were agreed to by the Senate, and 
S.B. No. 1740, SD 1, HD 1, passed 
Final Reading in the Senate on April 
15, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 795) returning House 
Bill No. 708, HD 1, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
PRISONER'S PSYCHOLOGICAL CARE", 
which passed Third Reading in the 
Senate on April 15, 1987, was placed 
on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 796) returning House 
Bill No. 1327, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO YOUTH 
CORRECTIONAL FACILITIES", which 
passed Third Reading in the Senate 
on April 15, 1987, was placed on file. 

At this time, Representative Crozier 
introduced to the members of the 
House Mr. Max Sword, a lobbyist 
from Samoa, and his brother, Repre­
sentative Gerhard Sword, a member of 
the Samoa House of Representatives. 

At 11:50 o'clock a.m., Representa­
tive Apo asked for a recess and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

Upon reconvening at 11: 52 o'clock 
a. m. , the Chair directed the Clerk to 
note the presence of Representatives 
Fukunaga and Taniguchi. 
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ORDER OF THE DAY 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were suspend­
ed for the purpose of considering 
certain resolutions. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions 
Nos. 469 and 470) were read 
Clerk and were disposed of 
lows: 

(H.R. 
by the 
as fol-

A resolution (H.R. No. 469) honor­
ing the Central Oahu Jaycees and the 
winners of the Miss Central Oahu 
Scholarship Pageant was jointly of­
fered by Representatives Okamura, 
Anderson, Hagino, Hayes, Hiraki, 
Isbell, Levin, Oshiro, Shito, Taka­
mine, Taniguchi, Tungpalan, Yoshi­
mura and Kihano. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, H.R. No. 469 
was adopted. 

Representative Okamura rose and 
proceeded to introduce the honorees, 
stating: 

"Mr. Speaker and members, it is 
indeed an honor for us to have with 
us this morning the first Miss Central 
Oahu and the leaders of the Central 
Oahu Jaycees who have done a remark­
able job since organizing, I believe, 
only about two years ago," and asked 
the following persons to stand to be 
recognized: Miss Yvette Lee Napua­
alohanani Paik, first Miss Central 
Oahu; Mr. Perfecto Inciong, Chairman 
of the Board of Directors for the 
Central Oahu Jaycees and past Presi­
dent; Miss Kelly Lau, current Presi­
dent of the Central Oahu Jaycees; 
Mr. Tom Izon, Co-Chairman of the 
Central Oahu Jaycees Scholarship 
Pageant; and Mr. Joseph Kahoonei, 
Director of the Central Oahu Jaycees. 

Carnation leis were presented to 
Miss Paik by Representative Hiraki; 
to Mr. Inciong by Representative 
Hashimoto; to Miss Lau by Represen­
tative Apo; to Mr. Izon by Represen­
tative Marumoto; and to Mr. Kahoonei 
by Representative Fukunaga. Repre­
sentative Okamura presented the 
honorees with certified copies of the 
resolution. 

Representative Lee then rose and 
remarked: 

"Our honoree today, Miss Paik, is a 
native of Mililani and a graduate of 
the Mililani schools -- Mililani-Waena 
Elementary and Wheeler so we 
would like to claim her as one of our 
own too." 

A resolution (H.R. No. 470) con­
gratulating Bette Midler, the once and 
forever Divine Miss M was jointly 
offered by Representatives Hagino, 
Medeiros, Andrews, Apo, Arakaki, 
Cavasso, Hemmings, Hiraki, Hirono, 
D. Ige, Kanoho, Levin, Metcalf, 
Oshiro, Ribellia, Shito, Shon, Tani­
guchi, Tom and Kihano. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Anderson and carried, H.R. No. 470 
was adopted. 

At 11:58 o'clock a.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
offering our warm aloha to our hon­
orees this morning." 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12 : 18 o'clock p.m. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were suspend­
ed for the purpose of considering 
bills on Final and Third Readings on 
the basis of a modified consent cal­
endar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

H.B. No. 736, HD 1, SD 2: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 578, HD 1, SD 1 : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1924, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1151, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 463, SD 1: 
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By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1150, HD 2, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 14, HD 2, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1510, HD 1, SD 1: 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1510, HD 
1, and H.B. No. 1510 , HD l, SD 1, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO CHILD ABUSE", hav­
ing been read throughout, passed 
Final Reading- by a vote of 50 ayes, 
with Representative Peters being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1510 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:20 o'clock p.m. 

At 12:21 o'clock p.m., Represen­
tative Shito asked for a recess and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair . 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:23 o'clock p.m. 

H.B. No. 1795, HD 1, SD 1: 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the House agreed to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1795, HD 1, and H.B. 
No. 1795, HD 1, SD 1, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
HOUSING", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 50 ayes, with Representa­
tive Peters being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1795 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:25 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 448, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1001, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1224, SD 1 : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 444, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 393, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 419: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 522: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 525, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 632, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 727, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 877, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 956, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1023, SD 1 : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1526, SD 2 : 
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By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 450: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 451: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 521: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 452, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 11, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 216, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 368: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 366, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 365, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1279) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 259 be re­
ferred to the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 259, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 

REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH TO IMPROVE PROGRAMS 
RELATED TO FOOD AND DRUG 
INSPECTION", was referred to ·the 
Committee on Finance. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1280) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 150 be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
150, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH TO IM­
PROVE PROGRAMS RELATED TO 
FOOD AND DRUG INSPECTION", was 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

Representative Shito, for the Com­
mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1281) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 116, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 116, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING A REPORT BY 
THE CITY AND COUNTY OF HONO­
LULU ON THE HUNA STREET AND 
NUUANU PARK PLACE CON­
TROVERSY", was adopted. 

Representative Shito, for the Com­
mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1282) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 62, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted, 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
62, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A REPORT 
BY THE CITY AND COUNTY OF 
HONOLULU ON THE HUNA STREET 
AND NUUANU PARK PLACE CON­
TROVERSY", was adopted. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1283) 
recommending that H.R. No. 386 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 386, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
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REQUESTING THE HOUSE COMMITTEE 
ON FINANCE TO CONDUCT OVER­
SIGHT HEARINGS ON THE 1987 
APPROPRIATIONS ACTS OF THE 
EXECUTIVE, JUDICIARY AND OFFICE 
OF HAWAIIAN AFFAIRS", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1284) recommending 
that H.R. No. 434 be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
434, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF METHODS 
FOR PROVIDING INSURANCE TO 
HAWAII RESIDENTS LOCATED IN 
AREAS SUSCEPTIBLE TO NATURAL 
DISASTERS AND VANDALISM", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1285) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 268 be referred to 
the Committee on Legislative Manage­
ment. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 268, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY OF METHODS FOR PRO­
VIDING INSURANCE TO HAWAII 
RESIDENTS LOCATED IN AREAS 
SUSCEPTIBLE TO NATURAL DI­
SASTERS AND VANDALISM", was 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

At this time, the following an­
nouncements were made to the mem­
bers of the House: 

Representative D. Ige: "Your 
conferees on Senate Bill 242, SD 1, 
HD 1, will be meeting tomorrow at 
3: 00 p. m. in Conference Room 3. " 

Representative Leong: "Your 
Committee on Health will hold a public 
hearing tomorrow morning at 8: 30 in 
Conference Room 314. Decision­
making will follow if time permits." 

Representative Hirono: 
Consumer Protection and 

"Your 
Commerce 

Conference on various bills will 
resume our bilateral discussions this 
afternoon from 4:00 to 6:00 p.m. and 
from 8: 30 until midnight, and we will 
be following the Wednesday, April 
15th, agenda for today, Conference 
Room 328." 

Representative Takamine: "Your 
House Committee on Labor and Public 
Employment will be holding a public 
hearing tomorrow morning at 8: 30 
a.m. on several resolutions. Due to 
the lack of conference rooms, this will 
be in Senate Conference Room 2. 
Decision-making to follow if time 
permits." 

Representative Shito: "Your con-
ferees on House Bill No. 11 and 
House Bill No. 310 will meet today at 
3: 00 p. m. in Conference Room 416." 

Representative Ihara: "Your Com­
mittee on Intergovernmental Relations 
will be holding a public hearing 
tomorrow in Senate Conference Room 2 
at 10:00 a.m." 

At 12:30 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:31 o'clock p.m. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were suspend­
ed for the purpose of reconsidering 
action previously taken on certain 
House bills. 

RECONSIDERATION OF 
ACTION TAKEN 

Representative Oshiro moved that 
the House reconsider its action pre­
viously taken in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1519, seconded by 
Representative Souki and carried. 

Representative Oshiro then gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No, 1519. 

Representative Cachola moved that 
the House reconsider its action pre­
viously taken in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1421, HD 1, seconded by 
Representative Souki and carried. 

Representative Cachola then gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
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amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1421, HD 1. 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 12: 34 o'clock p. m. , on motion by 

Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Anderson and carried, 
the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11: 30 o'clock a.m. 
tomorrow, Tuesday, April 21, 1987. 
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FIFTY-SIXTH DAY 

Tuesday, April 21, 1987 

The House of Representatives of 
the Fourteenth Legislature of the 
State of Hawaii, Regular Session of 
1987, convened at 11: 48 o'clock 
a.m., with the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked 
by the Reverend David Twigg, 
Senior Minister, Kaumakapili 
Church, after which the Roll was 
called showing all members present 
with the exception of Representa­
tives Arakaki, Okamura, Taniguchi 
and Tungpalan who were excused. 

The Clerk proceeded to read the 
Journals of the House of Represen­
tatives of the Fifty-First and 
Fifty-Second Days. 

On motion by Representative 
Apo, seconded by Representative 
Anderson and carried, reading of 
the Journals was dispensed with 
and the Journals of the Fifty-First 
and Fifty-Second Days were ap­
proved. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications 
from the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 
797 to 802) were read by the Clerk 
and were disposed of as follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 797) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
21, SDl, requesting that the 
Hawaii Association of Realtors 
amend their standard form 
D.R.O.A. to provide notice of the 
terms of any reversionary or 
surrender clause, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 20, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, further 
action on s.C.R. No. 21, SDl, 
was deferred. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 798) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
51, requesting the creation of a 
separate standard federal region 
for Hawaii and the territories and 
insular possessions in the Pacific, 
which was adopted by the Senate 
on April 16, 1987, was placed on 
file. 

By unanimous consent, 
action on S.C.R. No. 
deferred. 

further 
51 was 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 799) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 54, 
recognizing Hanapepe as the Bougain­
villaea capital of the State of Hawaii, 
which was adopted by the Senate on 
April 16, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous 
action on S.C.R. 
ferred. 

consent, 
No. 54 

further 
was de-

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 800) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 66, 
SDl, requesting a study of the 
existing and planned uses of Leahi 
intended to enhance cultural and 
recreational enjoyment by the people, 
including an evaluation of the feasi­
bility of increasing public use and 
access by developing a golf facility 
within the crater, which was adopted 
by the Senate on April 16, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, further 
action on S.C.R. No. 66, SDl, was 
deferred. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 801) returning House 
Bill No. 477, HDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
THE RESIDENTIAL LANDLORD­
TENANT CODE", which passed Third 
Reading in the Senate on April 16, 
1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 802) returning House 
Bill No. 1233, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO NET 
FISHING IN HILO BAY", which 
passed Third Reading in the Senate 
on April 16, 1987, was placed on file. 

At this time, the following intro­
ductions were made to the members of 
the House: 

Representative Leong introduced 39 
students from Waialua High School's 
Social Studies class accompanied by 
their teacher, Mrs. Florence Ishii, 
and staff member, Ms. Kay Kajiwara. 

Representative Crozier introduced 
Mrs. Ah Quon McElrath, "a very 
special person in the labor movement 
in Hawaii and she will go down as one 
of the great ladies of Hawaii," and 
Mrs. Kathy Ishii, his sister, "who 
does not have the long track record 
of fighting for human rights and civil 
justice, but she is making her first 
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attempt at protecting the rights of 
the public." 

Representative Isbell introduced her 
nephew, Mr. Bob Craig, "who is an 
appointee by the governor on the 
State Board of Surveyors and Engi­
neers in Washington State and is here 
in Honolulu for a conference." He 
was accompanied by his wife, Maxine. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

COMMITTEE REASSIGNMENT 

The following resolution (H.R. No. 
358) was re-referred as follows: 

House Resolution No. 358 was 
re-referred to the Committee on Labor 
and Public Employment. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
certain resolutions out of order. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions (H.R. 
Nos. 471 and 472) were read by the 
Clerk and were disposed of as fol­
lows: 

A resolution (H.R. No. 471) congra­
tulating the Board of Acupuncture on 
its Thirteenth Anniversary was jointly 
offered by Representatives Tam, 
Alcon, Apo, Honda, D. Ige, Ihara, 
Jones, Kawakami, Okamura, O'Kieffe, 
Ribellia, Say, Shon, Tajiri and Yoshi­
mura. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Shon and 
carried, H.R. No. 471 was adopted. 

Representative 
stated: 

Tam rose and 

"Mr. Speaker, it is indeed a plea­
sure today ... usually one would say 
that number thirteen is a very un­
lucky number. For me, it is a very 
honorable number. 

"What we have before us is a 
profession that is recognized within 
the State of Hawaii and it's going to 
be recognized for its thirteenth year 
of existence. You are a credit to our 
State of Hawaii and as one who has 
received acupuncture in the past, let 
me assure you that you have been 
very helpful to the people of the 

State of Hawaii. 

"I can recall back in 1975 when I 
was involved in two freak accidents 
as a passenger in an automobile and, 
because of your profession, you have 
enabled me to be able to walk and to 
stand up straight. Prior to that I 
was in a back brace for over a year." 

At this time, the honorees were 
introduced to the members of the 
House as follows : Mr. Paul Condry, 
chairman; Dr. Bill Picard, member; 
Mr. Benny Fan, member; Mr. Randy 
Chun, member; Yaacov Tzror, mem­
ber; and Dr. Set win Tan, president 
of the Acupuncture Association of 
Hawaii. All were asked to stand and 
be recognized. 

Seated in the gallery and recog­
nized by Representative Tam was Mr. 
Jim Kobashigawa, executive secretary 
of the Board of Acupuncture of the 
State of Hawaii. 

Floral leis and certified copies of 
the resolution were presented to the 
honorees by Representatives Fuku­
naga, Hayes, Hirono, Isbell, Kawa­
kami and Marumoto. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 472) extend­
ing condolences to the family of the 
late Robert F. Ellis was jointly of­
fered by Representatives Marumoto, 
Crozier, Shon, Okamura, Souki, 
Hashimoto, Andrews, Fukunaga, Liu, 
Ihara, Alcon, and Cavasso. 

On motion by Representative Maru­
moto, seconded by Representative 
Crozier and carried, H. R. No. 4 72 
was adopted. 

Representative Marumoto rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, would like to 
mention that this is for the late Bob 
Ellis with whom several of us served 
in the Constitutional Convention and 
Representative Cavasso was a very 
good friend of his. So, I am very 
happy to move for the adoption of 
this resolution. " 

Representative Cavasso then rose 
and stated: 

"Mr. Bob Ellis was a very special 
person and a great servant in our 
community with a tremendous sense of 
humor that brought laughter to many 
activities and organizations in our 
community. A more humble man I 
have seldom known for it was not 
until he actually had passed on that I 
learned of all his many achievements­
--serving under the governor, serv-
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ing with the mayor, serving in the 
military--throughout his lifetime. He 
was a great man 8fl.El.· he's got a great 
family, and I appreciate this resolu­
tion that was passed by this House 
and his wife and family will appreciate 
it as well. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker. 11 

At 12:03 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
greeting our honorees this morning." 

Upon reconvening at 12: 53 o'clock 
p. m. , the Chair directed the Clerk to 
note the presence of Representative 
Tungpalan. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion of Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
bills on Third and Final Reading on 
the basis of a modified consent cal­
endar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

H.B. No. 736, HDl, SD2, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 578, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1924, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1151, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 463, SDl, on Final Read­
ing: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1150, HD2, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 14, HD2, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1421, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

DISPOSITION OF MATTER 
PLACED ON CLERK'S DESK 

By unanimous consent, 
1519, SDl, was taken 
Clerk's desk. 

H.B. 
from 

No. 
the 

On motion by Representative 
Oshiro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the House 
agreed to the amendments proposed 
by the Senate to H.B. No. 1519 and 
H.B. No. 1519, SDl, entitled: "A 
BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
VESSEL REGISTRATION FEES AND 
CHARGES", having been read 
throughout, passed Final Reading by 
a vote of 48 ayes, with Representa­
tives Arakaki, Okamura and Taniguchi 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that H.B. No. 1519 had passed 
Final Reading at 12:54 o'clock p.m. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

S.B. No. 448, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1001, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1224, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 444, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 
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By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 393, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 419, on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S. B. No. 522, on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 525, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

S.B. No. 450, on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 451, on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 521, on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 452, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 11, SDl, on Third Read-
By unanimous consent, action was ing: 

deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 632, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B . No. 727, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 877, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 956, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1023, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1526, SD2, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 216, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 368, on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 366, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 365, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand . 
Com. Rep. No. 1286) recommending 
that H. R. No. 61, as amended in 
HDl, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

On motion by Representative Hi-
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rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
61, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION URGING A UNIFORM EMER­
GENCY PHONE NUMBER "911" 
THROUGHOUT THE STATE OF HA­
WAII", was referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1287) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 34, as amended in 
HDl, be referred to the Committee on 
Finance. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 34, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION URGING 
A UNIFORM EMERGENCY PHONE 
NUMBER "911" THROUGHOUT THE 
STATE OF HAWAII", was referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1288) recommending 
that H. R. No. 271, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Cro­
zier, seconded by Representative 
I hara and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
271, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
A FORM OF GOVERNMENT FOR 
MOLOKAI THAT WOULD BE CONSIS­
TENT WITH THE NEEDS AND RE­
SOURCES OF THE ISLAND", was 
adopted. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1289) recommending 
that H. C.R. No. 157, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

Representative Pfeil then rose and 
requested that his written comments, 
in favor of H.R. No. 271, HDl, and 
H.C.R. No. 157, HDl, be inserted 
into the Journal, and the Chair, 
noting that were no objections, "so 
ordered." 

The remarks of Representative 
Pfeil, in favor of the resolutions, are 
as follows: 

"Mr. Speaker, I believe residents of 
Molokai feel removed from decision­
making that takes place in Wailuku 
and Honolulu. We need to feel a part 

of the political process, involved in 
decision-making, and plugged mto the 
economy. That is the goal oithese 
resolutions. 

"I believe government is most 
effective when it is closest to the 
people it serves. Therefore, it is 
good news for Molokai that an interim 
House/Senate committee will be deter­
mining the facts relating to forms of 
government for Molokai that may 
provide greater input and self-gov­
ernance for Molokai such as town­
ships, or neighborhood boards, or 
satellite city halls. 

"Mr. Speaker, 'autonomy' to me 
doesn't mean 'removed' or 'separated,' 
but does mean self-determination so 
we can all-the-better participate in 
State and County government, and be 
involved in the larger scheme of 
things." 

On motion by Representative Cro­
zier, seconded by Representative 
!hara and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 157, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING A STUDY OF A FORM OF 
GOVERNMENT FOR MOLOKAI THAT 
WOULD BE CONSISTENT WITH THE 
NEEDS AND RESOURCES OF THE 
ISLAND", was adopted. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1290) 
recommending that H.R. No. 161 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Hagino 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 161 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
URGING THE ESTABLISHMENT OF 
BUSINESS-EDUCATION PARTNER­
SHIPS", was adopted. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1291) recommending that H.R. 
No. 166, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Hirono and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. R. No. 
166, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING A REPORT ON 
A COMPREHENSIVE PLAN OF SER­
VICE FOR HANDICAPPED INDIVI­
DUALS", was adopted. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre-
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sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1292) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 96, as amended in HD1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Hirono and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 96, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING A REPORT ON A COMPRE­
HENSIVE PLAN OF SERVICE FOR 
HANDICAPPED INDIVIDUALS", was 
adopted. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1293) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 194 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 194 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE ADMINISTRATOR 
OF THE U.S. ENVIRONMENTAL 
PROTECTION AGENCY TO WAIVE 
THE REQUIREMENTS FOR MANDA­
TORY DISINFECTION FOR QUALI­
FYING WATER SYSTEMS", was 
adopted. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health , presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1294) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 156, as 
amended in HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 156, 
HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH TO EXAMINE WAYS TO 
ENHANCE THE QUALITY OF LIFE 
FOR HANSEN'S DISEASE PATIENTS 
AT KALAUPAPA ON MOLOKAI", was 
adopted, 

Representatives Shon and Andrews, 
for the Committees on Health and 
Planning, Energy and Environmental 
Protection, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1295) recom­
mending that H. R. No. 193, as 
amended in HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Andrews 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
193, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RES­
OLUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF HEALTH TO ASSESS THEIR 
CAPABILITY OF STAFF AND FACILI­
TIES TO MONITOR THE UNINTEN­
TIONAL AND DELIBERATE RELEASE 

OF GENETICALLY MODIFIED ORGA­
NISMS INTO THE ENVIRONMENT", 
was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1296) recommending that H.R. 
No. 277 be adopted, 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 277 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
FEASIBILITY OF THE PRODUCTION 
AND CONSUMPTION OF ETHANOL IN 
HAWAII", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
majority of the Committee on Water, 
Land Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No, 1297) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 180, as amended in 
HDl, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the major­
ity of the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 180, HDl, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
AUTHORIZING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
LAND AND NATURAL RESOURCES TO 
DISPOSE, BY WAY OF AN EASE­
MENT, CERTAIN GOVERNMENT 
WATER RIGHTS FOR THE PURPOSE 
OF CONSTRUCTING CERTAIN HY­
DRO ELECTRIC POWER FACILITIES 
ON THE ISLAND OF KAUAI", was 
adopted. 

Representati\l"e Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1298) recommending that H.R. 
No. 236, as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 236, 
HDl , entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
CONCERNING A LAND EXCHANGE TO 
BENEFIT WAIMEA SCHOOL", was 
adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1299) recommending that H.C.R . 
No. 135 , as amended in HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
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seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
135, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION CONCERNING 
A LAND EXCHANGE TO BENEFIT 
WAIMEA SCHOOL", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1300) recommending that H.R. 
No. 320 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 320 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY ON THE 
ESTABLISHMENT OF A STOCK, 
COMMODITIES, OPTIONS AND FU­
TURES EXCHANGE IN HAWAII", was 
adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1301) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 194 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
194 entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
ON THE ESTABLISHMENT OF A 
STOCK, COMMODITIES, OPTIONS 
AND FUTURES EXCHANGE IN HA­
WAII", was adopted. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1302) 
recommending that H.R. No. 222, as 
amended in HDl, be referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Hagino 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 222, 
HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
RELATING TO THE CONSTRUCTION 
OF A PERMANENT SIXTEEN CLASS­
ROOM BUILDING AT KAIMILOA 
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL", was referred 
to the Committee on Finance. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1303) 
recommending that H.R. No. 235, as 
amended in HDl, be referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Hagino 

and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 235, 
HDl, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
RELATING TO EDUCATION AND 
CLASS SIZE", was referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

At 1:00 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1: 02 o'clock p. m. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1304) 
recommending that H. C.R. No. 128, 
as amended in HDl, be referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Hagino 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
128, HDl, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION RELATING 
TO THE CONSTRUCTION OF A PER­
MANENT SIXTEEN CLASSROOM 
BUILDING AT KAIMILOA ELEMEN­
TARY SCHOOL", was referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1305) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 184 be referred to the Committee 
on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Tungpalan and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 184 entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RE­
QUESTING A STUDY OF THE ADE­
QUACY OF THE BASIC NEEDS AL­
LOWANCE AND SHELTER ALLOWANCE 
SCHEDULE UNDER THE PUBLIC 
ASSISTANCE PROGRAM", was re­
ferred to the Committee on Legislative 
Management. 

ANNOUNCEMENT 

The following announcement was 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Hiraki: "The Com­
mittee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce will resume its Conference 
Committee meeting this afternoon at 
3: 00 o'clock p. m. , in Conference 
Room 314." 

ADJOURNMENT 
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At 1:04 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Anderson -and carried, 

the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11:30 o'clock a.m., 
tomorrow, Wednesday, April 22, 1987. 
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FIFTY-SEVENTH DAY 

Wednesday, April 22, 1987 

The House of Representatives of the 
Fourteenth Legislature of the State of 
Hawaii, Regular Session of 1987, 
convened at 11:30 o'clock a.m., with 
the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked by 
Reverend Dick Walenta, Pastor of the 
Windward United Church of Christ, 
after which the Roll was called show­
ing all members present with the 
exception of Representatives Cachola, 
Fukunaga, Horita, M. Ige, Peters, 
Souki, Tajiri and Taniguchi, who 
were excused. 

By unanimous consent, reading and 
approval of the Journal of the House 
of Representatives of the Fifty-Sixth 
Day was deferred. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications from 
the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 803 to 
809b) were read by the Clerk and 
were disposed of as follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 803) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
173, SD 1, requesting the Department 
of Land and Natural Resources to 
initiate condemnation proceedings on 
certain parcels of land on Oahu for 
the . development of a State veterans 
cemetery and a permanent public 
memorial for veterans, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 21, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, further 
action on S.C.R. No. 173, SD 1, was 
deferred until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 804) returning House 
Bill No. 131, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EMPLOYMENT 
PRACTICES", which passed Third 
Reading in the Senate on April 21, 
1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 805) returning House 
Bill No. 307, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO COLLECTIVE 
BARGAINING", which passed Third 
Reading in the Senate on April 21, 
1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 806) returning House 
Bill No. 374, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE OFFICE 

OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY CON­
TROL", which passed Third Reading 
in the Senate on April 21, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 807) returning House 
Bill No. 1028, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO ENVIRON­
MENTAL IMPACT STATEMENTS", 
which passed Third Reading in the 
Senate on April 21, 1987, was placed 
on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 808) returning House 
Bill No. 1174, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO DRIVER 
LICENSE RENEWAL BY MAIL", which 
passed Third Reading in the Senate 
on April 21, 1987, was placed on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 809) returning House 
Bill No. 1332, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO AIRPORTS", 
which passed Third Reading in the 
Senate on April 21, 1987, was placed 
on file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 809a) informing the 
House that the President had, on 
April 21, 1987, appointed Senator 
Nakasato as Co-Chairman together 
with Senator Yamasaki on the part of 
the Senate at the conference on H.B. 
No. 706, HD 1, SD 2, was placed on 
file. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 809b) informing the 
House that the President had, on 
April 21, 1987, discharged Senator 
Matsuura and has added Senator 
McMurdo as an additional member on 
the part of the Senate at the con­
ference on H.B. No. 889, HD 2, SD 
1, was placed on file. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

DEFERRED RESOLUTIONS 

The following concurrent resolutions 
(S.C.R. Nos. 21, 51, 54, 66 and 173) 
were disposed of as follows: 

S.C.R. Nos. Referred to: 

21 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

51 Committee on Inter-
governmental Relations 

54 Committee on Tourism 
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66 Jointly to the Committees 
on Tourism and Legislative Manage­
ment 

173 Jointly to the Committees 
on Water, Land Use, Development 
and Hawaiian Affairs and Finance 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
certain resolutions. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions 
Nos. 473 and 474) were read 
Clerk and were disposed of 
lows: 

(H.R. 
by the 
as fol-

A resolution (H.R. No. 473) con­
gratulating Mi~lan.i Waena Elementary 
School on wmnmg the statewide 
recycling award for the third year in 
a row was jointly offered by Repre­
sentatives Lee, Kihano, Alcon, Bun­
da, Hagino, Hashimoto, Hayes, Levin, 
Okamura, Shon, Tam and Tungpalan. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Tungpa­
lan and carried, H.R. No. 473 was 
adopted. 

Representative Lee rose and stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, members of the 
House and friends, today we honor 
another group of students from 
Mililani for their achievement. I am 
proud to do so because there is a 
personal connection to this school. 
live only a few blocks from it, and 
my three boys attended Mililani Waena 
Elementary School. John graduated 
in 1982, and Tom in 1985, and both 
went on to Wheeler Intermediate. 
Andrew is the youngest and he will 
graduate this year and he will also go 
on to Wheeler Intermediate School. I 
have helped my children collect cans; 
I even helped lift the containers until 
Yvonne Reyes who was one year in 
charge said, 'you're much too old for 
that, Mr. Lee,' so I gave that up. 
In any case, I enjoyed doing this 
with my children. We baked cakes 
together for the bake sale; we did 
things together. 

"What I want to say is that schools 
need parents as well as teachers, and 
we are very fortunate in Mililani 
because we have great cooperation 
and self-help among the parents, 
teachers, and above all, the stu-

dents. And Mililani Waena is only one 
of the fine schools in Mililani. The 
others are Kipapa and we have hon­
ored the Kipapa first grade; we have 
honored the Wheeler Intermediate 
Internship Program, the Mililani High 
School Band, and there are others in 
the Mililani Uka School. 

"These schools represent the best 
in our system, and I am proud to do 
these floor presentations because, 
members, they are our schools; our 
children go to them, and we can make 
them good. So I hope that you would 
bear with me while I do these floor 
presentations for my constituents. I 
also want to do them because I think 
it can be an inspiration, a recogni­
tion, and indeed, I hope as an ex­
ample that our schools are good and 
can even be better, even those in 
Mililani. 11 

Representative Lee then asked the 
following honorees to stand to be 
recognized: Mr. Gervacio Buencon­
sejo, Principal; Reid Yamane, John 
Santiago, Carolyn Ozaki, Cory Ann 
Shindo, Justin Shigemoto, Travis 
Yanagida and Benjamin Reyes, the top 
seven collectors; Jim Nutter of Island 
Recycling; Mrs. Pat Ranario, Chair­
person of the drive; and Mr. Herman 
Aizawa, Deputy Superintendent of 
Education. 

Representative Lee then asked Mr. 
Viduya, District Superintendent, and 
Mrs. Yamane, Reid's mother, who 
were seated in the gallery, to stand 
to be recognized. 

Floral leis were presented to the 
honorees by Representatives Bunda, 
Crozier, Hashimoto, Tungpalan, 
Hirono, Oshiro, Levin, Tam, Maru­
moto, Isbell and O'Kieffe. Repre­
sentative Lee presented them with 
certified copies of the resolution. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 474) hon­
oring Mr. Kayo R. Chung was jointly 
offered by Representatives Leong, 
Tam, Bellinger, Alcon, Bunda, 
Crozier, Isbell, Oshiro, Tajiri, Tom 
and Tungpalan. 

On motion by Representative Leong, 
seconded by Representative Tam and 
carried, H.R. No. 474 was adopted. 

Representative Leong rose and 
proceeded to introduce the honoree, 
stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, the resolution speaks 
for itself. I have known Kayo for a 
number of years and he is very 
dedicated to the youth of Hawaii, 11 

and asked Mr. Kayo Chung to stand 
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to be recognized. Accompanying 
Kayo were Mr. Walter Freitas, District 
Governor, Lions International, and 
Mr. Herman Aizawa, Assistant Super­
intendent of Education. 

Orchid leis were presented to Mr. 
Chung by Representative Tungpalan; 
to Mr. Freitas by Representative 
Kawakami; and to Mr. Aizawa by 
Representative Isbell. Representative 
Bellinger presented Mr. Chung with a 
certified copy of the resolution. 

At 12:03 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
offering our warm aloha to our hon­
orees this morning." 

Upon reconvening at 1: 13 o'clock 
p. m. , the Chair directed the Clerk to 
note the presence of Representatives 
Cachola, Fukunaga, M. Ige, Souki 
and Tajiri. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were suspend­
ed for the purpose of considering 
Final and Third Reading bills on the 
basis of a modified consent calendar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

H.B. No. 736, HD l, SD 2: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 578, HD l, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1924, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1151, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 463, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1150, HD 2, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 14, HD 2, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day . 

H.B. No. 1421, HD 1, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 448, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1001, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No . 1224, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S. B . No. 444, SD 1 : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 393, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 419: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 522: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 525, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 632, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 727, SD 1: 



HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 7 t h DAY 727 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 877, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 956, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1023, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1526, SD 2: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day, 

S.B. No. 450: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 451: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 521 : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 452, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 11, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 216, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 368: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 366, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No, 365, SD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Employ­
ment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1306) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1745 pass Second 
Reading and be placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading, 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Tungpalan and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S, B, 
No. 1745, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE WORKERS' 
COMPENSATION MEDICAL FEE SCHED­
ULE", passed Second Reading and 
was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1307) 
recommending that S.B. No. 791 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B, 
No, 791, entitled : "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO APPEALS IN 
CRIMINAL CASES", passed Second 
Reading and was placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1308) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1287 , SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 1287, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO BANK­
ING", passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1309) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1112 pass Second 
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Reading and be placed on the calen­
dar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 1112, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO INSURANCE", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading, with Representative Tung­
palan voting no. 

Representatives Hirono and Metcalf, 
for the Committees on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce and Judi­
ciary, presented a joint report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1310) recom­
mending that S. B. No. 449 pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the joint report 
of the Committees was adopted and 
S.B. No. 449, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO OPTOM­
ETRY", passed Second Reading and 
was placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Hirono, for the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1311) recommending 
that S.B. No. 1286, SD 1, pass 
Second Reading and be placed on the 
calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hiro­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B . 
No. 1286, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL 
FOR AN ACT RELATING TO BANK­
ING", passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

At 1: 18 o'clock p. m. , Representa­
tive Souki asked for a recess and the 
Chair declared a recess, subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1:19 o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1312) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1483, SD 
1, pass Second Reading and be placed 
on the calendar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Kawakami 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1483, SD 1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 

AN ACT RELATING TO A PUBLIC 
SCHOOLS FOUNDATION", passed 
Second Reading and was placed on 
the calendar for Third Reading. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1313) recommending 
that H.R. No. 211 be referred to the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
211, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE UNIVERSITY OF 
HAWAII TO DESIGNATE FULL INSTI­
TUTE STATUS TO THE SEA GRANT 
COLLEGE PROGRAM TO FURTHER 
PROMOTE THE SEA GRANT CONCEPT 
FOR HAWAII AND THE PACIFIC 
REGION", was referred to the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1314) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 120 be referred to 
the Committee on Higher Education 
and the Arts. 

On motion by Representative Okamu­
ra, seconded by Representative Alcon 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
120, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII TO DESIG­
NATE FULL INSTITUTE STATUS TO 
THE SEA GRANT COLLEGE PROGRAM 
TO FURTHER PROMOTE THE SEA 
GRANT CONCEPT FOR HAWAII AND 
THE PACIFIC REGION", was referred 
to the Committee on Higher Education 
and the Arts. 

Representative Shito, for the Com­
mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1315) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 272 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
272, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
LEGISLATIVE AUDITOR TO REVIEW 
THE 'OHAN A ZONING' PROGRAM", 
was referred to the Committee on 
Legislative Management. 

Representative Shito, for the Com-
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mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1316) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 331 be re­
ferred to the Committee on Legislative 
Management. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 331, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE LEGISLATIVE 
AUDITOR TO CONDUCT AN AUDIT 
OF THE HAWAII HOUSING AUTHOR­
ITY", was referred to the Committee 
on Legislative Management. 

Representative Shito, for the Com­
mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1317) recom­
mending that H. C.R. No. 257 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
257, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
LEGISLATIVE AUDITOR TO CONDUCT 
AN AUDIT OF THE HAWAII HOUSING 
AUTHORITY", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1318) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 129, as 
amended in HD 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
129, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
AN AUDIT OF THE MENTAL HEALTH 
DIVISION OF THE DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH", was referred to the Com­
mittee on Legislative Management. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1319) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 198, as 
amended in HD 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 198, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION URGING THE ESTABLISHMENT 
OF A COMPREHENSIVE NATIONAL 
HEALTH INSURANCE PROGRAM", was 

referred to the Committee on Con­
sumer Protection and Commerce. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1320) recom­
mending that H. C.R. No. 115, as 
amended in HD 1, be referred to the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
115, HD l, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION URGING THE 
ESTABLISHMENT OF A COMPREHEN­
SIVE NATIONAL HEALTH INSURANCE 
PROGRAM", was referred to the 
Committee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1321) recommending that H.R. 
No. 78 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 78, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE STATE 
COORDINATING COUNCIL ON DEAF­
NESS TO STUDY THE PROBLEM OF 
HOW TO BEST PROVIDE THE TELE­
COMMUNICATION DEVICE FOR THE 
DEAF RELAY SERVICES FOR 
HAWAII'S DEAF COMMUNITY", was 
adopted. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1322) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 45 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 45, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE STATE COORDINATING 
COUNCIL ON DEAFNESS TO STUDY 
THE PROBLEM OF HOW TO BEST 
PROVIDE THE TELECOMMUNICATION 
DEVICE FOR THE DEAF RELAY 
SERVICES FOR HAWAII'S DEAF 
COMMUNITY", was adopted. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1323) recommending that H.R. 
No. 306, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Bagi-
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no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 306, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
OF THE EFFECTS OF REORGANIZING 
THE ADMINISTRATIVE STRUCTURE 
OF THE DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL 
SERVICES AND HOUSING WHICH 
SERVES THE BIG ISLAND OF 
HAWAII", was adopted. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep . 
No. 1324) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 185, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted . 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 185, HD 1 , entitled : 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
EFFECTS OF REORGANIZING THE 
ADMINISTRATIVE STRUCTURE OF 
THE DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SER­
VICES AND HOUSING WHICH SERVES 
THE BIG ISLAND OF HAWAII", was 
adopted. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com . 
Rep. No. 1325) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 116, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 116, HD 1, entitled : "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST ­
ING THE APPOINTMENT OF A JOINT 
LEGISLATIVE INTERIM COMMITTEE 
TO RECOMMEND IMPROVEMENTS TO 
THE EXECUTIVE BUDGET SYSTEM" , 
was adopted. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on Planning, Energy and 
Environmental Protection , presented a 
report (Stand. Com . Rep. No. 1326) 
recommending that H.R. No. 65 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
65, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING PROGRESS IN THE 
DEVELOPMENT OF ALTERNATE 
ENERGY SOURCES IN HAWAII", was 
adopted. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on Planning , Energy and 

Environmental Protection, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1327) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 36 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 36, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
PROGRESS IN THE DEVELOPMENT OF 
ALTERNATE ENERGY SOURCES IN 
HAWAII" , was adopted . 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No . 1328) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 92 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Okamu­
ra, seconded by Representative Alcon 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
92, entitled : " HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
SUPPORT OF HAWAII'S CONGRES­
SIONAL DELEGATION FOR THE 
RESTORATION OF FEDERAL FUNDS 
FOR OCEAN RESEARCH", was 
adopted. 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the Committees on Education and 
Legislative Management, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1329) recommending that H.R. No. 
96, as amended in HD 1, b e adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
96, HD 1 , entitled : "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
THE FEASIBILITY OF ESTABLISHING 
A SCHOOL BUS PROGRAM FOR 
STUDENTS ATTENDING SCHOOLS IN 
THE LEEWARD AND HONOLULU 
SCHOOL DISTRICTS OF OAHU", was 
adopted . 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the Committees on Education and 
Legislative Management, presented a 
joint report (Stand . Com. Rep . No. 
1330) recommending that H.C.R. No. 
53, as amended in HD l, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 53, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING A STUDY OF THE FEASIBILITY 
OF ESTABLISHING A SCHOOL BUS 
PROGRAM FOR ST UDENTS ATTEND­
ING SCHOOLS IN THE LEE WARD AND 
HONOLULU SCHOOL DISTRICTS OF 
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OAHU", was adopted. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education , presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1331) 
recommending that H.R. No. 181, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 181, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THAT A REGIONAL 
LIBRARY BE PLANNED FOR THE 
SECOND URBAN CENTER IN THE 
EWA DISTRICT", was adopted. 

Representatives Shon and Tani­
guchi, for the Committees on Health 
and Higher Education and the Arts, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1332) recommending that 
H.R. No. 220, as amended in HD 1, 
be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
220, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE UNIVER­
SITY OF HAWAII SCHOOL OF NURS­
ING TO STUDY METHODS OF ALLE­
VIATING THE SHORTAGE OF NURSES 
IN THE STATE", was adopted. 

Representatives Taniguchi and Tam, 
for the Committees on Higher Educa­
tion and the Arts and Education, 
presented a joint report (Stand, Com. 
Rep. No. 1333) recommending that 
H.R. No. 237 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative Tam 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No, 
237, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING REPORT ON COMPUTER 
USAGE IN EDUCATION", was 
adopted. 

Representatives Taniguchi and Tam, 
for the Committees on Higher Educa­
tion and the Arts and Education, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1334) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 136 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative Tam 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 136, entitled : "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
REPORT ON COMPUTER USAGE IN 
EDUCATION", was adopted, 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
Committee on Higher Education and 

the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No, 1335) recommending 
that H.R. No. 254, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 254, HD 1 , entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION URGING SUPPORT FOR 
THE DEVELOPMENT OF AGRICUL­
TURAL PROGRAMS IN THE AMERI­
CAN PACIFIC", was adopted. 

Representative Taniguchi, for the 
Committee on Higher Education and 
the Arts, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1336) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 145, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 145, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
URGING SUPPORT FOR THE DEVEL­
OPMENT OF AGRICULTURAL PRO­
GRAMS IN THE AMERICAN PACIFIC", 
was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water , Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1337) recommending that 
H.R. No. 16, as amended in HD l, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 16, 
HD 1, entitled : "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY ON 
THE FEASIBILITY OF ESTABLISHING 
A DISCOVERER'S PARK AT KA LAE 
OR SOUTH POINT, HAWAII", was 
adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1338) recommending that H.R. 
No. 245 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 245, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A REPORT OF THE 
STATUS OF GOVERNMENT ROADS, 
TRAILS, AND RIGHTS-OF-WAY OVER 
PRIVATE PROPERTY", was adopted, 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel-
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opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1339) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 57, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
57, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
REMOVAL OF THE ENTRANCE FEES 
FOR HAWAII VOLCANO NATIONAL 
PARK, HALEAKALA NATIONAL 
PARK, AND PU'UHONUA O HONAU­
NAU NATIONAL PARK FOR RESI­
DENTS OF THE STATE OF HAWAII", 
was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1340) recommending that H. R. 
No. 233 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 233, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
CONCERNING KALAUPAPA NATIONAL 
HISTORICAL PARK", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1341) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 132 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
132, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION CONCERNING KALAUPA­
PA NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK", 
was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1342) recommending that H. R. 
No. 217, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 217, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THAT THE 
STATE SUPPORT EFFORTS FOR THE 
FEDERAL ACQUISITION OF THE 
CRATER HILL COASTAL WILDLANDS 
AREA ABUTTING THE KILAUEA 
POINT NATIONAL WILDLIFE REFUGE, 
KAUAI", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1343) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 125, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
125, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THAT THE STATE SUPPORT EF­
FORTS FOR THE FEDERAL ACQUI­
SITION OF THE CRATER HILL 
COASTAL WILDLANDS AREA ABUT­
TING THE KILAUEA POINT NA­
TIONAL WILDLIFE REFUGE, KAUAI", 
was adopted. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on Planning, Energy and 
Environmental Protection, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1344) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 221 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 221, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION CONCERNING 
THE MANAGEMENT AND FUNDING OF 
THE NATURAL AREA RESERVES 
SYSTEM", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1345) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 159, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
159, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEVELOPMENT OF WORKING 
PLANS FOR NATIVE HAWAIIAN 
HOMESTEADERS ON THE ISLAND OF 
MOLOKAI", was adopted. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1346) recommending that H. C.R. 
No. 59, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
59, HD l, entitled: "HOUSE CON-
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CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII AND 
THE DEPARTMENT OF LAND AND 
NATURAL RESOURCES TO STUDY 
THE NEED FOR POSTSECONDARY 
EDUCATION IN WEST HAWAII AND IF 
APPROPRIATE, TO IDENTIFY A SITE 
FOR A HIGHER EDUCATION FACIL­
ITY", was adopted. 

Representative Shito, for the Com­
mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1347) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 227, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
227, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE HAWAII HOUSING AUTHORITY 
TO ADDRESS ISSUES RELATED TO 
LEASEHOLD CONVERSION OF CON­
DOMINIUMS AND COOPERATIVE 
HOUSING PROJECTS", was adopted. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on Planning, Energy and 
Environmental Protection, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1348) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 222 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 222, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DIRECTOR OF THE DEPART­
MENT OF PLANNING AND ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT TO SPONSOR A CON­
FERENCE ON RENEWABLE ENERGY 
SYSTEMS", was adopted. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1349) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 9, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
9, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A REPORT ON THE EFFORTS OF THE 
HOSPITALS TO CONTROL COSTS 
AND THE RESULTS OF THE EF­
FORTS", was adopted. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1350) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 64, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
64, HD l, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION RELATING 
TO PHYSICAL THERAPISTS SERVING 
HANDICAPPED CHILDREN IN THE 
PUBLIC SCHOOLS", was adopted. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1351) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 144 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 144, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION URGING 
THE UNITED STATES TO EXTEND AN 
INVITATION TO FRANCE TO USE 
UNITED STATES NUCLEAR TESTING 
FACILITIES AS AN ALTERNATIVE TO 
USING ITS CURRENT SITE IN THE 
SOUTH PACIFIC", was adopted. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1352) 
recommending that H.R. No. 279 be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 279, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEVELOPMENT OF 
A PROGRAM TO CONSTRUCT AND 
INSTALL SECURITY SCREENS FOR 
PUBLIC SCHOOLS", was referred to 
the Committee on Finance. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1353) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 165 be 
referred to the Committee on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 165, 
entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEVELOPMENT OF A PROGRAM TO 
CONSTRUCT AND INSTALL SECU­
RITY SCREENS FOR PUBLIC 
SCHOOLS", was referred to the 
Committee on Finance. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1354) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 251 be 
referred to the Committee on Legis­
lative Management. 



734 HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 7 t h DAY 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 251, 
entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
ON THE ISSUE OF SUPPLEMENTAL 
PAY IN THE DEPARTMENT OF EDU­
CATION", was referred to the Com­
mittee on Legislative Management. 

At 1:28 o'clock p.m., Represen­
tative Okamura asked for a recess 
and the Chair declared a recess, 
subject to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1: 38 o'clock p. m. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were suspend­
ed for the purpose of reconsidering 
action previously taken. 

RECONSIDERATION OF 
ACTION TAKEN 

Representative Okamura moved that 
the House reconsider its action taken 
previously in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 853, seconded by Repre­
sentative Alcon and carried. 

Representative Okamura then gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 853. 

Representative Okamura moved that 
the House reconsider its action taken 
previously in disagreeing to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1469, HD 2, seconded by 
Representative Alcon and carried. 

Representative Okamura then gave 
notice of intent to agree to the 
amendments proposed by the Senate 
to H.B. No. 1469, HD 2. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Hagino: "Members 
of the CPC Committee, there will be a 
continuation of the conference on 
Consumer Protection and Commerce on 
deferred matters at 3: 30 today in 
Conference Room 328." 

Representative Anderson: "There 
will be a 6: 30 caucus for the Repub­
licans." 

Representative Okamura: "There 
will be a Majority caucus at 6: 40 this 
evening." 

At 1:40 o'clock p.m., the House of 
Representatives stood in recess until 
7:00 o'clock p.m. tonight. 

NIGHT SESSION 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 9:00 o'clock p.m. 

At 9:02 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Anderson asked for a recess and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 9:07 o'clock p.m. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1355) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 7, as amended in HD 1, 
be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Okamu­
ra, seconded by Representative Alcon 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
7, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY TO INVESTIGATE THE 
EXTENSION OF HAWAII'S EMPLOYEE 
BENEFIT PROGRAMS TO PART-TIME 
CASUAL AND TEMPORARY EM­
PLOYEES", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1356) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 87, HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 87, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING FOLLOW-UP AUDIT OF THE 
OFFICE OF HAWAIIAN AFFAIRS", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1357) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 149 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
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the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 149, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE CREATION OF A SEPARATE 
STANDARD FEDERAL REGION FOR 
HAWAII AND THE TERRITORIES AND 
THE INSULAR POSSESSIONS IN THE 
PACIFIC", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1358) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 215 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 215, entitled: ''HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION URGING 
THE POSTMASTER GENERAL TO 
CONTINUE POSTAL OPERATIONS AT 
HAKALAU AND PAAUHAU ON THE 
ISLAND OF HAWAII", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand, 
Com. Rep. No. 1359) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 230, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 230, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE STATE AND CITY 
AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU TO 
IMPLEMENT A PILOT PROGRAM TO 
PROVIDE CERTAIN SERVICES 
DURING EVENING HOURS AND ON 
SATURDAYS", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
majority of the Committee on Inter­
governmental Relations, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1360) 
recommending that H. C.R. No. 18, as 
amended in HD 2, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and H.C.R. No, 18, HD 2, 
entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION RELATING TO THE 
'OLD GOVERNMENT ROAD' AT DIA­
MOND HEAD, OAHU", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative 
Committee on 

Crozier, for the 
Intergovernmental 

Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1361) recommending 
that H.C.R, No. 201, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 201, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
RELATING TO A COMMISSION TO 
EXAMINE THE DEVELOPMENT OF 
KAPOLEI AS A SECOND CITY", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1362) 
recommending that H. C. R, No. 68, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted, 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 68, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
ESTABLISH A NEW HIGH SCHOOL IN 
WEST HAWAII", was adopted. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1363) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 167, 
as amended in HD 1, be adopted, 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 167, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
STUDY THE NEED, BENEFITS, AND 
COSTS OF PROVIDING STUDENT 
ACTIVITIES COORDINATORS FOR 
THE STATE'S INTERMEDIATE 
SCHOOLS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1364) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 101 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H, C, R. 
No. 101, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS BUREAU 
TO EVALUATE THEIR HANDLING OF 
JURORS' AND WITNESSES' PARKING 
TICKETS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 
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Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1365) 
recommending that H. C.R. No. 94 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 94, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY ON THE FEASIBILITY OF 
AN INTENSIVE SURVEILLANCE PRO­
GRAM IN HAWAII AS AN ALTERNA­
TIVE TO INCARCERATION", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No . 1366) recommending 
that H. C.R. No. 6, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred to the end of the calendar. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1367) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 140, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 140, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE SUPPORT OF HAWAII'S 
CONGRESSIONAL DELEGATION FOR 
THE SUPPORT OF LEGISLATION AND 
OTHER PROGRAMS TO HELP CON­
TROL THE PLASTIC AND NET POL­
LUTION OF OUR OCEANS", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1368) recommending 
that H.C.R. No . 133, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 133, HD l, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION EXPRES­
SING LEGISLATIVE SUPPORT FOR 
PROPOSED SUBMARINE TOUR OPERA­
TIONS IN HAWAIIAN WATERS BY 
ATLANTIS SUBMARINES, INC.", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1369) recommending that H. C.R. 
No. 166, as amended in HD 1 , be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 166, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING ENCOURAGEMENT AND 
ASSISTANCE TO THOSE WISHING TO 
MAKE AN ORGAN DONATION", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1370) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 67, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried , the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C . R. No. 67, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION TO DEVISE A 
PEDESTRIAN SAFETY PLAN FOR 
KALANIANAOLE HIGHWAY IN EAST 
HONOLULU", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation , pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com . Rep. 
No. 1371) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 195 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 195, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANS­
PORTATION TO REPORT ON TRAF­
FIC PLANS AND PRIORITIES FOR 
UPCOUNTRY MAUI", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1372) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 181 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C . R. No. 181, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RELAT­
ING TO SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS AT 
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THE SOUTH INTERSECTION OF 
KUNIA DRIVE AND KUNIA ROAD", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1373) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 266 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 266, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING A STUDY TO IMPROVE THE 
TRANSPORTATION ACCESS SYSTEM 
TO LEEWARD COMMUNITY COLLEGE 
AND WEST OAHU COLLEGE", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro , for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1374) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 198 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 198, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION RELAT­
ING TO ANTI-COMMUTING TELEWORK 
CENTERS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1375) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 196 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 196, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION URGING 
THE INCREASED ENFORCEMENT OF 
MAXIMUM VEHICLE BUMPER HEIGHT 
REGULATIONS", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com . Rep. 
No. 1376) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 13, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 13, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
URGING THE UNITED STATES DE-

PARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION TO 
BAN SMOKING ON COMMERCIAL 
AIRLINE FLIGHTS " , was adopted, 
with Repres entative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1377) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 270, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro , seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried , the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R . No. 270, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION TO REVIEW AND 
UPDATE THE WAIMEA, ISLAND OF 
HAWAII, BYPASS ROAD PROJECT", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
majority of the Committee on Trans­
portation, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 13 7 8) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 193, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and H. C.R. No. 193, HD 1, 
entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A FEASI­
BILITY STUDY OF THE CONSTRUC­
TION OF AN INTERCHANGE ON THE 
H-1 FREEWAY AT KAONOHI 
STREET", was adopted, with Rep­
resentatives Anderson and Tungpalan 
voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1379) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 22, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. · 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
22, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION URGING THE 
UNITED STATES CONGRESS TO 
SUPPORT LEGISLATION THAT PRO­
VIDE COMPREHENSIVE HEALTH CARE 
SERVICES TO NATIVE HAWAIIANS", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre-
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sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1380) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 118, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried , the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
118, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION URGING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF LAND AND 
NATURAL RESOURCES TO GIVE TOP 
PRIORITY TO THE PLANNING, DE­
SIGN AND CONSTRUCTION OF A NEW 
IRRIGATION SYSTEM AT THE EAST 
WAIOLI RIVER, KAUAI", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1381) recommending that H.C.R . 
No. 119, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. lge 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
119, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF LAND AND 
NATURAL RESOURCES TO CONDUCT 
A BASELINE STUDY OF THE HANA­
LEI RIVER ESTUARY AND OTHER 
NORTH SHORE RIVERS, KAUAI", was 
adopted, with Representative An­
derson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water , Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1382) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 234 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. lge 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. C.R. No. 
234, entitled : "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THAT 
THE GOVERNOR OF HAWAII PRO­
CLAIM 1988 AS THE YEAR OF TELE­
COMMUNICATIONS IN THE STATE OF 
HAWAII", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use , Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1383) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 256, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. lge 

and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
256, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION DIRECTING 
THE HIGH TECHNOLOGY DEVELOP­
MENT CORPORATION TO WORK WITH 
TELECOMMUNICATIONS CARRIERS 
TO IDENTIFY THE LEGAL AND 
ECONOMIC INCENTIVES NECESSARY 
TO PROMOTE THE GROWTH OF 
TELECOMMUNICATIONS INFRASTRUC­
TURE IN THE STATE OF HAWAII", 
was adopted, with Representatives 
Anderson, Hemmings and Liu voting 
no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand . Com. Rep. 
No . 1384) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 100, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

Representative Hemmings rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, rise to speak 
against House Resolution 172, HD 1, 
and House Concurrent Resolution 100, 
HD 1. 

"Mr. Speaker, the easy thing for 
me to do would be to sit idly by and 
let this resolution pass without saying 
anything, but in good consciousness 
and probably the wise political thing 
for me to do would be to sit by and 
let it pass, but in good consciousness 
I must speak against the resolutions. 

"First of all, it is my understanding 
from the Department of Land and 
Natural Resources, and I checked this 
a short time ago. ,it was ten 
minutes ago , that the concerned land 
is outside the Diamond Head Monument 
line and eligible to have something 
constructive and positive to be done 
on it without interfering with the 
established line to protect the Dia­
mond Head Monument. 

"Secondly, most of the people that 
have come to my office and lobbied in 
behalf of these resolutions have 
lobbied without seeing the plans of 
the proposed tennis complex, and I 
have seen the plans, Mr. Speaker and 
colleagues. The plans provide for a 
very aesthetically beautiful tennis 
complex in which many hundreds of 
thousands of dollars are going to be 
spent on beautification and land­
scaping which will greatly enhance 
the aesthetic value of the place. It 
will be contrary to misinformed 
peoples' statements about a modest 
clubhouse and a modest restaurant on 
the property. 



HOUSE JOURNAL - 5 7 t h DAY 739 

"Third, this facility would, at no 
cost to the taxpayers, provide a 
recreational benefit to visiting 
tourists as well as, under the terms 
of the lease, certain courts would be 
reserved for use by the residents in 
the nearby areas, so we would get a 
recreational facility at no cost to us. 

"Fourth, it would turn land that is 
presently a liability. . .if any of you 
have driven by that area, you can 
see that there is keawe bushes, it's 
very poorly kept. We turn a liability 
land into an asset. Not only an asset 
aesthetically, but also an asset eco­
nomically because the business ac­
tivity would be going on there. We 
pay taxes, you know we pay land 
taxes, so it would benefit not only 
the recreational use, but also benefit 
the economic activity in the area. 
The Department of Land and Natural 
Resources, in good consciousness, 
has examined this very closely and 
has and are proceeding with allowing 
this to happen. 

"There is another principle involved 
here and as every year goes by, and 
as our State becomes more and more 
crowded, it seems that we are having 
our actions dictated by the nimbies 
and by the nay-sayers rather than by 
the people that want to constructively 
do something. Every major economic 
development activity and every major 
proposal, including some of the many 
wonderful proposals of our Governor, 
are being bogged down by nay­
sayers. We do want economic oppor­
tunity; we do want diversified in­
dustry; we do want jobs; we do want 
affordable · housing; we do want 
improved transportation, but not in 
our district - - do it somewhere else. 
And I think we had better start 
rethinking it and I think on issues 
like this, we are going to have to 
take a stand in favor of some of these 
activities rather than letting the 
nay-sayers and the anties and the 
nimbies dictate the course of this 
Legislature. We have to take bold 
leadership positions; we have to 
advocate development of the America's 
Cup; we have to advocate develop­
ment of geothermal energy; we have 
to advocate development in our dis­
tricts that is going to benefit the 
larger interests of the State of 
Hawaii. 

"For that reason, I ask all of you 
to vote against these resolutions. 
It's in my district . Probably the safe 
thing for me to do would be to sit 
down and let it just fly but in good 
consciousness, I am asking you all to 
consider voting no. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. _Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
100, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION CLARIFYING 
THE INTENT OF THE LEGISLATURE 
WITH RESPECT TO THE DIAMOND 
HEAD STATE MONUMENT", was 
adopted, with Representatives Ander­
son, Cavasso and Hemmings voting 
no. 

Representative Cachola, for the 
Committee on Tourism, presented a 
report (Stand, Com. Rep. No. 1385) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 174 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Oshiro and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C, R. 
No. 174, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THAT EFFORTS BE MADE TO ESTAB­
LISH MORE PROFESSIONAL GOLF 
TOURNAMENTS IN HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1386) recommending that H. C.R. 
No. 235, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted, 

Representative Liu rose and stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, I'd like to speak in 
favor of the resolutions ( H. R. No. 
398, HD 1 and H.C.R. No, 235, HD 
1), but with some reservations. 

"I don't know if I really understand 
the semantics in the resolutions and 
that I don't really understand if it's 
the change since those concepts were 
embodied in the last major master plan 
of, I think, ten or twelve years ago, 
but in deference to the Committee 
chairman and his wisdom, and trust­
ing that he is looking for a change in 
that area, I will be voting for it and 
looking for, perhaps, some clarifi­
cation during the interim with it. 

"Thank you very much, Mr. Speak­
er." 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 235, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
ESTABLISHING A PHILOSOPHY OF 
CORRECTIONS FOR HAWAII" , was 
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adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1387) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 242 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 242, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION URGING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
AND THE DEPARTMENT OF LAND 
AND NATURAL RESOURCES TO 
IMPLEMENT THE RECOMMENDATIONS 
OF THE AD HOC COMMITTEE FOR A 
MANAGEMENT PLAN FOR THE 
HANALEI/NORTH SHORE AREA OF 
KAUAI", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1388) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 207, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 207, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING A STUDY OF EDUCATIONAL 
PROGRAMS IN MARITIME-RELATED 
FIELDS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1389) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 237, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried , the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 237, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THAT THE GOVERNOR AND THE 
MAYORS OF HAWAII, HONOLULU, 
KAUAI AND MAUI PROCLAIM THE 
MONTH OF MAY 1987 AS HOKULE' A 
MONTH", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report {Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1390) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 225 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 

Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 225, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THAT HAWAII'S CONGRESSIONAL 
DELEGATION SUPPORT THE RES­
TORATION OF FEDERAL FUNDS FOR 
CONTINUED OPERATION OF THE 
NEWLY ESTABLISHED REGIONAL 
AQUACULTURE CENTERS PROGRAM 
IN THE UNITED STATES DEPART­
MENT OF AGRICULTURE", was 
adopted. 

Representative Bunda , for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report {Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1391) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 238 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 238, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY OF THE FEASIBILITY OF 
DEVELOPING A HAWAII OCEAN­
BOOK", was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No, 1392) recommending that H. C.R. 
No. 173, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted, 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 173, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 
TO TEST DISPERSANTS AND FOR 
THE STATE CIVIL DEFENSE TO 
MAKE RECOMMENDATIONS ON STOCK­
PILING DISPERSANTS BEST SUITED 
FOR HAWAIIAN WATERS AND TO 
ESTABLISH MORE EFFICIENT OPER­
ATING PROCEDURES IN THE EVENT 
OF AN OIL SPILL", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report {Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1393) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 172 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 172, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE OFFICE OF ENVIRONMENTAL 
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QUALITY CONTROL TO MONITOR 
AND COORDINATE THE PROGRESS 
OF PESTICIDE ACTION PLANS DE­
VELOPED UNDER ACT 275, SESSION 
LAWS OF HAWAII, 1984, AS AMENDED 
BY ACT 127, SESSION LAWS OF 
HAWAII, 1985", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1394) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 267 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 267, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A REVIEW OF THE APPLICABILITY 
OF CHAPTER 343, HRS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1395) 
recommending that H. C.R. No. 248, 
as amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 248, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
GOVERNOR'S APPOINTED TASK 
FORCE TO EXPLORE METHODS TO 
PREVENT THE CLOSING OF WAIALUA 
SUGAR COMPANY AND FOR A STUDY 
OF HAWAII'S SUGAR INDUSTRY", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1396) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 183, 
as amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 183, HD 
l, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION URGING CONGRESS TO 
OPPOSE THE REAGAN ADMINISTRA­
TION PROPOSAL TO LOWER THE 
PRICE SUPPORT LEVEL FOR SUGAR 
TO 12 CENTS PER POUND", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the Committees on Education and 
Legislative Management, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1397) recommending that H.C.R. No. 

253 be adopted, 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 253, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY ON THE ISSUE OF FED­
ERAL IMPACT AID", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the Committees on Education and 
Legislative Management, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1398) recommending that H.C.R, No. 
170, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 170, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING A STUDY ON THE PROS AND 
CONS OF THE JPO PROGRAM, AS 
WELL AS POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES 
TO THE PROGRAM", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the majority of the Committees on 
Education and Legislative Management, 
presented a joint report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1399) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 191 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the joint report of the 
majority of the Committees was 
adopted and H.C.R. No. 191, enti­
tled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A FEASIBILITY 
STUDY REGARDING A PROGRAM FOR 
JOB SHARING TEACHERS NEAR 
RETIREMENT IN THE DEPARTMENT 
OF EDUCATION", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1400) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 2, as amended in HD 1, 
be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 2, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE 
BUREAU TO FORMULATE RECOMMEN­
DATIONS TO THE LEGISLATURE AND 
THE PUBLIC UTILITIES COMMISSION 
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TOWARD THE DEVELOPMENT OF 
LEGISLATION AND RULES WHICH 
WOULD REQUIRE THE LOCAL ELEC­
TRIC UTILITIES TO INITIATE 
PROGRAMS WHICH WOULD PROVIDE 
THE FINANCING MECHANISMS NECES­
SARY FOR INDIVIDUAL CONSUMERS 
AND PRODUCERS TO ESTABLISH 
ALTERNATE ENERGY AND CONSERVA­
TION TECHNOLOGIES IN HAWAII", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management , 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep, No. 1401) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 27, as amended in HD 2, 
be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 27, HD 2 , entitled : "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING AN EXAMINATION OF THE NEED 
FOR TWO :tAND RECORDING SYS­
TEMS" , was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1402) recommending that 
H.C.R. No. 12 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 12, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
A STUDY OF THE POSSIBLE FORMA­
TION OF A SECOND PUBLIC DE­
FENDER PROGRAM", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1403) recommending that 
H.C.R . No. 124, as amended in HD 
2, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 124 , HD 2, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING A STUDY OF THE FUTURE OF 
THE SUGAR INDUSTRY IN HAWAII", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga , for the 
Committee on Legislative Management , 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1404) recommending that 

H.C.R. No. 147, HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 147, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE 
BUREAU TO STUDY THE STATE OF 
SMALL BUSINESS IN HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1405) recommending that 
H.R. No. 14, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried , the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
14, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE LEGISLA­
TIVE REFERENCE BUREAU TO FORMU­
LATE RECOMMENDATIONS TO THE 
LEGISLATURE AND THE PUBLIC 
UTILITIES COMMISSION TOWARD THE 
DEVELOPMENT OF LEGISLATION AND 
RULES WHICH WOULD REQUIRE THE 
LOCAL ELECTRIC UTILITIES TO 
INITIATE PROGRAMS WHICH WOULD 
PROVIDE THE FINANCING MECHA­
NISMS NECESSARY FOR INDIVIDUAL 
CONSUMERS AND PRODUCERS TO 
ESTABLISH ALTERNATE ENERGY 
AND CONSERVATION TECHNOLOGIES 
IN HAWAII", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no . 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand . Com. Rep. No. 1406) 
recommending that H.R. No. 173 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
173, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE TRAFFIC VIOLA­
TIONS BUREAU TO EVALUATE THEIR 
HANDLING OF JURORS' AND WIT­
NESSES' PARKING TICKETS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com . Rep. No. 1407) 
recommending that H.R. No. 97 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
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97, entitled : "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE HAWAII CRIMINAL 
JUSTICE COMMISSION TO STUDY 
THE EFFECTIVENESS OF THE BLOOD 
ALCOHOL MEASURING IGNITION 
INTERLOCK DEVICE IN DUI CASES", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1408) 
recommending that H.R. No. 393 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Met­
calf, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
393, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE STATE ATTORNEY 
GENERAL TO REVIEW THE POLICIES 
AND PROCEDURES OF THE MEDICAID 
FRAUD UNIT", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1409) 
recommending that H.R. No. 162 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Met-
calf, seconded by Representative , 
Hagino and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
162, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY ON THE 
FEASIBILITY OF AN INTENSIVE 
SURVEILLANCE PROGRAM IN HAWAII 
AS AN ALTERNATIVE TO INCARCERA­
TION", was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1410) recommending that H.R. 
No, 276, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 276, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION RELATED TO THE PROTECTION 
AND MANAGEMENT OF ENDANGERED 
SPECIES", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1411) recommending that H.R. 
No. 269, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 

seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 269, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING THE DEVELOP­
MENT OF WORKING PLANS FOR 
NATIVE HAWAIIAN HOMESTEADERS 
ON THE ISLAND OF MOLOKAI", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1412) recommending that H.R. 
No. 209, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 209, 
HD l, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION URGING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
LAND AND NATURAL RESOURCES TO 
GIVE TOP PRIORITY TO THE PLAN­
NING, DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION 
OF A NEW IRRIGATION SYSTEM AT 
THE EAST WAIOLI RIVER, KAUAI", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1413) recommending that H.R. 
No. 275, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 275, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION RELATING TO GEOGRAPHIC 
INFORMATION SYSTEMS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1414) recommending that H.R. 
No. 435 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 435, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A FEASIBILITY STUDY 
ON THE ESTABLISHMENT OF BUSI­
NESS AND INDUSTRIAL DEVELOP­
MENT CORPORATIONS (BIDCOS) IN 
HAWAII", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
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Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1415) recommending that H.R. 
No. 364 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 364, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
RECOGNIZING THE INTENT OF LAND 
OWNERS TO HARVEST TREES IN 
AREAS DESIGNATED AS TREE 
FARMS", was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1416) recommending that H.R. 
No. 112, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 112, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING THE UNIVERSITY 
OF HAWAII AND THE DEPARTMENT 
OF LAND AND NATURAL RESOURCES 
TO STUDY THE NEED FOR POST­
SECONDARY EDUCATION IN WEST 
HAWAII AND IF APPROPRIATE, TO 
IDENTIFY A SITE FOR A HIGHER 
EDUCATION FACILITY", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1417) recommending that H.R. 
No. 377 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
377, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
CONCERNING THE MANAGEMENT AND 
FUNDING OF THE NATURAL AREA 
RESERVES SYSTEM", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1418) recommending that H. R. 
No. 205 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
205, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 

REQUESTING A STUDY ON 
PROPER DISPOSAL OF 'WET' 
TERIES", was adopted, with 
resentative Anderson voting no. 

THE 
BAT­
Rep-

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1419) recommending that H.R. 
No. 376 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
376, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DIRECTOR OF THE 
DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING AND 
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT TO SPON­
SOR A CONFERENCE ON RENEWABLE 
ENERGY SYSTEMS", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1420) recommending 
that H.R. No. 339, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 339, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION RELATING TO A COM­
MISSION TO EXAMINE THE DEVEL­
OPMENT OF KAPOLEI AS A SECOND 
CITY", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1421) recommending 
that H.R. No. 356 be adopted, 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 356, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION URGING THE POSTMASTER 
GENERAL TO CONTINUE POSTAL 
OPERATIONS AT HAKALAU AND 
PAAUHAU ON THE ISLAND OF 
HAWAII", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
majority of the Committee on Inter­
governmental Relations, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1422) 
recommending that H.R. No. 30, as 
amended in HD 2, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
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the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and H.R. No. 30, HD 2, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
RELATING TO THE 'OLD GOVERN­
MENT ROAD' AT DIAMOND HEAD, 
OAHU", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. .Rep. No. 1423) recommending 
that H.R. No. 253 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 253, entitled: "HOUSE RESO-
LUTION URGING THE UNITED 
STATES TO EXTEND AN INVITATION 
TO FRANCE TO USE UNITED STATES 
NUCLEAR TESTING FACILITIES AS 
AN ALTERNATIVE TO USING ITS 
CURRENT SITE IN THE SOUTH 
PACIFIC", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand . 
Com. Rep. No. 1424) recommending 
that H.R. No. 258 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 258, entitled: " HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE CREATION 
OF A SEPARATE STANDARD FED­
ERAL REGION FOR HAWAII AND THE 
TERRITORIES AND THE INSULAR 
POSSESSIONS IN THE PACIFIC" , was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health , presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep . No. 1425) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 165, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 165, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE HOUSE 
HEALTH COMMITTEE TO HOLD HEAR­
INGS AND RECOMMEND MEASURES 
TO BE TAKEN ON THE APPARENT 
SHORTAGE OF NURSES", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 142il) recom­
mending that H.R. No . 199 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 199, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
CONCERNING THE ESTABLISHMENT 
OF A STATE VETERANS HOME ON 
THE ISLAND OF HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1427) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 122, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted . 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 122, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU-
TION RELATING TO PHYSICAL 
THERAPISTS SERVING HANDICAPPED 
CHILDREN IN THE PUBLIC 
SCHOOLS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1428) recom­
mending that H.R. No . 18, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 18, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING A REPORT ON 
THE EFFORTS OF THE HOSPITALS 
TO CONTROL COSTS AND THE 
RESULTS OF THE EFFORTS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1429) 
recommending that H.R. No. 249, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted . 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 249, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION TO REDRAW SCHOOL 
BOUNDARIES ACCORDING TO NEIGH-
BORHOODS IN MILILANI", was 
adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1430) 
recommending that H.R. No. 282, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
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seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 282, HD 
l, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION TO STUDY THE NEED, 
BENEFITS, AND COSTS OF PRO­
VIDING STUDENT ACTIVITIES CO­
ORDINATORS FOR THE STATE'S 
INTERMEDIATE SCHOOLS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Shito, for the Com­
mittee on Housing and Community 
Development, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1431) recom­
mending that H. R. No. 380, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shito, 
seconded by Representative Hayes 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 380, 
HD l, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLU­
TION REQUESTING THE HAWAII 
HOUSING AUTHORITY TO ADDRESS 
ISSUES RELATED TO LEASEHOLD 
CONVERSION OF CONDOMINIUMS 
AND COOPERATIVE HOUSING PRO­
JECTS", was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for 
Committee on Transportation, 
sented a report (Stand. Com. 
No. 1432) recommending that 
No. 336 be adopted. 

the 
pre­
Rep. 
H.R. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 336, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION RELATING TO ANTI­
COMMUTING TELEWORK CENTERS", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for 
Committee on Transportation, 
sented a report (Stand. Com. 
No. 1433) recommending that 
No. 431 be adopted. 

the 
pre­
Rep. 
H.R. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 431, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY TO 
IMPROVE THE TRANSPORTATION 
ACCESS SYSTEM TO LEEWARD COM­
MUNITY COLLEGE AND WEST OAHU 
COLLEGE", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for 
Committee on Transportation, 
sented a report (Stand. Com. 
No. 1434) recommending that 

the 
pre­
Rep. 
H.R. 

No. 322 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 322, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF TRANSPORTATION TO 
REPORT ON TRAFFIC PLANS AND 
PRIORITIES FOR UPCOUNTRY MAUI", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro , for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1435) recommending that H. R. 
No. 185, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 185, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
ENCOURAGEMENT AND ASSISTANCE 
TO THOSE WISHING TO MAKE AN 
ORGAN DONATION", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Oshiro, for 
Committee on Transportation, 
sented a report (Stand. Com. 
No. 1436) recommending that 
No. 303 be adopted. 

the 
pre­
Rep. 
H.R. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 303, entitled: "HOUSE RESO-
LUTION RELATING TO SAFETY 
IMPROVEMENTS AT THE SOUTH 
INTERSECTION OF KUNIA DRIVE 
AND KUN IA ROAD", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1437) recommending 
that H. R. No. 234, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
234, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION EXPRESSING LEGISLATIVE 
SUPPORT FOR PROPOSED SUB-
MARINE TOUR OPERATIONS IN 
HAWAIIAN WATERS BY ATLANTIS 
SUBMARINES, INC.", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 
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Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a rept,rt (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1438) recommending 
that H.R. No. 11, as amended in HD 
l, be adopted. 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred to the end of the calendar. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1439) recommending 
that H.R. No. 243, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
243, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE SUPPORT 
OF HAWAII'S CONGRESSIONAL DELE­
GATION FOR THE SUPPORT OF 
LEGISLATION AND OTHER PRO­
GRAMS TO HELP CONTROL THE 
PLASTIC AND NET POLLUTION OF 
OUR OCEANS", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1440) recommending 
that H. C.R. No. 4 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 4, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING A REPORT IDENTIFYING 
GROUPS OF INDIVIDUALS MOST 
SUSCEPTIBLE TO ECONOMIC JOB 
DISLOCATION DUE TO INDUSTRIAL 
CLOSINGS, AND RECOMMENDING A 
PRELIMINARY CONTINGENCY PLAN 
FOR REPLACEMENT JOBS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1441) recommending that H.R. 
No. 100, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 100, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
TO DEVISE A PEDESTRIAN SAFETY 
PLAN FOR KALANIANAOLE HIGHWAY 
IN EAST HONOLULU", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 

no. 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the Committees on Education and 
Legislative Management, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1442) recommending that H.R. No. 
102, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Okamura 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
102, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
THE CURRENT SYSTEM OF ELECTING 
BOARD OF EDUCATION MEMBERS", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1443) recommending 
that H.R. No. 400, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
400, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THAT THE 
GOVERNOR AND THE MAYORS OF 
HAWAII, HONOLULU, KAUAI AND 
MAUI PROCLAIM THE MONTH OF MAY 
1987 AS HOKULE' A MONTH", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representatives Tam and Fukunaga, 
for the Committees on Education and 
Legislative Management, presented a 
joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1444) recommending that H.R. No. 
281 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tam, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the joint report of the 
Committees was adopted and H.R. No. 
281, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE LEGISLATIVE 
REFERENCE BUREAU TO STUDY THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION'S 
PROCEDURES AND CRITERIA IN 
IDENTIFICATION OF SPECIAL EDU­
CATION STUDENTS", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1445) recommending that H.R. 
No .. 438, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi-
ro, seconded by Representative 
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Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 438, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
TO REVIEW AND UPDATE THE WAI­
MEA, ISLAND OF HAWAII, BYPASS 
ROAD PROJECT", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for 
Committee on Transportation, 
sented a report (Stand. Com. 
No. 1446) recommending that 
No. 332 be adopted. 

the 
pre­
Rep. 
H.R. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 332, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION URGING THE INCREASED 
ENFORCEMENT OF MAXIMUM VEHICLE 
BUMPER HEIGHT REGULATIONS", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1447) recommending that H.R. 
No. 172, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 172, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION CLARIFYING THE INTENT 
OF THE LEGISLATURE WITH RES­
PECT TO THE DIAMOND HEAD 
STATE MONUMENT", was adopted, 
with Representatives Anderson, 
Cavasso and Hemmings voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1448) recommending that H.R. 
No. 210, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 210, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF LAND AND NATURAL 
RESOURCES TO CONDUCT A BASE­
LINE STUDY OF THE HANALEI RIVER 
ESTUARY AND OTHER NORTH SHORE 
RIVERS, KAUAI", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
majority of the Committee on Trans­
portation, presented a report (Stand. 

Com. Rep. No. 1449) recommending 
that H. R. No. 309, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the majority of the Committee was 
adopted and H.R. No. 309, HD 1, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A FEASIBILITY STUDY 
OF THE CONSTRUCTION OF AN 
INTERCHANGE ON THE H-1 FREEWAY 
AT KAONOHI STREET", was adopted, 
with Representatives Anderson and 
Tungpalan voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1450) recommending 
that H.R. No. 345, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
345, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
EDUCATIONAL PROGRAMS IN MARI­
TIME-RELATED FIELDS", was adopt­
ed, with Representative Anderson 
voting no. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1451) recommending 
that H.R. No. 401 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
401, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
FEASIBILITY OF DEVELOPING A 
HAWAII OCEANBOOK", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1452) recommending that 
H.R. No. 21 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
21, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF THE 
POSSIBLE FORMATION OF A SECOND 
PUBLIC DEFENDER PROGRAM", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
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and Environmental Protection, 
sented a report (Stand. Com. 
No. 1453) recommending that 
No. 432 be adopted. 

pre­
Rep. 
H.R. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
432, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A REVIEW OF THE 
APPLICABILITY OF CHAPTER 343, 
HRS", was adopted, with Representa­
tive Anderson voting no. 

Representative Cachola, for the 
Committee on Tourism, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1454) 
recommending that H.R. No. 272 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Oshiro and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
272, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY ON THE 
FEASIBILITY OF SPONSORING A HOT 
AIR BALLOON TO REPRESENT 
HAWAII IN AN INTERNATIONAL HOT 
AIR BALLOON FESTIVAL IN AUS­
TRALIA AND THE EFFECTS OF SUCH 
AN EVENT ON HAWAII'S TOURISM 
INDUSTRY", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1455) recommending 
that H.R. No. 120 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 120, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A REPORT 
IDENTIFYING GROUPS OF INDIVID­
UALS MOST SUSCEPTIBLE TO ECO­
NOMIC JOB DISLOCATION DUE TO 
INDUSTRIAL CLOSINGS, AND RECOM­
MENDING A PRELIMINARY CONTIN­
GENCY PLAN FOR REPLACEMENT 
JOBS", was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Hagino, for the 
Committee on Human Services, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1456) recommending that H.R. 
No. 398, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Hagi­
no, seconded by Representative 
Arakaki and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 398, HD l, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION ESTAB­
LISHING A PHILOSOPHY OF CORREC-

TIONS FOR HAWAII", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Cachola, for the 
Committee on Tourism, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1457) 
recommending that H.R. No. 289 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Oshiro and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
289, entitled : "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THAT EFFORTS BE 
MADE TO ESTABLISH MORE PROFES­
SIONAL GOLF TOURNAMENTS IN 
HAWAII", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Crozier, for the 
Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1458) recommending 
that H.R. No. 384, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative 
Crozier, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 384, HD 1, entitled : "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
STATE AND CITY AND COUNTY OF 
HONOLULU TO IMPLEMENT A PILOT 
PROGRAM TO PROVIDE CERTAIN 
SERVICES DURING EVENING HOURS 
AND ON SATURDAYS", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1459) recommending that H.R. 
No. 24, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Bellinger and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 24, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION URGING THE UNITED 
STATES DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPOR­
TATION TO BAN SMOKING ON COM­
MERCIAL AIRLINE FLIGHTS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1460) 
recommending that H.R. No. 411, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 411, HD 
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1, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE GOVERNOR'S 
APPOINTED TASK FORCE TO EX­
PLORE METHODS TO PREVENT THE 
CLOSING OF WAIALUA SUGAR COM­
PANY AND FOR A STUDY OF 
HAWAII'S SUGAR INDUSTRY", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1461) 
recommending that H.R. No. 305, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.R. No. 305, HD 
l, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
URGING CONGRESS TO OPPOSE THE 
REAGAN ADMINISTRATION PROPOS­
AL TO LOWER THE PRICE SUPPORT 
LEVEL FOR SUGAR TO 12 CENTS 
PER POUND", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1462) recommending that 
H.R. No. 47, as amended in HD 2, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
47, HD 2, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING AN EXAMI­
NATION OF THE NEED FOR TWO 
LAND RECORDING SYSTEMS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1463) recommending that 
H.R. No. 260, HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
260, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE LEGIS­
LATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU TO 
STUDY THE STATE OF SMALL BUSI­
NESS IN HAWAII", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1464) recommending that 
H.R. No. 216, as amended in HD 2, 
be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka-

mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
216, HD 2, entitled : "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING A STUDY OF 
THE FUTURE OF THE SUGAR INDUS­
TRY IN HAWAII", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1465) recommending that H.R. 
No. 288, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
288, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF HEALTH TO TEST DIS­
PERSANTS AND FOR THE STATE 
CIVIL DEFENSE TO MAKE RECOM­
MENDATIONS ON STOCKPILING 
DISPERSANTS BEST SUITED FOR 
HAWAIIAN WATERS AND TO ESTAB­
LISH MORE EFFICIENT OPERATING 
PROCEDURES IN THE EVENT OF AN 
OIL SPILL", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1466) recommending that H.R. 
No. 287 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.R. No. 
287, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE OFFICE OF EN­
VIRONMENTAL QUALITY CONTROL 
TO MONITOR AND COORDINATE THE 
PROGRESS OF PESTICIDE ACTION 
PLANS DEVELOPED UNDER ACT 275, 
SESSION LAWS OF HAWAII, 1984, 
AS AMENDED BY ACT 127, SESSION 
LAWS OF HAWAII, 1985", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1467) recommending that H.R. 
No. 397 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 397, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THAT THE GOVERNOR 
OF HAWAII PROCLAIM 1988 AS THE 
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YEAR OF TELECOMMUNICATIONS IN 
THE STATE OF HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1468) recommending that H.R. 
No. 420, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

Representative Liu rose and stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, rise to speak 
against House Resolution 420, HD 1, 
and House Concurrent Resolution 256, 
HD 1. 

"Mr. Speaker, I speak against these 
resolutions more out of a general 
concern that these resolutions with no 
ill-intents I know meant by the 
chairman of those who support the 
resolutions. As an example, I think 
of some of the excesses which per­
haps we are dealing with this 
evening. I don't believe that the 
resolutions in so many of these cases 
are necessary. I think there are 
many good resolutions but I think 
there are many which, like these 
resolutions before us, perhaps after 
hearing and after the concern of the 
subject matter committees expressed, 
that that would have been sufficient. 
I don't think that the High Tech­
nology Development Corporation needs 
to be told that it should look at legal 
and economic incentives to take 
advantage of the new high fiber-optic 
line which will be laid by 1990. I 
think that's why we created the High 
Technology Development Corporation. 

"And think for a number of 
resolutions here, unless our state 
government is totally in a state of 
inertia which, although a Republican, 
I don't believe, I would hope that 
perhaps, next session, we could all 
take some look at these with a view of 
some restraint. 

"So, with those words, Mr. Speak­
er, I speak against the resolutions 
and hope all of us take note as we 
end up this evening. 

"Thank you." 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 420, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION DIRECTING THE HIGH TECH­
NOLOGY DEVELOPMENT CORPORA­
TION TO WORK WITH TELECOM­
MUNICATIONS CARRIERS TO IDENTI-

FY THE LEGAL AND ECONOMIC 
INCENTIVES NECESSARY TO PRO­
MOTE THE GROWTH OF TELECOM­
MUNICATIONS INFRASTRUCTURE IN 
THE STATE OF HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representatives Ander­
son, Hemmings and Liu voting no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1469) recommending that H. C.R. 
No. 223, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H.C.R. 
No. 223, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION REQUEST­
ING THE PUBLIC UTILITIES COM­
MISSION TO DISCUSS THE WAYS 
AND MEANS OF ESTABLISHING 
COMPREHENSIVE LEAST-COST PLAN­
NING PROGRAMS FOR HAWAII'S 
ELECTRIC UTILITIES DURING ITS 
UPCOMING SEMINAR-WORKSHOP 
SCHEDULED FOR JUNE 1987", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1470) recommending that H.R. 
No. 250, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 250, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
STATE TO SURVEY, MARK AND 
PLAN CONSTRUCTION FOR A REA­
SONABLE RIGHT-OF-WAY FOR THE 
RESIDENTS LIVING IN 'SADDLE 
CITY', WAIMANALO, OAHU, 
HAWAII", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Oshiro, for the 
Committee on Transportation, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1471) recommending that H.C.R. 
No. 142, as amended in HD l, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oshi­
ro, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 142, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE STATE TO SUR­
VEY, MARK AND PLAN CONSTRUC­
TION FOR A REASONABLE RIGHT­
OF-WA Y FOR THE RESIDENTS LIVING 
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IN 'SADDLE CITY', WAIMANALO, 
OAHU, HAWAII", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1472) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 274, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted, 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 274, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF HEALTH'S MENTAL HEALTH 
DIVISION RELOCATE THE ADOLES­
CENT UNIT OF THE HAWAII STATE 
HOSPITAL", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1473) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No. 161, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H, C, R, No. 
161, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 
THE DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH'S 
MENTAL HEALTH DIVISION RE­
LOCATE THE ADOLESCENT UNIT OF 
THE HAWAII STATE HOSPITAL", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1474) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 388, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No, 388, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF HEALTH TO CONTINUE TO 
STUDY THE PROBLEM OF PROVIDING 
MEDICAL CARE TO INDIGENTS IN 
HAWAII", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No, 1475) recom­
mending that H.C.R. No, 232, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.C.R. No. 
232, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE CON­
CURRENT RESOLUTION REQUESTING 

THE DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH TO 
CONTINUE TO STUDY THE PROBLEM 
OF PROVIDING MEDICAL CARE TO 
INDIGENTS IN HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no, 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1476) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 389, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 389, 
HD l, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THE DEPART­
MENT OF HEALTH TO INVESTIGATE 
THE PROBLEMS AND HAZARDS TO 
PUBLIC HEALTH AND SAFETY AS-
SOCIATED WITH AMERICAN PIT 
BULL TERRIER BREEDING AND 
OWNERSHIP IN HAWAII", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

At 9:35 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Bunda asked for a recess and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 9:36 o'clock p.m. 

Representative Bunda, for the 
Committee on Ocean and Marine Re­
sources, presented a report (Stand, 
Com. Rep. No. 1477) recommending 
that H.R. No. 373 be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Bun­
da, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 373, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION REQUESTING THAT HAWAII'S 
CONGRESSIONAL DELEGATION SUP­
PORT THE RESTORATION OF FED­
ERAL FUNDS FOR CONTINUED 
OPERATION OF THE NEWLY ESTAB­
LISHED REGIONAL AQUACULTURE 
CENTERS PROGRAM IN THE UNITED 
STATES DEPARTMENT OF AGRI­
CULTURE", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representatives Honda and Levin, 
for the Committees on Agriculture and 
Water, Land Use, Development and 
Hawaiian Affairs, presented a joint 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1478) 
recommending that H.R. No. 327, as 
amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Levin and 
carried, the joint report of the Com­
mittees was adopted and H.R. No. 
327, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO-
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LOTION REQUESTING A STUDY ON 
THE FEASIBILITY OF PRODUCING 
HERBS, SPICES, DECIDUOUS 
FRUITS, AVOCADOS, AND JOJOBA 
BEANS IN THE STATE OF HAWAII", 
was adopted, with Representative 
Anderson voting no. 

Representative Honda, for the 
Committee on Agriculture, presented a 
report (Stand. Corn. Rep. No. 1479) 
recommending that H. R. No. 440 be 
adopted, 

On motion by Representative Honda, 
seconded by Representative Say and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H. R. No. 440, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING AN INVESTIGATION OF 
THE FEASIBILITY OF BIOLOGICAL 
CONTROL OF FOUNTAIN GRASS 
(PENNISETUM SETACEUM)", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Tam, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1480) 
recommending that H. C.R. No. 252, 
as amended in HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tarn, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 252, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
BOARD OF EDUCATION TO CONDUCT 
AN EVALUATION OF THE PRESENT 
PROGRAM OF READING AND WRITING 
INSTRUCTION IN THE PUBLIC 
SCHOOLS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Tarn, for the Com­
mittee on Education, presented a 
report (Stand. Corn. Rep. No. 1481) 
recommending that H.C.R. No. 255, 
as amended in HD 1 , be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Tarn, 
seconded by Representative Lee and 
carried, the report of the Committee 
was adopted and H.C.R. No. 255, HD 
1, entitled: "HOUSE CONCURRENT 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION TO 
STUDY THE FEASIBILITY OF ES­
TABLISHING A PUBLIC LIBRARY ON 
THE NORTH SHORE OF KAUAI", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Shon, for the Com­
mittee on Health, presented a report 
(Stand. Corn. Rep. No. 1482) recom­
mending that H.R. No. 387 be re­
ferred to the Committee on Legislative 
Management. 

On motion by Representative Shon, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 3.87, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING CERTAIN INTERIM 
STUDIES BY THE HOUSE COMMITTEE 
ON HEALTH", was referred to the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Corn. Rep. 
No. 1483) recommending that H.R. 
No. 365 be referred to the Committee 
on Finance. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H. R. No. 365, 
entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING AN EXAMINATION OF 
TAX LAWS WHICH SERVE TO INHIBIT 
REFORESTATION ACTIVITIES", was 
referred to the Committee on Finance, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Levin, for the 
Committee on Water, Land Use, Devel­
opment and Hawaiian Affairs, pre­
sented a report (Stand, Corn. Rep. 
No, 1484) recommending that H.R. 
No. 38, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Levin, 
seconded by Representative D. Ige 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and H.R. No. 38, 
HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE RESO­
LUTION URGING THE UNTED STATES 
CONGRESS TO SUPPORT LEGISLA­
TION THAT PROVIDE COMPREHEN­
SIVE HEALTH CARE SERVICES TO 
NATIVE HAWAIIANS", was adopted, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
no. 

Representative Andrews, for the 
Committee on the Planning, Energy 
and Environmental Protection, pre­
sented a report (Stand. Com. Rep. 
No. 1485) recommending that H.C.R. 
No, 236, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative An­
drews, seconded by Representative 
Kanoho and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. C.R. 
No. 236, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
CONCURRENT RESOLUTION URGING 
THAT THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANS­
PORTATION ADOPT RULES RE­
GARDING THE DISCHARGE OR LEAK­
AGE OF WATER POLLUTANTS FROM 
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VESSELS INTO OR UPON STATE 
WATERS", was adopted, with Repre­
sentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Cachola, for the 
Committee on Tourism, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1486) 
recommending that H.R. No. 353 be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Oka­
mura, seconded by Representative 
Alcon and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and H. R. No. 
353, entitled: "HOUSE RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THE DEVELOPMENT 
AND IMPLEMENTATION OF MARKET­
ING CAMPAIGNS TO ATTRACT PAR­
TICIPANTS AND SPECTATORS OF 
THE 1988 SUMMER OLYMPIC GAMES 
TO HAWAII", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1487) recommending 
that H.R. No. 378, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 378, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A REPORT 
ASSESSING THE ADEQUACY OF 
RESOURCES AVAILABLE TO ASSIST 
DISPLACED WORKERS IN HAWAII 
AND RECOMMENDING STRATEGIES 
FOR DEVELOPING A COORDINATED 
AND COMPREHENSIVE APPROACH TO 
SERVING THESE PERSONS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1488) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 220, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 220, HD l, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A REPORT ASSESSING 
THE ADEQUACY OF RESOURCES 
AVAILABLE TO ASSIST DISPLACED 
WORKERS IN HAWAII AND RECOM­
MENDING STRATEGIES FOR DEVEL­
OPING A COORDINATED AND COM­
PREHENSIVE APPROACH TO SERVING 
THESE PERSONS", was adopted, with 
Representative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em-

ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1489) recommending 
that H.R. No. 436, as amended in HD 
1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H.R. 
No. 436, HD 1, entitled: "HOUSE 
RESOLUTION REQUESTING A STUDY 
OF HEALTH FUND BENEFIT COSTS 
FOR RETIRED STATE AND COUNTY 
EMPLOYEES, ALTERNATE FUNDING 
SOURCES, AND RECOMMENDA­
TIONS", was adopted, with Rep­
resentative Anderson voting no. 

Representative Takamine, for the 
Committee on Labor and Public Em­
ployment, presented a report (Stand. 
Com. Rep. No. 1490) recommending 
that H.C.R. No. 269, as amended in 
HD 1, be adopted. 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and 
H.C.R. No. 269, HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING A STUDY OF HEALTH 
FUND BENEFIT COSTS FOR RETIRED 
STATE AND COUNTY EMPLOYEES, 
ALTERNATE FUNDING SOURCES, 
AND RECOMMENDATIONS", was 
adopted, with Representative Ander­
son voting no. 

At this time, Representative Ander­
son rose and stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, would like the 
Clerk to have a 'no' vote for me on 
all resolutions and concurrent reso­
lutions this evening and I waited for 
now because this is the last one. 

"The reason being, Mr. Speaker, a 
part of it is because of what Rep­
resentative Liu said, a part of it is 
because we had resolutions earlier 
that I thought beat the media and I 
talked to both chairmen and they 
refused, and I think the public 
deserves to hear certain bills when 
they pertain to either foreign in­
vestments or prostitution and AIDS, 
and if the chairman won't hear those, 
then it bothers me that I have to sit 
here all evening because all of these 
are so important that we had to wait 
all evening on our time, and for that 
reason, even though there are some 
in here that's very good, I think it 
should be brought to the attention of 
the public that some of these things 
that is supposed to be heard, have 
public hearings, and find out what's 
going on in this State, is not being 
done. And I don't think that we are 
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doing our job when we do it. Now, I 
can go ahead and joke a lot but when 
I get frustrated on this floor, I will 
most certainly tell you and, right 
now, I've had it. 

"Thank you very much, Mr. Speak-
er." 

MATTERS DEFERRED TO THE 
END OF THE CALENDAR 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1438 on 
H.R. No. 11, HD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1366 on 
H.C.R. No. 6, HD 1: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

At 9:41 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 9:49 o'clock p.m. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representatives Bunda, Levin and 
Oshiro, for the Committees on Ocean 
and Marine Resources; Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian Af­
fairs; and Transportation, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1515) recommending that H.C.R. No. 
139, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1515 on 
H.C.R. No. 139, HD 1, was deferred, 
and in accordance with Section 171-
60, Hawaii Revised Statutes, printed 
copies of H.C.R. No. 139, HD 1, 
were made available to the members of 
the House at 9: 30 o'clock p. m. 

Representatives Bunda, Levin and 
Oshiro, for the Committees on Ocean 
and Marine Resources; Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian Af­
fairs; and Transportation, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1516) recommending that H.C.R. No. 
151, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1516 on 
H.C.R. No. 151, HD 1, was deferred, 
and in accordance with Section 171-
60, Hawaii Revised Statutes, printed 

copies of H.C.R. No. 151, HD 1, 
were made available to the members of 
the House at 9: 30 o'clock p. m. 

Representatives Bunda, Levin and 
Oshiro, for the Committees on Ocean 
and Marine Resources; Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian Af­
fairs; and Transportation, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1517) recommending that H.C.R. No. 
152, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1517 on 
H.C.R. No. 152, HD 1, was deferred, 
and in accordance with Section 171-
60, Hawaii Revised Statutes, printed 
copies of H.C.R. No. 152, HD 1, 
were made available to the members of 
the House at 9:30 o'clock p.m. 

Representatives Bunda, Levin and 
Oshiro, for the Committees on Ocean 
and Marine Resources; Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian Af­
fairs; end Transportation, presented 
a joint report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 
1520) recommending that H.C.R. No. 
154, as amended in HD 1, be 
adopted. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1520 on 
H.C.R. No. 154, HD 1, was deferred, 
and in accordance with Section 171-
60, Hawaii Revised Statutes, printed 
copies of H.C.R. No. 154, HD 1, 
were made available to the members of 
the House at 9:30 o'clock p.m. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Shon: "There are a 
couple of bills in conference in the 
context of the Judiciary conferences 
that has just about started. I want 
to remind the members that we will be 
at the end of that agenda." 

Representative Levin requested 
waiver of the 48-hour notice for 
hearings on Senate Concurrent Reso­
lution No. 66, and the Chair "so 
ordered." 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 9:50 o'clock p.m., on motion by 
Representative Apo, seconded by 
Representative Anderson and carried, 
the House of Representatives ad­
journed until 11:30 o'clock a.m. 
tomorrow, Thursday, April 23, 1987. 
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FIFTY-EIGHTH DAY 

Thursday, April 23, 1987 

The House of Representatives of 
the Fourteenth Legislature of the 
State of Hawaii, Regular Session of 
1987, convened at 11: 50 o'clock 
a. m. , with the Speaker presiding. 

The Divine Blessing was invoked 
by Mrs. Marinell Eron of Christ 
Memorial Episcopal Church, after 
which the Roll was called showing 
all members present with the 
exception of Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
who were excused. 

By unanimous consent, reading 
and approval of the Journal of the 
House of Representatives of the 
Fifty-Seventh Day was deferred. 

SENATE COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications 
from the Senate (Sen. Com. Nos. 
810 to 825) were read by the Clerk 
and were disposed of as follows: 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 810) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
26, requesting that the Governor 
and Hawaii's congressional delega­
tion take immediate action to 
develop and implement an action 
plan to exempt Pearl Harbor Naval 
Shipyard from the Federal Govern­
ment's new competitive bidding 
policy, which was adopted by the 
Senate on April 22, 1987, was 
placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 26 was deferred until 
later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 811) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
31, SDl, urging action to order a 
new and distinctive issue of motor 
vehicle license plates, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 22, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 31, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 812) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
52, SDl, concerning a state stand­
ard road around Kaena Point, 
Oahu, which was adopted by the 
Senate on April 22, 1987, was 

placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 52, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 813) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 56, 
requesting a study to designate the 
Bishop Museum as the Hawaii State 
Museum for Natural and Cultural 
History, which was adopted by the 
Senate on April 22, 1987, was placed 
on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 56 was deferred until 
later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 814) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 65, 
SDl, concerning the posting of the 
price of gasoline by the gallon, which 
was adopted by the Senate on April 
22, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 65, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 815) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
102, SDl, requesting the Legislative 
Reference Bureau to study the state 
of small business in Hawaii, which 
was adopted by the Senate on April 
22, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 102, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 816) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
113, requesting Congress to allow the 
State of Hawaii to regulate the flight 
and altitude patterns of helicopters 
engaged in intrastate air travel, 
which was adopted by the Senate on 
April 22, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 113 was deferred until 
later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 817) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
115, SDl, requesting the erection of 
a new roadway directional sign for 
the benefit of lei sellers at the 
Honolulu International Airport, which 
was adopted by the Senate on April 
22, 1987, was placed on file. 
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By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 115, SD1, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 818) transmitting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
116, SDl, supporting continual efforts 
for the expeditious tranfer to the 
State of County highways designated 
for inclusion in the State Highway 
System, but not yet transferred, and 
the State funding of necessary repair 
and maintenance costs, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 22, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 116, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 819) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
140, SDl, urging the State admini­
stration to comply with the imple­
mentation plans of the panels of 
experts established under the consent 
decree between the American Civil 
Liberties Union and State of Hawaii in 
order to improve conditions at the 
Oahu Community Correctional Center 
and Women's Community Correctional 
Center, which was adopted by the 
Senate on April 22, 1987, was placed 
on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 140, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 820) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
142, SDl, requesting corrections 
officials of the Department of Social 
Services and Housing, with the active 
support and assistance of the Depart­
ment of Health, to develop a pilot 
study on implementing a low sugar 
and nutritionally sufficient, but not 
excessive, caloric dietary program for 
inmates, which was adopted by the 
Senate on April 22, 1987, was placed 
on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 142, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 821) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
145, requesting the Department of 
Transportation to revise the Bikeplan 
Hawaii for the safe and effective 
mtegration of the bicycle into the 
State Transportation System, which 
was adopted by the Senate on April 
22, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 145 was deferred until 
later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 822) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
165, encouraging and supporting the 
establishment of a center for inter­
national commercial dispute resolution, 
which was adopted by the Senate on 
April 22, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 165 was deferred until 
later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 823) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
166, SDl, requesting the Department 
of Planning and Economic Development 
to explore the problems and issues 
relating to the formation and avail­
ability of capital in Hawaii, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 22, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 166, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 824) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
171, requesting a management audit of 
the Corrections Division of the De­
partment of Social Service and Hous­
ing, which was adopted by the Senate 
on April 22, 1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S. C.R. No. 171 was deferred until 
later in the calendar. 

A communication from the Senate 
(Sen. Com. No. 825) transmittting 
Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
172, SDl, requesting the Conference 
of Personnel Directors to review and 
consider the feasibility of pricing the 
correctional officer series at higher 
salary ranges and to consider its 
effect on improving the quality of 
correctional officers, which was 
adopted by the Senate on April 22, 
1987, was placed on file. 

By unanimous consent, action on 
S.C.R. No. 172, SDl, was deferred 
until later in the calendar. 

At this time, the following intro­
ductions were made to the members of 
the House: 

Representative Tungpalan, on 
behalf of Representatives Hashimoto, 
D. Ige, Shito, Oshiro, Crozier, 
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Peters, Apo, and Kihano, introduced 
30 high school student government 
leaders from the following Leeward 
District schools: Pearl City, Waipahu, 
Nanakuli and Waianae. They were 
accompanied by teachers, Mrs. Mike 
Ishihara, from Pearl City; Mrs. Sue 
Stock from Nanakuli; Mr. Stan Suki­
moto from Waipahu; Mrs. Linda Ta­
naka from Waianae; and from the 
Leeward District office, Miss Joann 
Abe. 

Representative Cachola, on behalf 
of Representative Horita, introduced 
110 sixth grade students from Alia­
manu Elementary School, accompanied 
by their teachers, Mrs. Mikie Miya­
sato, Mrs. Marjorie Opulauoho, Mrs. 
Kathy Lee and Mrs. Gloria Shimizu. 

Tungpalan also Representative 
introduced Mr. 
his aide, Dot. 

Lefty Muramoto and 

Representative Cachola also intro­
duced Ms. Brenda Sterling, a former 
colleague and co-worker from Terri­
torial Savings and Loan. 

ORDER OF THE DAY 

DEFERRED RESOLUTIONS 

The following 
Resolutions were 
follows: 

S.C.R. Nos. 

Senate Concurrent 
disposed of as 

Referred to: 

26 Committee on Intergovern-
mental Relations 

31 Committee on Transportation 

52 Committee on Transportation 

56 Jointly to the Committees on 
Higher Education and the Arts and 
Legislative Management 

65 Committee on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce 

102 Jointly to the Committees on 
Water, Land Use, Development and 
Hawaiian Affairs and Legislative 
Management 

113 Committee on Transportation 

115 Committee on Transportation 

116 Jointly to the Committees on 
Intergovernmental Relations and 
Transportation 

140 
ces 

Committee on Human Servi-

142 Committee on Human Servi-
ces 

145 Committee on Transportation 

165 Jointly to the Committees on 
Judiciary and Consumer Protection 
and Commerce 

166 Committee on Water, Land 
Use, Development and Hawaiian 
Affairs 

171 Jointly to the Committees on 
Human Services and Legislative 
Management 

172 Committee on Labor and 
Public Employment 

COMMITTEE REASSSIGNMENT 

Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 
66 was re-referred jointly to the 
Committees on Water, Land Use, 
Development and Hawaiian Affairs; 
Tourism; and Legislative Management. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
certain resolutions out of order. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions 
Nos. 475 to 477) were read 
Clerk and were disposed of 
lows: 

(H.R. 
by the 
as fol-

A resolution (H.R. No. 475) congra­
tulating the State Elections Advisory 
Commitee and the members of the 1986 
state elections observer team was 
jointly offered by Representatives 
Ihara, Alcon, Anderson, Andrews, 
Apo, Arakaki, Bellinger, Bunda, 
Cachola, Cavasso, Crozier, Hagino, 
Hashimoto, Hayes, Hemmings, Hiraki, 
Hirono, Honda, D. Ige, Isbell, Jones, 
Kanoho, Kawakami, Lee, Leong; 
Levin, Liu, Medeiros, Okamura, 
O'Kieffe, Oshiro, Pfeil, Ribellia, Say, 
Shito, Shon, Takamine, Tam, Tom, 
Tungpalan and Yoshimura. 

On motion by Representative Ibara, 
seconded by Representative Leong 
and carried, H.R. No. 475 was 
adopted. 

Representative 
stated: 

I hara rose and 

"Mr. Speaker and fellow colleagues: 
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We have here, today, the individuals 
that this resolution congratulates, and 
it is my honor, at this time, to 
introduce the now-famous 1986 State 
election observer team. 

"First, from the Office of the 
Legislative Auditor, James Sterling; 
Patricia Rivera from Alu Like; Char­
lene Norris, Bar Association of Ha­
waii; Mary Jane Van Buren, Chamber 
of Commerce of Hawaii; Kevin Corri­
gan, Common Cause, Hawaii; Dennis 
Kam, Hawaii Newspaper Agency; 
Paulynn Ichimura, Hawaii Society of 
Certified Accountants; Barbara Sun­
derland, League of Women Voters; 
Glenn Robinson, Libertarian Party of 
Hawaii; and Jalna Keala, Office of 
Hawaiian Affairs; and Elwin Spray, 
Republican Party of Hawaii." All 
were asked to stand and be recog­
nized. 

Floral leis and certified copies of 
the resolution were presented to the 
honorees by Representatives Alcon, 
Arakaki, Bellinger, Cachola, Hayes, 
Hashimoto, Hiraki, Hirono, Ihara, 
Kanoho, Kawakami and Tungpalan. 

Representative Tom then rose to 
comment that the Democratic Party's 
observer in the State election was 
Representative Ihara. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 476) com­
mending and congratulating members 
of the heart transplant team and St. 
Francis Hospital for the successful 
performance of the first heart trans­
plant operation in Hawaii was jointly 
offered by Representatives Cachola, 
Alcon, Anderson, Bellinger, Bunda, 
Hagino, Hayes, Hiraki, Hirono, 
Honda, D. Ige, Ihara, Isbell, Lee, 
Leong, Marumoto, Medeiros, O'Kieffe, 
Pfeil, Ribellia, Shi to, Shon, Taniguchi 
and Tungpalan. 

On motion by 
chola, seconded 
Apo and carried, 
adopted. 

Representative Ca­
by Representative 
H.R. No. 476 was 

Representative Cachola then rose 
and stated: 

"Mr. Speaker and members of this 
Honorable Body: March 10, 1987, is 
a historical day for Hawaii for it was 
on that day that the first heart 
transplant operation in Hawaii was 
performed--truly a pioneering act. 
The fact that the modern day miracle 
such as heart transplant can be done 
in our lifetime is something that we 
can all be grateful for. 

"The gifted physician who led this 
most significant operation is a man 

with a remarkable background. His 
name is Dr. Ricardo Moreno-Cabral 
who is from Mexico. He arrived in 
Hawaii as an immigrant in 1971, the 
same year that I immigrated to Ha­
waii. I first met Dr. Moreno when he 
interned at St. Francis Hospital with 
my wife, Linda, in 1971-72. It was 
also in the same year that I met 
Sister Maureen Keleher, a friend. 
Since then, Dr. Moreno has risen to 
greater heights and contributed much 
to Hawaii's medical profession. Dr. 
Ricardo Moreno has an impressive list 
of awards and accomplishments includ­
ing fellowships with the American 
College of Surgeons, Royal College of 
Surgeons of Canada, and the Mexican 
Academy for Vascular Surgery. In 
addition, Mr. Speaker, Dr. Moreno 
has served as visiting professor of 
cardiac surgery in Barcelona, Spain, 
and as well as in Argentina. Dr. 
Moreno is currently assistant pro­
fessor at the College of Medicine at 
the University of Hawaii." 

The honoree, Dr. Moreno, was 
introduced to the members of the 
House by Representative Cachola. 
Accompanying Dr. Moreno was Sr. 
Maureen Keleher, chief executive 
officer of St. Francis Hospital and the 
heart transplant program, who is "a 
very special individual who spear­
headed the project from its infancy in 
January of 1984 at St. Francis Hospi­
tal." 

Carnation leis were presented to 
Dr. Moreno by Representative Fuku­
naga and to Sr. Keleher by Represen­
tative Ihara and certified copies of 
the resolution were presented to the 
honorees by Representative Cachola. 

Also recognized by Representative 
Cachola and who were seated in the 
gallery were the registered nurses 
who assisted in the heart transplant 
operation. They were: Ms. Joan 
Machado; Kathy Doi; Jan Kachur; and 
Fiona Beckley. Mrs. Bernice Moreno, 
wife of Dr. Moreno, was also recog­
nized as well as the hard-working 
staff of Dr. Moreno. They include: 
Kathy McLafferty; Judy Kerchak; 
Louise Anstrom; Teri Evanes; Waverly 
Izumigawa; Cheryl Chee; and Ivy 
Yamashita. 

A resolution (H.R. No. 477) recog­
nizing and acknowledging the Center 
for the Hearing Impaired of the 
Diocese of Honolulu was jointly of­
fered by Representatives Tom, Alcon, 
Crozier, Kawakami, Leong, Levin, 
Okamura, Oshiro, Say, Takamine and 
Tam. 

On motion by Representative Tom, 
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seconded by Representative Tung­
palan and carried, H.R. No. 477 was 
adopted. 

Representative Tom then rose and 
stated: 

"Mr. Speaker, it is with great pride 
that I stand before this Honorable 
Body and offer this resolution con­
gratulating and acknowledging the 
Center for the Hearing Impaired for 
the Diocese of Honolulu. 

"There are an estimated 60,000 
hearing-impaired citizens in Hawaii, 
4,500 of those with severe or pro­
found hearing loss, and this is a 
significant segment of our population. 

"I'm pleased to report that more 
and more people are learning sign 
language as a means of facilitating 
communication to those who are deaf, 
and you're seeing this means of 
communication being demonstrated 
before you today. I am told that 
even the Bishop of Honolulu, His 
Excellency Joseph Ferrario, is able to 
sign and further, popular recognition 
of the deaf community is growing as 
evident by the hit movie and Academy 
Award winner, 'Children of a Lesser 
God.' 

"Sometimes, Mr. Speaker, we in the 
Legislature can formulate bills to meet 
the needs of our citizens and some­
times it is best to be left to outside 
groups. Here is an example of an 
organization, the Catholic Church in 
Hawaii, reaching out to meet the 
needs of our deaf community. This is 
an exciting trend and I look forward 
to more groups to follow their lead. " 

At this time, the honorees were 
introduced to the members of the 
House and all were asked to stand 
and be recognized. They are as 
follows: Lorideane Mahaulu; John 
Morales; Sr. Marion Tung from the 
Office of the Hearing Impaired; Fr. 
Tony Bolger; and Fr. Tom Coughlin. 

Floral leis were presented to the 
honorees by Representatives Crozier, 
Fukunaga, Honda, Kawakami and 
Tungpalan and a certified copy of the 
resolution was presented to Fr. 
Coughlin by Representative Tom. 

At 12:20 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair, "for the purpose of 
greeting our honorees with a warm 
welcome this morning." 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:49 o'clock p.m. 

SUSPENSION OF RULES 

On motion by Representative Apo, 
seconded by Representative Anderson 
and carried, the rules were sus­
pended for the purpose of considering 
bills on Third and Final Reading on 
the basis of a modified consent cal­
endar. 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

H.B. No. 736, HD1, SD2, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 578, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1924, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1151, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 463, SDl, on Final Read­
ing: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1150, HD2, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 14, HD2, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

H.B. No. 1421, HDl, SDl, on Final 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

At 12:50 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
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declared a recess, subject to the call 
of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 12:51 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 448, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1001, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1224, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 444, SDI, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 393, SDI, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 419 on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 522 on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 525, SDI, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 632, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 727, SDI, on Third 
Reading : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 877, SDI, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 956, SDI, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1023, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 1526 , SD2, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 450 on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 451 on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 521 on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 452, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 11, SDl, on Third Read­
ing: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 216, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 
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S.B. No. 368 on Third Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 366, SDl, on Third 
Reading: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

S.B. No. 365, SD1, on Third 
Reading : 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1438 on 
H.R. No. 11, HDl: 

On motion by Representative 
Bunda, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and H. R. 
No. 11, as amended in HD 1, entitled: 
"HOUSE RESOLUTION DECLARING 
HAWAII'S COMMITMENT TO ATTAIN 
EFFECTIVE, SHARED MANAGEMENT 
ROLE WITH THE FEDERAL GOVERN­
MENT IN THE EXCLUSIVE ECONOMIC 
ZONE", was adopted. 

Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1366 on 
H.C.R. No. 6, HDl: 

Representative Bunda moved that 
the report of the Committee be 
adopted and H.C.R. No. 6, as 
amended in HDl, having been read 
throughout, be adopted, seconded by 
Representative Okamura. 

Representative Bunda then rose to 
speak in favor of the resolutions, 
stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, just briefly to ex­
plain why the resolutions are impor­
tant and were chosen as a part of the 
Ocean and Marine Resources Commit­
tee as a majority package. 

"In 1983, as you all know, the 
United States claimed ownership and 
control over the riches within the 
exclusive economic zone which extends 
200 miles from all of the United States 
coastal shores. This area is already 
known to have great potential for 
OTEC aquaculture and minerals like 
cobalt. It is one of the most crucial 
areas for the future of our state and 
a time to do something about it, is 
now. 

"The 
clared. 

EEZ was only recently de­
However, the Federal Govern-

ment has not yet established policies 
governing it. Hawaii, like other 
coastal states, must make a commit­
ment now if we are to have a say in 
what happens within the EEZ. If we 
miss this chance, the Department of 
the Interior and other federal agen­
cies will establish management policies 
that would exclude us. The impor­
tance of the ocean of our state is 
becoming clearer, Mr. Speaker, as we 
realiz~ its true potential. The EEZ 
area around Hawaii covers an area 
approximately 100 times the size of 
the land mass of our state and the 
three mile limit that the state now 
controls brings in hundreds of mil­
lions of dollars alone. The economic 
potential is somewhat known. Just 
how great it can be depends upon a 
cooperative plan of shared manage­
ment and shared revenues with the 
Federal Government. 

"Mr. Speaker, we must convince the 
Federal Government that we are 
competent and committed to the devel­
opment and management of our ocean. 
We have the administration, the 
university, the private sector and 
now, the Legislature, behind us and I 
hope this sends a clear message to 
Washington. 

"Mr. Speaker, appreciate the 
House's support on these resolutions 
and may I say that we're heading in 
the right direction and that to insure 
that we continue to do so. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and the report of the 
Committee was adopted, and H.C.R. 
No. 6, as amended in HDl, entitled: 
"HOUSE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
DECLARING HAWAII'S COMMITMENT 
TO ATTAIN EFFECTIVE, SHARED 
MANAGEMENT ROLE WITH THE FED­
ERAL GOVERNMENT IN THE EXCLU­
SIVE ECONOMIC ZONE", was adopted. 

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS 

Representative Metcalf, for the 
Committee on Judiciary, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1491) 
recommending that S. B. No. 435, 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, the report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 435, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO FISHING REGU­
LATIONS", passed Third Reading by 
a vote of 47 ayes, with Representa­
tives Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and 
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Tajiri being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1492) 
recommending that S. B. No. 17 41, 
SD2, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1741, SD2, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE EMPLOY­
EES' RETIREMENT SYSTEM", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1493) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1738, 
SD1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1738, SD1, entitled: '1A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE EMPLOY­
EES' RETIREMENT SYSTEM", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 435; 1741; and 
1738 had passed Third Reading at 
12:56 o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep . No. 1494) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1739, 
SD2, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1739, SD2, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE EMPLOY­
EES' RETIREMENT SYSTEM", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 1739 had passed 
Third Reading at 12:57 o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1495) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1746, 
SD1, pass Third Reading. 

Representative Liu then rose to 

speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, this is I know, a 
very well-meaning measure and I 
think the underlying statute which it 
intends to amend is also very well 
meaning. However , I think we have 
to, perhaps, at some point, perhaps, 
question where we're going and why 
and in some instances, perhaps, draw 
the line also. 

"I can understand the sense that, 
perhaps, volunteer boating enforce­
ment officers maintain the same type 
of potential danger in their line of 
assistance to the state as do reserve 
police officers and voluteer fire­
fighters. 

"However, I would like to point out 
that, currently , under our statutes-­
under 386-171 -- that, ' ... volunteer 
personnel are entitled to medical 
benefits for injuries incurred on the 
job'; that Section 90-4 concerning 
volunteer benefits, ' ... requires that 
the State agencies, within their 
budgets, should provide various 
benefits to volunteers, including 
meals, transportation reimbursements, 
out-of-service training, conference 
reimbursements, etc.' Granted, some 
agencies may not have that room in 
their budget, in which case they do 
not have to provide such measures. 
However, I think in many instances it 
can occur. The statutes again, I 
reiterate, does require the State to 
provide for medical costs when injur­
ies are incurred on the job, and I 
think we have to take a look at the 
whole reason that people volunteer, 
and I think those reasons are for a 
genuine feeling for wanting to assist 
others. I think we have to balance 
the interest involved and various cost 
to the State, and for that reason, I 
urge my other colleagues to please v­
ote 'no' on this measure. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1746, SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO WORKERS' 
COMPENSATION LAW", passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 43 ayes to 4 
noes, with Representatives Anderson, 
Hemmings, Liu and O'Kieffe voting 
no, and with Representatives Horita, 
M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being 
excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1496) 
recommending that S. B. No. 304, 
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pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 304, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE STATE LIBRAR­
IAN", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
being excused 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 17 46 and 304 had 
passed Third Reading at 12: 59 o'clock 
p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1497) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1752, 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1752, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE UNIVERSITY 
OF HAWAII", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and 
Tajiri being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1498) 
recommending that S. B. No. 17 42, 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
17 42, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO THE EMPLOYEES' 
RETIREMENT SYSTEM", passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, with 
Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 1752 and 1742 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 00 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1499) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1723, 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1723, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO TAXABLE MORT-

GAGE SECURITIES PROGRAMS", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Horita, M. 
Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. No. 1723 had passed 
Third Reading at 1: 01 o'clock p. m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1500) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1159 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee and S.B. No. 1159, entitled: 
"A BILL FOR AN ACT RELATING TO 
AIRPORTS", were recommitted to the 
Committee on Finance. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1501) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1151, 
SD1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1151, SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO HAWAII 
HOUSING AUTHORITY", passed Third 
Reading by a v.ote of 46 ayes to 1 no, 
with Representative Anderson voting 
n.o, and with Representatives Horita, 
M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being 
excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1502) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1083, 
SD1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1083, SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE CIVIL 
SERVICE LAW", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and 
Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. N.os. 1151 and 1083 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 02 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1503) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1053, 
SD1, pass Third Reading. 
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On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1053, SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO PUBLIC 
CONTRACTS", passed Third Reading 
by a vote of 47 ayes, with Represen­
tatives Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and 
Tajiri being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1504) 
recommending that S. B. No. 981, 
SDl, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 981, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO AGRICULTURE", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Horita, M. 
Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being excused 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1505) 
recommending that S. B. No. 909, 
SDl, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 909, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO SUBSTANCE ABUSE", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Horita, M. 
Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 1053; 981; and 
909 had passed Third Reading at 1: 03 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1506) 
recommending that S.B. No. 597, 
SD 1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 597, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO COUNTY HOUSING 
POWERS", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1507) 
recommending that S. B. No. 583, 
SD2, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 583, 
SD2, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO ANIMAL CONTROL 
FINES AND FORFEITURES", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 597 and 583 had 
passed Third Reading at 1: 04 o'clock 
p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1508) 
recommending that S.B. No. 533, 
SD 1, pass Third Reading. 

Representative Hemmings then rose 
to speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, though might 
admire the intent of the authors on 
this specific bill in consideration of 
the part that our House Judiciary 
Committee passed a good victim rights 
bill, and the Senate killed it, I would 
have to say, this bill 'stinks. ' 

"In short, it furthers the problem 
that we are facing in our society with 
a criminal justice system where we are 
too often worried about the welfare, 
rights, and the benefits of the cri­
minal while ignoring the rights and 
the welfare of the victim and society 
at large. I think it furthers the 
imbalance within our criminal justice 
system. We need systemic reform to 
the criminal justice system, and I do 
know that the chairman of Human 
Services and also the chairman of the 
Judiciary Committees have worked 
hard in certain aspects of this pro­
blem. 

"This bill, in light of what hap­
pened to the victim rights bill in the 
Senate, should not be acted on and 
passed. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

Representative Lee then rose to 
speak in favor of the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, the purpose of the 
bill is to establish an offender family 
service center. If we are to do 
something to rehabilitate, namely, the 
inmates, we should make it easier for 
the family members to come and visit 
them. It has nothing to do with 
coddling criminals. It has to do with 
trying to reintegrate inmates with 
their families, and I think we all 
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should recognize what the bill is and 
vote accordingly. 

"Therefore, I am in favor of this 
bill. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

Representative Crozier rose to 
speak in favor of the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I am one for justice; 
I am one for incarceration. However, 
I am a person who also believes in 
compassion, This bill addresses the 
needs and concerns of the families, 
They are not the criminals, but the 
families are still developing. They 
need to have an area where they can 
communicate with their parent, be it 
the father or the mother. I think we 
need this, we must show compassion 
for them. 

"Thank you very much." 

Representative Jones rose to speak 
in favor of the bill, with reserva­
tions, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I realize that this 
House does have compassion and I 
want to commend my colleagues for 
supporting this bill as well as the 
victims bill of rights. I think this 
House has definitely taken the high 
road and I think both Representative 
Hemmings and myself want to express 
our extreme frustration with the 
chairman of Judiciary in the Senate 
who has held up this victims bill of 
rights and, again, we see him leading 
the Senate in, perhaps, helping the 
families of the criminals, which is 
good, but ignoring the tremendous 
needs of the victims of our state, and 
when are we and our state going to 
get on board with helping the victims 
of crime? I think that both Repre­
sentative Hemmings and myself want 
to bring this point out very strongly 
this morning that the House was 
shafted by the chairman of Judiciary 
in terms of a balance to helping 
people who are victims of crime as 
well as the families of the perpetra­
tors. 

"That is why I have reservations 
and thank you, Mr. Speaker, for this 
chance to speak, 11 

Representative Hemmings then rose 
to speak in rebuttal, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, have a lot of 
compassion. But I have compassion, 
first, for the people who have been 
victimized, maimed and lives des­
troyed--for the families that have 
been destroyed--by the perpetrators 

of crime on our society. Compassion 
has to be balanced, and I see all too 
often the imbalance in our system 
where compassion is being given to 
the perpetrators of pain and anguish 
in our society, while the victims of 
pain and anguish are receiving little 
or nothing. 

"Thank you, Mr. Speaker." 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 533, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO OFFENDER FAMILIES", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 42 
ayes to 5 noes, with Representatives 
Cavasso, Hemmings, Liu, O'Kieffe and 
Ribellia voting no, and with Repre­
sentatives Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and 
Tajiri being excused, 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No, 1509) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1357, 
SDl, pass Third Reading, 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1357, SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE MOLOKAI 
IRRIGATION AND WATER UTILIZA­
TION PROJECT", passed Third Read­
ing by a vote of 47 ayes, with Repre­
sentatives Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and 
Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 533 and 1357 had 
passed Third Reading at 1: 10 o'clock 
p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1510) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1160, 
pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1160, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO CONCESSIONS", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 46 
ayes to 1 no , with Representative 
Anderson voting no, and with Repre­
sentatives Horita, M. lge, Metcalf and 
Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B . No. 1160 had passed 
Third Reading at 1:11 o'clock p.m, 
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Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1511) 
recommending that S. B. No. 1734, 
pass Third Reading. 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1512) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1737, 
SD2, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1737, SD2, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE DEPART­
MENT OF BUDGET AND FINANCE", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 43 
ayes to 4 noes, with Representatives 
Hemmings, Jones, Liu and O'Kieffe 
voting no, and with Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
being excused. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep, No. 1513) 
recommending that S.B. No. 1758, 
SD2, pass Third Reading, 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S.B. No. 
1758, SD2, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO THE DEPART­
MENT OF PLANNING AND ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT", passed Third Read­
ing by a vote of 46 ayes to 1 no, 
with Representative Hemmings voting 
no, and with Representatives Horita, 
M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being 
excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S.B. Nos. 1737 and 1758 
had passed Third Reading at 1: 12 
o'clock p.m. 

Representative Souki, for the 
Committee on Finance, presented a 
report (Stand. Com. Rep. No. 1514) 
recommending that S. B. No. 17 02, 
SD 1, pass Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Souki, 
seconded by Representative Fukunaga 
and carried, the report of the Com­
mittee was adopted and S. B. No. 
1702, SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR 
AN ACT RELATING TO EMPLOYEES 
OF THE LIEUTENANT GOVERNOR'S 
OFFICE", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 42 ayes to 5 noes, with 

Representatives Anderson, Cavasso, 
Jones, Liu and O'Kieffe voting no, 
and with Representatives Horita, M. 
Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 1702 had passed 
Third Reading at 1: 13 o'clock p. m. 

Rep re sen tatives Hirono and Metcalf, 
for the Committees on Consumer 
Protection and Commerce and Judici­
ary, presented a joint report (Stand, 
Com. Rep. No. 1518) recommending 
that S. B. No. 1098, pass Second 
Reading and be placed on the cal­
endar for Third Reading. 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, the joint report of 
the Committee was adopted and S. B. 
No. 1098, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO UNFAIR INSUR­
ANCE PRACTICES AND FRAUDS", 
passed Second Reading and was 
placed on the calendar for Third 
Reading. 

Representative Fukunaga, for the 
Committee on Legislative Management, 
presented a report (Stand. Com. 
Rep. No. 1519) recommending that 
S.C.R. No. 13, SDl, HDl, be 
adopted. 

On motion by Representative Fuku­
naga, seconded by Representative 
Souki and carried, the report of the 
Committee was adopted and S. C, R, 
No. 13, SDI, HDl, entitled: 
"SENATE CONCURRENT RESOLUTION 
REQUESTING THAT THE OFFICE OF 
THE LEGISLATIVE AUDITOR CON­
DUCT AN ASSESSMENT OF SUITABLE 
LAND SITES IN CENTRAL OAHU, 
APPROPRIATE FOR THE DEVELOP­
MENT OF A STATE VETERANS CEME­
TERY", was adopted. 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS 

The following resolutions 
Nos. 478 and 479) were read 
Clerk and were disposed of 
lows: 

(H.R. 
by the 
as fol-

A resolution (H.R. No. 478) congra­
tulating Judy Miyata of Mililani Pets 
as an outstanding young small busi­
nessperson was jointly offered by 
Representatives Kihano, Lee, Alcon, 
Bunda, Hagino, Hashimoto, Hi-rono, 
Okamura and Tungpalan. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Tam and 
carried, H.R. No. 478 was adopted. 
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A resolution (H.R. No. 479) congra­
tulating Wahiawa General Hospital 
Auxiliary on the opening on its new 
gift shop was jointly offered by 
Representatives Lee, Bunda, Alcon, 
Anderson, Andrews, Apo, Hagino, 
Hashimoto, Hayes, Hiraki, Hirono, 
Leong, Levin, Shon, Tam, Taniguchi 
and Tungpalan. 

On motion by Representative Lee, 
seconded by Representative Tam and 
carried, H.R. No. 479 was adopted. 

THIRD READING 

The following bills, which were on 
the calendar for Third Reading, were 
read throughout, and the following 
actions taken: 

S.B. No. 1745: 

On motion by Representative Taka­
mine, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, S.B. No. 1745, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO THE WORKERS' COM­
PENSATION MEDICAL FEE SCHE­
DULE", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
being excused. 

S.B. No. 791: 

On motion by Representative Ha­
gino, seconded by Representative 
Okamura and carried, S.B. No. 791, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO APPEALS IN CRIMINAL 
CASES", passed Third Reading by a 
vote of 47 ayes, with Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 17 45 and 791 had 
passed Third Reading at 1: 15 o'clock 
p.m. 

S.B. No. 1287, SD1: 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hiraki and carried, S. B . No. 12 87, 
SD1, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO BANKING", 
passed Third Reading by a vote of 47 
ayes, with Representatives Horita, M. 
Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 1287 had passed 
Third Reading at 1:16 o'clock p.m. 

S.B. No. 1112: 

Representative Hirono moved that 
S.B. No. 1112, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, 
seconded by Representative Hiraki. 

Representative Tungpalan then rose 
to speak against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, first, I surveyed my 
community and the majority voted 
against the passage of this bill. 

"Secondly, I believe that matters 
pertaining to conception are articles 
of faith and morals. In vitro ferti­
lization does not recognize the exist­
ence of the soul at the moment of 
conception. For this reason and the 
fact that the majority of my commu­
nity doesn't support this measure, I 
am casting a 'no' vote on it. " 

Representative Lee rose to speak 
against the bill, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I do so because this 
is an elective luxury. I don't think 
that it is in keeping with the 'raison 
d'etre' of medical insurance, and I 
join Representative Tungpalan in 
opposing this bill. 

"Thank you, sir." 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and S.B. No. 1112 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO INSURANCE", having 
been read throughout, passed Third 
Reading by a vote of 38 ayes to 9 
noes, with Representatives Anderson, 
Cavasso, Hemmings, Jones, Kanoho, 
Lee, O'Kieffe, Ribellia and Tungpalan 
voting no, and with Representatives 
Horita, M. Ige, Metcalf and Tajiri 
being excused. 

S.B. No. 449: 

On motion by Representative Hi­
rono, seconded by Representative 
Hagino and carried, S.B. No. 449, 
entitled: "A BILL FOR AN ACT 
RELATING TO OPTOMETRY", passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 4 7 ayes, 
with Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused. 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. Nos. 1112 and 449 had 
passed Third Reading at 1:17 o'clock 
p.m. 

S.B. No. 1286, SD1: 

Representative Hirono moved that 
S. B. No. 1286, having been read 
throughout, pass Third Reading, 
seconded by Representative Hiraki. 
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Representative Liu then rose to 
speak in favor of the bill, but with 
reservations, stating: 

"Mr. Speaker, I think the basic 
reason behind the change in the 
maximum loan amount from $100,000.00 
to $500,000.00 makes some sense. We 
all know the cost of home mortgages, 
etc. , are tremendous these days and 
a hundred thousand dollars, in many 
instances, is just not enough. 

"However, I am concerned with the 
large jump without an attendant tying 
of that jump to the assets of the 
banks involved or the financial in­
stitutions involved. 

"I just hope that we keep an eye on 
it during the interim and, hopefully, 
with some research I hope to be 
working on, will, perhaps, indicate 
next session whether -or not further 
modification of this section is needed. 
My concern is that in the smaller 
banks, smaller financial ins ti tu tions, 
five hundred thousand dollars is a lot 
of money, and I think we just have to 
be on the lookout that all board 
members be kept aware of those 
transactions and that shareholders, as 
well as depositors, are protected to 
the maximum abilities that the State 
can put forwar d . 

The motion was put by the Chair 
and carried, and S. B. No. 1286, 
SDl, entitled: "A BILL FOR AN 
ACT RELATING TO BANKING", 
having been read throughout, passed 
Third Reading by a vote of 47 ayes, 
with Representatives Horita, M. Ige, 
Metcalf and Tajiri being excused . 

The Chair directed the Clerk to 
note that S. B. No. 1286 had passed 
Third Reading at 1: 20 o'clock p. m. 

S.B. No. 1483, SDl: 

By unanimous consent, action was 
deferred one day. 

At 1:20 o'clock p.m., Representa­
tive Okamura asked for a recess, and 
the Chair declared a recess, subject 
to the call of the Chair. 

The House of Representatives 
reconvened at 1:26 o'clock p.m. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The following announcements were 
made to the members of the House: 

Representative Oshiro requested 
waiver of the 48-hour notice for 
hearings on S.C.R. Nos. 113 and 145 
and the Chair "so ordered." 

Representative Oshiro: The Com-
mittee on Transportation will be 
hearing these two measures tomorrow 
morning at 9: 00 a. m. , in Senate 
Conference Room No. 2. Decision 
making to follow." 

Representative Tam: "Mr. Speaker, 
your conferees of the Senate and the 
House, respectively, the Committees 
of Judiciary and Education, will have 
a meeting today at 1: 30 on Senate Bill 
No. 787, SDl, HD1. The following 
members of the conferees of the 
House--Representatives Metcalf, Lee, 
Honda, O'Kieffe, Honda and myself." 

Representative Crozier: "May I ask 
for a waiver on several Senate con­
current resolutions, and we are 
having a hearing tomorrow following 
Representative Oshiro's Transporta­
tion Committee hearing, 11 and the 
Chair, noting that there were no 
objections, "so ordered." 

Representative Hiraki: "The Com­
mittee on Consumer Protection and 
Commerce will resume our conference 
meeting today at 4: 00 o'clock in Room 
328. 11 

Representative Okamura: "Mr. 
Speaker, this is to give notice to the 
Majority members that there will be a 
caucus on Sunday at 1: 00 o'clock 
p. m. , in Conference Room 328. 11 

COMMITTEE REASSIGNMENTS 

House Resolutions Nos. 208; 177; 
and 207 and House Concurrent Resolu­
tions Nos. 117 and 213 were re-re­
ferred to the Committee on Legislative 
Management only. 

At this time, Representative Apo 
made the following motion, seconded 
by Representative Anderson and 
carried: "I move to keep the Journal 
open until midnight for the Clerk to 
receive Conference Committee Reports 
up to said time in order to comply 
with the constitutional 48-hour avail­
ability requirement for passage of 
bills on Final Reading. 11 

At 1:29 o'clock p.m., the Chair 
declared the House in recess for the 
purpose of rece1vmg Conference 
Committee Reports. 

ADJOURNMENT 

At 12: 00 o'clock midnight, the 
House of Representatives adjourned 
until 11:00 o'clock a.m., tomorrow, 
Friday, April 24, 1987. 




